
2010 Florida Building Code, Residential
Glitch Supplement

Chapter 1 – ADMINISTRATION
R101.2 Scope. – Change to read as follows. 

R101.2 Scope. The provisions of the Florida Building Code, Residential, shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, removal and demolition of detached one– and two–family dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories above grade plane in height with a separate means of egress and their accessory structures. 

Exceptions: 
1. Live/work units complying with the requirements of Section 419 438 of the Florida Building Code, Building shall be permitted to be built as one- and two-family dwellings or townhouses. Fire suppression required by Section 419.5 438.5 of the Florida Building Code, Building when constructed under the Florida Building Code, Residential shall conform to Section 903.3.1.3 of the International Building Code. Florida Building Code, Building. 

2.Existing buildings undergoing repair, alteration or additions, and change of occupancy shall comply with the Florida Building Code, Existing Building Code.
[CA4531]



Chapter 2 – DEFINITIONS

Revise the following definitions to read as follows:
Addition ADDITION. An extension or increase in floor area, number of stories or height of a building or structure. 

Means of escapeMEANS OF ESCAPE. A way out of a building or structure that does not conform to the strict definition of means of egress but does provide an alternate way out. A means of escape consists of a door, stairway, passage or hall providing a way of unobstructed travel to the outside at street or ground level.  It may also consist of a passage through an adjacent nonlockable space, independent of and remotely located from the means of egress, to any approved exit. 

[F4532] 

UNUSUALLY TIGHT CONSTRUCTION. Construction meeting the following requirements:

1. Walls comprising the building thermal envelope have a continuous water vapor retarder with a

rating of 1 perm [57.4 ng/(s ∙ m2 ∙ Pa)] or less with openings therein gasketed or sealed.

2. Doors and openable windows meet the air leakage requirements of Section N1106; and

3. Caulking or sealants are applied to areas such as joints around window and door frames between

sole plates and floors, between wall‐ceiling joints, between wall panels, at penetrations for plumbing, electrical and gas lines, and at other openings.

Comment after Glitch

Chapter 3 – BUILDING PLANNING 

R301.1 -  revise to read as follows:
R301.1 Application. Buildings and structures, and all parts thereof, shall be constructed to safely support all loads, including dead loads, live loads, roof loads, flood loads, and wind loads as prescribed by this code. The construction of buildings and structures in accordance with the provisions of this code shall result in a system that provides a complete load path that meets all requirements for the transfer of all loads from their point of origin through the load-resisting elements to the foundation. Buildings and structures constructed as prescribed by this code are deemed to comply with the requirements of this section.

EXCEPTION: Buildings and structures located within the High Velocity Hurricane Zone shall comply only with Sections R302 to R326, inclusive and the provisions of Chapter R44 and section R406. In addition, buildings and structures located in flood hazard areas established in Table R301.2(1) shall comply with Sections R301.2.4 and R322.

[S4514]

Figure R301.2(4) – Change to read as shown. 

[image: image1][image: image2.jpg]130

120 115
) N
15 ;e;r;a E olmes
% Walton €waNgngton| Jackson Gadsden
Caihoun Lean E
Wakula
140 SR 7 Franki
150

Wind-borne Debris Region

Designated areas where the basic wind speed

is 140 mph or greater.

m s s mm 130 MPH and within 1 mile of the coast

Notes:

1. values are nominal design 3-second gust
wind speeds in miles per hour (m/s) at 33
ft (16m) above ground for Exposure C cat-
egory.

2. Linear interpolation between contours
is permitted.

3. 1Islands and coastal areas outside the
last contour shall use the last wind speed
contour of the coastal area.

4. Mountainous terrain, gorges, ocean
promontories, and special wind regions
shall be examined for unusual wind condi-
tions.

5. Wind speeds correspond to approximately
a 7% probability of exceedance in 50 years
(Annual Exceedance Probability = 0.00143,
MRI = 700 years).

Madison

Hamitton

Suwannee

)
149

Gilchrist

115 130
120
N
2 _\4 Duval
3 |paker/
"immdfnrd Clay @ 1 46
John:
Aechia Putnam
Marion 1 5 e
Volusia
Cns g Seminole
Hemando Z || ke Orange

Figure R301.2(4) Ultimate Design Wind Speeds, Vit




[S4742] 

R301.2.1.1 Design criteria. – Change to read as shown. 

R301.2.1.1 Design criteria.  (no change) 

1-5 (no change) 

6. The MAF Guide to Concrete Masonry Residential Construction in High Wind Areas shall be permitted for applicable concrete masonry buildings where Vasd, determined in accordance with Section R301.2.1.3 does not exceed for a basic wind speed of 130 mph (58 m/s) or less in Exposure B and 110 mph (49 m/s) or less in Exposure C in accordance with Figure R301.2(4) 

7.     The applicable AF&PA WFCM Guide to Wood Construction in High Wind Areas shall be permitted for applicable wood-frame buildings in regions where Vasd, determined in accordance with Section R301.2.1.3 does not exceed with a basic wind speed (Vasd) of 130 mph (58 m/s) or less in Exposure B in accordance with Figure R301.2(4); 

The wind speeds in Figure R301.2(4) shall be converted to nominal wind speeds, Vasd, in accordance with Section R301.2.1.3 when the provisions of the standards referenced in Exceptions 1 through 8 are used unless the wind provisions in the standards are based on Ultimate Wind Speeds as specified in Figure R301.2(4) or Chapter 26 of ASCE 7.
[S4551] 

R301.2.1.2.1.1 - change to read as follows:
R301.2.1.2.1.1 Modifications to ASTM E 1886 and ASTM E 1996.  
Table 1 of ASTM E 1886 and ASTM E 1996 – add column and notes to read as follows:
Air Pressure Cycles

0.2 to 0.5 Ppos1

0.0 to 0.6 Ppos

0.5 to 0.8 Ppos
0.3 to 1.0 Ppos
0.3 to 1.0 Pneg2
0.5 to 0.8 Pneg

0.0 to 0.6 Pneg

0.2 to 0.5 Pneg

Notes:

1. Ppos = 0.6 x positive ultimate design load in accordance with ASCE 7. 

2. Pneg = 0.6 x negative ultimate design load in accordance with ASCE 7.

[S4552, Comment after Glitch] 

Table 301.2(2) – Change to read as shown. 

TABLE R301.2(2) 

COMPONENT AND CLADDING LOADS FOR A BUILDING WITH A MEAN 

ROOF HEIGHT OF 30 FEET LOCATED IN EXPOSURE B (psf)a,b,c,d,e
  

(No change to table values)

NOTES: 

a. The effective wind area shall be equal to the span length multiplied by an effective width. This width shall be permitted to be not be less than one-third the span length. For cladding fasteners, the effective wind area shall not be greater than the area that is tributary to an individual fastener. 

b. For effective areas between those given above, the load may be interpolated; otherwise, use the load associated with the lower effective area. 

c. Table values shall be adjusted for height and exposure by multiplying by the adjustment coefficient in Table R301.2(3). 

d. See Figure R301.2(7) for location of zones. 

e. Plus and minus signs signify pressures acting toward and away from the building surfaces. 

f. Positive design wind pressures shall not be less than +16 10 psf and negative design wind pressures shall not be less than -16 10 psf. 

[S4607]



R301.2(2) – Change to read as shown.

TABLE R301.2(2)
COMPONENT AND CLADDING LOADS FOR A BUILDING WITH A MEAN ROOF HEIGHT OF 30 FEET LOCATED IN EXPOSURE B (psf)[image: image3.jpg]Shective

Ul-l‘m(\a‘{e_. bQS.lS(\

Wind Speed

Vier

onel oo mph
isn 110 115 120 130 140 150 160 180 200
1 10 § 89 |-218] 97 | -238)] 105| %8| 124 304| 143 -353| 165 | -405| 187 | 46.1] 237 | €83 | 293 | -720
1 20 § 83 |-212] 01 |-zm2] 00 | 52| 116] 296 134 ]| -344| 154 | -304| 175 | 449 222 | s68]| 274 | 701
$ 1 so | 78 |-05]| 83 | 24| 90 | 244| 106 286 123 | 332 141 | -38.1| 160 | 43.3| 203 | 548 | 250 | 677 |
5 1 100 § 70 [-199) 77 | -218] 83 | 37| 98 | 278 14| 323] 130 | 370] 48] 421| 188 533| 2| &89
s | 2 10 | 83 |.385] 97 | -200| 105 | 435| 124 510] 143 | s02| 165 | -679] 187 ] 77.3] 237 | 978 »3 |27
s 2 20 § 83 |-226] 01 |[-357]| 99 | 88| 16| 456] 134|529 154 | e07| 176 | e00] 222 | 874 | 274 | 1070
o § 2 50 76 |-275} 83 |-201| 90 | 327| 106 384 123] 45| 141 | 511] 60| s82] 203 | 736| 20| 209
g 21 10 J70 |-zmel 77| 8] 83| 281] 98] 330] 114] 382] 130 | 439] 148 | s0.0] 188 632] 232 | 781
3 10 § 89 |.550] 07 | .e01] 05| 54| 124 | 768 143 ] -800| 165 |-1023] 187 [4183| 237 | 4472| 203 | 4817
3 20 [ 83 [465] o1 |-s08| 00 | 62| 116] 36| 134§ .738] 154 | 847] 17.6 | v63] 220 | 1210] 274 [ 9505
3 50 [ 76 |-331) 83 |-31] 90 | 203] 106] 462| 123] -535] 141 | 615] 60| 699] 203 | s85| 250 [1003
3| 100 § 70 |-286] 7.7 | 58| 63 | 21| 98 | 330 114 | 382 130 | 439 148 | B0.0| 188 | 632 | 232 | 781
1 10 Y125 |.190] 137 | -218]| 140]| 37| 175] 278] 203 ] -323] 233 | 370 265 ] 421 338 | 533 415 | .e50
1 20 § 112 ]|-104] 125 | -212] 138 | 0| 60| 270] 185 ] 314 213 | 350 242 | 41.0]| 306 | 519 378 | 640
811 50 | 100 | 186 109 | 04| 119 | 22.2| 138 260 161 | 302 | 185 | 36| 211 | 594 267 | 499 | 29| 616
g 1 100 § 89 |-181] 97 [-198] 105 ] 21.5] 124| 252| 143 ] .203] 185 | -336| 187 | 38.2] 237 | 484 | 293 | -508]
e 10 J 125 |.347] 137 | .ar0] 149 41.3] 175] 484 23] 552] 233 | ea5] 265 | 734] 338 | 929 415 [ 1148
NV Z1 20 [ 714|312 125|340 136 | 28.0] 160 | 446 185 | 51.7 | 213 | -503| 242 | 67.5| 306 | 854 | 378 | A5
~ 01 2] s Jwo|-z=2] 09| 09| ne| 6| 139] 394| 161{457| 185 525] 21.1| 59.7| 267 | 756 329 | -:3.3
% 2 1 100 § 89 |55 o7 | -278] 105 ] 303 124 | 356] 143 ]| 412| 185 | -473| 187 | 53.9] 237 | 582 203 |1 842
213 10 | 125 | 513] 137 | -s60| 149| s1.0] 175] 718] 203 831 233 | -054]| 265 |-1085] 338 | 137.3] 415 |.1695
3 20 114 | 470 125 | -524| 136 | 57.1] 160 | 670| 185 ] -77.7| 213 | -892| 24.2 | 1014] 306 | 1284| 37.8 | 1585
3| 50 J|wwo0|435] 09 478| 19| 51.8| 139 608| 161 | 705| 185 | -810] 211 | 92.1| 267 | 1168| 2.9 | 1439
31 100 § 89 | 402 o7 [ s10] 105] 479 124] 562] 143 ] -851] 165 | 748] 187 | #5.1] 237 | 1077] 203 [ 1320
E] 10 J 190 [.218] 218|.238]| 237 | 259] 278 304| 23| .353| 370 [.405] 421 [ 461] 533 ] 583 659 720
1 20 J194 207|212 28] 230| 24.6]| 27.0| 269] 314|-335| %0 | 384 41.0| 457] 519 | 553 | 640 | 683
g 11 50 J 186 |-192] 204 | 210] 22| 28| 2%0| 268| 2] .311| 346 |-357| 394 | 406] 499 | 514 615 | 634
g; 1 100 §181|-181] 198|-198] 215| 215] 252| 252| 203 -203| 336 | -336| 382 | 382] 484 | 484 508 | 598
o 1 2 10 J 199 |-255] 218 | -278| 237 | w0.3| 278 | 356 323 | 412| 370 | 4r3| 421 | 53.9] 533 | s82| 659 842
:of 2 20 [ 194 |-243] 212 | -268| 230 290] 27.0| 340] 314 ] 304 | 360 | 453] 410 515] 519 | 652 | &40 | -805
= 1 2 0 N 186 |-29] 204 | 280| 22| 27.2]| 260 320 302|371 346 | 425| 304 | 48.4] 499 13| 616 | -758
% 2] 100 Y8128 108 28| 215 250 262 304| 203] -355] 336 | 405 382 | 46.1] 484 | 583 | s08 | 720
s L3 10 § 199 |.-z55] 218 | -278] 237 20.3] 278] 356 23] 412] 3o | ar3 4114 539] 533 | 582 e59 | a2
3 20 ] 194 |-243] 212 | 268 230 200] 270 340! 314 | 304 30 | 453 91.0] 515] 519 652 10| -805
3 s0 | 186 |.20] 204 | 50| 22| 272] 0] 320] 302 ] 371] 346 | 425] 304 ] 484 439 | £13| 616 | 758
3 100 | 181 |-218] 198 | -288] 215 | 259] 252 304| 203 353 306 | 405| 382 | 461 484 | 583 | 508 | -720
4 10 218 [-238] 238 | 258] 250 | 21| 304 | 330 3] -382] 405 | 4309 461 | $0.0] 583 | 532 720 | 781 |
4 20 208 |.26] 227 | -247] 247 | 9] 20| 318] B7 240 479] 557 | 508 887 | 748
4 50 f 195 | 213] 213 | 33| ;32| 4] 272 | 208| 318 41.2] 45.1] 522 | 571| e44 | 708
4 | 100 | B5]|-204] 202]-22] 20| 22| 9] 284] 200 78| 9.2 | 43.1] 498 | 545 | 612 | 673
T 1 41 s |62|a81] 77| 18] 193 | 215] 27| 252] 263 ] 20, -336] 343 | 38.2] 435 | 484 537 | 593
S I 51 10 |28 | 21| 236 | 19| 259 57| 304 407 33| 72| 405 | 42| 461 | 61.7] 583 | 780] 720 | .63
5 20 | 208 | -272] 227 | 27| 247 | 324| 290 | 380| 337 | 440| 387 | 505 440 | 57.5] 557 | 728| 667 | -899
5 5o J 195 |-246] 213 | -269] 232 | 93] 72| 343 316|398 %2 |-457] 12| 520 522 658] 644 | 813
51 100 J185 | 26] 202 27| 20| 0| 2659] 316 00| -367] 344 | 421] 302 47.9] 496 | 508 612 | -748]
5§ 1 50 § 162 |-181] 177 198] 193] 21.5] 27| 252] 263 203 302 | -338| 343 | 382] 435 | 484| :37 | 508




[S4533]
R311.2 Egress door - revise to add the following exception:

R311.2 Egress door. At least one egress door shall be provided for each dwelling unit. The egress door shall be side-hinged, and shall provide a minimum clear width of 32 inches (813

mm) when measured between the face of the door and the stop, with the door open 90 degrees (1.57 rad). The minimum clear height of the door opening shall not be less than 78 inches

(1981 mm) in height measured from the top of the threshold to the bottom of the stop. Other doors shall not be required to comply with these minimum dimensions. Egress doors shall be

readily openable from inside the dwelling without the use of a key or special knowledge or effort.

Exception:  Buildings that are 400 square feet or less and that are intended for use in conjunction with one- and two-family residences are not subject to the door height and width requirements of this code.

Comment after Glitch

R311.7.4.3  - revise to read as shown:
R311.7.4.3  Profile. The radius of curvature at the leading edge of the tread shall be no greater than 9/16 inch (14.3 mm). A nosing not less than ¾ inch (19 mm) but not more than 1¼  inches (32 mm) shall be provided on stairways with solid risers. The greatest nosing projection shall not exceed the smallest nosing projection by more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm) between two stories, including the nosing at the level of floors and landings. Every tread less than 10 inches (254 mm) wide shall have a nosing or effective projection of approximately 1 inch (25 mm) over the level immediately below that tread. Beveling of nosing shall not exceed ½ inch (12.7 mm). Risers shall be vertical or sloped from the underside of the leading edge of the tread above at an angle not more than 30 (0.51 rad) degrees from the vertical. Open risers are permitted, provided that the opening between treads does not permit the passage of a 4-inch diameter (102 mm) sphere.

Exceptions:
1.    A nosing is not required where the tread depth is a minimum of 11 inches (279 mm).

2.   The opening between adjacent treads is not limited on stairs with a total rise of 30 inches (762 mm) or less.

[F4562]

	

	


R311.7.5 - reformat as follows so that the exception is independent of the specific code provisions.

R311.7.5 Landings for stairways. There shall be a floor or landing at the top and bottom of each stairway. 

Exception: A floor or landing is not required at the top of an interior flight of stairs, including stairs in an enclosed garage, provided a door does not swing over the stairs. 

A flight of stairs shall not have a vertical rise larger than 12 feet (3658 mm) between floor levels or landings. 

The width of each landing shall not be less than the width of the stairway served. Every landing shall have a minimum dimension of 36 inches (914 mm) measured in the direction of travel.

Comment after Glitch

318.2 Penetration. – Change to read as shown. 

318.2 Penetration. Protective sleeves around piping penetrating concrete slab-on-grade floors shall not be of cellulose-containing materials. If soil treatment is used for subterranean termite protection, the sleeve shall have a maximum wall thickness of 0.010 inch (0.25 mm), and be sealed withinthe slab using a non-corrosive clamping device to eliminate the annular space between the pipe and the sleeve. No termiticides shall be applied inside the sleeve. 

[P4755] 

SECTION R320 
ACCESSIBILITY
320.1  SCOPE - Change to read as shown. 

R320.1 Scope. Shall be in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 11 of the Florida Building Code, Building. Accessibility. 

R320.1.1 All new single-family houses, duplexes, triplexes, condominiums and townhouses shall provide at least one bathroom, located with maximum possible privacy, where bathrooms are provided on habitable grade levels, with a door that has a 29-inch (737 mm) clear opening. However, if only a toilet room is provided at grade level, such toilet rooms shall have a clear opening of not less than 29 inches (737 mm). 

[CA4732]
Chapter 4 – FOUNDATIONS

Section R401.1 - revise as follows:  

R401.1 Application.  The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and construction of the foundation and foundation spaces for all buildings. In addition to the provisions of this chapter, the design and construction of foundations in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1) shall meet the provisions of Section R322. Wood foundations shall be designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA PWF.  (see Section R301.2.1.1).  
Exceptions:  (no change)

Comment after Glitch

R404.1.1.1 Masonry foundation walls. – Change to read as shown. 

R404.1.1.1 Masonry foundation walls. Concrete masonry and clay masonry foundation walls shall be constructed as set forth in Table R404.1.1(1), R404.1.1(2), R404.1.1(3) or R404.1.1(4) and shall also comply with applicable provisions of Sections R606, R607 and R608. The use of rubble stone masonry foundation walls and plain masonry shall be limited to regions where the ultimate design basic wind speed, Vult, is 115 100 mph or less unless an engineered design is provided. 

[S4554]

Table R403.1.2 –In the second row of values (Footing A, Mono, 20, 16, 6, 285, 3) the value under the column for resistance should be 585, not 285, as follows:   

Table R403.1.2, second row of values, sixth column:  285 585
[S4794]
R403.4.1 Crushed stone footings – Change to read as shown. 

R403.4.1 Crushed stone footings. Clean crushed stone shall be free from organic, clayey or silty soils. Crushed stone shall be angular in nature and meet ASTM C 33, with the maximum size stone not to exceed 1/2 inch (12.7 mm) and the minimum stone size not to be smaller than 1/16-inch (1.6 mm). Crushed stone footings for precast foundations shall be installed in accordance with Figure R403.4(1) and Table R403.4. Crushed stone footings shall be consolidated using a vibratory plate in a maximum of 8-inch lifts. Crushed stone footings shall be limited to Seismic Design Categories A, B and C. 

[S4553]
TABLE R404.1(1) – Delete Table in its entirety. 

TABLE R404.1(1) 

TOP REACTIONS AND PRESCRIPTIVE SUPPORT FOR FOUNDATION WALLSa 

(delete all text and notes)
[S4588] 


R404.1.2.3.1 Compressive strength.  – Change to read as shown. 

R404.1.2.3.1 Compressive strength.  Reserved.The minimum specified compressive strength of concrete, f’c, shall comply with Section R402.2 and shall be not less than 2,500 psi (17.2 MPa) at 28 days. 

[S4555] 

R404.1.4 Seismic Design Categories D0, D1 and D2 – Change to read as shown. Delete all text in Section R404.1.4 including R404.1.4.1 and R404.1.4.2.
R404.1.4 Seismic Design Categories D0, D1 and D2. Reserved.  

 [S4556] 

R404.5.2 Precast concrete foundation design drawings – Change to read as shown. 

R404.5.2 Precast concrete foundation design drawings. (no change) 

 1-5 (no change) 

6. Basic Ultimate design wind speed, Vult from Figure R301.2(4). 

[S4557] 

Chapter 5 – FLOORS
Tables R502.2.3(1) and R502 – Line and column formatting of tables should be corrected, it appears that there have been software translation problems in the tables, making them unreadable.

 [S4795]

Chapter 6 – WALL CONSTRUCTION – Part A
R602.2 – Change to read as shown.

R602.2 Design and construction where wind speed is less than 100 miles per hour (45 m/s). Reserved.
[S4558]

R606.14.1.  Change to read as shown:

R606.14.1 Joist bearing.  Except where supported on a 1-inch by 4-inch (25.4 mm by 102 mm) ribbon strip and nailed to the adjoining stud and as provided in Section R606.11, the ends of each joist shall not have less than 11/2 inches (38 mm) of bearing on wood or metal, or less than 3 inches (76 mm) on masonry. Joists shall have a bearing of not less than 11/2 inches (38 mm), except as provided in Section R606.14, and shall be supported in accordance with Figure R606.11(1).
Comment after Glitch
R610.4.1 Exterior standard-unit panels. – Change to read as shown.
R610.4.1 Exterior standard-unit panels. The maximum area of each individual standard-unit panel shall be 144 square feet (13.4 m2) when the design wind pressure is 20 psf (958 Pa). The maximum area of such panels subjected to design wind pressures other than 20 psf (958 Pa) shall be in accordance with Figure R610.4.1. The maximum panel dimension between structural supports shall be 25 feet (7620 mm) in width or 20 feet (6096 mm) in height. Design wind pressures calculated according to ASCE 7 or obtained from Table R301.2(2) are permitted to be multiplied by 0.6.
[S4559]

R610.4.2 Exterior thin-unit panels. – Change to read as shown.
R610.4.2 Exterior thin-unit panels. The maximum area of each individual thin-unit panel shall be 85 square feet (7.9 m2). The maximum dimension between structural supports shall be 15 feet (4572 mm) in width or 10 feet (3048 mm) in height. Thin units shall not be used in applications where the design wind pressure as stated in Table R301.2(1) exceeds 20 33 psf (958 Pa). Design wind pressures calculated according to ASCE 7 or obtained from Table R301.2(2) are permitted to be multiplied by 0.6.
[S4560] Comment after Glitch

R611.2 Applicability limits – Change to read as shown.

R611.2 Applicability limits. The provisions of this section shall apply to the construction of exterior concrete walls for buildings not greater than 60 feet (18 288 mm) in plan dimensions, floors with clear spans not greater than 32 feet (9754 mm) and roofs with clear spans not greater than 40 feet (12 192 mm). Buildings shall not exceed 35 feet (10 668 mm) in mean roof height or two stories in height above-grade. Floor/ceiling dead loads shall not exceed 10 pounds per square foot (479 Pa), roof/ceiling dead loads shall not exceed 15 pounds per square foot (718 Pa) and attic live loads shall not exceed 20 pounds per square foot (958 Pa). Roof overhangs shall not exceed 2 feet (610 mm) of horizontal projection beyond the exterior wall and the dead load of the overhangs shall not exceed 8 pounds per square foot (383 Pa).

Walls constructed in accordance with the provisions of this section shall be limited to buildings subjected to a maximum Vasd, determined in accordance with Section R301.2.1.3, design wind speed of 130 miles per hour (58 m/s) Exposure B, 110 miles per hour (49 m/s) Exposure C and 100 miles per hour (45 m/s) Exposure D. Walls constructed in accordance with the provisions of this section shall be limited to detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses.

Buildings that are not within the scope of this section shall be designed in accordance with PCA 100 or ACI 318.

[S4563]

R611.8.3 Floor and roof diaphragm construction – Delete section in its entirety.
R611.8.3 Floor and roof diaphragm construction. Floor and roof diaphragms shall be constructed of wood structural panel sheathing, attached to wood framing in accordance with Section R803 or to cold- formed steel floor framing or to cold-formed steel roof framing in accordance with AISI 230.
[S4587]

R611.9 Requirements for connections where wind speed is less than 100 mph  –general – Change to read as shown.
R611.9 Requirements for connections where wind speed is less than 100 mph  –general . Concrete walls shall be connected to footings, floors, ceilings and roofs in accordance with this section.

 
Tables R611.9(1), R611.9(2), R611.9(3), R611.9(4), R611.9(5), R611.9(6), R611.9(7), R611.9(8), R611.9(9), R611.9(10), R611.9(11), and R611.9(12)- Delete the following note as shown:

 

Note: Table is limited to areas where wind speed (mph) is less than 100.
[S4564]

R612.5 Performance – Change to read as shown.

R612.5 Performance. Exterior windows and doors shall be designed to resist the design wind loads specified in Table R301.2(2) adjusted for height and exposure per Table R301.2(3). For testing required in Sections R612.6, R612.7, and R612.8, design pressures determined from Table R301.2(2) or ASCE 7 are permitted to be multiplied by 0.6.
[S4565]

R613.2 Applicability limits – Change to read as shown.
R613.2 Applicability limits. The provisions of this section shall control the construction of exterior structural insulated panel walls and interior load-bearing structural insulated panel walls for buildings not greater than 60 feet (18 288 mm) in length perpendicular to the joist or truss span, not greater than 40 feet (12 192 mm) in width parallel to the joist or truss span and not greater than two stories in height with each wall not greater than 10 feet (3048 mm) high. All exterior walls installed in accordance with the provisions of this section shall be considered as load-bearing walls. Structural insulated panel walls constructed in accordance with the provisions of this section shall be limited to sites subjected to a maximum Vasd, determined in accordance with Section R301.2.1.3, design wind speed of 130 miles per hour (58 m/s), and Exposure A, B or C, and a maximum ground snow load of 70 pounds per foot (3.35 kPa), and Seismic Design Categories A, B, and C.
[S4570]
R613.5.3 Wall bracing – Change to read as shown.

R613.5.3 Wall bracing. SIP walls used for wall bracing shall be designed for wind loads in accordance with Section R301.1 or Section R602.SIP walls shall be braced in accordance with Section R602.10. SIP walls shall be considered continuous wood structural panel sheathing for purposes of computing required bracing.  SIP walls shall meet the requirements of Section R602.10.4 except that SIPs corners shall be fabricated as shown in Figure R613.9. When SIP walls are used for wall bracing, the SIP bottom plate shall be attached to wood framing below in accordance with Section R602.3 Table R602.3(1).

[S4570]

R613.10.1 Wood structural panel box headers – Change to read as shown.
R613.10.1 Wood structural panel box headers. Wood structural panel box headers shall be allowed where SIP headers are not applicable. Wood structural panel box headers shall be constructed in accordance with Section R602 Figure R602.7.2 and Table R602.7.2.
[S4570]
[image: image4.png]roduced with a Trial Version of PDF Annotatorwaggg(ﬁnnotator.com
MINIMUM THICKNESS FOR SIP WALL SUPPORTING SIP LIGHT-FRAME ROOF ONLY (inches)

Maximum Vasd determined in accordance with Section R301.2.3 UILDING WIDTH (feet)

m 24 28 32 36 40
. . aNoviiohD Wall Helght (ft) Wall Helght (ft) Wall Helght (ft) Wall Helght (ft) Wall Helght (t)
AB C 8 9 10 8 9 10 8 9 10 8 9 10 8 9 10
R 45 | 45 |45 |45 | 45| 45 |45 | 45|45 | 45|45 | 45|45 |45 45
LR |
30 I-Fﬁ‘%% 45 | 45 |45 45|45 | 45 | 45 | 45445 45
85 — —
50 45 | 45 |45 |45 |45 | 45 [ 4545145 [ 45 | 45 |45 | 45 45
— —
70 | 45125 45 | 45 | 45 [45|45|45 | 45|45 [ 45 a5+451 45 |
20 | 45 |45 |45 |45 |45 |45 |45 [45 |45 |45 | 45 |45] 45 |45] 45
45 | 45 [a5t45145 |45 [45|45|45 |45 | 45 | 454545 | 45
100 85 —— e
50 45 45 | 45 | 45 | 45 a5 tasT4s | 45 | 45 | 45| 45 | 45 | 45
Fas5 145 |45 | 45 | 45| 45[ 45 [45 | 45 [ 45 o545 45
45 45 | 45 | 45| 4545 | 45| 45 [ 45| 45 | 45| 45
25— 45 | 45 |45 |45 |45 | 45 | 45 | 45+#545 | 45
1o | 100 il
45 45 | 45 [ a5 o545 | 45 | 45 | 45| 45 | 45| 45
45 45| 45 | 45| 45 45 | 45 | 45 [ a5 #5145 45
>
45 | 45 | 45 | 45| 45| 45| 45|45 | 45 | 45| 45 | 45| 45
vool B i [ &S5 45 | 45| 45|45 |45 |45 | 45| 45445 45 |
45 |45 | 45 | 45 [a5 @551 45 | 45 | 45| 45 | 45
b5 45 [ 45 | 45 | 45| 45| 45 | 45 | 45 | 65 [ 45145165 |
5|45 | 45|45 | 45 |45]|45]|45 |45 45 45 | 45| a5
%0 155 W 45 | 45 #5445 45 | 45 | 45|45 |45 | 45| 45 4545 | 45
50 45 | 45 | 45 | 45 | 45 | 45 [ 45+ F65 | 45 | 45 | 65| 45 65
70 s 45 | 65 | 45|45 65 a5
20 6.5 45 | 6.
= =
- 45 [ N7A—45] NA | 45|45 |NA| 45 | 65 | NAH#5T65 | NA
- 50 45 NA | 45 | 65 | Na a5 A 65 | Na | Nl 65 [va | Na
70 X_A.s,—m«—-wm’ [65 | WA | NA | 65 |NA | NA | NA [ WA [ NA N ad N |





[image: image5.png]MINIMUM THICKNESS FOR SIP WALLS SUPPORTING SIP OR LIGHT FRAME ONE STORY AND ROOF (inches)
Maximum Vasd determined in accordance with Section R3012.3 |y pING WIDTH (feet)

rProduced with a Trial Version of PDF Annotator. - R, PDE@nnotator com

i

WIND-SPEED-
M 24 28 32 36 40
Exp. Exp. SNOWLOAD Wall Helght (feet) ‘Wall Helght (feet) Wall Helght (feet) ‘Wall Helght (feet) ‘Wall Helght (feet)
AB c 8 9 10 8 9 10 8 9 10 8 9 10 8 9 10
}6 45 | 45 |45 |45 | 45 | 45 | 45| 45 45|45 |45 |45 | 45 45| 45
/30 45 |45 [ #5451 45 | 45 | 45| 45 | 45| 45 | 45 |45 +=45[45] 45
85 — =7 —
50 45 | 45 [ 45 | 45| 45 | 45 [ 45T a5 1451 45 | 45 | 45| 45 [45] 45
—
70 P4545 | 45 | 45 | 45 | 45| 45 | 45|45 | 45 | 65 [ 65165 65 |
20 45 | 45 (45| 45| 45 | 45 [ 45| 45 | 45| 45| 45 | 45| 45 [45]| 45

-rx
#
:

4.5 45 |45 | 45 [ 45 (45 | 45 45 6.5

45 :
100 | 85 —
>< 45 | 45 | 45| 45| 45 s a54s| 45 | 45 | 65| 45 |65] 65
ST 65 [ ©

IS
n
IS
n

:
d
|
?

4.5 45 | 45| 45 | 65 | 65 | 65 /A
4.5 45 | 45 | 45 | 45 | 45 | 45 | 45 6.5

45 | 45

&

n
.&
n
»
wn
&
n

45 | a5 [ ast45 | 45 | 45 [ 45| 45 |45 | 45 | 45 | 65{45165] 65
1o | 1o 45 |45 |45 | 45 | 45 | 45 a5 o565 | 45 | 65 | 65| 65 [65] NA
>J_.;,,4,s——4rs”i.’5’ 45 | 65 | 65| 65 |NA| 65 | NA | NA | WA NALNA |
20 45 |45 |45 | 45 | 45 |45 45| a5 |65 | 45 | 45 | 65| 45 |65| Na
| >< F‘F%—u‘\g_ 63 |45 |45 65|45 |6 | NA+65 65 | NA
45 |45 |65 | 45| 45 | 65 [ asTosfmal 65 | NA |NA | NA [NA| MA
| 45+65 1 45 | 65 | NA | 65 | NA | NA | WA | N/A | NIA [ N7A

20 45 | 45 | 65 | 45 | 45 | 65 | 45| 65 |NA| 45 | 65 |[NA| 65 |[NA| NA
22 | 58
. 45 |45 [ o545 45 | NA |45 | 65 |NA| 65 | NA | NAT65NA| NA
1 1 e
45 | 65 | NA| 45 | 65 | NA | 65 AT A | N/A [ N/A | N/A [NA| NA
4 | 65— N/A 65 | N/A | NIA [ N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | NIA | NIA [N7A- A
20 6.5 N/A | NA | 65 | N/A | NIA | N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | NIA | N/A | N/A [NIA| N/A
—— ==
65 | NAWATNALNA | NA |NA | NA | WA | A | NA [Na-wA WA | NA
— | 130 e =
NA | NA | NA | VA | NA | A TATIATA | NA | VA | N/A | /A |WA| NiA
T
| NATIVA | N/A | N/A | N/A [ N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A [ N7A TN





[image: image6.png]Produced with a Trial Version of PDF Annotator - www.PDF Annotator.com

PRE-ENGINEERED
'WOOD ROOF TRUSS

ATTACH PER CODE

CAP PLATE
TOP PLATE

‘CONTINUOUS
SEALANT EACH
SIDE OF FRAMING
AS RECOMMENDED
BY MANUFACTURER

SIP WALL PANEL

h =254 mm.

| PRESSED METAL
GUSSET PLATE

o0 o
\o o o
o\ o
o\o o
o ol
o o\

= GAP/TOP PLATE

~ CONNECTION
IN ACCORDANCE
WITH R602.3()-

oo o

C({(aol

8d COMMON NAILS

FIGURE R613.5(3)

AT 6 IN. O.C. EACH SIDE

CONTINUOUS SEALANT

TRUSSED ROOF TO TOP PLATE CONNECTION




[image: image7.png]Produced with a Trial Version of PDF Annotator - www.PDF Annotator.com

SIP WALL r !

CONTINUOUS
SEALANT EACH SIDE

2x SOLE PLATE
MATCHING THE SIP
CORE THICKNESS

8d NAILSAT 6 IN.
0.C.EACH SIDE

RIM BOARD
CAP PLATE

8d NAILSAT 6 IN.
0.C. EACH SIDE

CONTINUOUS
SEALANT EACH SIDE

For SI:  1inch =254 mm.

Note: Figures illustrate SIP-specific attachment requirements. Other connections shall be made in accordance with

SOLE PLATE CONNECTION
IN ACCORDANCE WITH

TABLE-RE62:3t1~ R{‘QL

FLOOR SHEATHING AND
FRAMING IN ACCORDANCE
WITH SECTION R502

FLOOR JOIST

INSULATION

TOP PLATE

FIGURE R613.5(4)
SIP WALL TO WALL PLATFORM FRAME CONNECTION




[image: image8.png]Produced with a Trial Version of PDF Annotator - www.PDF Annotator.com

WALL CONSTRUCTION

SIP WALL

SOLE PLATE CONNECTION IN
] ACCORDANCE WITH
TABLER6023(H~ _§ GCTIOM RuoZ
CONTINUOUS CAP PLATE
SEALANT EACH SIDE TO PLATE
2x SOLE PLATE FLOOR SHEATHING
AND FRAMING IN
MATCHING THE SIP | ANDERAMNGIN
CORE THICKNESS

BINAILSAT6IN. — |

0.C.EACH SIDE

SECTION R502

8d NAILS AT 6 IN. FLOOR JOIST
0.C. EACH SIDE
0‘) Vv
CONTINUOUS (.{\ )
SEALANT EACH SIDE 66 Q-(,

For S 1 inch =25.4 mm.

Note: Figures illustrate SIP-specific attachment requirements. Other connections shall be made in accordance with Tgerﬂé@i—?m

. as appropriate.

FIGURE R613.5(5)

SIP WALL TO WALL BALLOON FRAME CONNECTION

2x TOP PLATE RECESSED
INTO THE SIP CORE, WIDTH
EQUAL TO SIP CORE WIDTH

ForSI:  linch =254 mm.

Notes:
1. Top plates shall be continuous over header.

(I-Joist floor shown for lllustration only)

TOP PLATE
CAP PLATE

SIP HEADER

2x KING STUD RECESSED INTO
THE SIP CORE, WIDTH EQUAL
TO SIP CORE WIDTH

2x TOP PLATE RECESSED INTO
LOWER SIP

2x JACK STUD RECESSED
INTO THE SIP CORE, WIDTH
EQUAL TO SIP CORE WIDTH

u”

2. Lower2 xtop plate shall have a width equal to the SIP core width and shall be recessed into the top edge of the panel. Cap plate shall be placed over the recessed top

plate and shall have a width equal to the SIPs width.

3. SIP facing surfaces shall be nailed to framing and cripples with 8d common or galvanized box nails spaced 6 inches on center.

4. Galvanized nails shall be hot-dipped or tumbled. Framing shall be attached in accordance to Section

unless otherwise provide forin Section R613.

FIGURE R613.5.1
SIP WALL FRAMING CONFIGURATION




[image: image9.png]Produced with a Trial Version of PDF Annotator - www.PDF Annotator.com

MAXIMUM SPANS FOR 117/, INCH DEEP SIP HEADERS (feet)

TABLE R614.10

BUILDING WIDTH (feet)

24

32

LOAD CONDITION \swow LOAD (p:/
20

4 4 4 2
Supporting roof 30 / d
only \5(/ 2
7 p
/20\ 2 2 N/A N/A N/A
—
Supporting roof / 30 2 2 N/A NA _— N/A
andonestory |/ 5 2 N/A [—rr—] N/A N/A
70 N/A N/A N/A





[S4570]
R615.1 – Change to read as shown.

R615.1 Impact resistant coverings shall be tested at 1.5 times the design pressure (positive or negative) expressed in pounds per square feet as determined by the Florida Building Code, Building Section 1609 for which the specimen is to be tested. The design pressures, as determined from Section 1609 of the Florida Building Code, Building or ASCE 7, are permitted to be multiplied by 0.6.
[S4574]
R615.2. Labels – Change to read as shown.

R615.2. Labels. A permanent label shall be provided by the product approval holder on all impact resistant coverings.

R615.2.1  The following information shall be included on the labels on impact resistant coverings:

1.      Product approval holder name and address. 
2.      All applicable methods of approval. Methods of approval include, but, are not limited to Miami-Dade NOA; Florida Building Commission, TDI Product Evaluation; ICC-ES.
3.      The test standard or standards specified at Section 1609.1.4, including standards referenced within the test standards specified at Section 1609.1.4 used to demonstrate code compliance. 
4.      For products with a Florida Product Approval Number or a Miami-Dade County Building and Neighborhood Code Compliance Office Department Notice of Acceptance Number (NOA), such numbers shall be included on the label. 
[S4573]

R617.4 Installation – Change to read as shown.
R617.4 Installation.  All manufactured soffit materials shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions and in accordance with the product approval. Installation instructions shall be provided and shall be available to inspection personnel on the job site. Soffit pieces, components, fasteners, and other parts evaluated by an approved product evaluation entity, certification agency, testing laboratory, architect, or engineer and approved by the holder of the product approval may be interchangeable in manufactured soffit systems provided that the soffit system component or components provide equal or greater structural performance and durability as demonstrated by testing in accordance with approved test standards.

  All exterior wall coverings and soffits shall be capable of resisting the design pressures specified for walls for components and cladding loads in accordance with Section R703.1.1. Manufactured soffits shall be tested at 1.5 times the design pressure. For testing purposes, the design pressures determined from Section 1609 of the Florida Building Code, Building or ASCE 7, are permitted to be multiplied by 0.6.
[S4576]
Chapter 7 – WALL COVERING
Table R703.3.3(1)  and Table R703.3.3(2) – Change to read as shown.
Table R703.3.3(1)

In the table heading, change “Wind Speed (mph)” to “Maximum Vasd determined in accordance with Section R301.2.1.3.”

Table R703.3.3(2)
In the table heading, change “Wind Speed (mph)” to “Maximum Vasd determined in accordance with Section R301.2.1.3.”

[S4577]

Table R703.3.4(1) and Table R703.3.4(2) – Change to read as shown.
Table R703.3.4(1)
In the table heading, change “Wind Speed (mph)” to “Maximum Vasd determined in accordance with Section R301.2.1.3.”

Table R703.3.4(2)
In the table heading, change “Wind Speed (mph)” to “Maximum Vasd determined in accordance with Section R301.2.1.3.”
[S4578]
Table R703.4 – A code section reference in the row for Vinyl Siding is apparently incorrect.  In the row for Vinyl Siding, the last entry, change the Section reference from R703.3.4 to R703.11, as follows:

Table R703.4, row for Vinyl Siding, last entry:  See Section R703.3.4 R703.11.
[S4797]

R703.8 Flashing – Change to read as shown.

R703.8 Flashing. Approved corrosion-resistant flashing shall be applied shingle-fashion in a manner to prevent entry of water into the wall cavity or penetration of water to the building structural framing components. Self-adhered membranes used as flashing shall comply with AAMA 711. The flashing shall extend to the surface of the exterior wall finish. Approved corrosion-resistant flashings shall be installed at all of the following locations: 

1. Exterior window and door openings. Flashing at exterior window and door openings shall extend to the surface of the exterior wall finish or to the water-resistive barrier for subsequent drainage. Flashing at exterior window and door openings shall be installed in accordance with one or more of the following or other approved method:

1.1 The fenestration manufacturer’s written flashing instructions.

1.2 The flashing manufacturer’s written installation instructions.

1.3 In accordance with FMA/AAMA 100, FMA/AAMA 200, or FMA/WDMA 250.

1.4 In accordance with the flashing method of a registered licensed design professional.

 2. At the intersection of chimneys or other masonry construction with frame or stucco walls, with projecting lips on both sides under stucco copings.

3. Under and at the ends of masonry, wood or metal copings and sills.

4. Continuously above all projecting wood trim.

5. Where exterior porches, decks or stairs attach to a wall or floor assembly of wood-frame construction.

6. At wall and roof intersections.

7. At built-in gutters.

[S4579]

R704 – Change to read as shown.
SECTION R704
INSPECTION FOR TERMITES
 In order to provide for inspection for termite infestation, clearance between exterior wall coverings and final earth grade on the exterior of a building shall not be less than 6 inches (152 mm).

Exceptions:
1.    Paint or decorative cementitious finish less than 5/8 inch (17.1 mm) thick adhered directly to the masonry foundation sidewall.

2.    Access or vehicle ramps which rise to the interior finish floor elevation for the width of such ramps only.

3.    A 4-inch (102 mm) inspection space above patio and garage slabs and entry areas.

4.    If the patio has been soil treated for termites, the finish elevation may match the building interior finish floor elevations on masonry construction only. 

5.    Masonry veneers constructed in accordance with R318.4.
[S4580]
Chapter 8 – ROOF-CEILING CONSTRUCTION
R802.1.6.1 Truss design drawings. – Change to read as shown.

R802.1.6.1 Truss design drawings. Truss design drawings, prepared in conformance with Section R802.1.6.1, shall be provided to the building official and approved prior to installation. Truss design drawings shall include, at a minimum, the information specified below. Truss design drawing shall be provided with the shipment of trusses delivered to the jobsite.

1. Ultimate Ddesign wind speed, Vult and exposure category.

2.-13. (no change to remainder)

[S4581]
Section R802.1.6.2.1 (IRC R802.10.2.1).  Revise to delete this section.  

R802.1.6.2.1 [IRC R802.10.2.1] Applicability limits. Reserved. The provisions of this section shall control the design of truss roof framing when snow controls for buildings not greater than 60 feet (18 288 mm) in length perpendicular to the joist, rafter or truss span, not greater than 36 feet (10 973 mm) in width parallel to the joist, rafter or truss span, not greater than two stories in height with each story not greater than 10 feet (3048 mm) high, and roof slopes not smaller than 3:12 (25-percent slope) or greater than 12:12 (100-percent slope). Truss roof framing constructed in accordance with the provisions of this section shall be limited to sites subjected to a maximum design wind speed of 110 miles per hour (49 m/s), Exposure A, B or C, and a maximum ground snow load of 70 psf (3352 Pa). For consistent loading of all truss types, roof snow load is to be computed as: 0.7 pg.
Comment after Glitch

R802.1.8.2 Engineered wood products – Change to read as shown.
R802.1.8.2 Engineered wood products. Cuts, notches and holes bored in trusses, structural composite lumber, structural glue-laminated members or I-joists are prohibited except where permitted by the manufacturer’s recommendations or where the effects of such alterations are specifically considered in the design of the member by a licensed registered design professional.
[S4582]
R802.1.9 R802.2.9.1 [IRC R802.11.1] Uplift resistance – Change to read as shown.
R802.1.9 R802.2.9.1 [IRC R802.11.1] Uplift resistance. (no change to text)

[S4584]

R802.2.2 Allowable ceiling joist spans – Reserve text and delete remainder of text and tables in R802.2.2. 
R802.2.2 Allowable ceiling joist spans. Reserved. 
[S4583]

Table R802.1.9 R802.2.9.1 – Change table number and heading to read as shown. Delete all rows for Wind Speeds of 85 mph, 90 mph, and 100 mph.  Add new note “g” as shown:
Table R802.1.9 R802.2.9.1
In table heading change “Basic Wind Speed” to “Ultimate Design Wind Speed, Vult.”

 No change to table or notes a – f.
g. For Ultimate design wind speeds, Vult greater than 150 mph, wind uplift forces shall be determined in accordance with Section R802.3 or ASCE 7.
 [S4585]

Chapter 9 – ROOF ASSEMBLIES

Table R903.2.1 METAL FLASHING MATERIAL – Change to read as shown.
Table R903.2.1
METAL FLASHING MATERIAL
	MATERIAL
	GAGE MINIMUM

THICKNESS 

(Inches)
	GAGE
	WEIGHT (lbs per sq ft)

	Copper
	0.024
	 
	1 (16 oz)

	Aluminum
	0.024
	 
	28

	Stainless Steel
	 
	28
	 

	Galvanized Steel
	0.0179
	26(zinc coated G90)
	26 (zinc coated G90)

	Aluminum Zinc
	0.0179
	26 (AZ50

Alum Zinc)
	26 (AZ50 Alum Zinc)

	Zinc Alloy
	0.027
	 
	 

	Lead
	 
	 
	2.5 (40 oz)

	Painted Terne
	 
	 
	1.25 (20 oz)


[R4815]

Table R905.2.6.1 – Replace table to read as shown:

Table R905.2.6.1
Wind Resistance of Asphalt Shingles
	Classification of Asphalt Shingles 

	Maximum Basic Wind Speed From Figure R301.2(4)
	Vasd
	ASTM D 7158
	ASTM D 3161

	130
	85
	D, G or H
	A, D or F

	140
	90
	D, G or H
	A, D or F

	150
	100
	G or H
	A, D or F

	160
	110
	G or H
	F

	170
	120
	G or H
	F

	180
	130
	H
	F

	190
	140
	H
	F

	200
	150
	H
	F


[R4657] COMMENT AFTER GLITCH
R905.3 – R905.3.8 – Change to read as shown.

R905.3 Clay and concrete tile. The installation of clay and concrete shall be in accordance with the recommendations of FRSA/TRI 07320 where the Vasd is determined in accordance with Section 1609.3.1 or the recommendations of RAS 118, 119 or 120.

R905.3.1 Deck requirements. [No change to text] 
R905.3.2 Deck slope. Clay and concrete roof tile shall be installed on roof slopes in accordance with the recommendations of FRSA/TRI 07320 where the Vasd is determined in accordance with Section 1609.3.1 or the recommendations of RAS 118, 119 or 120.

 R905.3.3. Underlayment.  Required underlayment shall conform with ASTM D 226, Type II; ASTM D 2626 Type II; ASTM D 1970 or ASTM D 6380 Class M and shall be installed in accordance with the recommendations of FRSA/TRI 07320 where the Vasd  is determined in accordance with Section 1609.3.1 or the recommendations of RAS 118, 119 or 120.

 R905.3.3.1 Slope and underlayment requirements. Refer to FRSA/TRI 07320 where the Vasd is determined in accordance with Section 1609.3.1 or RAS 118, 119 or 120 for underlayment and slope requirements for specific roof tile systems.
R905.3.3.2 High slope roofs. Reserved.

R905.3.3.3 Underlayment and high wind. Reserved.
 R905.3.4 – R905.3.5 [No change to text]
R905.3.6 Fasteners.    Nails shall be corrosion-resistant and not less than 11 gage, 5/16-inch (mm) head, and of sufficient length to penetrate the deck a minimum of ¾ inch (19.1 mm) or through the thickness of the deck, whichever is less or in accordance with the recommendations of FRSA/TRI 07320 where the Vasd is determined in accordance with Section 1609.3.1 or in accordance with the recommendations of RAS 118, 119 or 120. Attaching wire for clay or concrete tile shall not be smaller that 0.083 (2.1 mm).

 R905.3.7 Application. Tile shall be applied in accordance with this chapter and the manufacturer's installation instructions, or recommendation of FRSA/TRI 07320 based on the following:

Attachment. Clay and concrete roof tile shall be fastened in accordance with FRSA/TRI 07320 where the Vasd is determined in accordance with Section 1609.3.1.

R905.3.7.1. Hip and Ridge tiles. Hip and ridge tiles shall be installed in accordance with the recommendations of FRSA/TRI 07320 where the Vasd is determined in accordance with Section 1609.3.1.

 

Table R905.3.7 Clay and Concrete Tile Attachment. Reserved.

R905.3.8 Flashing. At the juncture of roof vertical surfaces, flashing and counter flashing shall be provided in accordance with this chapter and the manufacturer’s installation instructions or in accordance with the recommendations of FRSA/TRI 07320 where the Vasd is determined in accordance with Section 1609.3.1 or the recommendations of RAS 118, 119 or 120.

[R4854]

Table R905.7.7 – Change title to read as shown. No other changes to table.
R905.7.7 WOOD SHAKE SHINGLE WEATHER EXPOSURE AND ROOF SLOPE
[R4814]

Table R905.10.3(1) – Change to read as shown.
Table R905.10.3(1), METAL ROOF COVERINGS STANDARDS.  Reserved.
[R4586]
Chapter 16 – DUCT SYSTEMS

Table M1601.4 – Change (in part) to read as shown:

TABLE M1601.4 

DUCT SYSTEM CONSTRUCTION AND SEALING

	DUCT TYPE/CONNECTION
	SEALING REQUIREMENTS
	MECHANICAL ATTACHMENT

	Mechanical closets
	All joints between the air barriers of walls, ceiling, floor and door framing and all penetrations of the air barrier shall be sealed to the air barrier with approved closure systems. Through-wall, through-floor and through-ceiling air passageways into the closet shall be framed and sealed to form an air-tight passageway.

Exception: Air passageways into the closet from conditioned space that are specifically designed for return air flow.

The following air barriers are approved for use in mechanical closets:

1. One-half-inch-thick (12.7 mm) or greater gypsum wallboard, taped and sealed with joint compound over taped joints between gypsum wallboard panels.

2. Other panelized materials having inward facing surfaces with an air porosity no greater than that of a duct product meeting Section 22 of UL 181 which are sealed on all interior surfaces to create a continuous air barrier by one of the following:

a. Sealants complying with the product and application standards of this table for fibrous glass ductboard or 
b. A suitable long-life caulk or mastic for all applications.
	The following closure systems are approved for use in mechanical closets:

1. Gypsum wallboard joint compound over taped joints between gypsum wallboard panels.

2. Sealants complying with the product and application standards of Table 503.2.7.2 for fibrous glass ductboard.

3. A suitable long-life caulk or mastic compliant with the locally adopted mechanical code for all applications.


Comment after Glitch

M1602.4. Add to read as follows: 

M1602.4 Balanced Return Air. Restricted return air occurs in buildings when returns are located in central zones and closed interior doors impede air flow to the return grill or when ceiling spaces are used as return plenums and fire walls restrict air movement from one portion of the return plenum to another. Provisions shall be made in both residential and commercial buildings to avoid unbalanced air flows and pressure differentials caused by restricted return air. Pressure differentials across closed doors where returns are centrally located shall be limited to 0.01 inch WC (2.5 pascals) or less. Pressure differentials across fire walls in ceiling space plenums shall be limited to 0.01 inch WC (2.5 pascals) by providing air duct pathways or air transfer pathways from the high pressure zone to the low zone.

Exceptions:  

1. Transfer ducts may achieve this by increasing the return transfer 1½  times the cross sectional area (square inches) of the supply duct entering the room or space it's serving and the door having at least an unrestricted 1 inch undercut to achieve proper return air balance.

2. Transfer grilles shall use 50 square inches (of grille area) to 100 cfm (of supply air) for sizing through-the-wall transfer grilles and using an unrestricted 1 inch undercutting of doors to achieve proper return air balance.

3. Habitable rooms only shall be required to meet these requirements for proper balanced return air excluding bathrooms, closets, storage rooms and laundry rooms, except that all supply air into the master suite shall be inlcuded.
Comment after Glitch
Chapter 34 General Requirements
3404 – Change to delete as shown. 

Section 3404 GFCI Protection 

  

3404.1 NFPA 70 - 08: National Electric Code, Article 680 (Swimming Pools, Fountains, and Similar Installation), Section 680.22(B), GFCI Protection, is amended to read as follows: 

  

(B) GFCI Protection. Outlets supplying pool pump motors from branch circuits with short-circuit and ground-fault protection rated 15 or 20 amperes, 125 volt or 240 volt, single phase, whether by receptacle or direct connection, shall be provided with ground-fault circuit-interrupter protection for personnel. 

  Exception: One-and two-family dwellings.     

[E4848]


Chapter 43 – Referenced Standards 

AAF – Change to read as shown. 

AAF -  2010 Guide to Aluminum Construction in High Wind Areas 2010  2007-1 

[S4591] 

ACCA – Change to read as shown. 

	Standard reference number 
	Title 
	Referenced in Code Section Number 

	ACCA Manual D-1995 
	Residential Duct Systems                     
	N1110.AB.1 M1601.1

	ACCA Manual J-2003 
	Residential Load Calculation, Eighth Edition with posted updates/errata 
	N1107.AB.1 

 


[EN4592] 


ANSI – Change to read as shown:
ANSI
American National Standards Institute 
25 West 43rd Street, Fourth Floor 
New York, NY 10036 
Standard reference number               Title                    

    Referenced in code section number

A97.1            
Specification for the Application and Finishing of Gypsum Wallboard 
GA – Add to read as shown:

GA
Gypsum Association
810 First Street, Northeast, Suite 510 
Washington, DC 20002-4268

Standard reference number               Title                  
      Referenced in code section number

GA-216-07 
Application and finishing of gypsum panel products
GA-600-06 
Fire resistance design manual
[S4760]
ASCE/SEI – Change to read as shown.
ASCE/SEI
American Society of Civil Engineers

Structural Engineering Institute

1801 Alexander Bell Drive

Reston, VA 20191-4400

 
Standard reference number               Title                        

Referenced in code section number

7-10     

Minimum Design Loads for Buildings and Other Structures 
(with Errata dated January 11, 2011)
[S4593]
ASTM – Change to read as shown:

ASTM
ASTM International

100 Barr Harbor Drive

West Conshohocken, PA 19428-2959

Standard reference number               Title                       

 Referenced in code section number

…
C 509-00               Elastomeric Cellular Preformed Gaskets and Sealing Material      
     R4410.2.3.4
…
C 864-05               Dense Elastomeric Compression Seal Gaskets, Setting Blocks, and Spacers   R4410.2.3.4
[S4807]

DHS/FEMA – Change to read as shown:
DHS/FEMA

P2601.3
FIA-TB-11-01
Standard reference number               Title                      

  Referenced in code section number

 

TB–2—93 


Flood–resistant Materials Requirements                   R323.17
[S4515]

Chapter 44 – HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE
R4402.6.5.2 – Change to read as shown:

R4402.6.5.2 Such fasteners shall be applied through T tin caps no less than 15/8-inches (41 mm) and not more than 2-inches (51 mm) in diameter and of not less than 32 gauge (0.010 inch) sheet metal. Cap nails or prefabricated fasteners with integral heads complying with this section shall be an acceptable substitute. All tin caps, cap nails, or prefabricated fasteners with integral heads shall be tested for corrosion resistance in compliance with TAS 114 Appendix E, Section 2 (ASTM G 85), and shall be have Product Approved Approval. All of cartons or carton labels for tin caps, cap nails​, or prefabricated fasteners with integral heads shall be labeled to note compliance with the corrosion resistance requirements.

[R4594] 

R4402.10.18.1 – Change to read as shown.

R4402.10.18.1 No sprayed polyurethane foam (PUF) and/or elastomeric coating systems shall be applied over existing composition shingles.
[R4850]

R4403.12.1.1 – Change exception to read as shown.

R4403.12.1.1 (no change)

Exception: Screen enclosures shall be permitted to be designed in accordance with the AAF Guide to Aluminum Construction in High Wind Areas. Construction documents based on the AAF Guide to Aluminum Construction in High Wind Areas shall be prepared and signed and sealed by an a Florida licensed architect or engineer.
[S4596]
R4403.12.2.2 – Change to read as shown.
R4403.12.2.2 Permanent frame shall be designed per section 1620 and 1622.1.2, or 1622.1.3. 4403.9 and 4402.12.1.2.
[S4595]

R4403.13.1 FLOOD RESISTANCE – Change to read as shown.
R4403.13.1 FLOOD RESISTANCE
R4403.13.1.1 Flood resistance. Where the building or structure is located in a flood hazard area areas established in Table 301.2(1), the building or structure, including enclosures below elevated buildings, shall be designed and constructed in accordance with Section R322 and this section.

[S4516]
R4403.13.1.2.2 – Change to read as shown.

R4403.13.1.2.2 Sunroom Categories. For the purpose of applying the criteria of the AAMA Standard for sunrooms based on the intended use, s Sunrooms shall be categorized in one of the following categories by the permit applicant, design professional, or the property owner where the sunroom is being constructed.
[S4601]
TABLE R4403.15.4 – Change to read as shown.
TABLE R4403.15.4
FATIGUE LOADING SEQUENCE

	RANGE OF TEST
	NUMBER OF CYCLES1

	0 to 0.5pmax2
	600

	0 to 0.6pmax
	70

	0 to 1.3pmax
	1


 

	1. Each cycle shall have minimum duration of 1 second and a maximum duration of 3 seconds and must be performed in a continuous manner.
2. pmax = 0.6 x ultimate design load in accordance with ASCE 7.The design wind load for the height and location, when the assembly will be used. For wall and roof components, shape factors given in ASCE 7 shall be used.


[S4804]

TABLE R4403.16 – Change to read as shown.
TABLE R4403.16
CYCLIC WIND PRESSURE LOADING

	INWARD ACTING PRESSURE 
	OUTWARD ACTING PRESSURE 

	RANGE 
	NUMBER OF CYCLES1 
	RANGE 
	NUMBER OF CYCLES1 

	0.2 Pmaxto 0.5 Pmax2 
	3,500 
	0.3 Pmaxto 1.0 Pmax 
	50 

	0.0 Pmaxto 0.6 Pmax
	300 
	0.5 Pmaxto 0.8 Pmax
	1,050 

	0.5 Pmaxto 0.8 Pmax
	600 
	0.0 Pmaxto 0.6 Pmax 
	50 

	0.3 Pmaxto 1.0 Pmax 
	100 
	0.2 Pmaxto 0.5 Pmax 
	3,350 


 

	Notes:

1. Each cycle shall have minimum duration of 1 second and a maximum duration of 3 seconds and must be performed in a continuous manner 1.

2. Pmax= 0.6 x ultimate denotes maximum design load in accordance with ASCE 7. The pressure spectrum shall be applied to each test specimen beginning with inward acting pressures followed by the outward acting pressures in the order from the top of each column to the bottom of each column. 


[S4805]
R4407.5.1 Standards. – Change to read as shown.

R4407.5.1 Standards. The provisions of TMS 402/ACI 530/ASCE 5 and TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE6 are hereby adopted as a minimum for the design and construction of reinforced unit masonry. In addition to TMS 402/ ACI 530/ ASCE 5 and TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE6 reinforced unit masonry structures shall comply with Sections 4407.2.
Exception:  (no change)

[S4604]
R4407.5.2 General – Change to read as shown.  
R4407.5.2 General. Reserved
[S4605]

R4409.5.1.3.3 – Change to read as shown.

R4409.5.1.3.3 Stud walls framing into base plates of exterior walls and interior bearing walls resting on masonry or concrete shall be anchored past the plate to the masonry or concrete, or shall be anchored to a sill plate which is anchored in accordance with Section R4409.5.1.4.1 when the net wind uplift is up to 500 300 pounds per foot (4378 N/m).

[S4606]

R4411.4.2 Standards – Change to read as shown. 
R4411.4.2 Standards. The following standards are adopted as set forth in Chapter 43.
 
Standard Specification for the Application and Finishing of Gypsum Wallboard, ANSI A97.1.
Application and finishing of gypsum panel products GA-216-07
Fire Resistance Design Manual GA-600-06
[S4758]

