Supplement to the 2007 Florida Building Code, 2008

Building (without energy)

Preface

Preface, after the section, Adoption and Maintenance, add text to read as follows:

Letter Designations in Front of Section Numbers

In each code development cycle, proposed changes to the code are considered at the Code Development Hearings by the ICC Fire Code Development Committee, whose action constitutes a recommendation to the voting membership for final action on the proposed change. Proposed changes to a code section that has a number beginning with a letter in brackets are considered by a different code development committee. For example, proposed changes to code sections that have [F] in front of them (e.g. [F] 903.1.1.1) are considered by the ICC Fire Code Development Committee at the code development hearings.

The content of sections in this code that begin with a letter designation are maintained by another code development committee in accordance with the following:

[E] = International Energy Conservation Code Development Committee;

[EB] = International Existing Building Code Development Committee;

[EL] = ICC Electrical Code Development Committee;

[F] = International Fire Code Development Committee;

[FG] = International Fuel Gas Code Development Committee;

[M] = International Mechanical Code Development Committee; and

[P] = International Plumbing Code Development Committee.
[Mod 2862]

Chapter 1 Administration
Section 105.3.1.2 revise to add item 5 to read as follows:

105.3.1.2  No change.

5.  Electrical documents.  See Florida Statutes 471.003(h).

[Mod 2863]

Section 105.15, add text to read as follows:

105.15 When any activity requiring a building permit that is applied for on or after July 1, 2008, and for which the estimated cost is $50,000 or more for a building that is located in the wind borne debris region as defined in the Florida Building Code and that has an insured value of $750,000 or more, or, if the building is uninsured or for which documentation of insured value is not presented, has a just valuation for the structure for purposes of ad valorem taxation of $750,000 or more.
Opening protections as required within the Florida Building Code, Building or Florida Building Code, Residential for new construction shall be provided.

[Mod 3050rev and Mod 3118]

Chapter 2 Definitions
Section 202, Definitions, revise text to read as follows:
Section 202, Definitions

AGRICULTURAL, BUILDING. Reserved.  A structure designed and constructed to house farm implements, hay, grain, poultry, livestock or other horticultural products. This structure shall not be a place of human habitation or a place of employment where agricultural products are processed, treated or packaged, nor shall it be a place used by the public.
[Mod 3067]
Add text to read as follows:

CARBON MONOXIDE ALARM. A device for the purpose of detecting carbon monoxide, that produces a distinct audible alarm, and is listed or labeled with the appropriate standard, either ANSI/UL 2034 - 96, Standard for Single and Multiple Station CO Alarms, or UL 2075 - 04, Gas and Vapor Detector Sensor, in accordance with its application. 
[Mod 3025]

Revise text to read as follows:

DESIGN DISPLACEMENT. Reserved See Section 1908.1.3.
[Mod 3307]

Add text to read as follows:

FOSSIL FUEL. Coal, kerosene, oil, fuel gases, or other petroleum or hydrocarbon product that emits carbon monoxide as a by-product of combustion.
[Mod 3025]

Revise text to read as follows:

ORDINARY PRECAST STRUCTURALWALL. Reserved See Section 1908.1.3.

ORDINARY REINFORCED CONCRETE STRUCTURALWALL. Reserved See Section 1908.1.3.

ORDINARY STRUCTURAL PLAIN CONCRETE WALL. Reserved See Section 1908.1.3.

[Mod 3307]

SUNROOM. See Section 1202.1.  A one-story structure added to an existing dwelling with an open or glazed area in excess of 40 percent of the gross area of the sunroom structure’s exterior walls and roof. For the purposes of this code the term “sunroom” as used herein, shall include conservatories, sun spaces, solariums, and porch or patio covers or enclosures.
SUNROOM ADDITION. Reserved.  See Section 1202.1.
[Mod 2851, Mod 3229, Mod 3025 and Staff]  
TOWNHOUSE. A single-family dwelling unit constructed in a group of three or more attached units with property lines separating each unit in which each unit extends from foundation to roof and with open space on at least two sides.
[Mod 2968]

Chapter 3 Use and Occupancy Classification

Section 302.1 General, revise text to read as follows:

302.1 General. Structures or portions of structures shall be classified with respect to occupancy in one or more of the groups listed below. A room or space that is intended to be occupied at different times for different purposes shall comply with all of the requirements that are applicable to each of the purposes for which the room or space will be occupied. Structures with multiple occupancies or uses shall comply with Section 508 302.2. Where a structure is proposed for a purpose that which is not specifically provided for in this code, such structure shall be classified in the group that which the occupancy most nearly resembles, according to the fire safety and relative hazard involved.

1. Assembly (see Section 303): Groups A-1, A-2, A-3, A-4 and A-5

2. Business (see Section 304): Group B

3. Educational (see Section 305): Group E

4. Factory and Industrial (see Section 306): Groups F-1, F-2 and F-3.

5. High Hazard (see Section 307): Groups H-1, H-2, H-3, H-4 and H-5

6. Institutional (see Section 308): Groups I-1, I-2 and I-3

7. Mercantile (see Section 309): Group M

8. Residential (see Section 310): Groups R-1, R-2, R-3 as applicable in Section 101.2, and R-4

9. Storage (see Section 311): Groups S-1 and S-2

10. Utility and Miscellaneous (see Section 312): Group U

11. Day care (see Section 313): Group D

[Mod 2845]

Chapter 4 Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy
Section 412.2.1 Exterior walls, revise text to read as follows:

412.2.1 Exterior walls.  Exterior walls located less than 30 feet (9 144 mm) from property lines, lot lines or a public way shall have a fire-resistance rating not less than 2 hours.

[Mod 3235]

Section 419.3.12.4 Carbon monoxide detector, revise text to read as follows:

419.3.12.4 Carbon monoxide detector.  See Section 913.1.

Section 420.3.13.16 Carbon monoxide detector, revise text to read as follows:

420.3.13.16 Carbon monoxide detector.  See Section 913.1.
Section 437.2.6.1.1 Carbon monoxide detector, revise text to read as follows:

437.2.6.1.1 Carbon monoxide detector.  See Section 913.1

[Mod 3025]

Section 423.14.2.1 Emergency rescue windows, revise text to read as follows:

423.14.2.1 Emergency rescue windows. Windows for emergency rescue shall comply with NFPA 101, Florida Edition, as adopted by the Florida Fire Prevention Code, shall be operable from the inside by a single operation, and shall be labeled “EMERGANCY RESCUE – KEEP AREA CLEAR.” Hinged emergency rescue windows shall swing in the direction of egress.

[Mod 2967]

Section 424.1 Public swimming pools and bathing places, revise text to read as follows:

424.1 Public swimming pools and bathing places.  Public swimming pools and bathing places shall comply with the design and construction standards of this section.

NOTE: Other administrative and programmatic provisions may apply. See Department of Health (DOH) Rule 64E-9, Florida Administrative Code and Chapter 514, Florida Statutes.

"Bathing load" means the maximum number of persons allowed in the pool or bathing place at one time.

"Collector tank" means a reservoir, with a minimum of 2.25 square feet water surface area open to the atmosphere, from which the recirculation or feature pump takes suction, which may receives the gravity flow from the main drain line and surface overflow system or feature water source line.

Add text to read as follows:

“Effective Barrier” – A barrier which consists of a building, or equivalent structure, plus a 48 inch minimum height fence on the remaining sides or a continuous 48 inch minimum height fence. All access through the barrier must have one or more of the following safety features: alarm, key lock or self-locking doors and gates. Safety covers that comply with the American Society for Testing Materials standard F1346 may also be considered as an effective barrier.

“Marking” or “Markings” – Refers to the placement and installation of visual marking cues to help patrons identify step, bench and swimout outlines, slope break location, depth designations, and NO ENTRY and NO DIVING warnings. When markings are specified by code to be dark the term dark shall mean a Munsell Color Value from zero to four. 

Revise text to read as follows:

"Wet deck area" means the 4-foot-wide (1219 mm) unobstructed pool deck area around the outside of the pool water perimeter, curb, ladders, handrails, diving boards, diving towers, or pool slides, waterfalls, water features, starting blocks, planters, or lifeguard chairs.

Section 424.1.1 Sizing, revise text to read as follows:

Section 424.1.1 Sizing – The bathing load for conventional swimming pools and special purpose pools shall be computed on the basis of one person per five gallons per minute (gpm) of recirculation flow. The bathing load for wading pools and interactive water features shall be established by averaging one person per 20 10 square feet of pool area and one person per 5 gallons per minute of filter rate. The bathing load for spa type pools shall be based on one person per each 10 square feet of surface area. The filtration system shall be capable of meeting all other requirements of these rules while providing a flowrate of at least one gallon per minute for each living unit at transient facilities and three-fourths gallon per minute at non-transient facilities. All other types of projects shall be sized according to the anticipated bathing load and proposed uses. For the purpose of determining minimum pool size only, the pool turnover period used cannot be less than three hours.

Section 424.1.2.1 Pool structure, revise text to read as follows:

424.1.2.1 Pool structure.  Pools shall be constructed of concrete or other impervious and structurally rigid material. All pools shall be watertight, free from structural cracks and shall have a nontoxic smooth and slip-resistant finish. Floors and walls shall be white or pastel in color and shall have the characteristics of reflecting rather than absorbing light.  Tile used in less than 5 feet (1524 mm) of water must be slip resistant except for bull-nose tile when utilized as step, bench or swimout markings.  A minimum 4 inch tile line shall be installed at the water line, but shall not exceed 12 inches in height if a dark color is used. Gutter type pools may substitute 2-inch tile along the pool wall edge of the gutter lip. 

Section 424.1.2.2.2 Walls and corners, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.2.2 Walls and corners.   All pool walls shall have a clearance of 15 feet (4572 mm) perpendicular to the wall. Offset steps and spa coves are exempt from this clearance requirement. Where interior steps protrude into the pool resulting in less than 15 feet of clearance from any wall such protrusion shall not exceed six feet on any perpendicular line from a tangent to any pool wall from which the steps emanate. The upper part of pool walls in areas 5 feet deep or less shall be within 5 degrees (4572 mm) vertical for a minimum depth of 2½ feet (762 mm) from which point the wall may join the floor with a maximum radius equal to the difference between the pool depth and 2½ feet. The upper part of pool walls in areas over 5 feet deep shall be within 5 degrees vertical for a minimum depth equal to the pool water depth minus 2½ feet (762 mm) from which point the wall may join the floor with a maximum radius of 2½ feet (762 mm). Corners shall be a minimum 90-degree angle. The corner intersections of walls which protrude or angle into the pool water area shall be rounded with a minimum radius of 2 inches (51 mm).  

Section 424.1.2.2.3.2 revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.2.3.2 Any transition in floor slope shall occur at a minimum of 5 feet (1524 mm) of water depth. A slope transition must shall have a 2 to 6 inch wide (51 mm) dark contrasting tile marking across the bottom and must extend up both sides of the pool at the transition point.  The marking shall be continuous except for recessing grouting.  A slope transition must shall have a safety line mounted by use of recessed cup anchors, 2 feet (610 mm) before the contrasting marking, towards the shallow end. The safety line shall have visible floats at maximum 7-foot (2134 mm) intervals.

Section 424.1.2.3.1 Depth and markings, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.3.1 Depth and markings.  Depth and markings shall meet the following criteria:

1.  The minimum maximum water depth shall be 3 feet in shallow areas and 4 feet in deep areas.

21. Permanent depth markings followed by the appropriate full or abbreviated words "FEET", “FT” or "INCHES", “IN” shall be installed in minimum 4-inch-high (102 mm) numbers and letters on a contrasting background. Depth markers shall indicate the actual pool depth, within 3 inches (76 mm), at normal operating water level when measured 3 feet (914 m3) from the pool wall. Symmetrical pool designs with the deep point at the center may be allowed provided a dual marking system is used which indicates the depth at the wall and at the deep point.

3 2. At a minimum, tThe markings shall be located on both sides of the pool at the shallow end, slope break, deep end wall and deep point (if located more than five feet from the deep end wall). Depth markings shall be legible from inside the pool and also from the pool deck. The  with a maximum perimeter distance between depth markings is of 25 feet (7620 mm). Pool size and geometry may necessitate additional depth marking placements about all sides of the pool to meet this requirement. and shall be legible from inside the pool and also from the pool deck.

 4 3. When a curb is provided, the depth markings shall be installed on the inside and outside or top of the pool curb. When a pool curb is not provided, the depth markings shall be located on the inside vertical wall at or above the water level and on the edge of the deck within  2 two feet of the pool water. When open type gutter designs are utilized, depth markers shall be located on the back of the gutter wall.  
54. When deck level perimeter overflow systems are utilized, additional depth marking signs markers shall be posted nearby or placed on adjacent fencing or walls and the size shall be increased so they are recognizable from inside the swimming pool.  Alternatively tile depth markers may be placed at the top of the pool wall just under the water level. Depth markers placed on the pool deck shall be within 3 three feet of the water.

65.
Those areas of the pool that are not part of an approved diving bowl shall have dark contrasting tile ,permanent,  4-inch-high (102 mm) "NO DIVING" markings installed along the perimeter of the pool on the top of the pool curb or deck within 2 feet (610 mm)of the pool water on each side of the pool with a maximum perimeter distance of 25 feet (7620 mm) between markings. A 6-inch (152 mm) tile with a 4-inch (102 mm) or larger red, international "NO DIVING" symbol may be substituted for the "NO DIVING" markings.

76.
All depth markings shall be tile, except that pools constructed of fiberglass, thermoplastic or stainless steel may substitute other type markings when it can be shown that said markings are permanent and will not fade over time. This exemption does not extend to concrete pools that are coated with fiberglass. Tile alternative examples include stone or manufactured plaques with engraved or sandblasted numbers and characters with permanent paint. Permanent appliqués may be used for fiberglass, thermoplastic or stainless steel pools. All markings installed on horizontal surfaces shall have a slip resistant finish. Markings shall be flush with the surrounding area where placed and recessed if necessary to provide a smooth finish that will avoid creation of an injury hazard to bathers. Pools that are not conducive to tile can employ other equivalent markings as stated above. All depth and "NO DIVING" markings installed on horizontal surfaces shall have a slip-resistant finish.

Section 424.1.2.3.3 Lane markings, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.3.3 Lane markings.  Pools that are not intended to be utilized for officially sanctioned competition may install lap lane markings provided they meet the following criteria: the markings must be 2 to 6  4 inches (102 mm) wide, they must terminate 5 feet (1524 mm) from the end wall in a "T" with the "T" bar at least 18 inches (1524 mm) long, they must be placed at 7-foot (2134 mm) intervals on center and be no closer than 4 feet (1219 mm) from any side wall, steps or other obstructions.  Floating rope lines associated with lap lanes must not obstruct the entrance or exit from the pool and are prohibited when the pool is open for general use.

Section 424.1.2.3.4 Targets, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.3.4 Targets.  Pools that are not intended for officially sanctioned competition may have a 2 to 6  up to 4- inch (102 mm) wide 18-inch by 18-inch (457 mm by 457 mm) targets (+) installed on the pool wall.

Section 424.1.2.5.1 Ladders, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.5.1 Ladders.  Ladders shall be of the cross-braced type and shall be constructed of corrosion-resistant materials and be securely anchored into the pool deck. Clearance between the ladder and pool wall shall be between 3 to 6 inches (76 mm to 152 mm). Ladders shall extend at least 28 inches (711 mm) above the pool deck.  Ladder bottom braces shall have intact end caps or bumpers that rest firmly against the pool wall.

Section 424.1.2.5.3 Stairs, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.5.3 Stairs.  Stairs shall have a minimum tread width of 10 inches (254 mm) and a maximum width of 48 inches for a minimum tread length of 24 inches (610 mm) and a maximum riser height of 10 inches (254 mm). Treads and risers between the top and bottom treads shall be uniform to within 1/2 inch in width and height.  The riser heights shall be measured at the marked step edges and the differences in elevation shall be considered the riser heights.  The front ¾ to 2 inches (19.1 to 51 mm) of the tread and the top 2 inches (51mm) of the riser shall be tile, dark in color, contrasting with the interior of the pool. Tile shall be slip resistant. Bullnose , except when ¾ inch by 2-inch (51 mm) bull-nose tile may be is used when and the ¾ inch (19 mm) segment is placed on the tread or horizontal surface and the 2-inch (51 mm) segment is placed on the riser or vertical surface. All markings shall be tile, except that pools constructed of fiberglass, thermoplastic or stainless steel may substitute other type markings when it can be shown that said markings are permanent and will not fade over time. This exception does not extend to concrete pools that are coated with fiberglass.  

Section 424.1.2.5.4 Swimouts, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.5.4 Swimouts.  Swimouts shall extend 18 to 24 inches (610 mm) back from the pool wall, shall be 4 to 5 feet (1219 mm to 1524 mm) wide, shall be a maximum of 12 inches (305 mm) below the deck, unless stairs are provided in the swimout, and shall be located only in areas of the pool greater than 5 feet (1524 mm) deep. Pools that do not utilize a continuous perimeter overflow system must provide a wall return inlet in the swimout for circulation. A permanent dark contrasting colored band of tile shall be installed at the intersection of the pool wall and the swimout and must extend 2 inches (51 mm) on the horizontal and vertical surfaces. Tile must be slip resistant.  Bullnose  , except that bull-nose tile may be substituted and installed in accordance with Section 424.1.2.5.3 above.

Section 424.1.2.5.5 Handrails and grabrails, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.5.5 Handrails and grabrails.  Handrails shall be provided for all stairs, shall be anchored in the bottom step and the deck. Where "figure 4" deck- mounted type handrails are used, they shall be anchored in the deck and extend laterally to any point vertically above the bottom step. A grabrail shall be provided for all swimouts and shall not protrude more than 6 inches (152 mm) over the water surface. Grabrails must be mounted in the pool deck at each side of recessed steps. Handrails and grabrails shall extend at least 28 inches (28 mm) above the step edge and deck.

Section 424.1.2.5.6 Disabled access, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.5.6 Disabled access.  Permanent or portable steps, ramps, handrails, lifts or other devices designed to accommodate handicapped individuals persons with disabilities in swimming pools may be provided. Lifts mounted into the pool deck shall have a minimum four 4-foot-wide (1219 mm) deck behind the lift mount.

Section 424.1.2.6 Obstructions, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.6 Obstructions.  The pool water area shall be unobstructed by any type structure unless justified by engineering design as a part of the recirculation system. Engineering design and material specifications shall show that such structures will not endanger the pool patron, can be maintained in a sanitary condition and will not create a problem for sanitary maintenance of any part of the pool, pool water, or pool facilities. Structures in accord with the above shall not be located in a diving bowl area or within 15 feet (4572 mm) of any pool wall.

Exceptions:

1.
Stairs, ladders and ramps, necessary for entrance/exit from the pool are not considered obstructions.

2.
Underwater seat benches may be installed in areas less than five 5 feet (1524 mm) deep. Bench seats must be 14 to 18 inches (356 to 457 mm) wide and must have a dark contrasting tile marking on the seat edge extending two 2 inches (51 mm) on the horizontal and vertical surface. If tile is used it must be slip resistant.  , except that Bbullnose tile may be substituted and installed in accordance with Section 424.1.2.5.3.  Benches shall not protrude into the 15 foot clearance requirement of Section 424.1.2.6.

Section 424.1.2.7 Diving areas, revise to read as follows:

424.1.2.7 Diving areas.  Diving facilities shall meet the minimum requirements of the FINA dimensions for diving facilities in accordance with the 1998-2000 FINA Handbook and include the following:

1.
Diving boards or platforms with heights of less than the established standard shall meet the dimensional requirements of the next greater height.

2.
Diving boards, platforms and ladders shall have a nonabsorbent, slip-resistant finish and be of sufficient strength to safely carry the anticipated loads. Diving equipment one meter and greater shall have guard rails which are at least 36 inches (914 mm) above the diving board and extend to the edge of the pool wall. All diving boards over 21 inches (533 mm) from the deck shall be provided with a ladder. Diving boards or platforms shall not be installed on curved walls where the wall enters into the defined rectangular diving area specified in this section. Adjacent platform and diving boards shall be parallel.

3.
The location of pool ladders shall be such that the distance from the ladder to any point on a diving board or platform centerline is not less than the plummet to side wall dimension (b) indicated in the FINA standards. Trampoline-type diving facilities are prohibited.

4.
Diving targets may be installed in accordance with FINA standards.

Section 424.1.3.1.3, revise text to read as follows:

424.1.3.1.3  Pool wet decks shall have a minimum unobstructed width of four 4 feet (1219 mm) around the perimeter of the pool, pool curb, ladders, handrails, diving boards, diving towers and slides. 

Section 424.1.3.1.6, revise to read as follows:
424.1.3.1.6  Ten percent of the deck along the pool perimeter may be obstructed. Obstructions shall have a wet deck area behind or through them, with the near edge of the walk within 15 feet (4572 mm) of the water except approved slide obstructions shall have the near edge of the walk within 35 feet of the water. These obstructions must shall be protected by a barrier or must shall be designed to discourage patron access. When an obstruction exists in multiple areas around the pool the minimum distance between obstructions shall be 4 feet (1219 mm).

Section 424.1.3.1.8, revise to read as follows:
424.1.3.1.8  The vertical clearance above the pool deck shall be at least 7 feet (2137 mm).

Section 424.1.3.1.9 is revised to read as follows:

424.1.3.1.9 All public pools shall be surrounded by a minimum 48 inch high fence. The fence shall be continuous around the perimeter of the pool area that is not otherwise blocked or obstructed by adjacent buildings or structures and shall adjoin with itself or abut to the adjacent members. Access through the barrier other than from doored exits of adjacent building(s) shall be through self-closing self-latching lockable gates of 48 inch minimal height with the latch located a minimum of 54 inches from the bottom of the gate or at least 3 inches below the top of the gate on the pool side. Gates shall open outward away from the pool area. Consideration shall be given to the U.S. Consumer Product Safety Commission (CPSC) Pub. No. 362 guidelines. Safety Covers that comply with ASTM F 1346 do not satisfy this requirement.

424.1.3.1.9 All public pools shall be surrounded by a minimum 48 inch (1219 mm) in height fence. The fence shall be continuous around the perimeter of the pool area that is not otherwise blocked or obstructed by adjacent buildings or structures and shall adjoin with itself or abut to the adjacent members. Access through the barrier other than from doored exits of adjacent building(s) shall be through self-closing, self-latching lockable gates of 48 inch (1219 mm) minimal height with the latch located near the top. Consideration shall be given to the U.S. Consumer Product Safety Commission (CPSC) Pub. No. 362 guidelines. Safety covers that comply with ASTM F 1346 do not satisfy this requirement. 

Section 424.1.4.2.1 Outdoor pool lighting, revise text to read as follows:

424.1.4.2.1 Outdoor pool lighting.  Overhead lighting shall provide a minimum of 3 footcandles (30 lux) of illumination at the pool water surface and the pool wet deck surface. Underwater lighting shall be a minimum of ½ watt per square foot of pool water surface area.

Section 424.1.4.2.2 Indoor pool lighting, revise text to read as follows:
424.1.4.2.2 Indoor pool lighting.   Overhead lighting shall provide a minimum of 10 foot candles of illumination at the pool water surface and the pool wet deck surface. Underwater lighting shall be a minimum of 8/10 watt per square foot of pool surface area.

Section 424.1.4.2.3 Underwater lighting, revise text to read as follows:
424.1.4.2.3 Underwater lighting.  Underwater lighting shall utilize transformers and low-voltage circuits with each underwater light being grounded. The maximum voltage for each light shall be 15 volts and the maximum incandescent lamp size shall be 300 watts. The location of the underwater lights shall be such that the underwater illumination is as uniform as possible and shall not be less than 18 inches (457 mm) below the normal operating water level. All underwater lights which depend upon submersion for safe operation shall have protection from overheating when not submerged. Underwater lighting requirements can be waived when the overhead lighting provides at least 15 footcandles (150 lux) of illumination at the pool water surface and pool wet deck surface. Alternative lighting systems which do not utilize electricity in the pool or on the pool deck, such as fiber-optic systems, may be utilized if the applicant demonstrates to reasonable certainty that the system development has advanced to the point where the department is convinced that the pool illumination is equal to the requirements in Sections 424.1.4.2.1 and 424.1.4.2.2 above.

Section 424.1.4.2.4 Overhead wiring, revise text to read as follows:
424.1.4.2.4 Overhead wiring.  Overhead service wiring shall not pass within an area extending a distance of 10 feet horizontally away from the inside edge of the pool walls, diving structures, observation stands, towers, or platforms. Electrical equipment wiring and installation including the grounding of pool components Overhead service wiring shall comply with Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building the currently adopted National Electrical Code, NFPA 70.

Section 424.1.5.1 Outdoor equipment, revise text to read as follows:
424.1.5.1 Outdoor Eequipment.  Equipment designated by the manufacturer for outdoor use may be located in an equipment area, all other equipment must be located in an equipment room or enclosure.  Plastic pipe subject to a period of prolonged sunlight exposure must be coated to protect it from ultraviolet light degradation. An equipment area shall be surrounded with a enclosed by four-sided fenceing that is at least 4 feet (1219 mm) high on all sides not confined by a building or equivalent structure with A a self-closing and self-latching gate with and has a permanent locking device shall be provided if necessary for access. An equipment room shall be protected on at least three sides and overhead. The fourth side may be a gate, fence, or open if otherwise protected from unauthorized entrance. The equipment area or room floor shall be of concrete or other nonabsorbent material having a smooth slip-resistant finish and shall have positive drainage, including a sump pump if necessary.  An equipment enclosure shall be lockable or otherwise protected from unauthorized access. 
Section 424.1.5.3 Materials, revise text to read as follows:
424.1.5.3 Materials.  The equipment enclosure, area or room floor shall be of concrete or other nonabsorbent material having a smooth slip-resistant finish and shall have positive drainage, including a sump pump if necessary.  Ancillary equipment, such as a heater, not contained in an equipment enclosure or room shall necessitate an equipment area as described above.

Section 424.1.5.6 Size, revise text to read as follows:
424.1.5.6 Size.   The size of the equipment enclosure, room or area shall provide working space to perform routine operations. Clearance shall be provided for all equipment as prescribed by the manufacturer to allow normal maintenance operation and removal without disturbing other piping or equipment.  In rooms with fixed ceilings, the minimum height shall be 7 feet (2137 mm).

Section 424.1.5.8 Storage, revise text to read as follows:
424.1.5.8 Storage.   Equipment enclosures, rooms or areas shall not be used for storage of chemicals emitting corrosive fumes or for storage of other items to the extent that entrance to the room for inspection or operation of the equipment is impaired.
Section 424.1.6.1 Sanitary facilities, revise text to read as follows:
424.1.6.1 Sanitary facilities.  Separate sanitary facilities shall be provided and labeled for each sex and shall be located within a 200-foot (60 960 mm) walking distance radius of the nearest water’s edge of each pool served by the facilities.

Exception: Where a swimming pool serves only a designated group of residential dwelling units and not the general public, poolside sanitary facilities are not required if all living units are within a 200-foot (60 960 mm) radius of the nearest water’s edge, are not over three stories in height unless serviced by an elevator, and are each equipped with private sanitary facilities.

Section 424.1.6.1.1 Required fixtures, revise text to read as follows:
424.1.6.1.1 Required fixtures.  Fixtures shall be provided as indicated on Table 424.1.6.1.  When multiple fixture sets are required and separate facilities are provided for each sex the fixtures used in ancillary family style restrooms can be used to meet the requirements of Section 424.1..6.1.1
Diaper changing tables shall be provided at facilities that cater to families with small children. 

[Mod 3177rev]

Section 437.2.2.2, revise text to read as follows:
437.2.2.2 All new iInpatient sleeping rooms shall be made accessible and shall comply in accordance with the requirements of the Florida Building Code, Section11-6.1(1).

[Mod 3037]

Chapter 5 General Building Heights and Areas
Section 503.1.1 Special industrial occupancies, revise to read as follows:

503.1.1 Special industrial occupancies. Reserved. Buildings and structures designed to house special industrial processes that require large areas and unusual heights to accommodate craneways or special machinery and equipment, including, among others, rolling mills; structural metal fabrication shops and foundries; or the production and distribution of electric, gas or steam power, shall be exempt from the height and area limitations of Table 503.
[Mod 2871 revised]

Section 509.4 Parking beneath Group R, revise text to read as follows:
509.4 Parking beneath Group R. Where a maximum one-story above grade plane Group S-2 parking garage, enclosed or open, or combination thereof, of Type I construction or open of Type IV construction, with grade entrance, is provided under a building of Group R, the number of stories to be used in determining the minimum type of construction shall be measured from the floor above such a parking area. The number of stories to be used in determining the height in stories in accordance with Section 903.6 shall include the parking garage as a story. The floor assembly between the parking garage and the Group R above shall comply with the type of construction required for the parking garage and shall also provide a fire-resistance rating not less than the mixed occupancy separation required in Section 508.3.3 302.3.2.
[Mod 2846]

Chapter 6 Types of Construction

Table 602 Fire-Resistance Rating Requirements for Exterior Walls Based on Fire Separation Distance, revise text to read as follows:

TABLE 602 
FIRE-RESISTANCE RATING REQUIREMENTS FOR EXTERIOR 
WALLS BASED ON FIRE SEPARATION DISTANCE a, e 
	FIRE SEPARATION DISTANCE 
= x (feet) 
	TYPE OF CONSTRUCTION 
	GROUP H 
	GROUP F-1, M, S-1 
	GROUP A, B, E, F-2, I, R b , S-2, Ub 

	xc 
	I-A, I-B, III-A, III-B, IV 

Others 
	3 

3 
	3 

2 
	3 

1 

	5 ( x < 10 
	I-A, I-B, III-A, III-B, IV 

Others 
	3 
2 
	2 
1 
	2 

1 

	10  ( x < 20 
	I-A, I-B, III-A, III-B, IV 
IIB, VB 
Others 
	2 
1 
1 
	2 
0 
1 
	2 d
0 
1 d

	20 (  x < 30 
	I-A, I-B, III-A, III-B, IV 

Others 
	1 

1 
	1 

0 
	1 d

0 d

	x30 
	All 
	0 
	0 
	0 


For SI:     1 foot = 304.8 mm. 

a. Load-bearing exterior walls shall also comply with the fire-resistance rating requirements of Table601. 

b. For special requirements for Group U occupancies see Section 406.1.2 

c. See Section 705.1.1 for party walls. 

d. Open parking garages complying with Section 406 shall not be required to have a fire-resistance rating. 

e. The fire-resistance rating of an exterior wall is determined based upon the fire separation distance of the exterior wall and the story in which the wall is located. 

[Mod 2847]

Chapter 7 Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction

Section 704.8.2 First story, revise text to read as follows:
704.8.2 First story. In occupancies other than Group H, unlimited unprotected openings are permitted in the exterior walls of the first story above grade of exterior walls facing a street that have a fire separation distance of greater than 15 feet (4572 mm) or facing an unoccupied space. The unoccupied space shall be on the same lot or dedicated for public use, shall not be less than 30 feet (9144 mm) in width and shall have access from a street by a posted fire lane in accordance with the Florida Fire Prevention Code.
[Mod 2848]
708.1 General. The following wall assemblies shall comply with this section:

1. Walls separating dwelling units in the same building.

2. Walls separating sleeping units in occupancies in Group R-1 hotel, R-2 and I-1 occupancies.

3. Walls separating tenant spaces in covered mall buildings as required by Section 402.7.2.

4. Corridor walls as required by Section 1017.1 1016.1.

5. Elevator lobby separation as required by Section 707.14.1.

6. Residential aircraft hangars.

7. Wall separating individual tenant spaces.

Exceptions:  No change.
[Mod 2871 Staff Comment]

Section 716.5.4 Fire partitions, revise text to read as follows:

716.5.4 Fire partitions. Ducts and air transfer openings that penetrate fire partitions shall be protected with listed fire dampers installed in accordance with their listing.

Exceptions: In occupancies other than Group H, fire dampers are not required where any of the following apply:

1. The duct system is constructed of approved materials in accordance with the Florida Building Code, Mechanical and the duct penetrating the wall complies with all of the following requirements:

1.1. The duct shall not exceed 100 square inches (0.06 m2).

1.2. The duct shall be constructed of steel a minimum of 0.0217 inch (0.55 mm) in thickness.

1.3. The duct shall not have openings that communicate the corridor with adjacent spaces or rooms.

1.4. The duct shall be installed above a ceiling.

1.5. The duct shall not terminate at a wall register in the fire-resistance-rated wall.

1.6. A minimum 12-inch-long (305 mm) by 0.060-inch-thick (1.52 mm) steel sleeve shall be centered in each duct opening. The sleeve shall be secured to both sides of the wall and all four sides of the sleeve with minimum 

1 ½ -inch by 1 ½ -inch by 0.060-inch (38mm by 38mm by 1.52 mm) steel retaining angles. The retaining angles shall be secured to the sleeve and the wall with No. 10 (M5) screws. The annular space between the steel sleeve and the wall opening shall be filled with mineral wool batting on all sides.

1. The partitions are tenant separation or corridor walls in buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 of the Florida Building Code, Building and the duct is protected as a through penetration in accordance with Section 712 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

2. Tenant partitions in covered mall buildings where the walls are not required by provisions elsewhere in the code to extend to the underside of the floor or roof deck above.

3. The duct system is constructed of approved materials in accordance with the Florida Building Code, Mechanical and the duct penetrating the wall complies with all of the following requirements:
3.1. The duct shall not exceed 100 square inches (0.06 m2).

3.2. The duct shall be constructed of steel a minimum of 0.0217-inch (0.55 mm) in thickness.

3.3. The duct shall not have openings that communicate the corridor with adjacent spaces or rooms.

3.4. The duct shall be installed above a ceiling.

3.5. The duct shall not terminate at a wall register in the fire-resistance-rated wall.

3.6. A minimum 12-inch-long (305 mm) by 0.060-inch-thick (1.52 mm) steel sleeve shall be centered in each duct opening. The sleeve shall be secured to both sides of the wall and all four sides of the sleeve with minimum 

1 ½ -inch by 1 ½ -inch by 0.060-inch (38 mm by 38 mm by 1.52 mm) steel retaining angles. The retaining angles shall be secured to the sleeve and the wall with No. 10 (M5) screws. The annular space between the steel sleeve and the wall opening shall be filled with rock (mineral) wool batting on all sides.

[Mod 3244 revised]

Chapter 8 Interior Finishes

Section 801.1.3 Applicability, revise text to read as follows:

801.1.3 Applicability. For buildings in flood hazard areas, see Section 3110 as established in Section 1612.3, interior finishes, trim and decorative materials below the design flood elevation shall be flood-damage-resistant materials.
[Mod 2883]

Section 804.4.1 Minimum critical radiant flux, revise text to read as follows:
804.4.1 Minimum critical radiant flux. Interior floor finish and floor covering materials in exit enclosures, exit passageways and corridors shall not be less than Class I in Groups I-2 and I-3 and not less than Class II in Groups A, B, E, H, I-4, M, R-1, R-2 and S. In all areas, floor covering materials shall comply with theDOCFF-1 “pill test” (CPSC 16 CFR, Part 1630).

Exception: Where a building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, Class II materials are permitted in any area where Class I materials are required, and materials complying with the DOC FF-1 “pill test” (CPSC 16 CFR, Part 1630) are permitted in any area where Class II materials are required.
[Mod 3038]

Chapter 9 Fire Protection Systems
Section 901.1 Scope, revise text to read as follows:
901.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall specify where fire protections systems are required and shall apply to the design, installation and operation of fire protection systems and carbon monoxide detection alarms.
Section 909 Smoke Control Systems, revise text to read as follows:
Replace “fire code official” with “Building Official” in sections; 909.8, 909.9, 909.10, 909.15, 909.18.8.3.1, and 909.19.  [See below.]
 [Mod 3189]
Section 909.7 Airflow design method, revise text to read as follows:

909.7 Airflow design method When approved by the fire code official Building Official, smoke migration through openings fixed in a permanently open position, which are located between smoke control zones by the use of the airflow method, shall be permitted. The design airflow shall be in accordance with this section. Airflow shall be directed to limit smoke migration from the fire zone. The geometry of openings shall be considered to prevent flow reversal from turbulent effects.

[Mod 3115 revised and Mod 3268]  
Section 909.8 Exhaust method, revise text to read as follows:
909.8 Exhaust method. When approved by the fire code Official Building Official, mechanical smoke control for large enclosed volumes, such as in atriums or malls, shall be permitted to utilize the exhaust method. Smoke control systems using the exhaust method shall be designed in accordance with NFPA 92B.

[Mod 3120 revised, Mod 3119 and Mod 3189]

Section 909.9 Design fire, revise text to read as follows:

909.9 Design fire. The design fire shall be based on a rational analysis performed by the registered design professional and approved by the fire code official Building Official. The design fire shall be based on the analysis in accordance with Section 909.4 and this section.

[Mod 3128 revised, Mod 3123 and Mod 3189]

Section 909.10 Equipment, revise text to read as follows:

909.10 Equipment. Equipment including, but not limited to, fans, ducts, automatic dampers and balance dampers, shall be suitable for its intended use, suitable for the probable exposure temperatures that the rational analysis indicates and as approved by the Building Official fire code official. 

Section 909.15 Control diagrams, revise text to read as follows:

909.15 Control diagrams. Identical control diagrams showing all devices in the system and identifying their location and function shall be maintained current and kept on file with the Building Official fire code official, the fire department and in the fire command center in a format and manner approved by the fire chief.

[Mod 3189]

Section 909.18.8.3.1 Report filing, revise text to read as follows:

909.18.8.3.1 Report filing. A copy of the final report shall be filed with the fire code official Building Official and an identical copy shall be maintained in an approved location at the building.

[Mod 3136 revised, Mod 3189, Mod 3121, and Mod 3134] 
Section 909.19 System acceptance, revise text to read as follows:
909.19 System acceptance. Buildings, or portions thereof, required by this code to comply with this section shall not be issued a certificate of occupancy until such time that the fire code building official determines that the provisions.
Exception: In buildings of phased construction, a temporary certificate of occupancy, as approved by the fire code building official, shall be allowed provided that those portions of the building to be occupied meet the requirements of this section 
[Mod 3114 and Mod 3117] 
Section 909.20 Smokeproof enclosures, revise text to read as follows:
909.20 Smokeproof enclosures. Where required by Section 1020.1.7, a smokeproof enclosure shall be constructed in accordance with this section. A smokeproof enclosure shall consist of an enclosed interior exit stairway that conforms to Section 1020.1 and an open exterior balcony or ventilated vestibule meeting the requirements of this section. Where access to the roof is required by the Florida Fire Prevention Building Code, such access shall be from the smokeproof enclosure where a smokeproof enclosure is required.

[Mod 3165] 
Section 913 Carbon Monoxide Protection, add text to read as follows:

913 Carbon monoxide protection

913.1 Carbon monoxide protection.  Every building for which a permit for new construction is issued having a fossil-fuel-burning heater or appliance, a fireplace, or an attached garage shall have an operational carbon monoxide alarm installed within 10 feet of each room used for sleeping purposes.
[Mod 3025revised]

913.1.1 Power Source. In new construction, alarms shall receive their primary power from the building wiring when such wiring is served from the local power utility. Such alarms shall have battery back up. 
913.1.2 Combination alarms. Combination smoke/carbon monoxide alarms shall be listed or labeled by a Nationally Recognized Testing Laboratory. 
Exception: An approved operational carbon monoxide detector shall be installed inside or directly outside of each room or area within a hospital, inpatient hospice facility or nursing home facility where a fossil-fuel burning heater, engine, or appliance is located.  The carbon monoxide detector shall be connected to the fire-alarm system of the hospital, inpatient hospice facility, or nursing home facility as a supervisory signal.

[Mod 3025]

Chapter 10 Means of Egress

Section 1001.5, revise text to read as follows:

1001.5 Where approved by the building official, existing stairs shall be permitted to be rebuilt in accordance with the dimensional criteria of the building code in effect at the time of original construction provided:
1. Handrails comply with Section 1009.11 1012, and, 

2. Guardrails comply with Section 1012, 1013, and, 

3. The elevation of the floor surfaces on both sides of the door complies with Section 1008.1.4
[Mod 3288]

Section 1001.6 Special egress requirements by occupancy, revise text to read as follows:

1001.6 Special egress requirements by occupancy. The general requirements of Chapter 10 apply to all occupancies except as modified for specific occupancies in accordance with Section 1024 1025 and Section 1026 1027 through 1033 1034.
[Mod 3289]

Section 1002.1 Definitions, revise text to read as follows:

1002.1 Definitions

MERCHANDISE PAD. A merchandise pad is an area for display of merchandise surrounded by aisles, permanent fixtures or walls. Merchandise pads contain elements such as non-fixed and moveable fixtures, cases, racks, counters and partitions as indicated in Section 105.2 from which customers browse or shop.
[Mod 3290]

Table 1004.1.1 Maximum Floor Area Allowances per Occupant, revise text to read as follows:
Table 1004.1.1 Maximum Floor Area Allowances per Occupant
Exercise rooms        50 gross  

[Mod 2828]

Section 1006.3.5, revise text to read as follows:

1006.3.5 Externally illuminated signs shall have the word "EXIT" or other appropriate wording in plainly legible letters not less than 6 inches (15 2 mm) high with the principal strokes of letters not less than 3/4 inches (19 mm) wide. The word "EXIT" shall have letters of a width not less than 2 inches (51 mm), except the letter "I," and the minimum spacing between letters shall be not less than 3/8 inches (10 mm). Signs larger than the minimum established in this paragraph shall have letter widths, strokes and spacing in proportion to their height. Externally illuminated signs shall be illuminated by not less than 5 footcandles (50 lux) at the illuminated surface and shall have a contrast ratio of not less than 0.5.

Exceptions:

1.
Marking required by Section 1009.5.43.

2.
Group R-3 and Group R-4 (small facility) occupancies.

Section 1006.3.6, revise text to read as follows:

1006.3.6 Internally illuminated signs shall be listed in accordance with UL 924, Standard for Safety Emergency Lighting Power Equipment. The visibility of an internally illuminated sign shall be the equivalent of an externally illuminated sign that complies with Section 1006.3.5.

Exceptions:

1.
Marking required by Section 1009.5.43.

2.
Signs in compliance with Sections 1006.3.4 and 1006.3.8.2.
[Staff]

Section 1008.1.1 Size of doors, revise text to read as follows:

1008.1.1 Size of doors. The minimum width of each door opening shall be sufficient for the occupant load thereof and shall provide a clear width of not less than 32 inches (813 mm). Clear openings of doorways with swinging doors shall be measured between the face of the door and the stop, with the door open 90 degrees (1.57 rad). Where this section requires a minimum clear width of 32 inches (813 mm) and a door opening includes two door leaves without a mullion, one leaf shall provide a clear opening width of 32 inches (813 mm). The maximum width of a swinging door leaf shall be 48 inches (1219 mm) nominal. Means of egress doors in a Group I-2 occupancy used for the movement of beds shall provide a clear width not less than 41.5 inches (1054 mm). The height of doors shall not be less than 80 inches (2032 mm).

Exceptions:

1. The minimum and maximum width shall not apply to door openings that are not part of the required means of egress in Group R-2 and R-3 occupancies.

2. Door openings to resident sleeping units in Group I-3 occupancies shall have a clear width of not less than 28 inches (711 mm).

3. Door openings to storage closets less than 10 square feet (0.93m2) in area shall not be limited by the minimum width.

4. Width of door leafs in revolving doors that comply with Section 1008.1.3.1 shall not be limited.

5. Door openings within a dwelling unit or sleeping unit shall not be less than 78 inches (1981 mm) in height.

6. Exterior door openings in dwelling units and sleeping units, other than the required exit door, shall not be less than 76 inches (1930 mm) in height.

7.  Reserved.  In other than Group R-1 occupancies, the minimum widths shall not apply to interior egress doors within a dwelling unit or sleeping unit that is not required to be an Accessible unit, Type A unit or Type B unit.

8.  Reserved.  Door openings required to be accessible within Type B units shall have a minimum clear width of 31.75 inches (806 mm).
[Mod 2885]

Section 1009.4 Stairway landings, revise text to read as follows:

1009.4 Stairway landings. There shall be a floor or landing at the top and bottom of each stairway. The width of landings shall not be less than the width of stairways they serve. Every landing shall have a minimum dimensioned measured in the direction of travel equal to the width of the stairway. Such dimension need not exceed 48 inches (1219 mm) where the stairway has a straight run.


Exceptions:

1. Aisle stairs complying with Section 1024 1025.11.
2. and 3.  No change.
[Mod 3292]

Section 1010.2 Slope, revise text to read as follows:

1010.2 Slope. Ramps used as part of a means of egress shall have a running slope not steeper than one unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (8.333-percent slope). The slope of other ramps shall not be steeper than one unit vertical in eight units horizontal (12.5-percent slope).

Exceptions:

1. Aisle ramp slope in occupancies of Group A shall comply with Section 1025.11 1024.11.

2. Ramps that provide access to vehicles, vessels, mobile structures and aircraft shall not be required to comply with the maximum slope or maximum rise for a single ramp run.

Section 1010.8 Handrails, revise text to read as follows:

1010.8 Handrails. Handrails shall be provided along both sides of a ramp run with a rise greater than 6 inches (152 mm) and shall conform to the requirements in Section 1012 1009.11. If handrails are not continuous, they shall extend at least 18 inches (305 mm) beyond the top and bottom of the ramp segment and shall be parallel with the floor or ground surface. Ends of handrails shall be either rounded or returned smoothly to floor, wall or post. Handrails shall not rotate within their fittings. Top of the handrail gripping surface shall be not less than 34 inches (864 mm) nor more than 38 inches (965 mm) above the ramp surface.

Exceptions: 
1. Handrails are not required when the total ramp run rise is 6 inches (152 mm) or less and the horizontal projection is 72 inches or less, except where required to be accessible.

2. Aisles in Group A occupancies (see Section 1025 1024).

3. In dwelling units not required to be accessible by Chapter 11, handrails are not required to extend beyond the top and bottom of the ramp segment.

4. Handrails are not required on curb ramps.
[Mod 3163 and Mod 3309]

Section 1012.5 Handrail extensions, revise text to read as follows:

1012.5 Handrail extensions. Handrails shall return to a wall, guard or the walking surface or shall be continuous to the handrail of an adjacent stair flight or ramp run. At stairways where handrails are not continuous between flights, the handrails shall extend horizontally at least 12 inches (305 mm) beyond the top riser and continue to slope for the depth of one tread beyond the bottom riser. At ramps where handrails are not continuous between runs, the handrails shall extend horizontally above the landing 18 12 inches (305 mm) minimum beyond the top and bottom of ramp runs.

Exceptions:

1. Handrails within a dwelling unit that is not required to be accessible need extend only from the top riser to the bottom riser.

2. Aisle handrails in Group A occupancies in accordance with Section 1025.13.

3. Accessible handrail extensions shall be as per Section 11-4.8.5(2).

[Mod 3309]

Table 1015.1 Spaces with One Means of Egress, revise text to read as follows:

Table 1015.1 SPACES WITH ONE MEANS OF EGRESS

	Occupancy
	Maximum Occupant Load

	A,B,D,E,F,M,U, R2, R3
	49

	H-1,H-2,H-3
	3

	D,H-4, H-5, I-1, I-3, R-1, R-4
	10

	S
	29


a. Day care maximum occupant load is 10.

[Mod 2886 revised]

Table 1017.1 Corridor Fire-Resistance Rating.  Change to read as shown.
	Occupancy
	Occupant Load Served by Corridor
	Required Fire-Resistance Rating (hours)

	
	
	Without Sprinkler System
	With Sprinkler Systemc

	H-1, H-2, H-3
	All
	1
	1

	A, H-4, H-5
	Greater than 30
	1
	1

	B, D, Ec, F, M, S, U
	Greater than 30
	1
	0

	R
	Greater than 10
	1
	1

	I-2a
	All
	Not permitted
	0

	I-1, I-3
	All
	Not Permitted
	1b


a. For requirements for occupancies in Group I-2, see Section 407.3.

b. Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

c. In buildings protected throughout by an approved, supervised automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903, corridor walls shall not be required to be rated, provided that such walls form smoke partitions in accordance with the Florida Fire Prevention Code.
[Staff after]

Section 1025.9.2 Means of egress capacity is revised to read as follows:

1025.9.2 Means of egress capacity. The capacity of means of egress shall be in accordance with Section 1005. The width of aisles and other means of egress serving theater-type seating or similar seating arranged in rows shall provide sufficient capacity in accordance with Sections 1025.9.2.1 1024.9.2.1 and 1025.9.2.2 1024.9.2.2

1025.9.2.1 Minimum clear widths of aisles and other means of egress serving theater-type seating, or similar seating arranged in rows, shall be in accordance with Table 1025.9.2.1 1024.9.2.1

1025.9.2.2 The minimum clear widths shown in Table 1025.9.2.1 shall be modified in accordance with all of the following:

1. If risers exceed 7 inches (178 mm)in height, multiply the stair width in the table by factor A, where

A = 1 + (riser height - 7 inches)
                               5

2. Stairs not having a handrail within a 30-inch (762 mm) horizontal distance shall be 25 percent wider than otherwise calculated (i.e., multiply by factor B = 1.25).

3. Ramps steeper than 1:10 slope where used in ascent shall have their width increased by 10 percent (i.e., multiply by factor C = 1.10).

Exceptions:

1. Lighting and access catwalks shall meet the requirements for Group F occupancies.

2. Grandstands, bleachers and folding and telescopic seating as permitted by Section 1025.6.2 1024.6.2.

[Mod 2849 and Staff Comment]

Section 1025.9.3 Converging aisles, add text to read as follows:

1025.9.3 Converging aisles. Where aisles converge to form a single path of egress travel, the required egress capacity of that path shall not be less than the combined required capacity of the converging aisles.

[Mod 2849]

Section 1025.10 Aisle accessways, revise text to read as follows:

1025.10 Aisle accessways. The aisle accessway between rows of seating shall have a clear width of not less than 12 inches (305 mm), and the minimum width shall be increased in accordance with Section 1025.10.2 Sections 1024.10.2 for seating not at tables and Section 1025.10.2.2 1024.10.2.2 for seating at tables. The width of aisle accessways shall be the clear horizontal distance from the back of the row ahead and the nearest projection of the row behind. Where chairs have automatic or self-rising seats that comply with ASTM F 851, the measurement shall be made with seats in the raised position. Where any chair in the row does not have an automatic or self-rising seat, the measurements shall be made with the seat in the down position. For seats with folding tablet arms, row spacing shall be determined with the tablet in the useable position.
No change to remainder of text.

[Staff]

Section 1026.4.1, revise text to read as follows:

1026.4.1 Every room or space greater than 250 square feet (23.2 m2) in educational occupancies used for classroom or other educational purposes or normally subject to student occupancy and every room or space normally subject to client occupancy, other than bathrooms, in Group D occupancies shall have not less than one outside window for emergency rescue that complies with the following:

1. Such windows shall be openable from the inside without the use of tools and shall provide a clear opening of not less than 20 inches (508 mm) in width, 24 inches (610 mm) in height, and 5.7 square feet (0.53 m2) in area.

2. The bottom of the opening shall be not more than 44 inches (1118 mm) above the floor, and any latching device shall be capable of being operated from not more than 54 inches (1372 mm) above the finished floor.

Exceptions:

1. Buildings protected throughout by an approved, supervised automatic sprinkler system in accordance with section 903.3.1.1.

2. Where the room or space has a door leading directly to the outside of the building.

3. Rooms located higher than three stories above grade.  

[Mod 2821 revised]

Section 1027.2 Handrails and guardrails, revise text to read as follows:

1027.2 Handrails and guardrails. Handrails and guardrails shall be in accordance with Sections 1009.11 1012 and 1012 1013.

Exceptions:  No change.
[Mod 3293]

Section 1027.3, revise text to read as follows:

1027.3 Stairs. Spiral stairs complying with Section 1009.9 1009.8 shall be permitted as a component in a means of egress.

[Mod 3295]

Section 1029.1 Handrails and guardrails, revise text to read as follows:

1029.1 Handrails and guardrails. Handrails and guardrails shall be installed in accordance with Sections 1009.11 1009.12 and 1012 1013.
Exceptions:  No change.

[Mod 3296, Staff]

Section 1029.2, revise text to read as follows:

1029.2 Stairs. Spiral stairs complying with Section 1009.89 shall be permitted as a component in a means of egress.
[Staff]

Section 1030.11.1, revise text to read as follows:

1030.11.1 Travel distance shall not exceed that specified in Table 10165.1.
[Staff]

Section 1030.12 Measurement of travel distance to exits, revise text to read as follows:

1030.12 Measurement of travel distance to exits. Travel distance shall be determined in accordance with Section 1016 1015, but shall not exceed:

 1.
One-hundred feet (30 480 mm) between any room door required as exit access and an exit.

 2.
One-hundred-and-fifty feet (45 720 mm) between any point in a room and an exit.

 3.
Fifty feet (15 240 mm) between any point in a sleeping room and the door of that room.

No change to remainder of text.

[Staff]

Section 1030.13.1, revise text to read as follows:

1030.13.1 Spiral stairs meeting the requirements of Section 1009.89 are permitted for access to and between staff locations.

[Staff]

Section 1030.13.2, revise text to read as follows:

1030.13.2 Alternating tread stairways meeting the requirements of Section 1009.10 1009.9 are permitted for access to and between staff locations subject to occupancy by no more than three persons all capable of using the alternating tread stairway.

[Mod 3297]

Section 1030.13.3, revise text to read as follows:

1030.13.3 Solid risers, intermediate handrails, latticework or similar facilities required by Sections 1009.3.32 and 10132.3 which would interfere with visual supervision of residents are not required.

[Staff]

Section 1031.1, revise text to read as follows:

1031.1 Stairs. Spiral stairs complying with Section 1009.9 1009.8 shall be permitted as a component of egress. 

[Mod 3298]

Section 1030.13.2, revise text to read as follows:

1031.2 Handrails and guardrails. Handrails and guardrails shall be installed in accordance with Sections 1009.11 1009.12 and 1012 1013.
Exceptions:  No change.

[Mod 3299 and staff]

Section 1033.2, revise text to read as follows:

1033.2 Stairs. Spiral stairs complying with Section 1009.9 1009.8 shall be permitted as a component of egress. 

[Mod 3300]
Section 1033.3 Handrails and guardrails, revise text to read as follows:

1033.3 Handrails and guardrails. Handrails and guardrails shall be installed in accordance with Sections 1009.121 and 10132.

Exception: In areas not accessible to the public in Group S, the clear distance between rails or ornamental pattern shall be such as to prevent the passage of a 21-inch (533 mm) diameter sphere.
[Staff]

Section 1034.2.3, revise text to read as follows:

1034.2.3 Doors designed to be normally closed shall comply with Section 715.43.7.
[Staff]

Chapter 11 Florida Accessibility Code for Building Construction 
Part A 
Section 11-4.3.3 Width, revise text to read as follows:
11-4.3.3 Width.  The minimum clear width of an accessible route shall be 36 inches (915 mm) except at doors (see Section 11-4.13.5 and 11-4.13.6).  If a person in a wheelchair must make a turn around an obstruction, the minimum clear width of the accessible route shall be as shown in Figure 7(a) and Figure 7(b).

Exceptions:

1. Curb ramps that are a part of a required means of egress shall be not less than 44 inches (1118 mm) wide.

2. All spaces must be located on an accessible route no less than 44 inches  (1118 mm) wide so that users will not be compelled to walk or wheel behind parked vehicles.
Section 11-4.6.4 Signage, revise text to read as follows:
11-4.6.4 Signage.  Each such accessible parking space must be prominently outlined with blue paint, and must be repainted when as necessary, to be clearly distinguishable as a parking space designated for persons who have disabilities and must be posted with a permanent above-grade sign bearing of a color and design approved by the Department of Transportation which is placed on or at a distance of 84 inches above the ground to the bottom of the sign and which bears the international symbol of accessibility meeting the requirements of color and design approved by the Department of Transportation of Section 11-4.30.7 , ADAAG Section 4.30.7 and the caption “PARKING BY DISABLED PERMIT ONLY.”  Such sign erected after October 1, 1996, must indicate the penalty for illegal use of the space.
Remaining text unchanged.
[Mod 3020 revised]

Part C, revise to read as follows:

CHAPTER 11

REQUEST FOR WAIVER FROM ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS

CHAPTER 553, PART V, FLORIDA STATUTES August 1999

PART C

See www.floridabuilding.org for containing the Waiver from Accessibility Requirements form and Florida Administrative Code Chapter 9B-7, and Part D Section 553.501-513, Florida Statutes.
[Mod 3143 revised]

Form 2002-01, revise text to read as follows:
CHAPTER 11

REQUEST FOR WAIVER FROM ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS

CHAPTER 553, PART V, FLORIDA STATUTES August 1999

PART C

NOTICE TO WAIVER APPLICANTS

Please make certain you comply with the following:

·
The person submitting the waiver request application as the Applicant MUST sign the application. Should you fail to do so, your application will be returned.

·
If a licensed design professional (architect or engineer) has designed the project, his or her comments MUST be included as a part of this application.

·
Be as explicit as possible. The more information provided to the Florida Building Commission, the more informed its decisions can be. If you are claiming financial hardship, please specify why and to what degree.

·
If at all possible, PLAN TO ATTEND the Accessibility Advisory Council and the Florida Building Commission meetings. Sometimes pertinent facts are inadvertently omitted, or information provided/presented in the Request for Waiver application is not clear. Your attendance at the meetings to answer questions will enhance the possibility of the waiver being approved, since the Council and the Commission will receive the most complete information - from you. When we receive the completed application, we will send you a notice of the time, date, and place for both the Council and the Commission meetings.

Enclosed are: a Checklist for Use by the Applicant, a List of Required Information, the Request for Waiver application, and a copy of the administrative rule governing the Florida Building Commission procedures for reviewing requests for waivers from accessibility requirements.

If you have questions or would like additional information, please call the Codes and Standards Office at (850) 487-1824.

This application is available in electronic format at:

http://www.dca.state.fl.us/fhcd/fbc/access_waiver/waiverap.htm.

Department of Community Affairs

FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION

2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100

NOTICE TO WAIVER APPLICANTS

Please make certain you comply with the following:

·
The person submitting the waiver request application as the Applicant MUST sign the application. Should you fail to do so, your application will be returned.

·
If a licensed design professional (architect or engineer) has designed the project, his or her comments MUST be included as a part of this application.

·
Be as explicit as possible. The more information provided to the Florida Building Commission, the more informed its decisions can be. If you are claiming financial hardship, please specify why and to what degree.

·
If at all possible, PLAN TO ATTEND the Accessibility Advisory Council and the Florida Building Commission meetings. Sometimes pertinent facts are inadvertently omitted, or information provided/presented in the Request for Waiver application is not clear. Your attendance at the meetings to answer questions will enhance the possibility of the waiver being approved, since the Council and the Commission will receive the most complete information - from you. When we receive the completed application, we will send you a notice of the time, date, and place for both the Council and the Commission meetings.

Enclosed are a List of Required Information and the Request for Waiver application.

If you have questions or would like additional information, please call the Codes and Standards Section at (850)487-1824.

This application is available in electronic format at:

http://www.dca.state.fl.us/fhcd/fbc/access_waiver/waiverap.htm.

Please mail this application to the Department of Community Affairs at the address above. As well as a hard copy, please include a copy of the application (without drawings or plans) on a 3.5 floppy disk in PC format.

This application is available in alternate formats upon request.

LIST OF REQUIRED INFORMATION:

1.
_______ Drawings that will clearly present your project and that identify the issue(s) that relate to the waiver you are requesting. As a minimum, the following drawings must be submitted:

 a. Project site plan

 b. 24" x 36" minimum size drawings

c. Building/project sections (if necessary to assist in understanding the waiver request)

d. Enlarged floor plan(s) of the area in question

2.
_______ One set of reduced scale (11" x 17") versions of the drawings submitted in item 1one above.

3.
_______ One set of overhead transparencies (8-1/2" x 11") of the drawings submitted in item one above. When numerous features are shown on the drawings, please designate the location of the waiver items by highlighting or outlining in color the affected areas.

4.
_______ When substantial financial cost of compliance is alleged, supporting cost estimates with quotes from at least two vendors or contractors and catalog information.

5.
_______ If you feel photographs and/or renderings are necessary for your presentation, provide 40 legible color photocopies of the photographs and/or renderings. If color photocopies of photographs are provided, use a minimum size of 4" x 6" photographs with a maximum of two photographs per photocopied page.

6.
_______ Please submit a hard copy of this application to the Department of Community Affairs, as well as a copy of the application on a 3.5 floppy disk in PC format. PLEASE NOTE:  Do not submit drawings or plans on the disk.

General Information:

a.
Equipment: An overhead projector is provided at the presentation; any other equipment necessary for your presentation, such as, TV/VCR, slide or LCD projectors, etc., is the responsibility of the applicant.

b.
Verbal Descriptions: Presentations may be to sight or hearing impaired persons; visual presentations should consider adequate verbal and text descriptions of charts and pictures.

Your application will be reviewed by the Accessibility Advisory Council. You will have the opportunity to answer questions and/or make a short presentation not to exceed 15 minutes. The Council will provide recommendations to the Florida Building Commission. The Commission will review the application. You will have another opportunity to answer questions and/or give a short presentation not to exceed 15 minutes. The Commission will consider all information and the Council’s recommendation before voting on the waiver.
REQUEST FOR WAIVER FROM ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS

CHAPTER 553, PART V, FLORIDA STATUTES

Your application will be reviewed by the Accessibility Advisory Council and its recommendations will be presented to the Commission.  You will have the opportunity to answer questions and/or make a short presentation, not to exceed 15 minutes, at each meeting.  The Commission will consider all information presented and the Council’s recommendation before voting on the waiver request.

1. Name and address of project for which the waiver is requested.

Name: __________________________________________________________

Address: ________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

2.  Name of Applicant.  If other than the owner, please indicate relationship of applicant to owner and written authorization by owner in space provided:

Applicant’s Name: ________________________________________________

Applicant’s Address: ________________________________________________________________

Applicant’s Telephone: ___________________ FAX ____________________

Applicant’s E-mail Address: ________________________________________

Relationship to Owner: ____________________________________________

Owner’s Name: ___________________________________________________

Owner’s Address: ________________________________________________________________

Owner’s Telephone: _____________________ FAX _____________________

Owner’s E-mail Address: __________________________________________

Signature of Owner: ______________________________________________

Contact Person: __________________________________________________

Contact Person’s Telephone: _______________________________________ 

Contact Person’s E-mail Address: ___________________________________


Form #2001-01

3. Please check one of the following:

[ ] New construction.

[ ] Addition to a building or facility.

[ ] Alteration to an existing building or facility.

[ ] Historical preservation (addition).

[ ] Historical preservation (alteration).

4. Type of Facility. Please describe the building (square footage, number of floors).  Define the use of the building (i.e., restaurant, office, retail, recreation, hotel/motel, etc.)

________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

5. Project Construction Cost (Provide cost for new construction, the addition or the alteration):

   ________________________________________________________________

6. Project Status: Please check the phase of construction that best describes your project at the time of this application. Describe status.

   [ ] Under Design      [ ] Under Construction

   [ ] In Plan Review    [ ] Completed*

* Briefly explain why the request has now been referred to the Commission.

________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

7. Requirements requested to be waived. Please reference the applicable section of the Florida law. Only Florida-specific accessibility requirements may be waived.

Issue 1: ________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

Issue 2: ________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

8. Reason(s) for Waiver Request: The Florida Building Commission may grant waivers of Florida-specific accessibility requirements upon a determination of unnecessary, unreasonable or extreme hardship.  Please describe how this project meets the following hardship criteria.  Explain all that would apply for consideration of granting the waiver.

[ ] The hardship is caused by a condition or set of conditions affecting the owner which does not affect owners in general. 

________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

[ ] Substantial financial costs will be incurred by the owner if the waiver is denied.

________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

[ ] The owner has made a diligent investigation into the costs of compliance with the code, but cannot find an efficient mode of compliance. Provide detailed cost estimates and, where appropriate, photographs. Cost estimates must include bids and quotes.

________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

9. Provide documented cost estimates for each portion of the waiver request and identify any additional supporting data which may affect the cost estimates. For example, for vertical accessibility, the lowest documented cost of an elevator, ramp, lift or other method of providing vertical accessibility should be provided, documented by quotations or bids from at least two vendors or contractors.

a.  ______________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

b.  ______________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

c.  ______________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

10. Licensed Design Professional: Where a design professional has designed the project, his or her comments MUST be included and certified by signature and affixing of his or her professional seal. The comments must include the reason(s) why the waiver is necessary.

________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

Signature                                           Printed Name

Phone Number ______________________

(SEAL) 

CERTIFICATION OF APPLICANT:

I hereby swear or affirm that the applicable documents in support of this Request for Waiver are attached for review by the Florida Building Commission and that all statements made in this application are to be the best of my knowledge true and correct.

Dated this ____________ day of _______________________________ , 20 __

_________________________________________________ 

Signature

_________________________________________________ 

Printed Name

By signing this application, the applicant represents that the information in it is true, accurate and complete. If the applicant misrepresents or omits any material information, the Commission may revoke any order and will notify the building official of the permitting jurisdiction. Providing false information to the Commission is punishable as a misdemeanor under Section 775.083, Florida Statutes.

REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION BY LOCAL BUILDING DEPARTMENT.

Please state why the issue is being referred to the Florida Building Commission as well as a recommendation for disposition. The building official or his or her designee should review the application and indicate that to the best of his or her knowledge, all information stipulated herein is true and accurate. Further, if this project is complete, explain why it is being referred to the Commission. The building official or his or her designee should sign a copy of the plans accompanying this application as certification that such plans are the same as those submitted for building department review. Please reference the applicable section of the Accessibility Code.

a. ______________________________________________________________

b. ______________________________________________________________

c. ______________________________________________________________

Has there been any permitted construction activity on this building during the past three years? If so, what was the cost of construction?

  [ ] Yes      [ ] No   Cost of Construction __________________ 

Comments/Recommendation _______________________________________

________________________________________________________________

Jurisdiction ______________________________________________________

Building Official or Designee  _____________________________________




                                      Signature





___________________________________________ 





Printed Name





___________________________________________ 





Certification Number





___________________________________________ 





Telephone/FAX

Address _________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________________

Form No.: 2001-02, Page 1 of 2

Certification of Licensed Design Professional for Replicated Designs to be Placed on Consent Agenda

NOTE: This form is to be used only for cases in which design documents are duplicates of previously approved waivers and the project can be placed on a Consent Agenda pursuant to Rule 9B-7.003(3), Florida Administrative Code.

I,___________________________________, a licensed architect/engineer in the state of Florida, whose Florida license number is ____________________, hereby state as follows:

1. I am the architect/engineer of record for the project known as (name of project) ___________________________________________, for which the Owner seeks a waiver of one or more accessibility requirements in an application to which this Certification is attached.

2. I hereby certify that to the best of my knowledge and belief to the Florida Building Commission that the design documents for the (insert project described in paragraph 1 above)________________________________________________ are the same as the design documents previously submitted to the Commission and referenced in paragraph 3 below, except that the two projects are built or to be built on different parcels of land at different locations.

3. The licensed design professional of record (identify the licensed design professional of record), _______________________________, prepared the design documents for the project known as _______________________________________________________, for which the majority of the Accessibility Advisory Council recommended approval and the Commission granted a waiver of one or more accessibility requirements in Final Order No. ____________.

Printed Name: __________________________ Affix certification seal below:

Address: _______________________________

_______________________________________

Telephone: _____________________________

Fax: ___________________________________

E-Mail Address: _________________________

Form No.: 2001-02, Page 2 of 2

Certification of Applicant for Replicated Designs to be Placed on Consent Agenda

NOTE: This form is to be used only for cases in which design documents are duplicates of previously approved waivers and the project can be placed on a Consent Agenda pursuant to Rule 9B-7.003(3), Florida Administrative Code.

I, _______________________________________________, am applying for placement on the Consent Agenda pursuant to Rule 9B-7.003(3), Florida Administrative Code. I (check one of the following and complete blanks):

[ ] am the owner of this project (name of project) ________________________, and was the owner of the project known as _________________________________,

[ ] am the franchisee of this project (name of project) ____________________, am under the same franchiser (name of franchiser) __________________________ who was the franchiser of the project known as_____________________________,

[ ] am the licensee of this project (name of project) ____________________,

am under the same licensor (name of licensor) ______________________________, who was the licensor of the project known as ______________________________, for which the majority of the Accessibility Advisory Council recommended approval, and the Florida Building Commission granted a waiver of one or more accessibility requirements in Final Order No. __________________.

I hereby swear or affirm that the above information to the best of my knowledge is true and correct.

Dated this ____________ day of ____________________________, 20 _____

__________________________________________

Signature

__________________________________________

Printed Name

Providing false information to the Florida Building Commission is punishable as a misdemeanor under Section 775.083, Florida Statutes.

[Mod 3020 revised]

Florida Administrative Code Chapter 9B-7, delete text to read as follows:

FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE

CHAPTER 9B-7

FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION — HANDICAPPED ACCESSIBILITY STANDARDS

9B-7.001
Purpose. (Repealed)

9B-7.002
Definitions. (Repealed)

9B-7.003
Procedures.

9B-7.004
Prerequisites for Consideration of Waiver Requests. (Repealed)

9B-7.0041
Guidelines for Accessible Automated Teller Machines and Fare Vending Machines (Repealed)

9B-7.0042
Florida Accessibility Code for Building Construction.

9B-7.005
Criteria for Granting of Waiver. (Repealed)

9B-7.006
Filing of Requests. (Repealed)

9B-7.003
Procedures.

(1)
All applications for a waiver or modification of the requirements of the Act or the Code shall be filed on the Request for Waiver, Forms No. 2001-01 and 2001-02, which the Commission hereby incorporates by reference, effective January 20, 2002. Copies of Forms No. 2001-01 and 2001-02 are available by writing to the Codes and Standards Section, Department of Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100. Upon certification from an applicant that all information requested by these rules has been furnished, the request will be scheduled for consideration at the Commission’s next scheduled meeting provided that at least 14 days notice can be given to the members of the Advisory Council.

(2)
All Requests shall be prepared in accordance with the instructions on Form 1997-03, but the Commission may waive a requirement in the instructions if the Commission finds the requirement unnecessary to the consideration of the Request. A Request shall be for one Project only, and no Request shall be considered by the Commission unless it shall have first been reviewed by the Council.

(3)
The Commission and the Council may delegate to staff the authority to review an application and place it on a consent agenda only in the following circumstances:

(a)
A majority of the Council has recommended approval of a waiver application accompanied by a particular set of design documents;

(b)
The Commission has ordered a waiver based on the same set of design documents; and

(c)
The Project for which application for a waiver is made is:

1.
Owned by the same owner, franchised by the same franchiser, or licensed by the same licensor as the project previously approved by the Commission; and

2.
To be built according to the same set of design documents previously approved by the Commission; and

3.
The design documents described in 2. above have been certified by the architect of record using Form No. 1997-04, which the Commission hereby incorporates by reference, effective October 1, 1997. Copies of Form No. 1997-04 are available by writing to the Codes and Standards Section, Department of Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100; and

(d)
The delegation has been entered in the minutes of the meetings of the Commission and of the Council. The Commission may, upon the request of any Commission member, remove an application from the consent agenda. If an application is removed from the consent agenda, it shall be placed on the agenda for hearing in sequence that day.

(4)
At its meetings, the Council shall consider all Requests, and shall prepare a recommendation for the Commission on each Request. The recommendation may be for approval, approval for a specified time, approval with a specified condition, or disapproval. If the Council finds that the Request does not give it sufficient information to make a recommendation, it may also recommend that the Commission defer action on the Request until such information is furnished. In the absence of a quorum, individual members of the Council may present recommendations to the Commission.

(5)
At the meeting of the Commission, the Chairman of the Council or his designee shall present the recommendations of the Council on each Request. At its discretion, the Commission may hear any argument in support of or opposition to any Request and it may at its discretion vote upon more than one Request together. In acting upon a Request, at its discretion the Commission may wholly or partly agree or disagree with the recommendation of the Council, and may approve any Request, may approve it for a specified time, may approve it with a specified condition, may disapprove it, or may defer it for additional information.

(6)
The Commission may waive one or more requirements of the Act or the Code if it finds that compliance with the literal requirements will cause an unnecessary, unreasonable, or extreme hardship. A waiver or denial of a waiver shall be applicable only to the project in the Request, and no waiver shall stand as precedent for any other project or projects. In order for the Commission to find an unnecessary, unreasonable, or extreme hardship, the owner of the project must show the following:

(a)
That the hardship is caused by a condition or set of conditions affecting the owner which does not affect owners in general.

(b)
That substantial financial costs will be incurred by the owner if the waiver is denied.

(c)
That the owner has made a diligent investigation into the costs of compliance with the Code, but cannot find an efficient mode of compliance.

 (7)
The Commission shall reflect its action in a Final Order. The original of each Final Order shall be filed with the Clerk of the Department, who shall also act as Clerk of the Commission. Copies of each Final Order shall be sent by United States mail to the owner, to all professionals engaged in designing or building the project, and to the Building Official of the permitting jurisdiction. In addition, pertinent information concerning each Final Order shall be entered in a Master Topical Index of Final Orders, which shall be maintained by the Clerk of the Commission.

Specific Authority 553.512(1) FS. Law Implemented 553.512(1) FS. History–New 1-31-79, Formerly 9B-7.03, Amended 10-1-96, 9-14-97, 9-7-00, 1-20-02.

9B-7.0042
Florida Accessibility Code for Building Construction.

The 1997 Florida Accessibility Code for Building Construction (the Code) is adopted by reference as the rule of this Commission, effective October 1, 1997. The 2001 revision to the Code are herein incorporated into this rule by reference and shall take effect on the effective date of this rule. Copies of the Code and the 2001 revision are available by writing to the Codes and Standards Section, Department of Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100.

Specific Authority 553.503 FS. Law Implemented 553.503 FS. History–New 9-14-97, Amended 10-31-99, 1-20-02.

[Mod 3143 revised]
Chapter 12 Interior Environment

Section 1202.1 General, delete text to read as follows:
1202.1 General. [No change to text.] 
SUNROOM ADDITION.  Reserved. A one-story addition added to an existing building with a glazing area in excess of 40 percent of the gross area of the structure’s exterior walls and roof.
[Mod 3230 and staff]

Chapter 14 Exterior Walls

Section 1401.1 Scope, revise text to read as follows:
1401.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall establish the minimum requirements for exterior walls, exterior wall coverings, exterior wall openings, exterior windows and doors, architectural trim, balconies and similar projections; and bay and oriel windows.
Exceptions:  No change.

[Mod 2850 and comment 1]

Chapter 15 Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Structures

Section 1502.1 General, add text to read as follows:
AGGREGATE. In roofing, crushed stone, crushed slag or water-worn gravel used for surfacing for roof coverings.
BALLAST. In roofing, ballast comes in the form of large stones or paver systems or light-weight interlocking paver systems and is used to provide uplift resistance for roofing systems that are not adhered or mechanically attached to the roof deck.

[Mod 3048 revised]

Section 1503.1 General, revise text to read as follows:
1503.1 General. Roof decks shall be covered with approved roof coverings secured to the building or structure in accordance with the provisions of this chapter. Roof coverings shall be designed, and installed and maintained in accordance with this code and the approved manufacturer’s instructions such that the roof covering shall serve to protect the building or structure.

[Mod 3186]

Section 1504.1.2 Alternate test method, delete text to read as follows:
1504.1.2 Alternative test method. Testing the acceptability of special fastening methods using the methodology in this section is permitted. The wind-induced uplift force on the shingle shall be determined using the method in UL 2390. The resistance of the shingle to the uplift force shall be determined using ASTM D 6381. Shingles passing this test shall be considered suitable for roofs located where the basic wind speed per Figure 1609 is as given in Table 1504.1.2.

Classification requires that the resistance of the shingle to wind uplift, measured using the method in ASTM D 6381, exceed the calculated load imposed by wind in the applicable zone as determined using UL 2390.

Classification by this method applies to buildings less than 60 feet (18 288 mm) high and with Wind Exposures B and C only in an Occupancy Category of I or II. Wrappers of shingle bundles that have been qualified using this alternative method shall be labeled with the tested wind classification and reference UL 2390/ASTM D 6381.

TABLE 1504.1.2

ROOF COVERING CLASSIFICATION

USING ALTERNATIVE METHOD

	MAXIMUM BASIC

Wind Speed (mph)
	ASTM D 6381

Classification

	90 
	Class D

	120 
	Class G

	150
	Class H


For SI: 1 mile per hour = 0.447m/s.
[Mod 3179 and Mod 3130]

Section 1504.4 Ballasted low-slope roof systems, revise text to read as follows:
1504.4 Ballasted low-slope roof systems. Ballasted low-slope (roof slope < 2:12) single-ply roof system coverings shall be designed in accordance with ANSI/SPRI RP-4.
[Mod 3203]  
Section 1504.8 Aggregate, revise text to read as follows:
1504.8 Aggregate.  Aggregate shall be permitted as roof surfacing when installed in accordance with the HVHZ requirements as defined in section 1519.12.1 on slopes of 3:12 or less, not less than 400 pound (182 kg) of roofing gravel or 300 pounds  (145 kg) of slag per  square shall be applied. A minimum of 50 percent of the total aggregate shall be embedded in the flood coat of bitumen or installed in accordance with its product approval. Aggregate shall be dry and free from dirt and shall be in compliance with the sizing requirements set forth in ASTM D 1863. A building official may request a test to confirm compliance with these requirements
Table 1504.8, Maximum Allowable Mean roof Height Permitted for Buildings with Gravel or Stone on the roof in Areas outside a Hurricane-Prone Region, delete to read as follows:

[image: image1.png]



For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm; 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s.

a. Mean roof height in accordance with Section 1609.2.

b. For intermediate values of basic wind speed, the height associated with the

next higher value of wind speed shall be used, or direct interpolation is permitted.

c. NP = gravel and stone not permitted for any roof height.
[Mod 3048 revised] 

Section 1507.2.3 Underlayment, revise text to read as follows:
1507.2.3 Underlayment. Unless otherwise noted, required underlayment shall conform to ASTM D 226, Type I or Type II, or ASTM D 4869 Type I or Type II, or ASTM D 6757 .

[Mod 3191]

Section 1507.2.5 Asphalt shingles, revise text to read as follows:
1507.2.5 Asphalt shingles. Asphalt shingles shall have self-seal strips or be interlocking and comply with ASTM D 225 or ASTM D 3462. Shingles shall also comply with Section 1507.2.10 Table 1507.2.10. Asphalt shingle packaging shall bear labeling indicating compliance with ASTM D 3161 one of the required classifications as shown in Table 1507.2.10 or a listing by an approved testing agency in accordance with the requirements of Section 1609.5.2.

[Mod 3188]

Table 1507.4.3(1) Metal Roof Coverings, revise text to read as follows:

TABLE 1507.4.3(1)

METAL ROOF COVERINGS
	ROOF COVERING TYPE 
	STANDARD
	STANDARD APPLICATION RATE/THICKNESS 

	Aluminum 
	ASTM B 209
	 0.024 inch minimum thickness for roll-formed panels and 0.019 inch minimum thickness for press-formed shingles. 

	Aluminum-zinc coated steel 
	ASTM A 792
	0.013 inch minimum thickness, 
AZ 50  (coated minimum application rate) 

	Cold-rolled copper 
	ASTM B 370
	Minimum 16 oz/sq. ft. and 12 oz./sq. ft. high yield copper for metal-sheet roof covering systems: 12 oz/sq. ft. for preformed metal shingle systems. 

	Copper 
	ASTM B 370
	16 oz./sq. ft. for metal-sheet roof-covering systems; 12 oz./sq. ft. for preformed metal shingle systems. 

	Galvanized steel 
	ASTM A 653
	0.013 inch minimum thickness, 

G-90 zinc-coated

	Hard lead 
	
	2 lbs./sq. ft. 

	Lead-coated copper 
	ASTM B 101
	

	Prepainted steel 
	ASTM A 755
	

	Soft lead 
	
	3 lbs./sq. ft. 

	Stainless steel 
	ASTM A 240
	300 Series Alloys 

	Steel 
	ASTM A 924/A924M
	

	Terne and terne-coated stainless 
	
	Terne coating of 40 lbs. per double base box, field painted where applicable in accordance with manufacturer’s installation instructions. 

	Zinc 
	
	0.027 inch minimum thickness; 99.995% electrolytic high grade zinc with alloy additives of copper (0.08% - 0.20%), titanium (0.07% - 0.12%) and aluminum (0.015%). 


[Mod 2983]

Section 1507.5.6 Flashing, revise text to read as follows:
1507.5.6 Flashing. Roof valley flashing shall be of corrosion-resistant metal of the same material as the roof covering or shall comply with the standards in Table 1507.4.3(1). The valley flashing shall extend at least 8 inches (203 mm) from the centerline each way and shall have a splash diverter rib not less than 0.75 inch (19.1 mm) high at the flow line formed as part of the flashing. Sections of flashing shall have an end lap of not less than 4 inches (102 mm).

[Mod 3035]

Section 1507.7.3 Underlayment, revise text to read as follows:
1507.7.3 Underlayment. Underlayment shall comply with ASTM D 226, Type II or ASTM D 4869 type II.
[Mod 2878]

Section 1507.8.3 Underlayment, revise text to read as follows:
1507.8.3 Underlayment. Underlayment shall comply with ASTM D 226, Type I or ASTM D 4869 type I.
[Mod 2899]

Section 1507.8.7 Flashing, revise text to read as follows:
1507.8.7 Flashing. At the juncture of the roof and vertical surfaces, flashing and counterflashing shall be provided in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions, and where of metal, shall not be less than 0.019-inch (0.48 mm) (No. 26 galvanized sheet gage) corrosion-resistant metal  shall comply with Table 1503.2. The valley flashing shall extend at least 11 inches (279 mm) from the centerline each way and have a splash diverter rib not less than 1 inch (25 mm) high at the flow line formed as part of the flashing. Sections of flashing shall have an end lap of not less than 4 inches (102 mm). For roof slopes of three units vertical in 12 units horizontal (25-percent slope) and over, the valley flashing shall have a 36-inch-wide (914 mm)underlayment of one layer of Type I underlayment running the full length of the valley, in addition to other required underlayment.
[Mod 2900]

Section 1507.9.3 Underlayment, revise text to read as follows:
1507.9.3 Underlayment. Underlayment shall comply with ASTM D 226, Type I or ASTM D 4869 type I.
[Mod 2901]

Section 1507.9.8 Flashing, revise text to read as follows:
1507.9.8 Flashing. At the juncture of the roof and vertical surfaces, flashing and counterflashing shall be provided in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions, and where of metal, shall not be less than 0.019-inch (0.48 mm) (No. 26 galvanized sheet gage) corrosion-resistant metal  shall comply with Table 1503.2. The valley flashing shall extend at least 11 inches (279 mm) from the centerline each way and have a splash diverter rib not less than 1 inch (25 mm)high at the flow line formed as part of the flashing. Sections of flashing shall have an end lap of not less than 4 inches (102 mm). For roof slopes of three units vertical in 12 units horizontal (25-percent slope) and over, the valley flashing shall have a 36-inch-wide (914 mm)underlayment of one layer of Type I underlayment running the full length of the valley, in addition to other required underlayment.
[Mod 2906]

Table 1507.10.2 Built-Up Roofing Material Standards, revise text to read as follows:

Add ASTM D 2824 as a fourth standard for “Asphalt coatings used in roofing” in 6th row of Table 1507.10.2 Built –up Roofing Materials Standards.  

[Mod 3334]

Section 1507.11.2 Material standards, revise text to read as follows:

1507.11.2 Material standards. Modified bitumen roof coverings shall comply with CGSB 37-GP-56M, ASTM D 6162, ASTM D 6163, ASTM D 6164, ASTM D 6222, ASTM D 6223, or ASTM D 6298 or ASTM D 6509.

[Mod 3206]

Section 1525 High-Velocity Hurricane Zones Uniform Permit Application, revise text to read as follows:

SECTION 1525

HIGH-VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONES UNIFORM PERMIT APPLICATION

Florida Building Code Edition 2004 2007

High-Velocity Hurricane Zone Uniform Permit Application Form.

No change to text.

Florida Building Code Edition 2007 2004
High-Velocity Hurricane Zone Uniform Permit Application Form.

Section A (General Information)
No change to text.

Florida Building Code Edition 2007 2004
High-Velocity Hurricane Zone Uniform Permit Application Form.

Section C (Low Slope Application)

No change to text.

Florida Building Code Edition 2007 2004
High-Velocity Hurricane Zone Uniform Permit Application Form.

Section D (Steep Sloped Roof System)

No change to text.

Florida Building Code Edition 2007 2004
High-Velocity Hurricane Zone Uniform Permit Application Form.

Section E (Tile Calculations)

No change to text.

[Mod 3279 and Staff]

Chapter 16 Structural Design

Section 1605.3.1.1 Load reduction, revise text to read as follows:
1605.3.1.1 Load reduction.

1. It is permitted to multiply the combined effect of two or more variable loads by 0.75 and add the effect of dead load. The combined load used in design shall not be less than the sum of the effect of dead load and any of the variable loads.

1 2. Increases in allowable stress specified in the materials sections of this code or a referenced standard shall not be permitted to be used with load combinations of Sections 1605.3.1. Duration of load increase shall be permitted in accordance with Chapter 23.

Exception: Increases in allowable stress shall be permitted in accordance with ACI 530/ASCE 5/TMS 402 provided the load reduction of Section 1605.3.1.1 Item 1 shall not be applied.

2 3. Simultaneous use of both one-third increase in allowable stress and the 25 percent reduction in combined loads shall not be permitted.
[Mod 2857]

Figure 1609 revise to remove “As Amended by Law CS /HB 1A – 2007” at the top and “wwww.floridabuilding.org” at the bottom of the figure.

[image: image2.png]State of Florida

Wind-Borne Debris Region
EIRN =

Basic Wind Speed





[Staff Comment]
Section 1609.1.1 Determination of wind loads, revise text to read as follows:
1609.1.1 Determination of wind loads. Wind loads on every building or structure shall be determined in accordance with Chapter 6 of ASCE 7. The type of opening protection required, the basic wind speed and the exposure category for a site is permitted to be determined in accordance with Section 1609 or ASCE 7.Wind shall be assumed to come from any horizontal direction and wind pressures shall be assumed to act normal to the surface considered

Note: Clarification to ASCE 7. Arrows shown on Figure 6-10 of ASCE7 indicate that the pressure coefficients apply specifically to “Direction of MWFRS being designed.” This means that the longitudinal pressure coefficients are not applicable to trusses that span in the transverse direction and, therefore, uplift reactions for trusses that span in the transverse direction would be determined by the pressure coefficients associated with those shown for the transverse direction.

Exceptions:

1. – 5.  No change.

6. ANSI/TIA/EIA 222 shall be permitted for communication tower and steel antenna support structures and shall meet the wind loads of ASCE 7 and shall be designed by a qualified engineer.

7. – 9.  No change.
[Mod 2853 and Mod 3028]

Section 1609.1.1.1 Applicability, revise text to read as follows:

1609.1.1.1 Applicability. The provisions of IBHS Guideline for Hurricane Resistant Residential Construction, the AF&PA Wood Frame Construction Manual for One- and Two-Family Dwellings, High Wind Areas, the FC & PA Guide to Concrete Masonry Residential Construction in High Wind Areas and the WPPC Guide to Wood Construction in High Wind Areas are applicable only to buildings located within Exposure B or C as defined in Section 1609.4. The provisions of IBHS Guideline for Hurricane Resistant Residential Construction, the AF&PA Wood Frame Construction Manual for One- and Two-Family Dwellings, High Wind Areas, the FC & PA Guide to Concrete Masonry Residential Construction in High Wind Areas and the WPPC Guide to Wood Construction in High Wind Areas shall not apply to buildings sited on the upper half of an isolated hill, ridge or escarpment meeting the following conditions:

1. – 3. No change to text.

[Mod 3316]

Section 1609.1.2 is revised to read as follows:

1609.1.2 Protection of openings. In wind-borne debris regions, glazing in buildings shall be impact resistant or protected with an impact resistant covering meeting the requirements of SSTD 12, ASTM E 1886 and ASTM E 1996, ANSI/DASMA 115 (for garage doors and rolling doors) or Miami-Dade TAS 201, 202 and 203 or AAMA 506 referenced therein as follows:  Windows Glazed openings in buildings located in wind-borne debris regions shall have glazed openings be protected from wind-borne debris. Glazed opening protection for wind-borne debris shall meet the requirements SSTD 12, ASTM E 1886 and ASTM E 1996, ANSI/DASMA 115 (for garage doors and rolling doors) or TAS 201, 202 and 203 or AAMA 506 referenced therein.
Remaining text unchanged. 
[Mod 3215 revised]

Section 1609.4.2 Surface roughness categories, revise text to read as follows:

1609.4.2 Surface roughness categories.  A ground surface roughness within each 45-degree (0.79 rad) sector shall be determined for a distance upwind of the site as defined in Section 1609.4.3 from the categories defined below, for the purpose of assigning an exposure category as defined in Section 1609.4.3.
Surface Roughness B. Urban and suburban areas, wooded areas or other terrain with numerous closely spaced obstructions having the size of single-family dwellings or larger.

Surface Roughness C. Open terrain with scattered obstructions having heights generally less than 30 feet (9144 mm). This category includes flat open country, grasslands, and all water surfaces in hurricane-prone regions. This surface roughness shall also apply to any building located within surface roughness B-type terrain where the building is within 100 feet horizontally in any direction of open areas of surface roughness C-type terrain that extends more than 600 feet (182.9 m) and width greater than 150 ft. in the upwind direction. Short-term (less than two year) changes in the pre-existing terrain exposure, for the purposes of development, shall not be considered surface roughness C. Where development buildout will occur within three years and the resultant condition will meet the definition of surface roughness B, surface roughness B shall be regulating for the purpose of permitting. This category includes flat open country, grasslands and ocean or gulf shorelines and shall extend downwind for a distance of 1500 feet.
Surface Roughness D. Reserved.
Section 1609.4.3 Exposure categories, revise text to read as follows:

1609.4.3 Exposure categories. An exposure category shall be determined in accordance with the following:  
Exposure B.  Exposure B shall apply where the ground surface roughness condition, as defined by Surface Roughness B, prevails in the upwind direction for a distance of at least 2,600 feet (792 m) or 20 times the height of the building, whichever is greater.

Exception: For buildings whose mean roof height is less than or equal to 30 feet (9144 mm), the upwind distance is permitted to be reduced to 1,500 feet (457 m).

Exposure C. Exposure C shall apply for all cases where Exposure B does not apply. Open terrain with scattered obstructions, including surface undulations or other irregularities, having heights generally less than 30 feet (9144 mm) extending more than 1,500 feet (457.2 m) from the building site in any quadrant. This exposure shall also apply to any building located within Exposure B-type terrain where the building is within 100 feet horizontally in any direction of open areas of Exposure C-type terrain that extends more than 600 feet (182.9 m) and width greater than 150 ft. in the upwind direction. Short-term (less than two year) changes in the pre-existing terrain exposure, for the purposes of development, shall not be considered open fields. Where development buildout will occur within three years and the resultant condition will meet the definition of Exposure B, Exposure B shall be regulating for the purpose of permitting. This category includes flat open country, grasslands and ocean or gulf shorelines and shall extend downwind for a distance of 1500 feet. For bBuildings located within a distance of 600 feet of inland bodies of water that present a fetch of 1 mile (1.61 km) or more or inland waterways or rivers with a width of 1 mile (1.61 km) or more shall be classified as Exposure C and roof sheathing uplift and roof-to-wall uplift loads shall be increased by 20 percent.

Exposure D. This exposure category is not applicable in Florida.
[Mod 3308]

Section 1609.5.2 Roof coverings, revise text to read as follows:

1609.5.2 Roof coverings. Roof coverings shall comply with Section 1609.5.1.
Exception: Rigid tile roof coverings that are air permeable and installed over a roof deck complying with Section 1609.5.1 are permitted to be designed in accordance with Section 1609.5.3.

Asphalt shingles installed over a roof deck complying with Section 1609.5.1 shall be tested to determine the resistance of the sealant to uplift forces using ASTM D 6381. comply with the wind resistance requirements of Section 1507.2.10.
Asphalt shingles installed over a roof deck complying with Section 1609.5.1 are permitted to be designed using UL 2390 to determine appropriate uplift and force coefficients applied to the shingle. 
[Mod 3190]

Section 1622.1 is revised to read as follows:

1622.1 Screen enclosures.

1622.1.1 The wind loads on screen surfaces shall be per ASCE 7 Table 6-12 based on the ratio of solid to gross area.

1622.1.2 Design shall be based on such loads applied horizontally inward and outward to the walls with a shape factor of 1.3 and applied vertically upward and downward on the roof with a shape factor of 0.7.

1622.2 Windbreakers.

1622.2.1 Vinyl and acrylic glazed panels shall be removable. Removable panels shall be identified as removable by a decal. The identification decal shall essentially state "Removable panel SHALL be removed when wind speeds exceed 75 mph (34 m/s)." Decals shall be placed such that the decal is visible when the panel is installed.

1622.2.2 Permanent frame shall be designed per section 1620 and 1622.1.2.

[Mod 2981 revised]

Section 1626.1 is revised to read as follows:

1626.1 All parts or systems of a building or structure envelope such as, but not limited, to exterior walls, roof, outside doors, skylights, glazing and glass block shall meet impact test criteria or be protected with an external protection device that meets the impact test criteria. Test procedures to determine resistance to wind-borne debris of wall cladding, outside doors, skylights, glazing, glass block, shutters and any other external protection devices shall be performed in accordance with this section.

Exception: The following structures or portion of structures shall not be required to meet the provisions of this section:

a. Roof assemblies for screen rooms, porches, canopies, etc., attached to a building that do not breach the exterior wall or building envelope and have no enclosed sides other than screen.

b. Soffits, soffit vents and ridge vents. Size and location of such vents shall be detailed by the designer and shall not compromise the integrity of the diaphragm boundary.

c. Vents in a garage with four or fewer cars. Size and location of such vents shall be detailed by the designer and shall not exceed the minimum required area by more than 25 percent.

d. Exterior wall or roof openings for wall or roof mounted HVAC equipment.

e. Openings for roof-mounted personnel access roof hatches.

f. Storage sheds that are not designed for human habitation and that have a floor area of 720 square feet (67 m2) or less are not required to comply with the mandatory windborne debris impact standards of this code.

g. Louvers as long as they properly considered ASCE 7 in the design of the building.

h. Buildings and structures for marinas, cabanas, swimming pools, solariums and greenhouses.

[Mod 3232]

Chapter 17 Structural Tests and Special Inspections

Section 1714.5.2.1 Testing and labeling, revise text to read as follows:

1714.5.2.1 Testing and labeling. Exterior windows and glass doors shall be tested by an approved independent testing laboratory, and shall be labeled with an approved label identifying the manufacturer, performance characteristics and approved product certification agency, testing laboratory, evaluation entity or Miami-Dade Product Approval to indicate compliance with the requirements of one of the following specifications:

ANSI/AAMA/NWWDA 101/I.S. 2 or ANSI/AAMA/WDMA/101/I.S. 2/NAFS or AAMA/WDMA/CSA 101/I.S. 2/A440 or TAS202 (HVHZ shall comply with TAS202 utilizing ASTM E 1300-98 or ASTM E 1300-04 or Section 2404).
Exterior windows and sliding glass doors shall be labeled with a permanent label, marking, or etching providing traceability to the manufacturer and product. The following shall also be required either on a permanent label or on a temporary supplemental label applied by the manufacturer: information identifying the manufacturer, the product model/series number, positive and negative design pressure rating, product maximum size, glazing thickness, impact-resistance rating if applicable, Florida Product Approval number or Miami-Dade Product Approval number, applicable test standard(s), and approved product certification agency, testing laboratory, evaluation entity or Miami-Dade Product Approval. 

The labels are limited to one design pressure rating per reference standard. The temporary supplemental label shall remain on the window or door until final approval by the building official. 

Exceptions:  

1.
Door assemblies installed in nonhabitable areas where the door assembly and area are designed to accept water infiltration need not be tested for water infiltration.

2.
Door assemblies installed where the overhang (OH) ratio is equal to or more than 1 need not be tested for water infiltration. The overhang ratio shall be calculated by the following equation:

OH ratio = OH Length/OH Height

Where:

OH length = The horizontal measure of how far an overhang over a door projects out from door surface.

OH height = The vertical measure of the distance from the door sill to the bottom of the overhang over a door.

3.
Pass-through windows for serving from a single-family kitchen, where protected by a roof overhang of 5 feet (1.5 m) or more shall be exempted from the requirements of the water infiltration test.
The permanent label is limited to only one design pressure rating per reference standard per label.

Exterior windows and glass doors shall be labeled with a temporary supplemental label printed and applied by the manufacturer. The label shall identify the manufacturer, products model/series number, positive and negative design pressure rating, products maximum size, glazing thickness, indicate impact rated if applicable, Florida Product Approval or Miami-Dade Product Approval number if applicable, and applicable test standard. The supplemental label is limited to only one design pressure rating per reference standard per label. This supplemental label shall remain on the window until final approval by the building official.

The permanent label shall always be the default label in case the temporary label is missing or no longer legible for final approval by the building official.

Glass Strength: Products tested and labeled as conforming to ANSI/AAMA/NWWDA 101/I.S.2 or ANSI/AAMA/WDMA/101/I.S.2/NAFS or AAMA/WDMA/CSA 101/I.S.2/A440 or TAS 202 shall not be subject to the requirements of Sections 2403.2 or 2403.3 or 2404.1. Determination of load resistance of glass for specific loads of products not tested and certified in accordance with Section 1714.5.2.1 shall be designed and labeled to comply with ASTM E 1300 in accordance with Section 2404. The temporary supplemental label shall designate the type and thickness of glass or glazing material.

[Mod 3202 and Mod 3193]  
Section 1714.5.2.1.1 Testing and labeling of skylights is revised to read as follows:

1714.5.2.1.1 Testing and labeling of skylights. Exterior skylights shall be tested by an approved independent testing laboratory, and shall be labeled with an approved permanent label identifying the manufacturer, the products model/series number, performance characteristics and approved product evaluation entity to indicate compliance with the requirements of one of the following specifications: 

ANSI/AAMA/WDMA 101/I.S.2/NAFS or AAMA/WDMA/CSA 101/I.S.2/A440, Voluntary Performance Specification for Windows, Skylights and Glass Doors, or TAS 202 (HVHZ shall comply with TAS 202). 

Exterior skylights shall be labeled with a permanent label, marking, or etching providing traceability to the manufacturer and product. The following shall also be required either on a permanent label or on a temporary supplemental label applied by the manufacturer: information identifying the manufacturer, the product model/series number, positive and negative design pressure rating, product maximum size, type and thickness of glass or glazing material, impact-resistance rating if applicable, Florida Product Approval number or Miami-Dade Product Approval number, applicable test standard(s), and approved product certification agency, testing laboratory, evaluation entity or Miami-Dade Product Approval. 

Labels are limited to one design pressure rating per reference standard. The temporary supplemental label shall remain on the skylight until final approval by the building official. 

The permanent label is limited to only one design pressure rating per reference standard per label. 

Exterior skylights shall be labeled with a temporary supplemental label printed and applied by the manufacturer. The label shall identify the manufacturer, products model/series number, positive and negative design pressure rating, products maximum size, glazing thickness, indicate impact rated if applicable, Florida Product Approval or Miami-Dade Product Approval number if applicable, and applicable test standard. The supplemental label is limited to only one design pressure rating per reference standard per label. This supplemental label shall remain on the window until final approval by the building official. The permanent label shall always be the default label in case the temporary label is missing or no longer legible for final approval by the building official.
[Mod 3195]

Section 1714.5.2.2 Comparative analysis label, revise text to read as follows:

1714.5.2.2 Supplemental label. Comparative Analysis Label. A temporary supplemental label conforming to AAMA 203, Procedural Guide for the Window Inspection and Notification System, shall be acceptable for establishing and communicating the calculated allowable design pressures higher than indicated on the label required by Section 1714.5.2.1 for window or door sizes smaller than that required by the ANSI/AAMA/NWWDA 101/I.S.2 or ANSI/AAMA/WDMA 101/I.S.2/NAFS or AAMA/WDMA/CSA 101/I.S.2/A440 test requirements. This temporary supplemental label shall be applied by the manufacturer and remain on the window or door until final approval by the building official. 

No change to remaining text.
[Mod 3199]

Section 1714.5.3 Exterior door assemblies, revise text to read as follows:

1714.5.3 Exterior door assemblies. Exterior door assemblies not covered by Section 1714.5.2 1714.4.2 or Section 1714.5.3.1 shall be tested for structural integrity in accordance with ASTM E 330 Procedure A, at a load of 1.5 times the required design pressure load. The load shall be sustained for 10 seconds with no permanent deformation of any main frame or panel member in excess of 0.4 percent of its span after the load is removed. High-velocity hurricane zones shall comply with TAS 202. After each specified loading, there shall be no glass breakage, permanent damage to fasteners, hardware parts, or any other damage which causes the door to be inoperable.

The minimum test sizes and minimum design pressures shall be as indicated in Table 1714.5.3.

The unit size tested shall qualify all units smaller in width and/or height of the same operation type and be limited to cases where frame, panels and structural members maintain the same profile as tested.

[Staff]

Chapter 18 Soils and Foundations

Section 1816.2 Penetration, add text to read as follows:

1816.2 Penetration. Protective sleeves around piping penetrating concrete slab-on-grade floors shall not be of cellulose-containing materials. If soil treatment is used for subterranean termite protection, the sleeve shall have a maximum wall thickness of 0.010 inch, and be sealed within the slab using a non-corrosive clamping device to eliminate the annular space between the pipe and the sleeve. No termiticides shall be applied inside the sleeve.

Section 1816.2.1 Penetration, delete text to read as follows:

     1816.2.1 Protective sleeves around metallic piping penetrating concrete slab-on-grade floors shall not be of cellulose-containing materials.

     1816.2.2 If soil treatment is used for subterranean termite protection, the protective sleeve shall meet the following minimum requirements:

1. The sleeve shall have a nominal thickness of 0.025 inch.

2. The sleeve shall be sized for the pipe.

3. The sleeve shall be sealed within the slab using a noncorrosive mechanical clamping device to eliminate the annular space between the pipe and pipe sleeve.

[Mod 2839]

Chapter 20, Aluminum

Section 2002.4 Loads is revised to read as follows:

2002.4 Loads. Structural members supporting screened enclosures shall be designed for wind in either both of two orthogonal directions using the pressures given in Table 2002.4. Each primary member shall also be designed for a 300 pound (1.33 kN) load applied vertically downward along any 1 foot (305 Mm) of any member, not occurring simultaneously with wind load.
[Mod 3220]
Table 2002.4, Note h is revised to read as follows:

h. Table pressures apply for all screen densities up to 20 x 20 x 0.013" mesh screen. For 18 X 14 X 0.013" mesh screen, pressures on screen surfaces may be multiplied by 0.88. For greater densities screen densities greater than 20X20X0.013", use pressures for enclosed buildings.

[Mod 3234]
Chapter 23, Wood
Section 2314.4.5 is revised to read as follows:

2314.4.5

American Wood Preservers Association P.O. Box 361784, Birmingham, AL 35236-1784 5283, Springfield, VA 22150 AWPA
1. 
AWPA Use Category Systems Standard U1 All Timber Products - Pressure Treatment (General Requirements) C1

2. 
AWPA Standard M4 Care of Pressure Treated Wood Products Lumber, Timbers, Bridge Ties & Mine Ties Pressure Requirements C2

3. 
Piles - Pressure Treatment C3

4. 
Poles - Pressure Treatment C4

5. 
Care of Pressure Treated Wood Products M4

6. 
Posts - Pressure Treatment C5

7. 
Crossties and Switch Ties -Pressure Treatment C6

8. 
Incised (Red, White & Alaska Yellow Cedar) Poles Butts Thermal Treatment C7

9.
Poles (Western Red & Alaska Yellow Cedar) Full Length Thermal Treatment C8

10. 
Plywood - Pressure Treatment C9

11. 
Poles (Lodgepole Pine) Full Length Thermal Treatment C10

12. 
Wood Blocks for Floors & Platforms Pressure Treatment C11

13. 
Wood for Highway Construction Pressure Treatment C14

14. 
Wood used on Farms - Pressure Treatment C16

15. 
Piles and Timbers in Marine Construction Pressure Treatment C18

16. 
Structural Lumber - Fire Retardant -Pressure Treatment C20

17. 
Lumber and Plywood for Permanent Wood Foundations C22

18. 
Pole Building Construction - Pressure Treatment C Section 23

19.
 Crossarms - Pressure Treatment C25

20. 
Crossarms - Non-Pressure Treatment C26

21. 
Structural Glued Laminated Members & Laminations Before Gluing Pressure Treatment C28

22. 
Lumber to be Used for the Harvesting, Storage and Transportation of Food Stuffs - Pressure Treatment C29

[Mod 2909]

Section 2315.1.9 is revised to read as follows:

2315.1.9  Pressure-treated poles shall be treated in accordance with AWPA U1 for sawn timber posts (Commodity Specification A, Use Category 4B) and for round timber posts (Commodity Specification B, Use Category 4B) branded in accordance with AWPA Standard M6 at the treating facility.
[Mod 2912]

Section 2325.3 is revised to read as follows:

2325.3  Plywood decking and approved wood panels, wood joists and wood studs supporting such wood joists may be used to support reinforced concrete slabs, concrete-base tile and terrazzo floors and lightweight concrete toppings as follows:

1.
There shall be an approved moisture vapor barrier between the concrete or other cementitious materials and the wood.

2.
Wood members supporting concrete shall be preservative treated in compliance with the standards of AWPA Use Category Systems Standard U1, Commodity Specification A Use Category 4B and AWPB set forth in Sections 2314.4 and 2326.

3.
Approved wood-based structural-use panel decking shall be rated for Exposure 1.

4.
Wood rafters may support concrete roof tile.

[Mod 2913]

Chapter 24, Glass and Glazing

Section 2403.1 Identification is revised to read as follows:

2403.1 Identification. Each pane shall bear the manufacturer’s mark designating the type and thickness of the glass or glazing material. With the exception of tempered glazing materials or laminated materials, the identification shall not be omitted unless approved and an affidavit is furnished by the glazing contractor certifying that each light is glazed in accordance with approved construction documents that comply with the provisions of this chapter. Safety glazing shall be identified in accordance with Section 2406.2. Each pane of tempered or laminated glass, except tempered spandrel glass, shall be permanently identified by the manufacturer and each pane of laminated glass shall be permanently identified with the laminator, overall glass thickness and trade name of interlayer.  The identification mark shall be acid etched, sand blasted, ceramic fired, laser etched, embossed or of a type that, once applied, cannot be removed without being destroyed. Tempered or laminated spandrel glass shall be provided with a removable paper marking by the manufacturer.

[Mod 3301 revised]

Chapter 26 Plastic

Section 2601.1 Scope, revise text to read as follows:

2601.1 Scope. These provisions shall govern the materials, design, application, construction and installation of foam plastic, foam plastic insulation, plastic veneer, interior plastic finish and trim and light-transmitting plastics. See Chapter 14 for requirements for exterior wall finish and trim.

Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Sections 2603.89 and 2612.

[Staff]

Chapter 27 Electrical

Section 2705 Equipotential Bonding, add text to read as follows:

Section 2705 Equipotential Bonding

2705.1 NFPA 70 - 05: National Electric Code, Article 680 (Swimming Pools, Fountains, and Similar Installation), Section 680.26, Equipotential Bonding is amended to read as follows:

680.26 Equipotential Bonding.

(A) Performance. The equipotential bonding required by this section shall be installed to reduce eliminate voltage gradients in the pool area as prescribed.

FPN: The 8 AWG or larger solid copper bonding conductor shall not be required to be extended or attached to any remote panelboard, service equipment, or any electrode.

(B) Bonded Parts. The parts specified in 680.26(B)(1) through (B)(57) shall be bonded together using solid copper conductors, insulated covered, or bare, not smaller than 8 AWG or with rigid metal conduit of brass or other identified corrosion-resistant metal. Connections to bonded parts shall be made in accordance with 250.8. An 8 AWG or larger solid copper bonding conductor provided to reduce voltage gradients in the pool area shall not be required to be extended or attached to remote panelboards, service equipment, or electrodes.

(1) Conductive Pool Shells. Bonding to conductive pool shells shall be provided as specified in 680.26(B)(1)(a) or (B)(1)(b). Poured concrete, pneumatically applied or sprayed concrete, and concrete block with painted or plastered coatings shall all be considered conductive materials due to water permeability and porosity. Vinyl liners and fiberglass composite shells shall be considered to be non-conductive materials.

(a). Structural Reinforcing Steel. Unencapsulated structural reinforcing steel shall be bonded together by steel tie wires or the equivalent. Where structural reinforcing steel is encapsulated in a nonconductive compound, a copper conductor grid shall be installed in accordance with 680.26(B)(1)(b).

(b). Copper Conductor Grid. A copper conductor grid shall be provided and shall comply with (b)(1) through (b)(4):

(1) Be constructed of minimum 8 AWG bare solid copper conductors bonded to each other at all points of crossing.

(2) Conform to the contour of the pool and the pool deck.

(3) Be arranged in a 300 mm (12 in.) by 300 mm (12 in.) network of conductors in a uniformly spaced perpendicular grid pattern with a tolerance of 100 mm (4 in.).

(4) Be secured within or under the pool no more than 150 mm (6 in.) from the outer contour of the pool shell.

(2) Perimeter Surfaces. The perimeter surface shall extends for 1 m (3 ft) horizontally beyond the inside walls of the pool and shall includes unpaved surfaces as well as poured concrete and other types of paving. Bonding to perimeter surfaces shall be provided as specified in 680.26(B)(2)(a) or (2)(b), and shall be attached to the pool reinforcing steel or copper conductor grid at a minimum of four (4) points uniformly spaced around the perimeter of the pool. For non-conductive pool shells, bonding at four points shall not be required.

(C) Equipotential Bonding Grid.  The parts specified in 680.26(B) shall be connected to an equipotential bonding grid with a solid copper conductor, insulated, covered, or bare, not smaller than 8 AWG or rigid metal conduit of brass or other identified corrosion-resistant metal conduit.  Connection shall be made by exothermic welding or by listed pressure connector or clamps that are labeled as being suitable for the purpose and are of stainless steel, brass, copper, or copper alloy.  The equipotential common bonding grid shall extend under paved walking surfaces for 1 m (3 ft) horizontally beyond the inside walls of the pool and shall be permitted to be any of the following:

(1)(a) Structural Reinforcing Steel. Structural reinforcing steel of a concrete pool where the reinforcing rods are bonded together by the usual steel tie wires or the equivalent shall be bonded In accordance with 680.26 (B)(1)(a).

(2) Bolted or Welded Metal Pools.  The wall of a bolted or welded metal pool.

(3) (b) Alternate Means. Where structural reinforcing steel is not available or is encapsulated in a nonconductive compound, a copper conductor(s) shall be utilized where the following requirements are met:

(1) At least one minimum 8 AWG bare solid copper conductor shall be provided.

(2) The conductor(s) shall follow the contour of the perimeter surface.

(3) Only listed splices shall be permitted.

(4) The required conductor shall be 450 to 600 mm (18 to 24 in.) from the inside walls of the pool.

(5) The required conductor shall be secured within or under the perimeter surface 100 to 150 mm (4 to 6 in.) below the subgrade.

 This system shall be permitted to be constructed as specified in (a) through (c):

a.  Materials and Connections.  The grid shall be constructed of minimum 8 AWG bare solid copper conductors.  Conductors shall be bonded to each other at all points of crossing.  Connection shall be made as required by 680.26(D).

b.  Grid Structure.  The equipotential bonding grid shall cover the contour of the pool and the pool deck extending 1 m (3 ft) horizontally from the inside walls of the pool.  The equipotential bonding grid shall be arranged in a 300 mm (12 in) by 300 mm (12 in) network of conductors in a uniformly spaced perpendicular grid pattern with tolerance of 100 mm (4 in).

c.  Securing.  The below-grade grid shall be secured within or under the pool and deck media.

(D) Connections.  Where structural reinforcing steel or the walls of bolted or welded metal pool structures are used as an equipotential bonding grid for nonelectrical parts, the connections shall be made in accordance with 250.8.

(13) Metallic Structural Components. All metallic parts of the pool structure, including reinforcing metal of the pool shell, coping stones, and deck, shall be bonded.  The usual steel tie wires shall be considered suitable for bonding the reinforcing steel together, and welding or special clamping shall not be required.  These tie wires shall be made tight.  If reinforcing steel is affectively insulated by an encapsulating nonconductive compound at the time of manufacture and installation, it shall not be required to be bonded. Where reinforcing steel of the pool shell or the reinforcing steel of coping stones and deck is encapsulated with a nonconductive compound or another conductive material is not available, provisions shall be made for an alternative means to eliminate voltage gradients that would otherwise be provided by an encapsulated, bonding reinforcing steel. not addressed in 680.26(B)(1)(a), shall be bonded. Where reinforcing steel is encapsulated with a nonconductive compound, the reinforcing steel shall not be required to be bonded.

(24) Underwater Lighting. All metal forming shells and mounting brackets of no-niche luminaires (fixtures) shall be bonded unless a. 
Exception: Listed low-voltage lighting systems with nonmetallic forming shells shall not requireing bonding is used.
(35) Metal Fittings. All metal fittings within or attached to the pool structure shall be bonded. Isolated parts that are not over 100 mm (4 in.) in any dimension and do not penetrate into the pool structure more than 25 mm (1 in.) shall not require bonding.

(46) Electrical Equipment. Metal parts of electrical equipment associated with the pool water circulating system, including pump motors and metal parts of equipment associated with pool covers, including electric motors, shall be bonded.  Accessible metal parts of listed equipment incorporating an approved system of double insulation and providing a means for grounding internal nonaccessible, non-current-carrying metal parts shall not be bonded by a direct connection to the equipotential bonding grid.  The means for grounding internal nonaccessible, non-current-carrying metal parts shall be an equipment grounding conductor run with the power-supply conductors in the case of motors supplied with a flexible cord, or a grounding terminal in the case of motors intended for permanent connection.  

Where a double-insulated water-pump motor is installed under the provisions  of this rule, a solid 8 AWG copper conductor that is of sufficient length to make a bonding connection to a replacement motor shall be extended from the bonding grid to an accessible point in the motor vicinity.  Where there is no connection between the swimming pool bonding grid and the equipment grounding conductor of the motor circuit.

Exception: Metal parts of listed equipment incorporating an approved system of double insulation shall not be bonded.

 (a) Double-Insulated Water Pump Motors. Where a double-insulated water-pump motor is installed under the provisions of this rule, a solid 8 AWG copper conductor that is of sufficient length to make a bonding connection to a replacement motor shall be extended from the bonding grid to an accessible point in the motor vicinity of the pool pump motor.  Where there is no connection between the swimming pool bonding grid and the equipment grounding system for the premises, this bonding conductor shall be connected to the equipment grounding conductor of the motor circuit.  

(bE) Pool Water Heaters. For pool water heaters rated at more than 50 amperes and having specific instructions regarding bonding and grounding, only those parts designated to be bonded shall be bonded and only those parts designated to be grounded shall be grounded.

(57) Metal Wiring Methods and Equipment. Metal-sheathed cables and raceways, metal piping, and all fixed metal parts that are within the following distances of the pool, except those separated from the pool by a permanent barrier, shall be bonded.

(1) Within 1.5 m (5 ft) horizontally of the inside walls of the pool

(2) Within 3.7 m (12 ft) measured vertically above the maximum water level of the pool, or any observation stands, towers, or platforms, or any diving structures.

Exception No. 1: Those separated from the pool by a permanent barrier shall not be required to be bonded.

Exception No. 2: (1) Within Those greater than 1.5 m (5 ft) horizontally of the inside walls of the pool shall not be required to be bonded.

Exception No. 3: (2) Within Those greater than 3.7 m (12 ft) measured vertically above the maximum water level of the pool, or as measured vertically above any observation stands, towers, or platforms, or any diving structures shall not be required to be bonded.

(C) Pool Water. An intentional bond of a minimum conductive surface area of 5806 mm 2 (9 in 2 ) shall be installed in contact with the pool water. This bond shall be permitted to consist of parts that are required to be bonded in 680.26(B).

Section 2706 Connection of Grounding and Bonding Equipment, add text to read as follows:

2706 Connection of Grounding and Bonding Equipment.

2706.1 NFPA 70-05 National Electric Code, Article 250 (Grounding and Bonding), Section 250.8 Connection of Grounding and Bonding Equipment is amended to read as follows:

250.8 Connection of Grounding and Bonding Equipment.  

A. Permitted Methods.  Grounding conductors and bonding jumpers shall be connected by one of the following means:

(1) Llisted pressure connectors, listed clamps, or
(2) Terminal bars

(3)  Pressure connectors listed as grounding and bonding equipment

(4)  Eexothermic welding process
(5)  Machine screw-type fasteners that engage not less than two threads or are secured with a nut

(6)  Thread-forming machine screws that engage not less than two threads in the enclosure

(7)  Connections that are part of a listed assembly

(8)  Oother listed means

B. Methods not permitted.  Connection devices or fittings that depend solely on solder shall not be used.  Sheet metal screws shall not be used to connect grounding conductors to enclosures.

[Mod 3014rev]

Chapter 30 Elevators and Conveying Systems

Section 3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate an ambulance stretcher, revise text to read as follows:

3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate an ambulance stretcher.  Where elevators are provided in buildings four or more stories above grade plane or four or more stories below grade plane, or where the rise exceeds 25 feet, at least one elevator shall be provided for fire department emergency access to all floors.  The elevator car shall be of such a size and arrangement to accommodate an ambulance stretcher 24-inch by 84-inch  76-inch (610 mm by 2250 1950 mm) ambulance stretcher in the horizontal, open position and shall be identified by the international symbol for emergency medical services (star of life). The symbol shall not be less than 3 inches (76 mm) high and shall be placed inside on both sides of the hoistway door frame.
[Mod 3145]

Chapter 31 Special Construction

Section 3105.3.1, revise text to read as follows:

3105.3.1 Fabric used for awnings or fabric-covered frames shall meet the flame propagation performance criteria of be flame resistant in accordance with NFPA 701.

Exception: Awnings or fabric-covered frames used in conjunction with Group R-3 occupancies

[Mod 3042]

Chapter 35 Reference Standards

Revise text to read as follows:

AAF              Aluminum Association of Florida, Inc.

                     1650 S Dixie Hwy, Ste 500 3165 McCrory Place, Suite 185  


Boca Raton, FL 33432  Orlando, FL 32803 
AAF—07 07-1  Guide to Aluminum Construction in High Wind Areas 2003 2007-1  2002.4.1
[Mod 2987]

Delete text to read as follows:

ASME

A112.18.19.8M—1987 Suction Fittings for Use in Swimming Pools, Wading Pools, Spas, Hot Tubs and Whirlpool Bathing Appliances………….3109.5.1

A112.19.17—2002 Manufactured Safety Vacuum Release Systems (SVRS) for Residential and Commercial Swimming Pool, Spa, Hot Tub and Wading Pool……………………………………………………………………………..3109.5.2

[Mod 3182]

Revise text to read as follows:

APSP NSPI
Association of Pool and Spa Professionals
National Spa and Pool Institute

ANSI/NSPI 6—99 92 American National Standard for Residential Portable Spas…………………………………………………………………………424.2.6.1

ANSI/APSP NSPI 7—06 American National Standard for Suction Entrapment Avoidance in Swimming Pools, Wading Pools, Spas, Hot Tubs, and Catch Basins…………….……………424.2.6.1, 424.2.6.3, 424.2.6.6 424.2.6
[Mod 3182]

ANSI/APSP NSPI-7 2006 American National Standard for Suction Entrapment Avoidance in Swimming Pools, Wading Pools, Spas, Hot Tubs, and Catch Basins………………………………………………………………….……....424.2.6 
[Mod 2974] 
Revise text to read as follows:

ASTM A 924 /A924M—04  Standard Specification for General Requirements for Steel Sheet, Metallic-coated by the Hot-dip Process . . . . . . . . . . . Table 1507.4.3(1) . 2319.17.2.2.7. 
[Mod 2983]
Add text to read as follows:

ASTM D 2824 Standard Specification for Aluminum-Pigmented Asphalt Roof Coatings, Nonfibered Asbestos Fibered, and Fibered without Asbestos…….    Table 1507.10.2

ASTM D 6509-00 Specification for Atactic Polypropylene (APP) Modified Bituminous Base Sheet Materials Using Glass Fiber Reinforcements……….1507.11.2
ASTM E 283-04 Test Method for Determining Rate of Leakage Through Exterior Windows, Curtain Walls and Doors Under Specified Pressure Differences Across the Specimen------------  13-606.ABC.1.1, 13-606.ABC.1.2.4
[Mod 3206, Mod 3334, Mod 2977 and Mod 2978]

Revise text to read as follows:

DASMA

ANSI/DASMA 107-98 (03)    Room Fire Test Standard…. (remainder unchanged)

ANSI/DASMA 108-02 05   Standard Method for Testing Sectional Garage Doors and Rolling Doors:  Determination of Structural Performance Under Uniform Static Air Pressure Difference                                                 1714.5.3.1
ANSI/DASMA 115-05           Standard Method for Testing Garage Doors….. (remainder unchanged)

[Mod 3236 and Mod 3237]

FM
4470 (1992) Approval Standard for Class 1 Roof Covers  .. . .1504.3.1, 1504.7, 1515.1.1

[Mod 2974 and Mod 3046]

Revise text to read as follows:

NFPA

32—04 00 Dry Cleaning Plants  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .415.6.4

96-04 Standard for Ventilation Control and Fire Protection of Commercial Cooking Operations . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 436.6.2

99—05 02 Standard for Health Care Facilities. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 4203.18.1, 420.3.20.2, 420.3.25.1, 419.3.18, 419.3.18.8

101—06 Life Safety Code . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 420.3.3.6, 423.6.1, 423.14.2.1, 423.27.9.1, 423.27.10.1, 427.2.2.1.1.1, 427.1.4.13.2, 427.1.4.2.13, 427.1.4.1.1.2, 427.1.3.1.1.2, 903.6.2, 1024.6.2 
120—04 99 Coal Preparation Plants  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .415.6.1

259—03 04Test Method for Potential Heat of Building Materials. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2603.4.1.10, 2603.5.3, 2612.3.2.4.4
286—06 00 Standard Method of Fire Test for Evaluating Contribution of Wall and Ceiling Interior Finish to Room Fire Growth  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .402.15.4, 803.2, 803.2.1, 803.5, 803.6.3, 2603.4, 2603.9

409—04 01 Aircraft Hangars  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .412.2.6, 412.4.5

484—06 02 Combustible Metals, Metal Powders and Metal Dust   . . . .415.6.1

780—04 97 Installation of Lighting Systems . . .419.3.19, 420.3.26.1, 423.17.7

[Mod 3052, Mod 2974 and Mod 3012]

Add text to read as follows:

UL

ANSI/UL 2034 - 96, Standard for Single and Multiple Station CO Alarms…………202
UL 2075 - 04, Gas and Vapor Detector Sensor………………………...…………….202
[Mod 3025]
PAGE  
59
C:\Documents and Settings\bettys\My Documents\2007 glitch\2007glitch supplement103108\Supplement to the 2007 Florida Building Code building no energy102808.doc
Last printed 11/13/2008 1:15:00 PM

