, | FSEC Energy
uce | Research Center

UNIVERSITY OF CENTRAL FLORIDA

RESIDENTIAL CODE REVIEW
FOR THE 2023 FLORIDA BUILDING
ENERGY CODE

Residential 2024 IECC Changes

Review Summary
June 18, 2024
Progress to Date Draft

Submitted to

Department of Business and Professional Regulation
Office of Codes and Standards
2601 Blair Stone Road
Tallahassee, FL 32399
Order No. C1DF39

Submitted by

Jeffrey Sonne

Copyright ©2024 Florida Solar Energy Center/University of Central Florida
All Rights Reserved.



Disclaimer

The Florida Solar Energy Center/University of Central Florida nor any agency thereof, nor any of their
employees, makes any warranty, express or implied, or assumes any legal liability or responsibility for the
accuracy, completeness, or usefulness of any information, apparatus, product, or process disclosed, or
represents that its use would not infringe privately owned rights. Reference herein to any specific
commercial product, process, or service by trade name, trademark, manufacturer, or otherwise does not
necessarily constitute or imply its endorsement, recommendation, or favoring by the Florida Solar Energy
Center/University of Central Florida or any agency thereof. The views and opinions of the authors
expressed herein do not necessarily state or reflect those of the Florida Solar Energy Center/University of
Central Florida or any agency thereof.



Residential 2024 IECC Changes Review Summary

Residential 2024 IECC changes with respect to the 2021 IECC and 2023 Florida Building Code,
Energy Conservation (FBC-EC) are summarized in the table below. The table contains six
columns defined as follows:

2024 IECC Section and Title: The 2024 IECC code section number and title for the code
change.

ICC Code Change No.: Proposed code change number in the ICC’s Complete Revision History
to the 2024 I-Codes document.

Change Summary between 2021 IECC and 2024 IECC: Brief description of the code change
between the 2021 IECC and 2024 IECC.

Change Summary between 2023 FBC-EC and 2024 IECC: Brief description of the code
change between the 2023 FBC-EC and 2024 IECC.

Anticipated Energy Impact on FBC-EC if Adopted: Anticipated energy use impact from the
code change if it is adopted in the FBC-EC. “None” means the code change has no or negligible
anticipated impact on energy use.

Anticipated Cost Impact on FBC-EC if Adopted: Anticipated construction cost impact from
the code change if it is adopted in the FBC-EC. “None” means the code change has no or
negligible anticipated impact on construction cost.

References:

2023 Florida Building Code, Energy Conservation, 8th Edition. (2023). International Code
Council, Inc. https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/FLEC2023P1

2021 International Energy Conservation Code. (2021). International Code Council, Inc.
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IECC2021P2

2024 International Energy Conservation Code. (2024). International Code Council, Inc. April
10, 2024 draft

Complete Revision History to the 2024 I-Codes. 2024. International Code Council, Inc.


https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/FLEC2023P1
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IECC2021P2

Residential Code Change Summary for 8" Edition (2023) Florida Energy Code vs. 2024 IECC

2024 IECC Section ICCﬁaioge Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ?;tlzigzts(;,ggﬁfg I;:H::tl l())z:lt;%g-)}sltC
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa pa
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Chapter R1: Scope and Administration
Adds applicable dwelling and
building types, a subsection
noting application of appendices, | Same as change between 2021
R101.2 Scope and moves “design and IECC and 2024 IECC None None
construction” language from
R101.3 to Scope section
Revises Intent section language,
including adding optional
supplemental requirements Same as change between 2021
R101.3 Intent overview, non-mandatory IECC and 2024 IECC None None
appendices, and code update
cycle discussions
. Same as change between 2021
R101.4 Compliance Renumbered from R101.5 IECC and 2024 TECC None None
Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC except
R101.4.1 for Florida, the Florida
Compliance Renumbered from R101.5.1 o ; L None None
Material Building Commission approves
eriais the software and other materials
instead of the code official
R102.1 Same as change between 2021
Applicability Renumbered from R101.4 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R102.1.1 Mixed
Residential and Same as change between 2021
Commercial Renumbered from R101.4.1 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
Buildings
Same as change between 2021
R102.2 Other Laws Renumbered from R108.3 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
renumbered from R107.3
o Same as change between 2021
R102.3 Application Renumbered from R108.2 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None

of References

renumbered from R107.2




2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁ::)l:gt)zt;dpgléegg(y: . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
R102.4 Referenced Same as change between 2021
Codes and Renumbered from R108.1 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
Standards renumbered from R107.1
Renumbered from R108.1.1 Same as change between 2021
R102.4.1 Conflicts IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
renumbered from R107.1.1
R102.4.2 Provisions Renumbered from R108.1.2 Same as change between 2021
in Referenced Codes IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
and Standards renumbered from R107.1.2
Same as change between 2021
R102.5 Partial Renumbered from R107.1 and IECC and 2024 IECC, except
T name changed from “General” to None None
Invalidity “Partial invalidity” renumber would be from
R105.1
SECTIONRI103 New section providing code
CODE . Same as change between 2021
COMPLIANCE comphance enforcement agency, IECC and 2024 IECC None None
AGENCY appointment and deputy language
glllgjr'cleglreiuon of Provides enforcement agency Same as change between 2021 None None
creation language IECC and 2024 IECC
Agency
R103.2 Reqqlres that the AHJ be o Same as change between 2021
Appointment appointed by the chiel appointing | 110 142004 TECC None None
authority of the jurisdiction
R103.3 Deputies g(;;f:isnf(:égglﬁyHiniii)ltillle(;rlty Same as change between 2021 None None
‘ IECC and 2024 IECC
employees
SECTION R104
ALTERNATIVE
MATERIALS,
DESIGN AND Renumbered from R102.1 Iséglé 223};‘512*%: IbEegéeen 2021 None None
METHODS OF
CONSTRUCTION
AND

R104.1.1 Above
Code Programs

Renumbered from R102.1.1 and
changes the thermal envelope
requirements from 2009 IECC
table-based efficiencies to thermal

Same renumbering as between
2021 IECC and 2024 IECC, but
the FBC-EC does not include
additional table-based thermal

None because an
above code program

None because an
above code program




2024 IECC Section I(C:ﬁafl"de Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘r:t‘:“t’atl‘:‘;g‘éeggg . r‘;“;wt‘pi‘lt;‘;;g"gc
and Title* ge IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pact 0 - pact 0 -
No. if Adopted if Adopted
conductance (TC) calculation envelope or thermal
efficiencies conductance (TC) calculation
efficiency requirements
SECTION R103 Same as change between 2021
CONSTRUCTION Renumbered from R103 IECC and 202g4 IECVé None None
DOCUMENTS
Same as change between 2021
R105.1 General Renumbered from R103.1 IECC and 2024 TECC None None
R105.2 Information
. Same as change between 2021
on Construction Renumbered from R103.2 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
Documents
R105.2.1 Building
Same as change between 2021
Theljmgl Envelope Renumbered from R103.2.1 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
Depiction
New section stipulating that
where a solar-ready zone is
R105.2.2 Solar- provided, the o nstmcngn Same as change between 2021
documents indicate dedicated roof None None
ready System IECC and 2024 IECC
area, roof and ground loads, and
routing of conduit, prewiring, or
plumbing
R105.3 Examination Same as change between 2021
of Documents Renumbered from R103.3 IECC and 2024 TECC None None
R105.3.1 Approval
. Same as change between 2021
of Construction Renumbered from R103.3.1 IECC and 2024 TECC None None
Documents
R105.3.2 Previous Same as change between 2021
Approvals Renumbered from R103.3.2 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R105.3.3 Phased Same as change between 2021
Approval Renumbered from R103.3.3 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
IélgStA A;nended R bered f R103.4 Same as change between 2021 N N
onstruction enumbered from . IECC and 2024 IECC one one
Documents
R105.5 Retention of
Construction Renumbered from R103.5 Same as change between 2021 None None

Documents

IECC and 2024 IECC




2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?nmele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘r;‘t‘:z‘t’zf‘;g‘g%g . r‘;“;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa pa
No. if Adopted if Adopted
The FBC-EC only includes a
SECTION R106 Renumbered from R104 reserved Fees section R108 None None
FEES .
(without any content)
R106.1 Payment of Renumbered from R104.1 and Would be new section in the None None
Fees minor editing FBC-EC
R106.2 Schedule of Would be new section in the
Permit fees Renumbered from R104.2 FBC-EC None None
New section requiring applicant
R106.3 Permit for a permit to provide an Same as change between 2021 None None or slightly
Valuation estimated value of the work at the | IECC and 2024 IECC increased cost
time of application
R106.4 Work Would be new section in the
commencing before Renumbered from R104.3 None None
. FBC-EC
Permit Issuance
R106.5 Related Fees Renumbered from R104.4 ;K]goél}% (l;e new section in the None None
R106.6 Refunds Renumbered from R104.5 ;’\1730(1:1}% (l;e new section in the None None
Same as change between 2021
SECTION R107 Renumbered from R105 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
INSPECTIONS
renumbered from R104
. Same as change between 2021
EIISOZ;:Zﬁ(I){;Squlred Renumbered from R105.2 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
P renumbered from R104.2
R107.2.1 Footing Same as change between 2021
and Foundation Renumbered from R105.2.1 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
Inspection renumbered from R104.2.1
Renumbered from R105.2.2, adds
“air barrier” to title, and replaces
R107.2.2 Framing existing insulation and
: . . . . Same as change between 2021 . . .
and Air barrier fenestration inspection text with None or slightly Slightly increased
. . S . IECC and 2024 IECC except . .
Rough-in expanded air barrier inspection increased stringency cost
. . . . renumbered from R104.2.2
Inspection. text (insulation and fenestration

inspection text moved to new
Section R107.2.6)




2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?nmele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁ:tl:g?,tflpgléﬁig(y: . r‘;“;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa P2
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Renumbered from R105.2.3 and None or slightly
. . . . Same as change between 2021 . :
R107.2.3 Plumbing adds inspection requirements for increased cost in
. . IECC and 2024 IECC except None .
Rough-in Inspection solar-ready zones where they are applicable solar-
. renumbered from R104.2.3
provided ready zone cases
R107.2.4 Same as change between 2021
Mechanical Rough- Renumbered from R105.2.4 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
in Inspection renumbered from R104.2.4
New section stipulating
R107.2.5 Electrical lnspe(?tlon requireme nts at. Same as change between 2021 None or slightly Slightly increased
. . electrical rough-in, including for . .
Rough-in Inspection IECC and 2024 IECC increased stringency cost
solar-ready zones where they are
provided
New section stipulating
R107.2.6 Insqlanon ¥nspect.1on requ1rement§ at Same as change between 2021
and Fenestration insulation and fenestration rough- IECC and 2024 IECC None None
Rough-in Inspection in (moved from Section R107.2.2
with slight rewording)
. Same as change between 2021
EISOZ;:Zﬁ.ZnFmal Renumbered from R105.2.5 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
P renumbered from R104.2.5
R107.3 Same as change between 2021
Reins. ection Renumbered from R105.3 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
P renumbered from R104.3
Renumbered from R105.4, adds
R107.4 Approved r(tahlli?r-eliral ?gt t;l(;tt lttlllfr, da_n(;llrattdds Same as change between 2021
Third-party requirer . party IECC and 2024 IECC except None None

. . inspection agencies be approved
Inspection Agencies . . e renumbered from R104.4

prior to issuance of the building

permit

New section requiring approved

third-party inspection agency
R107.4.1 . . .

L provide all requested information .
Authorization of . None or slightly
Approved third- for the code official to Same as change between 2021 None increased cost in

pp . determine that the agency meets IECC and 2024 IECC .
Party Inspection . . applicable cases
Agency the applicable requirements,

and to authorize its work in the
jurisdiction.




2024 IECC Section
and Title*

ICC Code
Change

Change Summary b/t 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

Change Summary b/t 2023
FBC-EC and 2024 IECC

Anticipated Energy
Impact on FBC-EC
if Adopted

Anticipated Cost
Impact on FBC-EC
if Adopted

R107.4.1.1
Independence

New section requiring that an
approved third-party inspection
agency be an independent
business identity, perform its
duties in accordance with the
scope of delegated
responsibilities established by the
code official, disclose any
conflicts of interest, and
acknowledge in writing that it is
authorized to work only within
the scope of delegated
responsibilities

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None

None or slightly
increased cost in
applicable cases

R107.4.1.2
Equipment

New section that requires that an
approved third-party inspection
agency have adequate

equipment to perform required
inspections and tests and that all
testing equipment be calibrated as
required

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None

None or slightly
increased cost in
applicable cases

R107.4.1.3
Personnel

New section that requires that
personnel assigned by an
approved third-party inspection
agency to perform inspections
and testing be trained or
credentialed, and
documentation of training or
credentials be available upon
request

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None

None or slightly
increased cost in
applicable cases

R107.4.1.4
Delegated Authority

New section that stipulates that
where approved, a third-party
inspection agency has the
authority to perform delegated
inspections and determine
compliance or noncompliance of
work

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None

None




2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁ::)l:gt)zt;dpgléegg(y: . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Rl.O7'4'2 Approved New section that stipulates third- None or slightly
Third-party . . . Same as change between 2021 . :
Inspection Agency party inspection agencies IECC and 2024 TECC None 1ncr§ased cost in
. reporting requirements applicable cases
Reporting
R107.5 Tnspection Same as change between 2021
Requests Renumbered from R105.5 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
renumbered from R104.5
R107.6 Same as change between 2021
Reinspection and Renumbered from R105.6 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
testing renumbered from R104.6
SECTION R108
NOTICE OF Renumbered from R106 Iséglé 2;21:};&5122(;: IbEe (t:\zeen 2021 None None
APPROVAL
Same as change between 2021
R108.1 Approval Renumbered from R106.1 IECC and 2 02g4 IECC None None
. Same as change between 2021
R108.2 Revocation Renumbered from R106.2 IECC and 2 02g4 [ECC None None
Would be new section in the
iféf;gl\éFR109 Renumbered from R110 FBC-EC (Florida alreafiy has None Slightly increased
APPEALS other means of addressing cost
appeals)
Would be new section in the
R109.1 General Renumbered from R110.1 FBC-EC (Florida alreafiy has None Slightly increased
other means of addressing cost
appeals)
Renumbered from R110.2 and Would be new section in the
R109.2 Limitations one edit regarding authority to FBC-EC (Florida already has None Slightly increased
on Authority interpret the administration of the | other means of addressing cost
code appeals)
Would be new section in the
R109.3 Renumbered from R110.3 and FBC-EC (Florida already has None Slightly increased
Qualifications adds qualification clarification other means of addressing cost
appeals)
Would be new section in the
R109.4 Renumbered from R110.4 and g b Florida already has Slightly increased
S . removes “immediate” from action . None
Administration other means of addressing cost

requirement

appeals)

10



2024 IECC Section I(C:ﬁafl"de Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘r:t‘:‘It’atI‘:ng‘éeE(y: . [‘;“;‘ct‘pi‘lt;‘}sg"gc
and Title* ge IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pact 0 - part o -
No. if Adopted if Adopted
SECTION R110
STOP WORK Renumbered from R109 Same as change between 2021 None None
IECC and 2024 IECC
ORDER
. Same as change between 2021
R110.1 Authority Renumbered from R109.1 IECC and 2024 TECC None None
Same as change between 2021
R110.2 Issuance Renumbered from R109.2 IECC and 2024 TECC None None
. Same as change between 2021
R110.3 Emergencies Renumbered from R109.3 IECC and 2024 TECC None None
R110.4 Failure to Same as change between 2021
Comply Renumbered from R109.4 IECC and 2024 TECC None None
Chapter R2: Definitions
The 2023 FBC-EC already has
R202 Air-Handling . a different but compatible
Unit New definition definition for “air-handling None None
unit”
R202 Approved .\ Same as change between 2021
source New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Automatic . Same as change between 2021
Shutoff Control New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Balanced .\ Same as change between 2021
Ventilation System New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Biodiesel .. Same as change between 2021
Blend New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Common .. Same as change between 2021
Areas New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Construction . Same as change between 2021
Documents New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Continuous Edit changes “building envelope” | Same as change between 2021 None None
Insulation (ci) to “building thermal envelope” IECC and 2024 IECC
R202 Continuous . Same as change between 2021
Pilot New definition IECC and 2024 TECC None None
.. Same as change between 2021
R202 Damper New definition IECC and 2024 TECC None None

11



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n()(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁﬂ"ﬁi‘fiﬁﬁ'&ﬁfg . r‘;“;‘cct‘ﬂi‘lt;‘;sg‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa P2
No. if Adopted if Adopted
R202 Demand .\ Same as change between 2021
Response Signal New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Demand . Same as change between 2021
Responsive Control New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
gzsotirlr? llstfi'llzigtll(;n New definition Same as change between 2021 None None
Y Y v IECC and 2024 IECC
(DSE)
Replaces “continuous
passageway bas.ed language with Same as change between 2021
R202 Duct System new language using newly None None
« » « IECC and 2024 IECC
defined “ductwork” and “space
conditioning equipment” terms
. Same as change between 2021
R202 Ductwork New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
. . Same as change between 2021
R202 Emittance New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Enclosed . Same as change between 2021
Reflective Airspace New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Energy Rating .\ Same as change between 2021
Index (ERI) New definition TECC and 2024 IECC None None
2023 FBC-EC already has a
R2Q2 'Ex1st1ng New definition dlffer'e.nt but c‘(‘)mpagble None None
Building definition for “existing
building”
R202 F-Factor None; 2023 FBC-EC already
(Thermal New definition has the same definition for “F- None None
Transmittance) Factor”
. Same as change between 2021
R202 Fuel Gas New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
. . Same as change between 2021
R202 Fuel Oil New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
. Same as change between 2021
R202 Grade Plane New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Heat .. Same as change between 2021
Exchanger New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None

12



2024 IECC Section | ' %4 | Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 | Ahticipated bacrey | Anticipatec Fost
and Title* ge IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pact 0 - pact 0 -
No. if Adopted if Adopted
[R202 ngh_ “High-Efficacy Light Sources” 2023 FBC-EC does not include
Efficacy Light . o None None
term deleted this definition
Sources]
R202 Intermittent . Same as change between 2021
Ignition New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Interrupted . Same as change between 2021
Ignition New definition IECC and 2024 TECC None None
R202 Knee Wall New definition Same as change between 2021 None None
v IECC and 2024 IECC
- .. Same as change between 2021
R202 Liquid Fuel New definition IECC and 2024 TECC None None
.. . Same as change between 2021
R202 Living Space New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
. 2023 FBC-EC has similar
R202 Low Slope New definition definition for “low-sloped roof” None None
R202 Occupiable . Same as change between 2021
Space New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 On-demand . Same as change between 2021
Pilot New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
2023 FBC-EC already has a
R202 Plenum New definition different but compatible None None
definition for “plenum”
Replaces “building” with
R202 Proposed “dwelling unit” and “total Same as change between 2021
Design building performance with IECC and 2024 IECC
“simulated building performance”
R202 Radiant . Same as change between 2021
Barrier New definition IECC and 2024 [ECC None None
R202 Rated Design ‘I}eplacps bu'll,c’hng with 2Q23 FB('Z—'EC does not include None None
dwelling unit this definition
R202 Reflective .. Same as change between 2021
Insulation New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Renewable . iy 2023 FBC-EC does not include
Energy Certificate Clarifies and expands definition . . None None
(REC) this definition

13



2024 IECC Section I(C:ﬁafl"de Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ?;‘t‘:‘?ats‘;g‘éeggg . r‘;“;wt‘pi‘lt;%g"gc
and Title* ge IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pact 0 - part o -
No. if Adopted if Adopted
R202 Roof . . Same as change between 2021
Replacement Revises definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
gzﬁiiilmulated New definition Same as change between 2021 None None
wome W TECC and 2024 TECC
Performance
2023 FBC-EC already has a
R202 Sleeping Unit New definition different but compatible None None
definition for “sleeping unit”
R202 Solar Ready . Same as change between 2021
Zone New definition IECC and 2024 TECC None None
R202 Space .. Same as change between 2021
Conditioning New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
IéZOi?p ace New definiti Same as change between 2021 N N
onditioning ew definition IECC and 2024 IECC one one
Equipment
. Same as change between 2021
R202 Steep Slope New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R202 Substantial .. Same as change between 2021
Improvement New definition IECC and 2024 IECC None None
Replaces deﬁnmor{,for dwelling 2023 FBC-EC does not include
. . unit enclosure area” and adds . o .
R202 Testing Unit “ . o definitions for “testing unit
newly defined “sleeping unit” to e . None None
Enclosure Area . enclosure area” or “dwelling
wall height measurement . »
. . unit enclosure area
stipulation
.. Same as change between 2021
R202 Work Area New definition IECC and 2024 TECC None None
Chapter R3: General Requirements
R303.1.1 Building Adds requirements for what must None or slightly None or slightly

Thermal Envelope

be included on the certification

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

increased stringency

increased cost in

Insulation for reflective insulation in applicable cases applicable cases
R303.1.2 Insulation gri(if):;silrilsatiggorﬁ:(s gﬁce ?:&r)l o Same as change between 2021 None None
Mark Installation b V¢ | IECC and 2024 IECC

roof deck

14



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁ::)l:g?;dpggegg(y: . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
New section stipulates
requirements for using the R- None or slightly None or slightly

R303.1.6 Airspaces

value of an enclosed reflective
airspace or enclosed nonreflective
airspace for code compliance

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

increased stringency
in applicable cases

increased cost in
applicable cases

R303.2.2 Radiant

New section stipulates standard

2023 FBC-EC already includes

. . . . standard requirements for None None
Barrier requirements for radiant barriers . :
radiant barriers
Chapter R4: Residential Energy Efficiency
Slightly to

As part of larger revision,
removes requirement for
residential buildings to comply

The 2023 FBC-EC does not
include the requirements of
removed IECC Section

To be determined

somewhat increased
cost in applicable
Prescriptive cases
when replacement

R401.2 Application w1th removed Section R401.2.5, R401.2.5 except for the 95% Vla’analys1s. Qf “Sectl‘or}’R408
which in the 2021 IECC, . combined revisions credits” based
. .. load option for Performance e
provided additional energy . Additional
. . compliance .
efficiency requirements Efficiency
Requirements are
included
R401.2.1 Adds Section R408 “credits” An additional Efficiency To be determined Slightly to
Prescriptive based Additional Efficiency Requirements option such as somewhat increased

compliance option

Requirements for the Prescriptive
compliance option

IECC Section R408 is not
included in the FBC-EC

via analysis of
combined revisions

cost in applicable
Prescriptive cases

R401.3 Certificate

For the certificate that indicates
listed efficiencies, in items 2 and
3 adds “thermal” to “building
envelope”, in item 7 adds
requirement to indicate Section
R408 additional efficiency
measures selected, and adds item
8 regarding solar-ready zone

2023 FBC-EC already has a
comparable requirement in its
Energy performance level
(EPL) display card

None

None




2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;‘;‘;ﬁf‘;g‘é"% . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Revises referenced building
thermal envelope compliance
sections t.o clarify R-value vs. Same as chanee between 2021
R402.1 General new (revised from Total UA) IECC and 2 02g4 IECC None None
Component performance
alternative Prescriptive
compliance options
R402.1.2 Insulation Adds maximum F-factor
and fenestration requirement for applicable Same as change between 2021 None None
criteria assemblies per new Table IECC and 2024 IECC
R402.1.2 limits
. Same as change between 2021
Table R402.1.2 Flips table rows and columns IECC and 2 02g4 IECC None None
Changes “Fenestration U-Factor”
column label into “Vertical Same as change between 2021
Table R402.12 Fenestration U-factor” (now row) | IECC and 202g4 IECC None None
label
Separates “Glazed Fenestration
SHGC” into “Glazed Vertical
Fenestration SHGC” and
“Skylight SHGC,” and adds new
skylight SHGC 11m1tsf(0.218 n Equivalent FBC-EC Table Slightly increased Slightly increased
Table R402.1.2 CZS‘ land 2 vs. 9'25. or glazed R402.1.4 does not include stringency in cost in applicable
vertical fenestration in CZs 1 and SHGC limits applicable cases cases
2); this maximum skylight limit is pp
lowered from 2021 IECC’s
(removed) footnote “d” exception
for CZs 1-3 which allowed
skylight SHGCs up to 0.30
Adds “Insulation Enirely Above decreased srngency | decreased cost
Table R402.1.2 REDI- Roof Deck”, “Unheated Slab F- Same as change between 2021 in applicable cases applicable cases
o 268-22 factor,” and “Heated Slab F- IECC and 2024 IECC

factor” assembly types

with insulation
above roof deck

with insulation
above roof deck

Table R402.1.2

Decreases maximum allowed
skylight U-factors from 0.75 to

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

Slightly increased
stringency in
applicable cases

Slightly increased
cost in applicable
cases

16



2024 IECC Section I(C:ﬁafl"de Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘r:t‘:“t’atl‘:‘;g‘éeggg . r‘;“;mt‘pi‘lt;‘;;g"gc
and Title* ge IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pact 0 - pact 0 -
No. if Adopted if Adopted
0.60 for CZ1 and from 0.65 to
0.60 for CZ2
Would make the two
codes of equal
Increases maximum allowed 2023 FBC-EC already has a stringency for
Table R402.1.2 ceiling U-factor for CZ2 from maximum ceiling U-factor of applicable None
0.026 to 0.030 0.030 for CZ2 Prescriptive and
performance
compliance cases
R;r.n‘;l"es %Oj ! dlff(? fooztn"te ¢ | Equivalent FBC-EC Table
Table R402.1.2 whieh excluded Vatine £one R402.1.4 does not include None None
SHGC requirements (for 2024 SHGC limits
IECC, included in table)
2024 IECC footnote “d” (“f” in
2O s | Wou e ot
Table R402.1.2 . FBC-EC, but does not apply to None None
5 through 8 for vertical .
. . . Florida CZs
fenestration products in provided
cases
Adds new footnote “e” that Same as change between 2021
Table R402.1.2 provides slab F-Factor details IECC and 2024 IECC None None
Adds “F-factor” to section, now
allowmg.assembhes Wlth. an R- FBC-EC has different wording,
value of insulation materials .
R402.1.3 R-value but basically same as change
. equal to or greater than that None None
alternative . . between 2021 IECC and 2024
specified in Table R402.1.3 to be [ECC
an alternative to the U-factor or
F-factor in Table R402.1.2
. Same as change between 2021
Table R402.1.3 Flips table rows and columns IECC and 2024 IECC None None
Changes “Fenestration U-Factor”
column label into “Vertical Same as change between 2021
Table R402.1.3 Fenestration U-factor” (now row) | IECC and 2024 IECC None None
label
Adds maximum vertical
Table R402.1.3 fenestration U-factor of 0.50 for Same as change between 2021 None None

CZs0and 1

IECC and 2024 IECC (for CZ

17



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;‘;‘;ﬁf‘;g‘é"% . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
1; FBC-EC does not include CZ
0)

Separates “Glazed Fenestration

SHGC” into “Glazed Vertical

Fenestration SHGC” and

“Skylight SHGC,” and adds new

skylight SHGC limits (0.28 in Slightly increased Slightly increased
Table R402.1.3 CZs‘ 1 and 2 vs. Q.25.for glazed Same as change between 2021 stringency in cost in applicable

vertical fenestration in CZs 1 and | IECC and 2024 IECC .

2); this maximum skylight limit is applicable cases cases

lowered from 2021 IECC’s

(removed) footnote “b” exception

for CZs 1-3 which allowed

skylight SHGCs up to 0.30

Adds “Insulation Entirely Above

Roof Deck” assembly type, and None or slightly None or slightly
etz | REDL | D S i D s e e 201 | ded sy | deredcou

o 268-22 IECC and 2024 IECC

Slab R-value & Depth,” and
“Heated Slab R-value & Depth”
assembly types

with insulation
above roof deck

with insulation
above roof deck

Decreases maximum allowed

Table R402.1.3 skylight U-factors from 0.75 to Same as change between 2021 Shft}rlitrlly éﬁzreijed ig;gthitlllyalnclriizﬁg
- 0.60 for CZ1 and from 0.65 to IECC and 2024 IECC EEnCy PP
0.60 for CZ2 applicable cases cases
Would make the two
Decreases minimum allowed 2023 FBC-EC already has a C;)r(iirels Orf eq}larl
Table R402.1.3 ceiling R-value for CZ2 from 49 minimum ceiling R-value of 38 strngency 1o None
t0 38 for CZ2 applicable
prescriptive
compliance cases
New footnote “c” requires slab Same as change between 2021 None or slightly None or slightly

Table R402.1.3

insulation to be installed in
accordance with Section
R402.2.9.1!, which provides

IECC and 2024 IECC (FBC-EC
footnote “d” has similar

increased stringency
in applicable cases

increased cost in
applicable cases

! Appears this section should be “R402.2.10.1” (may be corrected in final version of 2024 IECC).

18



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;‘;‘;ﬁf‘;g‘é"% . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 TECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
requirements removed from 2021 | language to 2021 IECC
IECC footnote “d” footnote “d”
Moves 2021 IECC footnote “f”
regarding basement wall Same as change between 2021
Table R402.1.3 insulation in Warm Humid IECC and 2094 [ECC None None
locations to footnote “d”
MOVCS. 2021 IECC footnc?te & Same as change between 2021
Table R402.1.3 regarding frame wall cavity and | yp o0 19004 TECC (except None None
continuous insulation to footnote o
“en moves from footnote “h”)
Same as change between 2021
Moves 2021 IECC footnote "l | 1o G nd 2004 IBCC (except
Table R402.1.3 ‘r‘igardmg mass walls to footnote the FBC-EC does not include None None
reference to mass wall section
while both IECC versions do
Moves 2021 IECC footnote “i”
regarding vertical fenestration
product U-factor for bulldlng“s "M | Would be new footnote in
Table R402.1.3 certain locatlo'ns to footnote "g”, FBC-EC, but does not apply to None None
decreases the included CZs from Florida CZs
3 — 8 to Marine 4 and 5 — 8, and
reduces the maximum U-factor
from 0.32 to 0.30
Adds cavity + continuous and
continuous only insulation Cavity + continuous and
REPI-35- | options for floors, and adds continuous only insulation
Table R402.1.3 21 f(f)otnote “h” to provide options for ﬂog]r insulation None None
clarifications regarding these would be new for the FBC-EC
options
Changes title from “Total UA Same as change between 2021
alternative” and replaces UA IECC and 2024 IECC, but
R402.1.5 . . . .
Component based compliance with thermal exception makes the perimeter
performance conduc;tance (TC) based' * F-factor calculation the same None None
alternative compliance which combines UA | value for the table-based and

calculation with perimeter * F-
factor calculation

proposed calculations for CZs 0
through 2

19



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?l()(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;}‘“:g:if‘;g‘é‘i%g . ﬁ“;‘cct“";‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa pa
No. if Adopted if Adopted
R402.1.6 Rooms Renumbered from R402.4.4 and
containing fuel clarifies “building thermal Same as change between 2021 None None
Hming et puraing IECC and 2024 [ECC
burning appliances envelope” term
Adds exception for Section
R402.1.3 requirement of R-38 Would make the two
insulation in the ceiling or attic codes of equal
- wherever the full height of 2023 FBC-EC already has R-38 . 4
R402.2.1 Ceilings : . . . stringency for
. . uncompressed R-30 insulation exception and does not include . None
with attics . applicable
extends over the wall top plate at | a R-60 exception e
L Prescriptive
the eaves, and removes a similar compliance cases
exception for when R-60 P
insulation is required
Replaces exception reference to
R402.2.1 Ceilings “Tort:lll [IJlAIl talti??:;\;i Wffh Same as change between 2021 Non Non
with attics component periotinance: IECC and 2024 IECC one one
alternative for consistency with
Section R402.1.5 change
New section requires that wood
attic knee wall assemblies that
separate conditioned space from None or slightly
unconditioned attic spaces decreased stringency
comply with Table R402.1.3 for for Prescriptive and None o slightly

R402.2.3 Attic knee
wall

wood-framed walls, and steel
attic knee wall assemblies comply
with Section R402.2.7; also
requires that these knee walls
have an air barrier between
conditioned and unconditioned
space

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

Performance
projects in
applicable cases
depending on
typical practice

decreased cost in
applicable cases

R402.2.3.1 Roof
truss framing
separating
conditioned and
unconditioned space

New section requires that where
wood vertical roof truss framing
members are used to separate
conditioned space and
unconditioned space, they must
comply with Table R402.1.3 for
wood-framed walls, and steel
frame vertical roof truss framing

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None or slightly
decreased stringency
for Prescriptive and
Performance
projects in
applicable cases
depending on
typical practice

None or slightly
decreased cost in
applicable cases

20



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁ::)l:gt)zt;dpgléegg(y: . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
members used to separate
conditioned space and
unconditioned space must comply
with Section R402.2.7
Same as change between 2021
bR:f(f)I%cQA Eave Renumbered from R402.2.3 IECC and 2024 IECC except None None
renumbered from R402.2.3
Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 TIECC, except
FBC-EC combines with
R402.2.5 Access Renumbered from R402.2.4 insulation retention None None
hatches and doors . .
requirements, while 2021 and
2024 IECC have separate sub-
section for these requirements
Replaces exception reference to
R402.2.5 Access “total UA” alternative Wltjl Same as change between 2021
hatches and doors component performance” TECC and 2024 IECC None None
alternative for consistency with
Section R402.1.5 change
R402.2.5.1 Access FBC-EC combines insulation
hatches and door installation and retention
insulation Renumbered from R402.2.4.1 requirements with other access None None
installation and hatch door requirements in
retention R402.2.4
&:ﬁi“ Mass Renumbered from R402.2.5 Iséglé Ziﬁ@aé’zgf IbEe(t:“(’fen 2021 None None
R402.2.7 Steel-
s Same as change between 2021
frame ceilings, walls Renumbered from R402.2.6 IECC and 202g4 IECC None None
and floors
Revises section, removing
requirement to comply with the
insulation R-value requirements
}fi:gl%i;lisrtlzzl-walls REDI1- of Table R402.2.6, keeping the U- | Same as change between 2021 None None
’ 185-22 factor requirements of Table IECC and 2024 IECC

and floors

R402.1.2, and revises the
calculation of the U-factor, now
requiring it to be in accordance

21



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?nmele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘r;‘t‘:z‘t’zf‘;g‘g%g . r‘;“;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa P2
No. if Adopted if Adopted
with AISI S250 with
modifications
[Table R402.2.6
Steel-frame Ceiling, Table removed as part of Section | Same as change between 2021 None None
Wall and Floor R402.2.7 revision IECC and 2024 IECC
Insulation R-values]
FBC-EC already has same
R402.2.8 Floors Renumbered from R402.2.7 numbering as 2024 TECC None None
R402.2.8 Floors Revises and clarifies floor Similar to change between Sh;gt}rlitllly elﬁzre?r?ed il)lfthitrllyalnclriizzfﬁ
- insulation installation section 2021 IECC and 2024 IECC neency pp
applicable cases cases
R402.2.9 Basement FBC-EC already has same
walls Renumbered from R402.2.8 numbering as 2024 [ECC None None
2021 and 202.4. IECC have Slightly increased Slightly increased
R402.2.9 Basement . . more unconditioned basement . . . .
Minor rewording . . stringency in cost in applicable
walls exception requirements than applicable ca
2023 FBC-EC pplicable cases cases
R402.2.9.1
Basement wall FBC-EC already has same
insulation Renumbered from R402.2.8 numbering as 2024 TECC None None
installation
e Adds phrase “or in accordance None or slight None or slight cost
Basement wall ith the proposed design or the Same as change between 2021 stringency impact in | impact in applicable
insulation bt prop st TECC and 2024 TECC gency lop Hop PpiL
. . rated design, as applicable applicable cases cases
installation
R402.2.10 Slab-on- FBC-EC already has same
erade floors Renumbered from R402.2.9 numbering as 2024 [ECC None None

R402.2.10 Slab-on-

Changes floor surface criterion
from “less than 12 inches (305
mm) below grade” to “within 24

Same as change between 2021

None or slight
stringency impact in

None or slight cost
impact in applicable

grade floors inches (610 mm) above or below IECC and 2024 IECC applicable cases cases
grade”

R402.2.10.1 Slab-

on-grade floor FBC-EC already has same

insulation Renumbered from R402.2.9.1 numbering as 2024 TECC None None

installation

22



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;‘;‘;ﬁf‘;g‘é"% . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Makes section requirements only
applicable to Prescriptive
compliance (Performance and
R402.2.10.1 Slab- ERI requirements in separate new None or slightly None or slightly

on-grade floor

section); with floor penetration

Same as change between 2021

increased stringency

increased cost in

insulation exceptions, requires full-slab IECC and 2024 IECC . . .
. . . . . in applicable cases applicable cases
installation insulation to be continuous under
the entire area of the floor; and
adds heated slab perimeter
requirements
R402.2.10.2 New section stipulating that for

Alternative slab-on-
grade insulation

Performance or ERI compliance,
slab-on-grade insulation be

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None or slight
stringency impact in

None or slight cost
impact in applicable

. installed in accordance with the applicable cases cases
configurations . .
proposed design or rated design
R402.2.11 Crawl Renumbered from R402.2.10 FBC-EC already has same None None

space walls

numbering as 2024 IECC

R402.2.11 Crawl
space walls

Changes the crawl space wall
insulation requirement from being
in accordance with Table
R402.1.3 to Section R402.2.11.1
or new 402.2.11.2

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None or slight
stringency impact in
applicable cases

None or slight cost
impact in applicable
cases

R402.2.11.1 Crawl

General rewording including

None or slight

None or slight cost

space wall changes to insulation location Same as change between 2021 stringency impact in | impact in applicable

insulation & IECC and 2024 IECC gency ump P PP

. . requirements applicable cases cases

installations

R402.2.11.2 New section stipulating that for

Alternative crawl Performance or ERI compliance, None or slight None or slight cost
. . Same as change between 2021 . . . . . .

space wall crawl space wall insulation be stringency impact in | impact in applicable

. . ) . . IECC and 2024 IECC .

insulation installed in accordance with the applicable cases cases

configurations proposed design or rated design

R402.2.12 Masonry Renumbered from R402.2.11 FBC_E(.: already has same None None

veneer numbering as 2024 IECC

FCEC sl oo

?:Sclil Elet?(t)id garage Renumbered from R402.2.12 FBC-EC does not include None None

heated garage provisions

23



2024 IECC Section I(C:ﬁafl"de Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘r:t‘:“t’atl‘:‘;g‘éeggg . r‘;“;wt‘pi‘lt;‘;;g"gc
and Title* ge IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pact 0 - pact o -
No. if Adopted if Adopted

R402.3 Radiant
barriers

New section requiring that where
installed, radiant barriers be
installed in accordance with

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 TIECC, except
the FBC-EC already includes

None or slight
stringency impact in

None or slight cost
impact in applicable

ASTM C1743 this requirement for' applicable cases cases
Performance compliance
R402.4 Fenestration Renumbered from R402.3 Same as change between 2021 None None
' Y ' IECC and 2024 IECC
Same as change between 2021
R402.4.1 U-factor Renumbered from R402.3.1 IECC and 2024 TECC None None
R402.4.2 Glazed Same as change between 2021
fenestration SHGC Renumbered from R402.3.2 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R402.4.3 Glazed Renumbered from RAE‘O2.3.3 and”
fenestration changes reference to “Total UA Same as change between 2021 Non Non
cnestratio to new “‘component alternative” IECC and 2024 IECC one one
exemption . .
compliance option
Renumbered from R402.3.4 and
R402.4.4 Opaque changes reference to “Total UA” | Same as change between 2021 Non Non
door exemption to new “component alternative” IECC and 2024 IECC one one
compliance option
Same as change between 2021
R402.4.5 Sunroom IECC and 2024 IECC; FBC-EC
and heated garage Renumbered from R402.3.5 . None None
. does not include heated garage
fenestration .
provisions
. Same as change between 2021
R402.5 Air leakage Renumbered from R402.4 IECC and 2024 TECC None None
R402.5.1 Building Same as change between 2021
thermal envelope Renumbered from R402.4.1 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R402.5.1.1 Same as change between 2021
Installation Renumbered from R402.4.1.1 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and Renumbered from Table Same as change between 2021 None None
> R402.4.1.1 [ECC and 2024 IECC
Insulation
Installation
Table R402.5.1.1 A LT} A
Air Barrier, Air Added “Air Sealing” to “Air Same as change between 2021 None None

Sealing and

Barrier Criteria” header

IECC and 2024 IECC

24



2024 IECC Section I(C:ﬁafl"de Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;‘t‘:“t’ats‘;g‘éeggg . r‘;“;wt‘pi‘lt;‘;;g"gc
and Title* ge IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pact 0 - pact o -
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Insulation

Installation: Air
Barrier, Air Sealing
Criteria header

Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and

Adds requirement that air barriers
installed in a dropped ceiling or
soffit separate it from
unconditioned space; removes
requirement that the air barrier be
aligned with the insulation and
any gaps be sealed; and requires

Same as change between 2021

None or slight
stringency impact in

None or slight cost
impact in applicable

Insulation . IECC and 2024 IECC .
. that seals for access openings, applicable cases cases
Installation: .
Ceiling/attic drop down stairs or knee wall
doors to unconditioned attic
spaces be sealed with gasketing
materials that allow for repeated
entrance over time
Table R402.5.1.1 Addg insulation installation
. . . requirement that access hatches
Air Barrier, Air .
. and doors be installed and
Sealing and . . . Same as change between 2021
> insulated in accordance with None None
Insulation . IECC and 2024 IECC
. Section R402.2.5, and eave
Installation: . .
Ceiling/atti baffles be installed in accordance
cring/atie with Section R402.2.4
Ta.tble R‘.‘OZ'S'.LI Adds “building” to Insulation
Air Barrier, Air . > .,
Sealine and Installation Criteria section’s Same as change between 2021 Non Non
caing “exterior thermal envelope” term | IECC and 2024 IECC one one
Insulation as clarification
Installation: Walls )
Table R402.5.1.1 New component entry provides None or slightly

Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and
Insulation

Air Barrier, Air Sealing Criteria
and Insulation Installation

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

decreased stringency
in applicable cases

None or slight cost
impact in applicable

Installation: Knee Criteria requirements for knee dependlng on cases
walls typical practice
wall
Table R402.5.1.1 Clarifies Air Barrier, Air Sealing | Same as change between 2021
None None

Air Barrier, Air

Criteria requirements and adds

IECC and 2024 IECC

25



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?l;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;}‘;‘;‘t’ﬁ‘;g‘é";ﬁ% . ﬁ[r)litil:tl?)?lt;‘%(é(-)ls*:tc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Sealing and that sealing must be in accordance
Insulation with fenestration manufacturer's
Installation: instructions
Windows, skylights
and doors
Tgble R‘.‘O2'5'.1 1 Adds Insulation Installation
Air Barrier, Air Criteria section entry that None or slightly
Sealing and None or slightly

Insulation
Installation:
Windows, skylights
and doors

insulation is not required in the
rough opening gap except as
required by the fenestration
manufacturer's instructions

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

decreased stringency
depending on
typical practice

decreased cost in
applicable cases

Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and

Removes “exterior” from Air
Barrier, Air Sealing Criteria

FBC-EC already has same

Insulation secthn requirement: .le. joists requirement as 2024 IECC None None
. . shall include an exterior air
Installation: Rim .
. barrier.
joists
Replaces existing Air Barrier, Air

Table R402.5.1.1 Sealing Criteria section
Air Barrier, Air requirement that an air barrier be
Seahng and mstallgd at any eqused edge of None or slightly
Insulation insulation with requirement that increased strineenc None or slight cost
Installation: Floors, floor framing members that are Same as change between 2021 in anplicable fasesy impact in a & licable
including part of the building thermal IECC and 2024 IECC pphicat P PP

. . S depending on cases
cantilevered envelope be air sealed to maintain tvpical practice
floors and a continuous air barrier; also adds ypicalp
floors above requirement that air permeable
garages floor cavity insulation be

enclosed

Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and
Insulation
Installation: Floors,
including
cantilevered

Replaces existing floor framing
cavity Insulation Installation
Criteria requirements with
requirement that floor insulation
be installed in accordance with
Section R402.2.8

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None or slight
stringency impact in
applicable cases
depending on
typical practice

None or slight cost
impact in applicable
cases

26



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;‘;‘;ﬁf‘;g‘é"% . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC : :
No. if Adopted if Adopted
floors and
floors above
garages

Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and
Insulation
Installation:
Basement,

crawl space

and slab
foundations

As clarification, puts comma
between “basement” and “crawl
space” in “Basement, crawl space
and slab foundations” component
title

FBC-EC does not include
basements in this component
title; instead has component
title “Crawl space walls”

None (from change)

None (from change)

Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and
Insulation
Installation:
Showers, tubs and
fireplaces adjacent
to the building
thermal envelope

Changes component title from
“Shower/tub on exterior wall” to
“Showers, tubs and fireplaces
adjacent to the building

thermal envelope”

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None or slightly
increased stringency
in applicable cases

None or slightly
increased cost in
applicable cases

Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and
Insulation
Installation:
Showers, tubs and
fireplaces adjacent
to the building
thermal envelope

Revises Air Barrier, Air Sealing
Criteria requirement wording and
adds fireplaces

Same as change between 2021
[ECC and 2024 IECC

None or slightly
increased stringency
in applicable cases

None or slightly
increased cost in
applicable cases

Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and
Insulation
Installation:
Showers, tubs and

Revises Insulation Installation
Criteria requirement wording
slightly and adds fireplaces

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None or slightly
increased stringency
in applicable cases

None or slightly
increased cost in
applicable cases

27



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;‘;‘;ﬁf‘;g‘é"% . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
fireplaces adjacent
to the building
thermal envelope
Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and Changes component title from
Insulation “Electrical/phone box on
Installation: Exterior walls” to “Electrical, FBC-EC already has 2024 None None
Electrical, Communication and other IECC language
communication equipment boxes, housings and
and other equipment enclosures”
boxes, housings and
enclosures
Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and FBC-EC already has this 2024
Insulatiqn RC.ViSE':S Air Barrier, Air Sealiing IECC lgnguage, aqd add.s “the None or slightly None or slightly
Installation: Criteria requirement air-sealing continuity of the air barrier ) ;
Electrical, wording, and adds concealed shall be maintained around d.e crease.d stringency decre.ased cost in
o . . . . in applicable cases applicable cases
communication opening sealing requirement boxes, housings and enclosures

and other equipment
boxes, housings and
enclosures

that penetrate the air barrier”

Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air
Sealing and

Insulation Adds new Insulation Installation

Installation: Criteria that boxes, housing and FBC-EC already has this 2024 None None
Electrical, enclosures must be buried in IECC language

communication or surrounded by insulation

and other equipment

boxes, housings and

enclosures

Table R402.5.1.1 Removes “that penetrate

Air Barrier, Air REPI-50- | building thermal envelope” from | Same as change between 2021 None None
Sealing and 21 HVAC boot Air Barrier, Air IECC and 2024 IECC

Insulation

Sealing Criteria requirement

28



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?nmele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁ:tl:g?,tflpgléﬁig(y: . r‘;“;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa P2
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Installation: HVAC
register boots
./E?flgalsr‘itgf'/iilr.l Adds new Insulation Installation
Sealing and REDI1-32- %é;z?ﬁ?ﬁg:ﬁiﬁeﬁm?}feﬁ%?f Same as change between 2021 None None
Insulation 22 g thett IECC and 2024 IECC
Installation: HVAC envelope assembly be buried in or
register boc; ts surrounded by insulation
Table R402.5.1.1
Air Barrier, Air .
Sealing and New component entry provides
? Air Barrier, Air Sealing Criteria . .
Insulation ) ; None or slightly None or slightly
. and Insulation Installation . . . :
Installation: o . f h increased stringency increased cost in
Common walls or RED1- Criteria requirements for common Same as change between 2021 in applicable cases applicable cases
229-22 walls or double walls separating IECC and 2024 IECC ) .
double walls ) . . depending on depending on
. attached single-family dwellings : . . .
separating attached . . typical practice typical practice
single-family or townhouses, including fire-
dwellings or resistance-rating related
townhouses
Removes “air barrier” from
Table R402.5.1.1 footnote to clarify that “air
Air Barrier, Air barrier” is not intended to be
Sealing and REPI-55- | included in this exception, FBC-EC does not include this Non Non
Insulation 21 leaving: “Insulation full enclosure | exception footnote one one
Installation: is not required in
footnote “b” unconditioned/ventilated attic
spaces and at rim joists”
R402.5.1.2 Air RED1- Renumbered from R402.4.1.2, Same as change between 2021 None None
leakage testing 222-22 and renamed from “Testing” IECC and 2024 IECC
Revises air leakage testing
R402.5.1.2 Air REC2D- ;eqlfilcr:zgllznte;(::l?zie\frgl}lligha:uﬁ?zrre Same as change between 2021 None None
leakage testing 8-23 pp ’ ng untt, IECC and 2024 [ECC
(newly defined) sleeping unit in
the building must be tested
R402.5.1.2 Air REDI1- Alr leakage rgte limits are moved | Same as change between 2021 Increased stringency Increased cost in
1 . from this section to Section IECC and 2024 IECC, except . . .
eakage testing 222-22 in applicable cases applicable cases

R402.5.1.3 and revised

FBC-EC limits air leakage rate

29



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?nmele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁﬂt'ﬁi'i’ifdpﬁ'éi:gcy; . r‘;“;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa P2
No. if Adopted if Adopted
to 7 ACH50 in Florida Climate
Zones while the 2024 IECC
limits leakage to 4 ACHS50 in
Florida Climate Zones
(exceptions for each code)
R402.5.1.2 Air REPI-43- | Adds ASTM E3158 testing Same as change between 2021 Not known None (optional)
leakage testing 21 standard IECC and 2024 IECC p
Adds “differential” to clarify that
R402.5.1.2 Air REPL-57- | 27 dlizlgiftzg’;lgi ;Zscs?:rlgwed Same as change between 2021 None None
leakage testing 21 differential of 0.2 inch water IECC and 2024 IECC
gauge (50 Pascals)
Moves heated, attached private
R402.5.1.2 Air garages and heated, de.tached FBC-EC does not have a heated None or sh.ghtly None or shghtly
leakage testing private garages exception from garage testing exception d.ecreasc?d stringency decrefased cost in
before “During testing” items to in applicable cases applicable cases
after these items
R402.5.1.2 Air REPI-61- | Adds dwelling and sleeping unit | FBC-EC does not have a unit |, one Or slightly - None or slightly
leakage testing 21 sampling testing exception sampling option d'e crease.d stringency decre'ased costin
in applicable cases applicable cases
Removes individual dwelling
R402.5.1.2 Air REDI1- units that are 1,500 square feet FBC-EC does not include this None None
leakage testing 222-22 (139.4 m2) or smaller language exception
from testing exception
Removes mechanical ventilation
R402.5.1.2 Air REDI1- requirement from this section (but | FBC-EC does not include this
. C T None None
leakage testing 222-22 similar language remains in language
Section R403.6
New building air leakage testing d I\iozle (c)lr stlrliihﬂz Somewhat
R402.5.1.2.1 Unit REPI-61- | sampling provision for buildings Same as change between 2021 cereased strmgency omew. .
; . . > in applicable cases decreased cost in
sampling 21 with eight or more dwelling units | IECC and 2024 IECC ) .
. . depending on applicable cases
or sleeping units : .
typical practice
R402.5.1.3 REDI1- Renumbered section from . .
Maximum air 224-22 R402.4.1.3 and renamed from fig:ic does not include this None None
leakage rate Part I &II | “Leakage rate”

30



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?nmele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁ:tl:g?,tflpgléﬁig(y: . r‘;“;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa pa
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Air leakage rate limits are moved
from R402.1.2.1 to this section FBC-EC does not include this
and revised downward, with section; FBC-EC limits air
R402.5.1.3 REDI1- exceptions for attached dwelling leakage rate to 7 ACHS50 in Increased cost in
Maximum air 224-22 or sleeping units or when located | Florida Climate Zones while Increased stringency applicable cases
leakage rate PartI & II | in an R-2 occupancy, and for the 2024 IECC limits leakage to pp
buildings with 1,500 square feet 4 ACHS50 in Florida Climate
(139.4 m?) or less of conditioned | Zones
floor area
. Same as change between 2021
R402.5.2 Fireplaces Renumbered from R402.4.2 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R402.5.3
. . Same as change between 2021
Fenestration air Renumbered from R402.4.3 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
leakage
R402.5.4 Recessed Same as change between 2021
lighting Renumbered from R402.4.5 IECC and 2024 IECC None None
R402.5.5 Alr-sealed Renumbered fr‘(L)m R4Q2.4.6 and Except FBC-EC title is “Air-
and electrical and REPI-66- | renamed from “Electrical and .
. L . sealed electrical and None None
communication 21 communication outlet boxes (air- . ’
" communication boxes
outlet boxes sealed boxes)
R402.5.5 Air-sealed
and electrical and REPI-66- . . . . Makes section language very
communication 71 Revises wording to clarify section similar to FBC-EC language None None
outlet boxes
R402.6 Maximum FB(;—EC doc?s not have.thls
fenestration U- section, but includes (higher) None (from section | None (from section
Renumbered from R402.5 fenestration SHGC limits and
factor and SHGC . number change) number change)
an overhang depth alternative
for Performance compliance
Revises heat pump supplementary | Corresponding FBC-EC section
heat section language to include is R403.1.3; FBC-EC has
R403.1.2 Heat pump | REPI-73- | fuel gas and liquid fuel heating similar language to 2024 IECC None None
supplementary heat | 21 systems, and further stipulates but does not include

when supplemental heat can be
used

supplementary fuel gas or
liquid fuel heating systems

31



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?nmele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁ:tl:g?,tflpgléﬁig(y: . r‘;“;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 TECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa pa
No. if Adopted if Adopted
R4.03.2 Hot water RECDI- Revises language including FBC-EC uses. different o
boiler temperature oS . » language but includes a similar None None
12-22 changing “oil” to “liquid fuel .
reset requirement
R403.3 Duct « » Same as change between 2021
systems Renamed from “Ducts IECC and 2024 TECC None None
2021 IECC includes a duct testing
exception in Section R403.3.5 for
ventilation system ducts that are
not integrated with ducts serving
heating or cooling systems; the
R403.3 Duct REDI- 2024 IECC modifies this FBC-EC does not state it, but Non. Non
systems 285-22 exception language slightly and may interpret it the same one one
moves it up to Section R403.3 so
it now applies to duct system
testing and other duct system
installation sections from
R403.3.3 through R403.3.9
New section stipulating duct inclr\i(e):see?irsigihg?c Slightly increased
R403.3.1 Duct REDI1- system design and sizing Same as change between 2021 in applicable fasesy cosgt inya licable
system design 285-22 standards based on number of IECC and 2024 IECC dle):pen dine on calsjel?s
dwelling or sleeping units P €0
typical practice
o Renumbered from R403.3.7 and Same as change between 2021
i“vﬁi -2 Building term “ducts” changed to IECC and 2024 IECC, except None None
“ductwork” renumbered from R403.3.5
Renumbered from R403.3.1,
R403.3.3 Dgctwork renamed fror.n. Ducts 1oce},ted FBCV-EC does not include this None (from None (from
located outside outside conditioned space”, and section changes) changes)
conditioned space term “ducts” changed to & g
“ductwork”
Renumbered from R403.3.2,
R403.3.4 Duct . REDI1- renar'n'ed from Dl,l,CtS located in FBCV-EC does not include this None (from None (from
systems located in conditioned space”, and term .
285-22 section changes) changes)

conditioned space

“ductwork” changed to “duct
systems”

32



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;‘;‘;ﬁf‘;g‘é"% . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Section language revised for None from'chang.es,
R403.3.4 Duct clarification purposes; also adds but adopting this
- . REDI- . o FBCV-EC does not include this | IECC section would .
systems located in 28520 unvented attics with vapor section slightly decrease None (optional)
conditioned space diffusion ports to buried ductwork . .
option stringency in
applicable cases
Renumbered from R403.3.3,
renamed from “Ducts buried
lefr?S('isji g})l:lrftcvgﬁlrrlfg RED1- within ceiling insulation”, term FB(;—EC does not include this None (frqm None (frqm
insulation 285-22 “duct” changed to “ductwork”, section changes; optional) changes; optional)
and minor additional text
revisions
Adds items #4 and 4.1 which add
R403.3.5 Ductwork an unvented attic (with vapor . .
buried within ceiling I;FPI_SZ_ diffusion port) buried R8 supply i]ig(flc does not include this None (optional) None (optional)
insulation duct option for Climate Zones
0A, 1A, 2A and 3A
R403.3.5.1 Effective Renumbered from R403.3.3.1,
R-value of deeply term “duct” changed to FBC-EC does not include this None (optional) None
buried ducts. Where “ductwork”, and minor additional | section
complying text revisions
Corresponding FBC-EC section
Renumbered from R403.3.4, term | is 403.3.2; FBC-EC has similar
R403.3.6 Scaling RED1- “ducts” changed to “ductwork”, general intent as 2024 IECC, None (from None (from
e 285-22 and minor additional text and in addition references changes) changes)
revisions Florida statutes that provide
duct tester qualifications
Renumbered from R403.3.4.1,
renamed from “Sealed air Same as change between 2021
zér‘—(;is('i?i'rllgsjﬁifd handler”, and “air handlers” IECC and 2024 TIECC, except None None
changed to “air-handling units” in | renumbered from R403.3.2.1
text
Renumbered from R403.3.5, Corresponding FBC-EC section
R403.3.7 Duct REPI-86- rengmed from "‘Du‘th testing”, an’c} is' R.403'3'5; FBC-EC has None (from None (from
. revised, removing “rough-in test similar language to 2021 IECC
system testing 21 changes) changes)

and “postconstruction test” based
organization

outside of testing exceptions
and overall content still

33



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?l;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;}‘;‘;‘t’ﬁ‘;g‘é";ﬁ% . ﬁ[r)litil:tl?)?lt;‘%(é(-)ls*:tc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
somewhat similar to 2024
IECC, again outside of testing
exceptions
Adds duct testing exception for FBC-EC does not require duct
10 feet or less of total ductwork testing for Performance
when the duct system is entirely compliance with default
Eéts(t)e?n? 't7es]t)i;l10t 5;55]?212_ in conditioned space and the leakage or for Prescriptive None None
Y & ductwork does not include compliance when ducts are
building cavity or gypsum board | within the building thermal
plenums envelope
Adds duct testing exception to
section, allowing testing where
space conditioning equipment is
not installed-- in these cases,
R403.3.7 Duct REDI1- requires total supply and return Same as change between 2021 . .
system testing 285-22 duci:t leakage to gg l}e]:ss than or IECC and 202g4 IECC None (optional) None (optional)
equal to 3.0 cfin/sq. ft.; 2021
IECC had same allowance, but
applied to Prescriptive only; now
also applies to Performance
Adds exception to section which,
in conjunction with new Section . .
R403.3.7 Duct REPI-85- | R403.3.9, allows duct testing Same as change between 2021 d None (c)lr s,tlr{ghtly Shgth.tly de(i.reats)cled
system testing 21 sampling for buildings with eight | IECC and 2024 IECC cereased stngency |- costin appricable
. : in applicable cases cases
or more dwelling units or
sleeping units
Renumbered from R403.3.6, Slichily increased or
renamed from “Duct leakage”, decgreaze d stringenc
and revised, moving from “rough- for Prescriptive Y
in tiSt” and “postco.ns.truction compliance
R403.3.8 Duct RED]. | !5t ductleakage limits ) Same as change between 2021 | - e jing onarea | Slightly increased
systern leakage 28520 organization to limits shown in IECC and 2024 IECC (for served cost
M & new Table R403.3.8, based on changes) ’

floor area served by the duct
system, equipment and duct
configuration, and number of
ducted returns

configuration, and

number of ducted

returns; somewhat
increased stringency

34



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?l()(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;}‘“:g:if‘;g‘é‘i%g . ﬁ“;‘cct“";‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa pa
No. if Adopted if Adopted
for Performance
compliance
Adds duct testing unit sampling
section which, in conjunction . .
R403.3.9 Unit REPI-85- | with new Section R403.3.7, Same as change between 2021 delc\lrzgze?irsstlrliihtelzc Sclcfthitrllyade(l:if:ﬁ:
sampling 21 allows duct testing sampling for IECC and 2024 IECC . . gency pp
o ol in applicable cases cases
buildings with eight or more
dwelling units or sleeping units
Minor edit and new requirement
R403.4.1 Protection | REPI-87- that p 1p1r11g P roltecn(})ln be & Same as change between 2021
of piping insulation | 21 removable no less than 6 fect IECC and 2024 IECC None None
(1828 mm) from the equipment
for maintenance
Reorganizes language slightly,
adds gravity circulation system
prohibition, and adds requirement
that where a cold water supply Same as change between 2021
R403.5.1.1 REDI- pipe is used as the return pipe, a IECC and 2024 TIECC, except
Circu.laii(')n svstems | 310-22 temperature sensor connected to FBC-EC already includes None None
M the controls be located on the hot | gravity circulation system
water supply not more than two prohibition
feet (305 mm) from the
connection to the cold water
supply pipe _
R403.5.1.1.1 Removes . Whe.re installed” and Same as change between 2021 Slightly increased Slightly increased
Demand REDI1- adds specifications on how
recirculation water 310-22 controls must limit pump IECC and 2024 IECC except stringency in cost in applicable
systems operation FBC-EC section is R403.5.2 applicable cases cases
Changes hot water pipe insulation
requirements for stipulated . . . .
p1p REPI-89- insulation thickness based on Same as change between 2021 a licible Zases casesp(rr)l ow
Table R403.5.2 71 fluid operating temperature range | IECC and 2024 IECC except (};1 }:) w includin includin
Minimum P.i .e and usage as provided in new FBC-EC section is R403.5.3 Per forrnanceg Performa ngc .
. P Table R403.5.2; also removes . .
Insulation Thickness compliance) compliance)

piping serving more than one
dwelling unit condition and

35



2024 IECC Section
and Title*

ICC Code
Change
No.

Change Summary b/t 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

Change Summary b/t 2023
FBC-EC and 2024 IECC

Anticipated Energy
Impact on FBC-EC
if Adopted

Anticipated Cost
Impact on FBC-EC
if Adopted

provides exception for cold water
returns in demand recirculation
water systems; section now also
applies to performance
compliance

R403.6 Mechanical
ventilation

RED1-
318-22

Adds “dwelling units” to the
structures that must comply with
this section, further changes the
structures that must comply with
this section by changing reference
from Section R402.5.1 “Building
thermal envelope” to R402.5.1.1
“Installation” and adds
“mechanical” to phrase “shall be
provided with mechanical
ventilation...”

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC except
FBC-EC has somewhat
different wording for section

None

None

R403.6.1 Heat or
energy recovery
ventilation

REPI-94-
21

Adds Climate Zone 6 to those
included in this section’s heat or
energy recovery ventilation
requirements and revises text to
include sensible recovery
efficiency (SRE) term and
stipulates how SRE must be
determined

FBC-EC does not include this
section

None (Climate
Zones do not apply
to Florida)

None (Climate
Zones do not apply
to Florida)

R403.6.2 Whole-
dwelling mechanical
ventilation system
fan efficacy

Table R403.6.2
Whole-Dwelling
Mechanical
Ventilation System
Fan Efficacy

REPI-95-
21,
REC2D-
10-23

Fixes typos, provides minor
clarifications, and references and
provides revised mechanical
ventilation system fan efficacy
Table R403.6.2 that includes test
procedure for each system type
and provides additional minimum
efficacies for “Balanced
ventilation system without heat or
energy recovery” and “other
exhaust fans” with airflow rate
above 200 cfm; also provides
footnote with means of

Same as change between 2021
IECC and 2024 IECC

None

None

36



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;‘;‘;ﬁf‘;g‘é"% . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
determining efficacy for balanced
ventilation systems, HRVs, and
ERVs
Changes mechanical ventilation
system testln% sFlpulatlgn from None for changes:
manufacturer’s instructions or liohtly increased
. code listed options to instead be FBC-EC does not include this None for changes or SUSALY neh
R403.6.3 Testing . . . . . cost in applicable
in accordance with ANSI/ section if section is adopted F section i
RESNET/ICC 380; revises Cases 11 section 1s
existing testing exception and adopted
adds two exceptions
Adds mechanical ventilation
testing unit sampling section
which, in conjunction with new FBC-EC does not include the Slichily i d
R403.6.4 Unit RED1- Section R403.3.7, allows ventilation system testing ghtly inerease
. . S . . . . None cost in applicable
sampling 365-22 mechanical ventilation system section to which this sampling cases
testing sampling for buildings section applies
with eight or more dwelling units
or sleeping units
$1036tf ¢ exhaust New section requires exhaust Slichtly i d Slichtly i d
" etrrmll fen exhaust | RECDI- system controls for bathrooms Same as change between 2021 lgi Ly merease lgt Y 1nc1r.ea:)elz
controt for . 1-22 and toilet rooms when designed IECC and 2024 IECC SHINgEncy m costin apphicable
bathrooms and toilet for i . . applicable cases cases
or intermittent operation
rooms
New section requires detached
one- and two-family dwellings
and townhouses in Climate Zones
R403.7.1 Electric- | REPI-99- | 4 through 8 using electric- None (Climate None (Climate
resistance space 21, resistance space hea}mg to limit Same as change between 2021 Zones do not apply | Zones do not apply
heating REDI- the total electric resistance IECC and 2024 IECC to Florida) to Florida)
325-22 heating capacity to not more than
2.0 kW or requires installation of
a heat pump in the largest space
that is not used as a bedroom
Eej?/fnz rsn}ilslttf}r)rllz REDI- lszisisnegxr(flﬁttlig?etg\xszglslgflrginits Same as change between 2021 None None
329-22 IECC and 2024 IECC

dwelling units

section for systems complying

37



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?nmele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁ:tl:g?,tflpgléﬁig(y: . r‘;“;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa pa
No. if Adopted if Adopted
with new Section R403.9, which
addresses mechanical systems
located outside of the building
thermal envelope
R403.9 Mechanical . .
New section provides
systems located . .
outside of the REDI1- requirements for mechanical Same as change between 2021 None None
- 329-22 systems located outside of the IECC and 2024 IECC
building thermal o
building thermal envelope
envelope
New section provides type and . . .
R403.9.1 Heating RED1- control requirements for systems | Same as change between 2021 inijg::egrsﬂiihgzc ig;gthitrllyamclr;:;?g
outside a building 329-22 that provide heat outside of a IECC and 2024 IECC . . gency PP
building in applicable cases cases
R403.9.2 Snow melt
and ice system ;EgDzlz_ Renumbered from R403.9 Isgglé Zisga(;lzg: ijs é\geen 2021 None (for change) None (for change)
controls i
R403.9.3 Roof and CEPI-82- New section provides control Same as change between 2021 None or slightly Slightly increased
gutter deicing 21 Part I requirements for roof and gutter IECC and 2024 TECC increased stringency cost in applicable
controls deicing systems in applicable cases cases
R403.9.4 Freeze REDI- New section provides control Same as change between 2021 None or slightly Slightly increased
protection system 32922 requirements for freeze protection IECC and 2024 TECC increased stringency cost in applicable
controls systems in applicable cases cases
Replaces pool pump control FBC-EC already has an
R403.10.2 Time RED1- plac 1,3 p }3 - exception for pumps that are
. exception’s use of “solar” with o None None
switches 299-22 hy . . powered by “onsite renewable
on-site renewable energy o7
generation
With an exception for gas-fired
combustion safety devices, new .
section requires gas fireplace in(I:\ig:seegrsﬂ;rglhgr}:c Slightly increased
R403.13 Gas RED1- systems to not be equipped with a | Same as change between 2021 in anplicable fasesy co;gt inya licable
fireplaces 286-22 continuous pilot, and instead be IECC and 2024 IECC dgpen dine on cals) g s
equipped with an on-demand ; ?cal - agc tice
pilot, intermittent ignition or yprealp
interrupted ignition
R403.13.1 Gas REDI1- New section provides vented gas | Same as change between 2021 ing(e):see?irsigﬁhg?c il)lsgthitrllyamclrii;ﬁg
fireplace efficiency | 286-22 fireplace heater fireplace IECC and 2024 IECC . . gency pp
in applicable cases cases

38



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?nmele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 ﬁ:tl:g?,tflpgléﬁig(y: . r‘;“;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa P2
No. if Adopted if Adopted
efficiency (FE) rating and listing
and labeling requirements
SECTION R404
ELECTRICAL
POWER, «
RENEWABLE i
ENERGY
SYSTEMS
D REPI- Replaces high efﬁcgcy lighting FBC-EC already has similar None or slightly None or slightly
R404.1 Lighting sources language with actual . :
. 102-21 2. language as 2024 IECC, but decreased stringency decreased cost in
equipment efficacy minimums and adds . . . . .
Part 11 . with only one exception in applicable cases applicable cases
three exceptions
Revisions include moving
connected exterior lighting
compliance requirement from
Section C405.5 to new Sections None to somewhat None or slightly
R404.1 1 Exterior REPL R404'1.1'.2 through R4041 A4, FBC—EC does ngt 1n§luQe 1ncrea§ed strlingency 1nc'reased.cost
lichtin 105-21 specifying applicability is for residential exterior lighting combined with new | combined with new
ghiing Group R-2, R-3 and R-4 requirements Sections R404.1.2 Sections R404.1.2
residential buildings, and adding and R404.1.3 and R404.1.3
exception for Group R-3
buildings that do not contain
more than two dwelling units
New section adds applicable
R404.12 Exterior | NEPL- exterior lighting power FBC-EC does not include .
lichting power 105-21, requirements from Section residential exterior lichtin None to somewhat None or slightly
ghung p REDI1- C405.5 (as part of moving . ghting increased stringency increased cost
requirements . . requirements
110-22 requirements from commercial
provisions)
R404.1.3 Exterior New section adds applicable
lighting power exterior lighting power allowance .
allowance REPI- from Section C405.5 including fe}ii((jijiga(li(;istenr(i)(t)rullflﬁgi None to somewhat None or slightly
105-21 new Table R404.1 used to ghtng increased stringency increased cost

Table R404.1
Lighting Power

calculate allowed lighting power
for various area types (as part of

requirements

39



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?l;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;}‘;‘;‘t’ﬁ‘;g‘é";ﬁ% . ﬁ[r)litil:tl?)?lt;‘%(é(-)ls*:tc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted

Allowances for moving requirements from
Building Exteriors commercial provisions)
R404.1.4 Additional REPL New section provides for FBC-EC does not include None or slightly None or slightly
exterior lighting 10521 additional exterior lighting power | residential exterior lighting increased stringency increased cost in
power allowances for building facades requirements in applicable cases applicable cases

Renumbered from R404.1.2,

renamed from “Fuel gas lighting

equipment”, revises existing None or slightly
R404.1.5 Gas REDI- lgnggage anq adds that gas-fired Iséglé Zisga(;lzg: IbEe géee;zggtl ipcreasgd stringency None or slightlly
ligh til'lg' 286-22 lighting appliances are not be renumbered and renar;le d from in applicable cases increased cost in

equipped with a continuous pilot, “R404.1.1 Lichti . o depending on applicable cases

and instead be equipped with an -1 LIEhUNg equipmen typical practice

on-demand pilot, intermittent

ignition or interrupted ignition

E)e:l]:;ssseecﬁ;ori 1}?2%2&2‘% el t;nﬁfer Slightly increased Slightly increased
R404.2 Interior REPI- R404.2.2 and removeé tilree FB.C_E(? dqes no t igclu@e stripgency combined cost combine;d with
lightiﬁg controls 10621 excep'ti;)n locations, leaving an residential interior lighting with new Sections new Sections

excepton o sy orseury | "0 SR | R

New section requires all

permanently installed luminaires

in habitable spaces to be .
R404.2.1 Habitable | REPI- controlled wi?h a manual dimmer FB.C_E(.: dqes 1o t “?Ch‘qe Slightly increased Slightly increased
spaces 106-21 or automatic shutoff control; also residential interior lighting stringency cost

must incorporate a manual control controls

to allow occupants to turn the

lights on or off

New section requires all

permanently installed luminaires

in garages, unfinished
R40422 Specific | REPL. | basements, laundry rooms anc | FBC-EE does not include Slightly increased | Slightly increased
locations 106-21 Y Y ghting stringency cost

an automatic shutoff control; also
must incorporate a manual control
to allow occupants to turn the
lights on or off

controls

40



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?l;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;}‘;‘;‘t’ﬁ‘;g‘é";ﬁ% . ﬁ[r)litil:tl?)?lt;‘%(é(-)ls*:tc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Revises Section R404.3 to instead
of providing exterior lighting
R404.3 Exterior controls requirements in this
lighting controls sectioq which i'ncll}ded an FBC-EC does not include Sligh.tly incregsed Slightly increased
REDI- exception for lighting serving residential exterior lighting stringency in cost in applicable
R404.3.1 Controls 112-22 multiple dwelling units, moves applicable .
L . . controls - Prescriptive cases
for individual the existing controls requirements Prescriptive cases
dwelling units to new Section R404.3.1 which
specifies applicability to
individual dwelling units
New section requires that where
renewable energy generation is
used to comply with the code,
documentation be provided Slight reduction in Slight increase to
R404.4 Renewable demonstrating that where overall community cost of PY system
energy certificate REPI- rengwable energy Same as change between 2021 energy use fpr for app hc?b.le
(REC) 15821 certilﬁcates (RECS) or energy IECC and 2024 TECC applicable proj ects’ projects as utility or
documentation attributable certificates (EACs) as these RECs won’t | others cannot offset
are associated with that portion of be used for costs by buying
renewable energy used to comply offsetting others RECs
with this code, the RECs or EACs
will be retained, or retired,
on behalf of the property owner
SECTION R405
SIMULATED Changes section title from “Total | FBC-EC already uses new None None
BUILDING Simulated Building Performance” | IECC title
PERFORMANCE
Revision clarifies that simulated
building performance analysis are
REDI1- limited to dwelling units., and . Same as change between 2021
R405.1 Scope 24922 Spaces other than dwelling units IECC and 2024 TECC None None
in Group R-2, R-3 or R-4
buildings are to comply with
Sections R402 through R404
R405.2 Simulated Renamed from “Performance- FBC._ EC uses” Mgndatory .
requirements” as title for this None None

building

based compliance”

section

41



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?l;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;}‘;‘sz‘t’zf‘;g‘éeggg . ﬁ;)l;lcctll())illt;‘(;}(é?l?c
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC : :
No. if Adopted if Adopted
performance
compliance

Revises Table R405.2
requirements for simulated
building performance entries:
removes Section R402.1.5
Additional Energy Efficiency,
requires all of Section R403.5
Service hot water systems instead
of previously just R403.5.1
Heated water circulation and
temperature maintenance systems
and R403.5.3 Drain water heat

CEPI-24- : -
21 Part 11, recovery units subsectlpq, adds
REDI1-56- | k402.1.6 Rooms containing fuel- | ppc b oes not use IECCs
burning appliances (for CZ 3-8), .
Table R405.2 22, . table-based requirements .
. new R402.2.3 Attic knee wall, None to slightly None to somewhat
Requirements for REDI- format for Performance . . .
. oy R402.2.10 Slab-on grade floors, . increased stringency increased cost as
Simulated Building | 224-22 . . compliance and does not . .
R402.5.1.3 Maximum air leakage | . as applicable applicable
Performance Part I, . include a number of the IECC
REPI.86- rate, R402.5.2 Flreplace§, requirements
1 R402.5.3 Fenestration air leakage,
R402.5.4 Recessed lighting,
R402.5.5 Air-sealed electrical and
communication outlet boxes,
R403.2 Hot water boiler
temperature reset, R403.13 Gas
fireplaces; also changes crawl
space requirement from
R402.2.11.1 to R402.2.11; also
removes Section R403.3 Duct
systems exceptions, also edits for
Section number and name
changes consistency
R405.2 Simulated Changes item #2 requirement to FBC-EC Performance To be determined
building RED1-27- | meet 2009 IECC thermal compliance has several thermal via analvsis of Slightly increased
performance 22 envelope efficiencies to new envelope minimum efficiency combined i]evisions cost
compliance thermal conductance (TC) based | requirements but does not

42



2024 IECC Section I(C:ﬁafl"de Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;}‘t‘;“t’atlf‘;g‘éeggg . ﬁ“;‘ct‘p?lt;‘;;cj"gc
and Title* ge IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pact 0 - pact o -
No. if Adopted if Adopted

requirement; also reduces the
maximum weighted fenestration
SHGC for Performance
compliance in Climate Zones 0
through 3 to 0.30

include either the 2009 IECC
thermal envelope efficiency
requirement or new thermal
conductance (TC) based
requirement

R405.2 Simulated
building
performance
compliance

RED1-27-
22,
REPI-33-
21

Changes item #3 requirement that
the annual energy cost be less
than or equal to that of the
standard reference design to
separate requirements for
dwelling units that use fuel-
burning appliances for space
heating, water heating, or both vs.
for all other dwelling units, with
annual energy cost limits being
80 percent and 85 percent of that
of the standard reference design,
respectively; also, for each
dwelling unit with greater than
5,000 square feet (465 m?) of
living space above grade plane,
the annual energy cost of the
dwelling unit must be reduced by
an additional 5 percent; also adds
source energy multipliers for
natural gas, propane, fuel oil, and
imported liquefied natural gas,
and revises source energy
multiplier for electricity for
energy use based on source
energy exception; and adds new
exception for energy use based on
site energy

Applicable FBC-EC Section
R405.3 “Performance-based
compliance” requires the
proposed design be shown to
have annual total normalized
Modified Loads that are less
than or equal to 95 percent of
the annual total loads of the
standard reference design

Increased stringency

Increased cost

R405.3 Compliance
documentation

RECDI-
8-22

Renamed from “Documentation”
and revises language, separating
requirements into application and

Same as for IECC except
renumbered from R405.4

None or slightly
increased stringency
depending on
typical practice

None or slightly
increased cost
depending on

typical practice

43



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?l()(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;}‘“:g:if‘;g‘é‘i%g . ﬁ“;‘cct“";‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* g IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC pa pa
No. if Adopted if Adopted
certificate of occupancy
compliance reports
Renumbered from R405.4, and
FBC-EC currently requires
Florida Building Commission
approval-- 2024 TECC added
[R405.§.1 RECDI- Re;moveg section, replgcmg 1t' new 'SCCtIOIl R405.5.2 Slightly increased
Compliance 8-22 with revised language in Section | requirement that software stringenc None
software tools] R405.4.1 vendors test software in geney
accordance with
ANSI/ASHRAE 140 Class 1,
Tier 1 test procedures and
publish results
Revises, reorganizes, and clarifies Renumbered from R405.5,
: vISeS, TEOTEanIZes, Ak R405.5.1, R405.5.2, and
R405.4 Calculation existing sections, including
. , . R405.6.3, and as noted above,
procedure stipulating revised R405.5 .
. FBC-EC currently requires
software tools approval section . g .
S . Florida Building Commission
R405.4.1 General which includes new Section
. approval-- 2024 IECC added . .
RECDI- R405.5.2 requirement that . Slightly increased
. . new Section R405.5.2 ; None
R405.4.2 Residence | 8-22 software vendors test software in requirement that software stringency
specifications accordance with ANSI/ASHRAE 4 .
. vendors test software in
140 Class II, Tier 1 test accordance with
R405.4.3 Input procedures and publish result[s; ANSI/ASHRAE 140 Class I,
values also moves Input values section Tier 1 test procedures and
from R405.5.3 to R405.4.3 oStD
publish results
Table R405.4.2(1)
tshiegltgﬁzgféls for Revises Standard Reference
Reference and REDI1- Design solar absorptance Same as change between 2021 None None
. 252-22 specification to solar reflectance IECC and 2024 IECC
Proposed Designs: without changing stringenc
Above-grade gmng geney
walls
Table R405.4.2(1) Revises Standard Reference
Specifications for RED1- Design solar absorptance Same as change between 2021 None None
the Standard 252-22 specification to solar reflectance IECC and 2024 IECC

Reference and

without changing stringency

44



2024 IECC Section I((:Iﬁa?n;(ele Change Summary b/t 2021 Change Summary b/t 2023 i‘;‘;‘;ﬁf‘;g‘é"% . rﬁ;‘;‘cct“(’;‘lt;‘;;g‘_’gc
and Title* IECC and 2024 IECC FBC-EC and 2024 IECC . .
No. if Adopted if Adopted
Proposed Designs:
Roofs
Tablg R4O.5'4'2(1) Revises Standard Reference
Specifications for Design foundation specification
the Standard REC2D- . i . i Same as change between 2021
Reference and 4-23 removing “area and adding IECC and 2024 IECC None None
. foundation wall or slab
Proposed Designs: . v
Foundations perimeter length
Table R405.4.2(1)
Specifications for Adds that foundation wall
the Standard RED1- Standard Reference Design U- Same as change between 2021 None None
Reference and 208-22 factor and slab F-factor be as IECC and 2024 IECC
Proposed Designs: specified in Table R402.1.2
Foundations
Table R405.4.2(1) Changes building component
Specifications for section title from “Air exchange
the Standard rate” and revises Climate Zone 0 FBC-EC currently uses 7.0
Reference and REDI1- — 2 Standard Reference Design air ACHS50 for the Standard ' Increased stringency | Increased cost for
Proposed Designs: 251-22 leakage rate from 5.0 ACH50 to for applicable cases applicable cases

Air leakage rate

4.0 ACHS50 (applies to detached
one-family dwellings > 1,500 sq.
ft.)

Reference Design

---- Progress to date as of June 18, 2024 ----

45



	Residential 2024 IECC Changes Review Summary

