NEmo | etc.

Certificate of Authorization #32455
353 Christian Street, Unit #13
Oxford, CT 06478

(203) 262-9245

ENGINEER EVALUATE TesT CoONSULT CERTIFY

EVALUATION REPORT

Johns Manville Corporation Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12
P.O. Box 5108 FL2948-R13
Denver, CO 80217 Date of Issuance: 03/28/2008
(303) 978-4879 Revision 12: 12/16/2019
SCOPE:

This Evaluation Report is issued under Rule 61G20-3 and the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of
construction materials in the State of Florida. The documentation submitted has been reviewed by Robert Nieminen,
P.E. for use of the product under the Florida Building Code. The product described herein has been evaluated for
compliance with the 6% Edition (2017) Florida Building Code sections noted herein.

DESCRIPTION: Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems

LABELING: Labeling shall be in accordance with the requirements of the Accredited Quality Assurance Agency noted
herein.

CONTINUED COMPLIANCE: This Evaluation Report is valid until such time as the named product(s) changes, the referenced
Quality Assurance documentation changes, or provisions of the Code that relate to the product change. Acceptance of
this Evaluation Report by the named client constitutes agreement to notify Robert Nieminen, P.E. of any changes to the
product(s), the Quality Assurance or the production facility location(s). NEMO|etc. requires a complete review of this
Evaluation Report relative to updated Code requirements with each Code Cycle.

ADVERTISEMENT: The Evaluation Report number preceded by the words “NEMO |etc. Evaluated” may be displayed in
advertising literature. If any portion of the Evaluation Report is displayed, then it shall be done in its entirety.
INSPECTION: Upon request, a copy of this entire Evaluation Report shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or
its distributors and shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.

This Evaluation Report consists of pages 1 through 6, plus a 48-page Appendix.
Prepared by:

/7 S
Robert J.M. Nieminen, P.E.
Florida Registration No. 59166, Florida DCA ANE1983

TR et The facsimile seal appearing was authorized by Robert

B ‘,?EM,. ",:;;,\\“ Nieminen, P.E. on 12/16/2019. This does not serve as an
e
; ! electronically signed document.

CERTIFICATION OF INDEPENDENCE:

1. NEMO ETC, LLC does not have, nor does it intend to acquire or will it acquire, a financial interest in any company manufacturing or
distributing products it evaluates.

2. NEMO ETC, LLC is not owned, operated or controlled by any company manufacturing or distributing products it evaluates.

3. Robert Nieminen, P.E. does not have nor will acquire, a financial interest in any company manufacturing or distributing products for
which the evaluation reports are being issued.

4. Robert Nieminen, P.E. does not have, nor will acquire, a financial interest in any other entity involved in the approval process of the
product.

5. Thisis a building code evaluation. Neither NEMO | etc. nor Robert Nieminen, P.E. are, in any way, the Designer of Record for any project
on which this Evaluation Report, or previous versions thereof, is/was used for permitting or design guidance unless retained specifically

for that purpose.
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC



NEmoO | etc.

ROOFING SYSTEMS EVALUATION:
1. SCOPE:

Product Category: Roofing

Sub-Category: Modified Bitumen Roof Systems

Compliance Statement: Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems, as produced by Johns Manville
Corporation, have demonstrated compliance with the following sections of the 6% Edition (2017) Florida Building
Code through testing in accordance with the following Standards. Compliance is subject to the Installation
Requirements and Limitations / Conditions of Use set forth herein.

2. STANDARDS:

Section Property Standard Year
1504.3.1 Wind FM 4474 2011
1504.3.1 Wind UL 1897 2012
1504.7 Impact FM 4470 2012
1507.11.2 Physical Properties ASTM D6162 2008
1507.11.2 Physical Properties ASTM D6163 2008
1507.11.2 Physical Properties ASTM D6164 2011
1507.11.2 Physical Properties ASTM D6298 2005
1515.1.1 Wind TAS 114 2011

3. REFERENCES:

Entity Examination Reference Date

ACRC (TST4671) TAS 114 03-017 09/30/2003
ACRC (TST4671) TAS 114 03-015 09/30/2003
ACRC (TST4671) TAS 114 03-012 12/04/2003
ACRC (TST4671) TAS 114 06-003 03/27/2006
ACRC (TST4671) TAS 114 06-005 03/27/2006
ACRC (TST4671) TAS 114 06-009 06/28/2006
ACRC (TST4671) TAS 114 07-014 04/18/2007
ERD (TST6049) Physical Properties 00257.03.05-1 03/17/2005
ERD (TST6049) TAS 114 02843.02.07 02/07/2007
ERD (TST6049) Physical Properties 16990.12.07 12/03/2007
ERD (TST6049) Physical Properties J17040.11.09 11/16/2009
ERD (TST6049) Physical Properties J13700.05.10-1 05/11/2010
ERD (TST6049) Physical Properties J13700.05.10-2 05/11/2010
ERD (TST6049) FM 4470/4474 J30820.09.10-1 09/16/2010
ERD (TST6049) FM 4470/4474 J30820.09.10-1 04/04/2011
ERD (TST6049) FM 4470/4474 JM-SC7565.10.14-1 10/13/2014
ERD (TST6049) FM 4470/4474 RAS-SC8750.05.15 05/27/2015
ERD (TST6049) FM 4470/4474 JM-SC7565.08.15-1 08/03/2015
ERD (TST6049) FM 4470/4474 JM-SC11320.03.16 03/10/2016
ERD (TST6049) FM 4470/4474 JM-11190.03.16 03/11/2016
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 1Q6A4.AM 12/11/1990
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3001002 05/11/1998
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3001482 08/11/1998
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3001623 09/10/1998
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3002823 04/01/1999
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3003468 02/02/2000
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3007148 04/19/2000
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3005753 09/13/2000
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3006346 09/15/2000
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3009499 04/04/2001
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3011057 08/10/2001
FM Approvals (TST1867) FM 4470 3001457 03/04/2002

NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION FL2948-R13

Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Page 2 of 6

Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems



Entity

FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
FM Approvals (TST1867)
Madinah C&TC (TST9199)
Madinah C&TC (TST9199)
PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

PRI (TST5878)

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455

Examination
FM 4470
FM 4470
FM 4470
FM 4470
FM 4470
FM 4470
FM 4470
FM 4470
FM 4470
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470
FM 4470/4474
TAS 114
TAS 114

Physical Properties

FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474

Physical Properties

FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
UL 1897

FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474
FM 4470/4474

Reference
3001457
3012974
3012064
3014090
3011248
3015224
3017543
3020586
3020703
3020586
3020600
3026130
3023458
3026128
3026151
3024311
3026728
163479-48573-0
3029993
3035191
3034810
3036559
3037222
3037929
3040986
3043824
797-07736-267
3044716
3046174
3053754
3060143

MCTC 10-003
MCTC 10-006
JMC-106-02-01
JMC-108-02-01
JMC-109-02-01
JMC-114-02-01
JMC-118-02-01
JMC-107-02-01
JMC-126-02-01
JMC-131-02-01
JMC-132-02-01
JMC-113-02-01
JMC-118-02-02
JMC-141-02-01
JMC-222-02-01
JMC-222-02-02

JMC-222-02-02(A)

JMC-222-02-04
JMC-242-02-01
JMC-242-02-02
JMC-242-02-03
JMC-245-02-01
JMC-245-02-02
JMC-268-02-01

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems

NEmoO | etc.

Date

04/04/2002
06/03/2002
06/25/2002
09/05/2002
11/02/2002
02/21/2003
03/05/2004
06/09/2004
07/30/2004
11/29/2004
01/21/2005
04/26/2006
07/18/2006
08/04/2006
08/15/2006
11/01/2006
11/22/2006
01/09/2007
09/21/2007
05/20/2009
09/10/2009
10/02/2009
10/02/2009
07/18/2011
09/23/2011
04/06/2012
10/04/2012
10/19/2012
04/03/2013
03/04/2015
01/05/2017
07/02/2010
08/12/2010
04/15/2013
04/16/2013
04/16/2013
04/16/2013
04/16/2013
04/17/2013
04/17/2013
04/17/2013
04/17/2013
04/19/2013
04/19/2013
05/13/2013
02/26/2015
04/22/2015
04/22/2015
08/14/2015
11/18/2015
11/18/2015
11/18/2015
03/29/2016
03/29/2016
03/30/2016

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12

FL2948-R13

Revision 12: 12/16/2019

Page 3 of 6



NEmoO | etc.

Entity Examination Reference Date

PRI (TST5878) FM 4470/4474 JMC-267-02-01 03/31/2016
PRI (TST5878) FM 4470/4474 JMC-267-02-02 04/05/2016
PRI (TST5878) FM 4470/4474 JMC-272-02-01 04/07/2016
Miami-Dade (CER1592) TAS 114 Various NOAs Current

UL, LLC (QUA9625) Quality Assurance Service Confirmation 04/24/2019

4. PRODUCT DESCRIPTION:
This Evaluation Report covers Johns Manville Modified Bitumen Roof Systems installed in accordance with Johns
Manville published installation instructions and the Limitations / Conditions of Use herein. The following Johns
Manville products make up the subject systems.

TABLE 1: ROLL-GOODS FOR JOHNS MANVILLE MODIFIED BITUMEN ROOF SYSTEMS
Specification
Type HEcHRct Reference Grade Type
GlasPly IV ASTM D2178 N/A \%
GlasPly Premier ASTM D2178 N/A Vi
GlasBase Plus ASTM D4601 N/A Il
PermaPly 28 ASTM D4601 N/A 1l
Base / Ply Sheets JMCleanBond SBS Base ASTM D4601 N/A I
JM BaseGrip SD/SA ASTM D4601 N/A 1l
Ventsulation Felt ASTM D4897 N/A 1]
DeckPro Proprietary N/A N/A
DynaPly T1 ASTM D6162 S [
DynaBase ASTM D6163 S [
DynaBase HW ASTM D6163 S |
DynaWeld Base ASTM D6163 S [
DynaBase XT ASTM D6163 S |
DynaBase PR ASTM D6164 S |
DynaFast 180 HW ASTM D6164 S |
DynaFast 180 S ASTM D6164 S [
Smooth-Surfaced SBS Dynalastic 180 S ASTM D6164 S |
DynaWeld 180 S ASTM D6164 S |
DynaFast 250 HW ASTM D6164 S 1l
Dynalastic 250 S ASTM D6164 S 1l
Dynalastic 250 FR S ASTM D6164 S 1l
DynaGrip Base SA/SD Proprietary N/A N/A
DynaGrip Base SD/SA Proprietary N/A N/A
DynaGrip Base SA/SA Proprietary N/A N/A
DynaKap T1 ASTM D6162 G |
DynaKap FRT1 ASTM D6162 G |
DynaKap FRT1 CR ASTM D6162 G |
DynaKap FRT1CR G ASTM D6162 G |
DynaMax FR ASTM D6162 G 1]
DynaMax FR CR ASTM D6162 G 1]
DynaMax FR CR G ASTM D6162 G 1]
Granule-Surfaced SBS DynaGlas ASTM D6163 G I
DynaGlas 30 FR ASTM D6163 G |
DynaGlas 30 FR CR ASTM D6163 G |
DynaGlas FR ASTM D6163 G |
DynaGlas FR CR ASTM D6163 G |
DynaGlas FRCR G ASTM D6163 G |
DynaWeld Cap FR ASTM D6163 G |
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION FL2948-R13
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems Revision 12: 12/16/2019

Page 4 of 6



NEmoO | etc.

TABLE 1 (CONTINUED): ROLL-GOODS FOR JOHNS MANVILLE MODIFIED BITUMEN ROOF SYSTEMS

Specification
Type Riceaet Reference Grade Type
DynaWeld Cap FR CR ASTM D6163 G |
DynaWeld Cap FRCR G ASTM D6163 G I
DynaGlas 30 FR XT ASTM D6163 G I
DynaGlas FR XT ASTM D6163 G |
DynaGlas FR XT CR ASTM D6163 G |
DynaGlas FR XT CR G ASTM D6163 G |
JMCleanBond SBS Cap ASTM D6163 G |
Dynalastic 180 ASTM D6164 G I
Dynalastic 180 FR ASTM D6164 G I
Dynalastic 180 FR CR ASTM D6164 G I
Dynalastic 180 FR CR G ASTM D6164 G |
DynaWeld Cap 180 ASTM D6164 G |
Granule-Surfaced SBS DynaWeld Cap 180 CR ASTM D6164 G I
(continued) DynaWeld Cap 180 FR ASTM D6164 G |
DynaWeld Cap 180 FR CR ASTM D6164 G |
DynaWeld Cap 180 FRCR G ASTM D6164 G I
Dynalastic 250 ASTM D6164 G 1]
Dynalastic 250 FR ASTM D6164 G 1]
Dynalastic 250 FR CR ASTM D6164 G 1]
Dynalastic 250 FR CR G ASTM D6164 G 1]
DynaWeld Cap 250 ASTM D6164 G 1]
DynaWeld Cap 250 CR ASTM D6164 G 1]
DynaWeld Cap 250 FR ASTM D6164 G 1]
DynaWeld Cap 250 FR CR ASTM D6164 G 1]
DynaWeld Cap 250 FR CR G ASTM D6164 G I
DynaGrip Cap Proprietary N/A N/A
. DynaClad ASTM D6298 N/A N/A
Foil-Surfaced SBS DynaClad Copper ASTM D6298 N/A N/A

5. LIMITATIONS:

5.1  Thisis a building code evaluation. Neither NEMO |etc. nor Robert Nieminen, P.E. are, in any way, the Designer of
Record for any project on which this Evaluation Report, or previous versions thereof, is/was used for permitting or
design guidance unless retained specifically for that purpose.

5.2 This Evaluation Report is not for use in HVHZ jurisdictions.

5.3 Refer to a current UL Roofing Materials Directory for fire ratings of this product.

5.4  For steel deck installations, foam plastic insulation shall be separated from the building interior in accordance with
FBC 2603.4 unless the exceptions stated in FBC 2603.4.1 and 2603.6 apply.

5.5  The roof system evaluation herein pertains to above-deck roof components. Roof decks and structural members
shall be in accordance with FBC requirements to the satisfaction of the Authority Having Jurisdiction. Load
resistance of the roof deck shall be documented through proper codified and/or FBC Approval documentation.

5.6 For recover installations, the existing roof shall be examined in accordance with FBC 1511.

5.7  For mechanically attached insulation or membrane or strip-bonded insulation, the maximum design pressure for
the selected assembly shall meet or exceed the Zone 1 design pressure determined in accordance with FBC Chapter
16. Zones 2 and 3 shall employ an attachment density designed by a qualified design professional to resist the
elevated pressure criteria. Commonly used methods are ANSI/SPRI WD1, FM Loss Prevention Data Sheet 1-29,
Roofing Application Standard RAS 117 and Roofing Application Standard RAS 137. Assemblies marked with an

NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION FL2948-R13

Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Page 5 of 6




5.8

5.9

5.10

5.11

5.12

5.13

NEmoO | etc.

asterisk* carry the limitations set forth in Section 2.2.10.1 of FM Loss Prevention Data Sheet 1-29 (January 2016)
for Zone 2/3 enhancements.

For assemblies with all components fully bonded in place, the maximum design pressure for the selected assembly
shall meet or exceed critical design pressure determined in accordance with FBC Chapter 16. No rational analysis
is permitted for these systems.

For mechanically attached insulation or membrane over existing roof decks, fasteners shall be tested in the existing
deck for withdrawal resistance. A qualified design professional shall review the data for comparison to the
minimum requirements for the system. Testing and analysis shall be in accordance with ANSI/SPRI FX-1 or Testing
Application Standard TAS 105.

For bonded insulation or membrane over existing substrates in a re-roof (tear off) or recover installation, the
existing deck or existing roof surface shall be examined for compatibility with the adhesive to be installed. If any
surface conditions exist that bring system performance into question, field uplift testing in accordance with
ANSI/SPRI IA-1, ASTM E907, FM Loss Prevention Data Sheet 1-52 or Testing Application Standard TAS 124 shall be
conducted on mock-ups of the proposed new roof assembly.

For bonded insulation or membrane over existing substrates in a recover installation, the existing roof system shall
be capable of resisting project design pressures on its own merit to the satisfaction of the Authority Having
Jurisdiction, as documented through field uplift testing in accordance with ASTM E907, FM Loss Prevention Data
Sheet 1-52 or Testing Application Standard TAS 124.

Metal edge attachment (except gutters), shall be designed and installed for wind loads in accordance with FBC
Chapter 16 and tested for resistance in accordance with ANSI/SPRI ES-1 or Roofing Application Standard RAS 111,
except the basic wind speed shall be determined from FBC Figure 1609.3(1), 1609.3(2) or 1609.3(3).

All products in the roof assembly shall have quality assurance in accordance with FAC Rule 61G20-3.

INSTALLATION:

6.1

6.2

Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems shall be installed in accordance with Johns Manville published
installation instructions, subject to the Limitations / Conditions of Use noted below.

System attachment requirements for wind load resistance are set forth in Appendix 1. "MDP” = Maximum Design
Pressure is the result of testing for wind load resistance based on allowable wind loads, and reflects the ultimate
passing pressure divided by 2 (the 2 to 1 margin of safety per FBC 1504.9 has already been applied). Refer to FBC
1609 for determination of design wind loads.

BUILDING PERMIT REQUIREMENTS: ‘

As required by the Building Official or Authority Having Jurisdiction in order to properly evaluate the installation of
this product.

MANUFACTURING PLANTS: ‘

Contact the named QA entity for information on plants covered under F.A.C. Rule 61G20-3 QA requirements.

QUALITY ASSURANCE ENTITY: ‘

UL, LLC — QUA9625; (847) 664-3623; LeAnna.Gradecki@ul.com

- THE 48-PAGES THAT FOLLOW FORM PART OF THIS EVALUATION REPORT -

NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION FL2948-R13

Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Page 6 of 6


mailto:LeAnna.Gradecki@ul.com

NEmoO | etc.

APPENDIX 1: ATTACHMENT REQUIREMENTS FOR WIND UPLIFT RESISTANCE

TABLE DECK APPLICATION DESCRIPTION PAGE
1A Wood New or Reroof (Tear-Off) A-1 Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 5
1B Wood New or Reroof (Tear-Off) A-2 Mech. Attached Anchor Sheet, Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 5
1C Wood New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover A-2 Mech. Attached Anchor Sheet, Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 6
1D Wood New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover B Mech. Attached Base Insulation, Bonded Top Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 6
1E Wood New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover C Mech. Attached Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 7
1F Wood New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover D Prelim. Attached Insulation, Mech. Attached Base Sheet, Bonded Roof Cover 7
1G Wood New, Reroof (Tear-Off) E Non-Insulated, Mech. Attached Base Sheet, Bonded Roof Cover 8
1H Wood New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover E Non-Insulated, Mech. Attached Base Sheet, Bonded Roof Cover 8
2A Steel or Concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover B Mech. Attached Base Insulation, Bonded Top Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 9-13
2B Steel or Concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover C Mech. Attached Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 14-17
2C Steel or Concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover D Prelim. Attached Insulation, Mech. Attached Base Sheet, Bonded Roof Cover 18-20
3A Structural concrete New or Reroof (Tear-Off) A-1 Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 21-25
3B Structural concrete New or Reroof (Tear-Off) A-1 Bonded Temporary Roof, Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 26
3C Structural concrete New or Reroof (Tear-Off) F Non-Insulated, Bonded Roof Cover 27
3D Structural concrete New or Reroof (Tear-Off) F Non-Insulated, Bonded Roof Cover, Paver System Overburden 27
4A LWIC New or Reroof (Tear-Off) A-1 LWC to Deck, Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 28-31
4B LWIC New or Reroof (Tear-Off) A-2 LWC to Deck, Mech. Attached Anchor Sheet, Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 32
4C LWIC New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover C LWC to Deck, Mech. Attached Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 32
4D LWIC New or Reroof (Tear-Off) E LWC to Deck, Mech. Attached Base Sheet, Bonded Roof Cover 33-37
4E LWIC New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover E LWC to Deck, Mech. Attached Base Sheet, Bonded Roof Cover 38
4F LWIC New or Reroof (Tear-Off) F LWC to Deck, Bonded Roof Cover 38
4G LWIC New or Reroof (Tear-Off) F LWC to Deck, Bonded Roof Cover, Paver System Overburden 38
5A CWF Reroof (Tear-Off) A-1 Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 39
5B CWF Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover A-2 Mech. Attached Anchor Sheet, Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 40
5B CWF Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover B Mech. Attached Base Insulation, Bonded Top Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 40
5C CWF Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover C Mech. Attached Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 41
5D CWF Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover E Non-Insulated, Mech. Attached Base Sheet, Bonded Roof Cover 41
6A Gypsum New or Reroof (Tear-Off) A-1 Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 42
6B Gypsum New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover A-2 Mech. Attached Anchor Sheet, Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 43-44
6C Gypsum New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover B Mech. Attached Base Insulation, Bonded Top Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 44
6D Gypsum New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover C Mech. Attached Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 45
6E Gypsum New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover E Non-Insulated, Mech. Attached Base Sheet, Bonded Roof Cover 45
7 Various Recover A-1 Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 46-48

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Revision 12:12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 1 of 48



NEmoO | etc.

The following notes apply to the systems outlined herein:

1.  Theevaluation herein pertains to above-deck roof components. Roof decks and structural members shall be in accordance with FBC requirements to the satisfaction of the Authority Having Jurisdiction. Load resistance
of the roof deck shall be documented through proper codified and/or FBC Approval documentation.
2. Unless otherwise noted, fasteners and stress plates for insulation attachment shall be as follows. Fasteners shall be of sufficient length for the following engagements:
»  Wood Deck: UltraFast Fasteners or All Purpose Fasteners with UltraFast Metal Plates. Minimum 0.75-inch plywood penetration or minimum 1-inch wood plank embedment.
»  Steel Deck: UltraFast Fasteners or All Purpose Fasteners with UltraFast Metal Plates. Minimum 0.75-inch steel penetration and engage the top flute of the steel deck.
»  Structural concrete: All Purpose Fasteners with UltraFast Metal Plates or Structural Concrete Fasteners with UltraFast Metal Plates (flat bottom only). Minimum 1-inch embedment. Fasteners installed
with a pilot hole in accordance with the fastener manufacturer’s published installation instructions.
3. Unless otherwise noted, insulation may be any one layer or combination of polyisocyanurate, polystyrene, wood fiberboard, perlite, gypsum-based roof board, that meets the QA requirements of F.A.C. Rule -3 and is
documented as meeting FBC 1505.1 and, for foam plastic, FBC Chapter 26, when installed with the roof cover.
4. Minimum 200 psi, minimum 2-inch thick lightweight insulating concrete may be substituted for, or installed below the rigid insulation board for System Type D (mechanically attached base sheet, bonded roof cover),
whereby the base sheet fasteners are installed through the LWIC to engage the structural steel or concrete deck. The structural deck shall be of equal or greater configuration to the steel and concrete deck listings.
Roof decks and structural members shall be in accordance with FBC requirements to the satisfaction of the Authority Having Jurisdiction. Load resistance of the roof deck shall be documented through proper codified
and/or FBC Approval documentation.
5. Preliminary insulation attachment for System Type D: Refer to Section 2.2.10.1.3 of FM Loss Prevention Data Sheet 1-29 (January 2016).
6.  Unless otherwise noted, insulation adhesive application rates are as follows. Ribbon or bead width is at the time of application; the ribbons/beads shall expand as noted in the manufacturer’s published instructions.
»  Hot asphalt (HA): Full coverage at 25-30 Ibs/square
»  JM MBR Bonding Adhesive (MBR-BA): Continuous 0.75-inch wide ribbons, 12-inch o.c. or full coverage at 2.0 gal/square
»  JM One-Step Foamable Adhesive (OSFA): Continuous 0.5 to 0.75-inch wide ribbons, 12-inch o.c.
»  JM Roofing System Urethane Adhesive (RSUA): Continuous 0.5 to 0.75-inch wide ribbons, 12-inch o.c.
»  JM Two-Part Urethane Insulation Adhesive (UIA-TWO-PART):  Continuous 0.75-inch wide ribbons, 12-inch o.c. Note: JM Green Two-Part Urethane Insulation Adhesive, JM Two Part Urethane Insulation
Adhesive Canister, JM Two-Part UIA or JIM Two-Part UIA Canister may be used where “UIA-TWO-PART” is referenced.
> ICP Adhesives Polyset CR-20: Continuous 2.5 to 3.5-inch ribbons, 12-inch o.c.
»  Note: When multiple layers(s) of insulation and/or coverboard are installed in ribbon-applied adhesive, adhesive ribbons shall be staggered from layer-to-layer a distance of one-half the ribbon spacing.
»  Note: The maximum edge distance from the adhesive ribbon to the edge of the insulation board shall be not less than one-half the specified ribbons spacing
7. Unless otherwise noted, all insulations are flat stock or taper board of the minimum thickness noted. Tapered polyisocyanurate at the following thickness limitations may be substituted with the following Maximum
Design Pressure (MDP) limitations. In no case shall these values be used to ‘increase’ the MDP listings in the tables; rather if MDP listing below meets or exceeds that listed for a particular system in the tables, then the
thinner board listed below may be used as a drop-in for the equivalent thicker material listed in the table:
»  JM Two-Part Urethane Insulation Adhesive (UIA-TWO-PART): MDP -315.0 psf  (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
»  JM Roofing System Urethane Adhesive (RSUA): MDP -157.5 psf  (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
»  JM One-Step Foamable Adhesive (OSFA): MDP -157.5 psf  (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
»  ICP Adhesives Polyset CR-20: MDP -117.5 psf  (Min. 1.0-inch thick)
8.  Bonded polyisocyanurate insulation boards shall be maximum 4 x 4 ft.
9.  For mechanically attached components or partially bonded insulation, the maximum design pressure for the selected assembly shall meet or exceed the Zone 1 design pressure determined in accordance with FBC
Chapter 16, and Zones 2 and 3 shall employ an attachment density designed by a qualified design professional to resist the elevated pressure criteria. Commonly used methods are ANSI/SPRI WD1, FM Loss Prevention
Data Sheet 1-29, Roofing Application Standard RAS 117 and Roofing Application Standard RAS 137. Assemblies marked with an asterisk* carry the limitations set forth in Section 2.2.10.1 of FM Loss Prevention Data
Sheet 1-29 (January 2016) for Zone 2/3 enhancements.
10. For fully bonded assemblies, the maximum design pressure for the selected assembly shall meet or exceed critical design pressure determined in accordance with FBC Chapter 16, and no rational analysis is permitted.
11. For mechanically attached components over existing decks, fasteners shall be tested in the existing deck for withdrawal resistance. A qualified design professional shall review the data for comparison to the minimum
requirements for the system. Testing and analysis shall be in accordance with ANSI/SPRI FX-1 or Testing Application Standard TAS 105.
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 2 of 48



NEmoO | etc.

12. For existing substrates in a bonded recover or re-roof installation, the existing roof surface or existing roof deck shall be examined for compatibility and bond performance with the selected adhesive, and the existing
roof system (for recover) shall be capable of resisting project design pressures on its own merit to the satisfaction of the Authority Having Jurisdiction, as documented through field uplift testing in accordance with
ANSI/SPRI IA-1, ASTM E907, FM Loss Prevention Data Sheet 1-52 or Testing Application Standard TAS 124.

13. For Recover Applications using System Type D, the insulation is optional. Alternatively, an FBC Approved coverboard may be used as a separator board, preliminarily attached prior to roof cover installation. The existing
roof system shall be suitable for a recover application.

14. Lightweight insulating concrete (LWIC) shall be cast in accordance with FBC Section 1917 to the satisfaction of the Authority Having Jurisdiction. For systems where specific LWIC is referenced, refer to current LWIC
Product Approval for specific deck construction and limitations. Unless otherwise noted, for systems where specific LWIC is not referenced, the minimum design mix shall be 300 psi. In all cases, the minimum top-coat
thickness is 2-inches. For LWIC over structural concrete, reference is made to FBC Section 1917.4.1, Point 1. For “pre-existent” LWC references, listings were established through testing over lightweight concrete cast
using only foaming agent (ASTM C896), water and Portland cement (ASTM C150), with no proprietary additives, in accordance with procedures adopted by Miami-Dade BCCO (FBC CER1592). Unless otherwise noted,
use of these listings in new construction or re-roof (tear-off) applications is at the discretion of the Designer or Record and Authority Having Jurisdiction.

15. Unless otherwise noted, refer to the following references for bonded base, ply or cap sheet applications.

JoHNS MANvVILLE RoOF COVERS
REFERENCE LAYER MATERIAL APPLICATION
BP-AA Base Ply | GlasBase Plus, PermaPly 28
(Base and Ply sheets, . Hot asphalt at 20-40 lbs/square
Asphalt-Applied) Ply | GlasPly IV, GlasPly Premier, GlasBase Plus, PermaPly 28
BP-CA1 - .
(Base and Ply sheets, Cold- Base Ply or Ply | GlasBase Plus, PermaPly 28 IM MER Cold Application Adhesive
- at 1.5 to 2.0 gal/square
Applied, 1-part)
BP-CA2
M MBR B ing Adhesi 1.
(Base and Ply sheets, Cold- Base Ply or Ply | GlasBase Plus, PermaPly 28 Jz 0gal/s S:img dhesive at 1.5 to
Applied, 2-part) - 8al/sq
BP-CA3 .
(Base and Ply sheets, Cold- Base Ply or Ply | GlasBase Plus, PermaPly 28, GlasPly IV, GlasPly Premier Jl;/:/l:reur;\::m Cold App at 1.5 t0 2.0
Applied, 1-part) gav/sq
Base Ply or Ply | DynaPly T1, DynaBase, DynaBase XT, DynaBase PR, Dynalastic 180 S, Dynalastic 250 S, Dynalastic 250 FR S
DynaPly T1, DynaKap T1, DynaKap FR T1, DynaKap FR T1 CR, DynaKap FR T1 CR G, DynaGlas, DynaGlas FR, DynaGlas FR XT, DynaGlas FR
SBS-AA XT CR, DynaGlas FR XT CR G, DynaGlas FR CR, DynaGlas FR CR G, DynaGlas 30 FR, DynaGlas 30 FR CR, DynaGlas 30 FR, DynaGlas 30 FR CR Hot asphalt at 20-40 Ibs/square
(SBS, Asphalt-Applied) Cap Ply | XT, Dynalastic 180 S, DynalLastic 250 S, Dynalastic 250 FR S, Dynalastic 180, Dynalastic 180 FR, Dynalastic 180 FR CR, DynalLastic 180 FR P q
CR G, Dynalastic 250, Dynalastic 250 FR, Dynalastic 250 FR CR, Dynalastic 250 FR CR G, DynaMax FR, DynaMax FR CR, DynaMax FR CR
G
Base Ply or Ply | DynaPly T1, DynaBase, DynaBase XT, DynaBase PR, Dynalastic 180 S, Dynalastic 250 S, Dynalastic 250 FR S
DynaPly T1, DynaKap T1, DynaKap FR T1, DynaKap FR T1 CR, DynaKap FR T1 CR G, DynaGlas, DynaGlas FR, DynaGlas FR XT, DynaGlas FR
SBS-CA1 XT CR, DynaGlas FR XT CR G, DynaGlas FR CR, DynaGlas FR CR G, DynaGlas 30 FR, DynaGlas 30 FR CR, DynaGlas 30 FR, DynaGlas 30 FRCR | JM MBR Cold Application Adhesive
(SBS, Cold-Applied, 1-part) Cap Ply | XT, Dynalastic 180 S, DynaLastic 250 S, Dynalastic 250 FR S, Dynalastic 180, Dynalastic 180 FR, Dynalastic 180 FR CR, Dynalastic 180 FR | at 1.5 to 2.0 gal/square
CR G, Dynalastic 250, Dynalastic 250 FR, Dynalastic 250 FR CR, Dynalastic 250 FR CR G, DynaMax FR, DynaMax FR CR, DynaMax FR CR
G
Base Ply or Ply | DynaPly T1, DynaBase, DynaBase XT, DynaBase PR, Dynalastic 180 S, Dynalastic 250 S, Dynalastic 250 FR S
DynaPly T1, DynaKap T1, DynaKap FR T1, DynaKap FR T1 CR, DynaKap FR T1 CR G, DynaGlas, DynaGlas FR, DynaGlas FR XT, DynaGlas FR
XT CR, DynaGlas FR XT CR G, DynaGlas FR CR, DynaGlas FR CR G, DynaGlas 30 FR, DynaGlas 30 FR CR, DynaGlas 30 FR, DynaGlas 30 FR CR . .
(SSBSSCQ; d-Applied, 2-part) CapPly | XT, Dynalastic 180 S, DynaLastic 250 S, DynaLastic 250 FR S, DynaLastic 180, DynaLastic 180 FR, DynaLastic 180 FR CR, DynaLastic 180 FR Jz'\g Ma?/i Bj:r‘i'”g Adhesive at 1.5 to
g pplied, p CR G, Dynalastic 250, DynaLastic 250 FR, DynaLastic 250 FR CR, DynaLastic 250 FR CR G, DynaMax FR, DynaMax FR CR, DynaMax FR CR | “* 82/54
G
Note: | SBS-CA2 applications shall not be ‘mixed’ with SBS-AA applications
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 3 of 48



NEmoO | etc.

JOHNS MANVILLE ROOF COVERS (CONTINUED)

(SBS, Cold-Applied, 1-part)

Cap Ply

XT, Dynalastic 180 S, Dynalastic 250 S, Dynalastic 250 FR S, DynalLastic 180, Dynalastic 180 FR, Dynalastic 180 FR CR, Dynalastic 180 FR
CR G, Dynalastic 250, DynalLastic 250 FR, Dynalastic 250 FR CR, Dynalastic 250 FR CR G, DynaMax FR, DynaMax FR CR, DynaMax FR CR
G

REFERENCE LAYER MATERIAL APPLICATION
Base Ply or Ply | DynaPly T1, DynaBase, DynaBase XT, DynaBase PR, Dynalastic 180 S, Dynalastic 250 S, Dynalastic 250 FR S
DynaPly T1, DynaKap T1, DynaKap FR T1, DynaKap FR T1 CR, DynaKap FR T1 CR G, DynaGlas, DynaGlas FR, DynaGlas FR XT, DynaGlas FR
SBS-CA3 XT CR, DynaGlas FR XT CR G, DynaGlas FR CR, DynaGlas FR CR G, DynaGlas 30 FR, DynaGlas 30 FR CR, DynaGlas 30 FR, DynaGlas 30 FR CR | JM Premium Cold App at 1.5 to 2.0

gal/square

SBS-TA
(SBS, Torch-Applied)

Base Ply or Ply

DynaBase HW, DynaWeld Base, DynaWeld 180 S

Cap Ply

DynaWeld Cap FR, DynaWeld Cap FR CR, DynaWeld Cap FR CR G, DynaWeld Cap 180, DynaWeld Cap 180 CR, DynaWeld Cap 180 FR,
DynaWeld Cap 180 FR CR, DynaWeld Cap 180 FR CR G, DynaWeld Cap 250, DynaWeld Cap 250 CR, DynaWeld Cap 250 FR, DynaWeld
Cap 250 FR CR, DynaWeld Cap 250 FR CR G, DynaClad, DynaClad Copper

Torch-Applied

SBS-SA
(SBS, self-adhering)

Base Ply or Ply

DynaGrip Base SD/SA, DynaGrip Base SA/SA, JMCleanBond SBS Base Sheet

Cap Ply

DynaGrip Cap, JMCleanBond SBS Cap Sheet

Self-Adhering

16. Modified bitumen vapor barrier options for use over structural concrete deck followed by adhered insulation applied as follows carry the following Maximum Design Pressure (MDP) limitations. The lesser of the MDP

listings below vs. those in Table 3A applies:

VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS; STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECK; FOLLOWED BY ADHERED INSULATION PER TABLE 3A:

OPTION # PRIMER VAPOR BARRIER INSULATION ADHESIVE MDP (PSF)
. JM Roofing System Urethane Adhesive
VB-1. ASTM D41 T | lasPly IV, GlasPly P ierinh hal -180.
S wo plies GlasPly IV, GlasPly Premier in hot asphalt (RSUA), 12-inch o.c. 80.0
VB-2. | ASTM D41 Two plies GlasPly IV, GlasPly Premier in hot asphalt IM One-Step Foamable Adhesive (OSFA), -180.0
12-inch o.c.
VB3 ASTM D41 DynaPly T1, DynaBase, DynaBase XT, DynaBase PR, Dynalastic 180 S, DynaLastic 250 S, Dynalastic 250 FR S in hot asphalt | JM One-Step Foamable Adhesive (OSFA), 1800
: or DynaBase HW, DynaWeld Base, DynaWeld 180 S torch-applied 12-inch o.c. ’
JM SA Primer ) JM Two-Part Urethane Insulation
VB-4. Low VOC IM Vapor Barrier SA, self-adhered Adhesive (UIA-TWO-PART), 12-inch o.c. 2775
JM SA Primer . JM Roofing System Urethane Adhesive
VB-5. Low VOC JM Vapor Barrier SA, self-adhered (RSUA), 12-inch o.c. -277.5
VB-6 ASTM D41 DynaPly T1, DynaBase, DynaBase XT, DynaBase PR, DynalLastic 180 S, Dynalastic 250 S, Dynalastic 250 FR S in hot asphalt JM Two-Part Urethane Insulation 2775
: or DynaBase HW, DynaWeld Base, DynaWeld 180 S torch-applied Adhesive (UIA-TWO-PART), 12-inch o.c. '
VB-7. ASTM D41 DynaPly T1, DynaBase, DynaBase XT, DynaBase PR, Dynalastic 180 S, Dynalastic 250 S, Dynalastic 250 FR S in hot asphalt M Rooﬂng.System Urethane Adhesive -277.5
(RSUA), 12-inch o.c.
) JM Roofing System Urethane Adhesive
VB-8. ASTM D41 DynaBase HW, DynaWeld Base, DynaWeld 180 S torch-applied (RSUA), 12-inch o.c. -292.5

17. ”"MDP” = Maximum Design Pressure is the result of testing for wind load resistance based on allowable wind loads. Refer to FBC 1609 for determination of design wind loads.

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 4 of 48




NEmoO | etc.

TABLE 1A: WOOD DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)
SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Base Insulation Top Insulation Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY SBS-CAL or
Min. 15/32-inch pl ional) Additional
W-1 m;r; 2521/- ?nc;]nsc a’;zw°°d 3 | 3 R-panel, ENRGY 3 25 | RSUA or OSFA I(Sztr'sogzs)e i:‘::lg’t?sn RSUA or OSFA | DynaGrip SD/SAor | (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0%
: P PSI, R-Panel 25 PS 4 JM BaseGrip SD/SA

TABLE 1B: WOOD DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-2: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ANCHOR SHEET, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Anchor Sheet Base Insulation Top Insulation Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners Attach Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch x‘:éooéls;zm
PermaPly 28 32 ga., 1-5/8- 9-inch o.c. in 4- ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY (homogeneous)
. . Yo inch diameter inch lap and 12- 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, X g ) ! BP-AA, BP- (Optional)
Min. 15/32-inch DynaBase, R . . . min. 0.5-inch Retro- SBS-AA,
tin caps with inch o.c. in three, | ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, . CA2, SBS- BP-AA, BP-
W-2 plywood at max. GlasBase Plus HA Fit Board, RetroPlus | HA SBS-CA2 -45.0%
24-inch spans or 11 ga. annular | equally spaced, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or Board or DuraBoard AA or SBS- CA2 SBS-AA or SBS-TA
P . ring shank staggered center | CGF, ValuTherm AGF or ) . CA2 or SBS-TA
Ventsulation ; or min. 1.5-inch
nails rows CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI Fesco Foam or
AGF or CGF
DuraFoam
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch FMel:c'ooéz)s;gCh
Two plies of 32ga., 1-5/8- 9-inch o.c. in 4- ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY (homogeneous) (Optional)
Min. 15/32-inch PermaPly 28, |r.1ch dlamgter !nch lap afnd 12- 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, min. 0.5-inch Retro- BP-AA, BP- BP-AA, BP- SBS-AA,
DynaBase, tin caps with inch o.c. in two, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, . CA2, SBS-
W-3 plywood at max. HA Fit Board, RetroPlus | HA CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 -52.5
. GlasBase Plus 11 ga. annular | equally spaced, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or AA or SBS-
24-inch spans A Board or DuraBoard SBS-CA2 or or SBS-TA
or ring shank staggered center | CGF, ValuTherm AGF or or min. 1.5-inch CA2 SBS-TA
Ventsulation nails rows CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI -
Fesco Foam or
AGF or CGF
DuraFoam
Min. 0.75-inch
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch Fel:cooBosa:gc
GlasPly 32 ga., 1-5/8- 9-inch o.c. in 4- ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY (homogeneous) (Optional)
Min. 19/32-inch | Premier, inch diameter | inchlapand S 3 25 PSl, R-Panel 25 PS|, min. 0.5-inch Retro- BP-AA BP- | gp.aa, BP- | SBS-AA,
tin caps with inch o.c. in two, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, . CA2, SBS-
W-4 plywood at max. PermaPly 28 HA Fit Board, RetroPlus | HA CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 -60.0
. 11 ga. annular | equally spaced, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or AA or SBS-
24-inch spans or R Board or DuraBoard SBS-CA2 or or SBS-TA
. ring shank staggered center | CGF, ValuTherm AGF or . R CA2
Ventsulation ; or min. 1.5-inch SBS-TA
nails rows CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI
Fesco Foam or
AGF or CGF
DuraFoam
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 5 of 48



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 1C: WOOD DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE A-2: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ANCHOR SHEET, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Anchor Sheet Base Insulation Top Insulation Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners Attach Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch x's”c'ooézs;gd’
GlasPly 8-inch o.c. in 4- ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY (homogeneous) (Optional)
Min. 19/32-inch | Premier, ::z: ':E i:i:r'ee i;: GPYS'3 RAg?;'fl CZGSFPS" min. 0.5-inch Retro- gf\}Aﬁ'Bip' BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
W-5 plywood at max. PermaPly 28 Note 2 - ! ! HA Fit Board, RetroPlus | HA ! CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 -52.5
. equally spaced, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or AA or SBS-
24-inch spans or Board or DuraBoard SBS-CA2 or or SBS-TA
Ventsulation staggered center | CGF, ValuTherm AGF or or min. 1.5-inch CA2 SBS-TA
rows CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI Fesco I;oz;m or
AGF or CGF
DuraFoam

TABLE 1D: WOOD DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE B: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 0.75-inch Fesco
. . Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, Board (homogeneous), (Optional) BP-
Min. 19/32-inch BP-AA, BP- SBS-AA
Wt I"\'Nooé e R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY325 | Loeraf2 | Min- O5dinch Retro-Fit | s Shoap | AA BP-CA2 escaror | asor
o M PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, P Board, RetroPlus Board eneiny | SBSAASBS- | S '
P ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF or min. 1.5-inch Fesco CA2 or SBS-TA
Foam
. . Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI,
Min. 19/32-inch R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 Min. 0.5-inch UIA-TWO (Optional) SBS
B _ a ’ ’ 2 s V0T 3 - B - . ~ *
w-7 m‘;"?:n:t max. 24 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, Note 2 1per2ft | b raBoard PART SBS-TA TA SBS-TA 450
P ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
) . Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, HA or (Optional) BP-
Min. 19/32-inch BP-AA, BP- SBS-AA
W I”\’Noog " x;x - R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY325 | 1per1.33 | Min.0.5-inch MBRBA | Lo cnc 1\ | A BP-CA2 ecaror | 6000
ﬁ\!h spans ’ PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ft? DuraBoard full or S;BS—CAZ SBS-AA, SBS- SBS-TA ’
P ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF coverage CA2 or SBS-TA
Min. 15/32-inch _ . Note 2 Min. 0.5-inch .
. 1.5- E - E 2 1 1. BS-
W-9 plywood at max. 24- Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, (square per2 33 SECUROCK Gypsum- RSUA or SBS-TA (Optional) SBS SBS-TA 675
. R-Panel 25 PSI ft . OSFA TA
inch spans plates) Fiber Roof Board
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 6 of 48



TABLE 1E: WOOD DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Base Insulation Layer
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board, RetroPlus
. ) . ' BP-AA, BP-CA2, | (Optional) BP-AA,
wio | Mn L9zt pvieat | Creorrelmrs | Sowte Dkt 07500 | ey | dperare | sssaborses | omsisan | SAEOR | e
: P ' & o cA2 SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA
Fesco Foam or DuraFoam
W-11 Min. 19/32-inch plywood | One or more fayers, any | . ¢ i 4 braBoard Note 2 1per2ft® | SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA | SBS-TA -45.0%
at max. 24-inch spans combination, loose laid
Min. 19/32-inch plywood One or more layers, any . . 1per1.33 (Optional) BP-CA2,
W-12 Min. 0.75-inch DuraB: N 2 BS-TA BS-CA2, SBS-TA -60.
at max. 24-inch spans combination, loose laid in. 0.75-inch DuraBoard ote ft? SBS SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-CA2, SBS 60.0

TABLE 1F: WOOD DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D: PRELIMINARILY ATTACHED INSULATION, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

Syst Insulation Layer(s) Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
ystem Deck (Note ) Slip Sheet
No. Type Attach Base Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
) ) (Optional) One or more High Load Fasteners ) s )

W-13 N:”;"Olfgz x;: 24 layers PermaPly 28, loose I(:‘nsrcsar:;ore Loose- DvnaBase through 1-inch wide JM Z::E: ;;:’ﬁg;_twhzlgz' (Optional) SBS- SBS-AA or 37.5%
P v ’ laid below or above v ! y laid v Polymer Membrane ; ! AA or SBS-TA SBS-TA '
inch spans . . combination side laps.

insulation Batten
Min. 15/32-inch (Optional) One or more One or more DynaFast 180 High Load Fasteners 18-inch o.c. within the .
layers PermaPly 28, loose Loose- HW or . . . (Optional) SBS- «

W-14 plywood at max. 24- ; layers, any . and JM APB Plates or min. 4-inch wide, heat- SBS-TA -45.0
. laid below or above [ laid DynaFast 250 ) X TA
inch spans R . combination High Load Plates welded side laps.

insulation HW
Min. 19/32-inch (Optional) One or more One or more . GIasP.Iy 8-inch o.c.. at min. 4-inch (Optional) BP- SBS-AA, SBS-
W-15 plywood at max. 24- layers PermaPly 28, loose layers, any Prelim Premier, Note 2 lap and 8-inch o.c. at AA, BP-CA2 SBS- CA2 or SBS- 525
inch spans ’ laid below or above combilnation Attach PermaPly 28 or three, equally spaced, AA, SBS-CA2 or A ’
P insulation Ventsulation staggered center rows SBS-TA
i | DynaFast 1
Min. 15/32-inch I(::)F;t:sg::rr?an;l o;;f:;e gnsrzrnr?i?]re Loose- Hwaorast 80 High Load Fasteners 9-inch o.c. within the min. (Optional) SBS-

W-16 plywood at max. 24- Y VS, vers, ' ; and JM APB Plates or 4-inch wide, heat-welded P SBS-TA -60.0
. laid below or above 1-inch, any laid DynaFast 250 . R TA
inch spans R . S High Load Plates side laps.

insulation combination HW
Min. 15/32-inch (Optional) One or more One or m'ore DynaFast 180 High Load LH through 1- | 6-inch o.c. within the min. .
layers PermaPly 28, loose | layers, min. Loose- HW or X X X R (Optional) SBS-

W-17 plywood at max. 24- h . ; inch wide JM Polymer 4-inch wide, heat-welded SBS-TA -82.5
. laid below or above 1-inch, any laid DynaFast 250 . TA
inch spans . . S Membrane Batten side laps.

insulation combination HW

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13

Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 7 of 48




TABLE 1G: WOOD DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE E: NON-INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Base Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
o | M ot | P T e G | 900 00 DI oo st | o sscrn | o
24-inch spans v ’ ps with % ga. € < » equatly SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA | or SBS-TA :
Ventsulation shank nails spaced, staggered center rows
W1 Min. 19/32-inch plywood at max. GlasPly Premier, PermaPly 28 or :’: g,sa&iiésl/f"gcr;:;mft:;t'” ?n'crrz :Tn 'tnwt'?hu:f and 91 5 ptional) BP-AA, BP-CA2 SBS-AM, SBS-CA2 | o
24-inch spans Ventsulation ps with 22 ga. & o » equaty SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA | or SBS-TA :
shank nails spaced, staggered center rows

TABLE 1H: WOOD DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE E: NON-INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Slip Sheet
No. (Note 1) Base Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
. High Load Fasteners . L. .
. . (Optional) One or more . . 9-inch o.c. within the min. 4-
W-20 Min. 19/32.mch plywood layers PermaPly 28, loose DynaBase through 1-inch wide JM inch wide, heat-welded side (Optional) SBS-AA or SBS-TA SBS-AA or SBS -37.5%
at max. 24-inch spans h Polymer Membrane TA
laid laps.
Batten
. . (Optional) One or more DynaFast 180 HW High Load Fasteners and 18-inch o.c. within the min.
Min. 15/32-inch plywood . ) ) ) ’
W-21 ) layers PermaPly 28, loose or DynaFast 250 JM APB Plates or High min. 4-inch wide, heat-welded (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
at max. 24-inch spans h .
laid HW Load Plates side laps.
Wz | Min1932inchpwood | (O DY ey s8or | Note2 h o0 mthree, saualy | (0PN BPAABPCA | SBSAASBSCA2 |, ¢
at max. 24-inch spans y V<8 y. o » equatly SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA or SBS-TA ’
laid Ventsulation spaced, staggered center rows

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 8 of 48




TABLE 2A: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE B: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasten Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-P I, ENRGY
Min. 22 ga., type B, in. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRG HA or (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
. 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF . . BP-AA, BP-CA2,
Grade 33 steel or min. 1 per Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus MBR-BA, CA1l, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-1 ” or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 , BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -37.5%
2,500 psi structrual 5.33 ft Board full SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 coverage SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF & '
Min. 22 ga., type B, g/l lzr; F}j-:—;:rf:RZGSYP?gI Rl;mnee\lf':xg? BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
Grade 33 steel or min. ! ! 1 per Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus UIA-TWO- ’ ’ CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-2 . or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 5 BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -37.5*
2,500 psi structrual 5.33 ft Board PART SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3
concrete CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 22 ga., type B, BP-AA, BP-CAL, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- i::-éAA’l
Grade 33 steel or min. . . 1 per Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK UIA-TWO- | BP-CA2, BP-CA3 CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3 e
S-3 Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, ValuTh . Note 2 ’ ! ’ ’ ! SBS-CA2 -37.5*
2,500 psi structrual N L.>ine » valutherm ote 5.33ft2 | Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board | PART SBS-AA, SBS-CAL, | SBS-AA, SBS-CAL, SBS- | oo © %
concrete SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga. type B Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY
oo 3§s't,eglpor .| 325 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF Loera BP-CA2, BP-CA3, | (Optional) BP-CA1, BP- | SBS-CA1,
S-4 2500 psi structrual ’ or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 F:‘tz Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard MBR-BA SBS-CA2 or SBS- CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1, | SBS-CA2or -45.0*
cé)ncrerfte ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 CA3 SBS-CA2 or SBS-CA3 SBS-CA-3
PSI AGF or CGF
. Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY
Min. 22 ga., type B, .
Grade 33 steel or min 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF 1per2 One or more layers base BP-CA2, BP-CA3, (Optional) BP-CA1, BP- | SBS-CAL,
S-5 2 500 psi structrual : or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 F;tz insulation followed by min. | MBR-BA SBS-CA2 or SBS- CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1, | SBS-CA2or -45.0*
! P ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 0.5-inch DuraBoard CA3 SBS-CA2 or SBS-CA3 SBS-CA-3
concrete
PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 22 ga., type B, Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK
Grade 33 steel or min 325Ps|, R-Panel 25 PS], ENRGY 3 AGF 1per2 | Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board UIA-TWO-
S-6 . : or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 P ) P . . SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
2,500 psi structrual ft or min. 0.5-inch PART
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 DuraBoard
PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 22 ga., type B Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY
) v - 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF . .
57 (23?(;1; 3;,’ ::fj:;:;:'" or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 ! F;fzr 2 Z'”SS;SF:S::' :ch?;ifg gssl'FjAA °" | sps-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
czl)ncreie ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 yp
PSI AGF or CGF

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 9 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2A: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE B: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasten Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
. Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY
g"r':('jezési't’et;p;im 325 PS|, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF Loer | Min. 0-25-inch Invinsa ;JIA/-I\R_‘:—\:)Vro_
S-8 . : or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 P N Roof Board or min. 1.5- DynaGrip SD/SA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
2,500 psi structrual ft X . RSUA or
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 inch Invinsa Foam OSFA
PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 22 ga. tvoe B Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY
Cras Sss't’eglpor .| 325PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF Loer UIATWO
S-9 2500 bsi structrual ! or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 21:2 Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard PART SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
m,)ncreze ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25
PSI AGF or CGF
Min 22ga, types, | L ;é?-E;ZESRziYPi'l RE-E?;:;\:':?ESY HA or BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
Grade 33 steel or min. ! ! 1per4 | Min.0.5-inch RetroPlus MBR-BA, ! ’ CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-10 . or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 > BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -45.0*
2,500 psi structrual ft Board full SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 coverage SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF & '
Min. 22 ga., type B, g/l Izr; ;éls_lr?cPZEZRziYPi'l Réili{?&ﬁé? BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
Grade 33 steel or min. ! ! 1lper4d Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus UIA-TWO- ’ ’ CA1l, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1, *
S-11 . or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 > BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -45.0
2,500 psi structrual ft Board PART SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF ’
BS-AA
Min. 22 ga., type B, BP-AA, BP-CA1, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- sz—CA’l
Grade 33 steel or min. . . 1lperd Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK UIA-TWO- BP-CA2, BP-CA3, CA1l, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, ! *
12 |5 500 psi structrual Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, ValuTherm. Note 2 f2 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board | PART SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, | SBS-AA, SBS-CAL, SBS- :gg_gg' 45.0
concrete SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-TA
in. 2-i E - E
Min. 22 ga., type B, Min. 2-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 HA or (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
. 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or . . BP-AA, BP-CA2,
Grade 33 steel or min. 1 per Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus MBR-BA, CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-13 . CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 5 BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -45.0*
2,500 psi structrual 5.33 ft Board full SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 coverage SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF & '
Min 22ga, types, | 30 g'sf-:-;ZEZRz?Pssll REEZ:{E\I(; 2221? BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
Grade 33 steel or min. ! ’ 1 per Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus UIA-TWO- ’ ’ CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-14 . CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 2 BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -45.0*
2,500 psi structrual 5.33 ft Board PART SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3
concrete PSI AGE or CGF CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 10 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



TABLE 2A: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE B: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasten Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
BS-AA
Min. 22 ga., type B, BP-AA, BP-CA1, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- ng—CAIl
Grade 33 steel or min. . . 1 per Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK UIA-TWO- BP-CA2, BP-CA3, CA1l, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, ! %
15 |5 500 psi structrual Min. 2-inch ENRGY 3, ValuTherm. Note 2 533ft> | Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board | PART SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, | SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- ig: Eig' 45.0
concrete SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-TA
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY BM;;‘;:'SR';?:;‘P?E:E’C:L o
Min. 22 ga., type B, 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF DuraB’oard min. 0.75-inch SBS-AA,
516 Grade 33 steel or min. | or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 1per2 Fesco Boar'd o HA BP-AA, BP-CA2, (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- | SBS- 525
2,500 psi structrual ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 ft? SBS-AA or SBS-CA2 | AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA | CA2,SBS- '
(homogeneous) (flat or
concrete PSI AGF or CGF, Fesco Foam or . . TA,
tapered) or min. 1.5-inch
DuraFoam
Fesco Foam or DuraFoam
Min. 22 ga., type B, UIA-TWO- .
. . . Note 2 . . . DynaGrip Base
Grade 40 steel or min. Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 1 per Min. 0.25-inch Invinsa PART .
S-17 ! ! ! D/SA, self- Opt 1) SBS-TA SBS-TA -52.5
2,500 psi structrual 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI (square 1.45 ft> | Roof Board RSUA or SD/s J s€ (Optional)
plates) adhering
concrete OSFA
Min. 22 ga., type B, BP-AA, BP-CAL, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- ::2:@2’1
Grade 33 steel or min. . . 1 per Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK UIA-TWO- | BP-CA2, BP-CA3 CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3 !
-1 Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, ValuTh . Note 2 ’ ! ! ! ! BS-CA2 -60.
>18 1 2,500 psi structrual in. 1.5-inch ENRGY'3, ValuTherm ot 1.78ft | Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board | PART SBS-AA, SBS-CAL, | SBS-AA, SBS-CAL, SBS- 232_ s 600
concrete SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-TA
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY . . .
Min. 22 ga., type B, 325 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF g/'o'gr::e':::},?::?oz'; o SBSAA
$19 Grade 33 steel or min. or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 1 per DuraB’oard or min. 1.5 HA BP-AA, BP-CA2, (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- SBS-CA’Z or 60.0
2,500 psi structrual ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 1.78 ft? | | T SBS-AA or SBS-CA2 | AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA ’
inch Fesco Foam or SBS-TA
concrete PSI AGF or CGF, Fesco Foam or
DuraFoam
DuraFoam
Min. 22 ga., type B, Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY HA or (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
) 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF ) . BP-AA, BP-CA2,
Grade 33 steel or min. 1 per Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus MBR-BA, CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-20 . or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 2 BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -60.0
2,500 psi structrual 1.78 ft Board full SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 coverage SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF & '
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-P I, ENRGY
Min. 22 ga., type B, 3 Izr; PS|5 IF?-cPaneI st P?;I ENTRZEY’S AGS BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
Grade 33 steel or min. ! ! 1 per Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus UIA-TWO- ! ! CA1l, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-21 . or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 N BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -60.0
2,500 psi structrual 1.78 ft Board PART SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3
concrete PSI AGF or CGF CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 11 of 48




TABLE 2A: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE B: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasten Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
, Min. 2-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 SBS-CA2,

Min. 22 ga., type B, 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or HA or BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-CA2, BP- | SBS-AA
I in. - ’ 1per2 | Min.3/8-inch SECUROCK R e AN
522 | Srades3steelormin. | oo byipay 325 psi AGF or CGF, Note 2 pe in. 3/8-inch SECUROC UIATWO- | SBS-AA, SBS-CA2, | AA, SBS-AA, SBS-CA2, | SBS-CA2, -60.0
2,500 psi structrual ft Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PART SBS-SA or SBS-TA SBS-SA or SBS-TA SBS-SA or
PSI AGF or CGF SBS-TA
. Min. 2-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 SBS-CA2,
Min. 22 ga., type B, 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or RSUAor | BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-CA2, BP- | SBS-AA
5.3 | Grade33steelormin. | op F\pey 395 ps| AGE or CGF, Note 2 Lper2 | Min.3/8-inch SECUROCK | nc) ‘o | cpo an SBS-CA2, | AA, SBS-AA, SBS-CA2, | SBS-CA2, -60.0
2,500 psi structrual ft Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board .
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 inch o.c. SBS-SA or SBS-TA SBS-SA or SBS-TA SBS-SA or
PSI AGF or CGF SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY HA or (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
. 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF . . BP-AA, BP-CA2,
Grade 33 steel or min. 1 per Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus MBR-BA, CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-24 . or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 5 BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -67.5
2,500 psi structrual 1.33 ft Board full SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 coverage SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF & '
Min. 22 ga., type B, g/l Izr; ;éls_lr?cPZEZRziYPi'l RE_ElaRTse\:’SEZgSY BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
Grade 33 steel or min. ! ! 1 per Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus UIA-TWO- ’ ’ CA1l, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-25 . or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 5 BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -67.5
2,500 psi structrual 1.33 ft Board PART SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF ’
BS-AA
Min. 22 ga., type B, BP-AA, BP-CA1, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- sz—CA’l
Grade 33 steel or min. . . 1 per Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK UIA-TWO- BP-CA2, BP-CA3, CA1l, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, !
526 | 500 psi structrual Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, ValuTherm. Note 2 1.33ft> | Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board | PART SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, | SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- ::2_222' 67:5
concrete SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-TA
Min. 2-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3
! ! Min. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit
Min. 22 ga., t B 25 PSI, R-P |1 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF
n ga. type - > PSl, R-Panel 25 PS, GY 3 AGF or Board, RetroPlus Board or (Optional) BP-AA, BP- SBS-AA,
527 Grade 33 steel or min. CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 1 per DuraBoard or min. 1.5- HA BP-AA, BP-CA2, CA2 SBS-AA. SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 or 75.0
2,500 psi structrual ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 1.45 ft? | " SBS-AA or SBS-CA2 ! ’
inch Fesco Foam or or SBS-TA SBS-TA
concrete PSI AGF or CGF, Fesco Foam or
DuraFoam
DuraFoam
in. 1.5-i E - E .
Min. 22 ga., type B, g/l lzr; PS-IE’ :-;Zn:RZGsYPZ RErF\’JaRZe\If'a ,’:2?\( HA or BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
Grade 33 steel or min. ! ! 1per1 | Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus MBR-BA, ’ ’ CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-28 R or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 > BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -90.0
2,500 psi structrual ft Board full SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3
concrete PSI AGF or CGF coverage CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 12 of 48




TABLE 2A: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE B: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasten Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-P |, ENRGY
Min. 22 ga., type B, 3 Izr; PS? IF?—(I:?aneI st lel ENE:?ZEY,3 AGS BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
Grade 33 steel or min. ! ! lperl Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus UIA-TWO- ! ! CA1l, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
5-29 X or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 2 BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -90.0
2,500 psi structrual ft Board PART SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3
concrete CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 22 ga., type B, UIA-TWO- BP-AA, BP-CA1, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- :g::é:’l
Grade 33 steel or min. . . 1perl | Min.0.5-inch SECUROCK BP-CA2, BP-CA3 CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3 !
. . PART , , , , 3 ) an (%
5-30 2,500 psi structrual Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, ValuTherm. Note 2 ft? Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board e SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- 2::_222' 90.0
concrete 4-incho.c. | gps cA2 SBS-CA3 | CA2, SBS-CA3 ’
SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Min. 2-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 HA or (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
. 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or . . BP-AA, BP-CA2,
Grade 33 steel or min. 1 per Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus MBR-BA, CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-31 . CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 5 BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -90.0
2,500 psi structrual 1.45 ft Board full SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 coverage SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF & '
. Min. 2-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 .
Min. 22 ga., type B, | 550 ¢ panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or _ . BP-AA, BP-CA2, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
Grade 33 steel or min. 1 per Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus UIA-TWO- CA1l, BP-CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-CA1,
S-32 . CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 5 BP-CA3, SBS-AA, -90.0
2,500 psi structrual 1.45 ft Board PART SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- SBS-CA2,
concrete ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF ’
BS-AA
Min. 22 ga., type B, UIA-TWO- BP-AA, BP-CA1, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- sz—CA’l
Grade 33 steel or min. . . 1 per Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK BP-CA2, BP-CA3 CA1l, BP-CA2, BP-CA3 !
_ _ PART ’ ’ ’ ’ ’ - i *
33| 3,500 psi structrual Min. 2-inch ENRGY 3, ValuTherm. Note 2 145t | Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board _ SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, | SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, SBS- :gg_gig' 9.0
concrete Adncho.c. | sps.ca2, SBS-CA3 | CA2, SBS-CA3 BeTA

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 13 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2B: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck SSUURNU— Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
ase Insulation Layer
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
. UltraFast (steel only)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . .
K . One or more layers, any . . . or All Purpose with , | BP-CA3or SBS- (Optional) BP-CA3 or x
S-34 fjjzttafulac:rcr:;:.rizoo psi combination, loose laid Min. 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof Board UltraFast Metal 1 per 2 ft CA3 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3 37.5
(round) Plates
. . UltraFast (steel only)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade | (Optional) One or more i .
S-35 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | layers, any Min. 1.75-inch Invinsa Foam ?Jrltﬁr\LIle;:T\;l):a\:mh 1 per 2 ft? gz?’CAS or SBS (Scégi:?;l) BP-CAS or SBS-CA3 -37.5*
structrual concrete combination, loose laid
(round) Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . .
536 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi S;’;;;?t?;s 'E)yfsrjl:;y 'Fvi't')';'r%iz f'gzgrsdECUROCK Gypsum Note 2 (square plates) | * pefrtzz.67 ng;‘:f!f sBBa;-?r A | (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA 37.5%
structrual concrete !
Min. 22 ga.. tvoe B, Grade BP-AA, BP-CA1, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
<37 3 sieeli - iynp ) 200 ogi | One ormore layers, any | Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- Note 2 (square plates) | 1 PST267 | BPCA2, BP-CA-3 | CAL BP-CA2 BP-CA- | SBS-CAL | .,
e PS! | combination, loose laid | Fiber Roof Board quarep ft2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, | 3SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, | SBS-CA2, :
SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, UltraFast (steel only)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, an ENRGY'3 25 PS, R-Panel 25 PS], or All Purpose withy (Optional) BP-CA3 or
S-38 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi combination onose’laidy ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI UltraFastFI)VIetal 1 per 2 ft? BP-CA3 orSBS-CA3 SBg CA3 SBS-CA3 -45.0*
structrual concrete ! AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, (round) Plates
ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, an BP-CA2, BP-CA3, fSOPp(tIi:;aQPBz/_-\gA?BS 2::_22;
$-39 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi " more1avers, anY | mMin. 0.5-inch DuraBoard Note 2 1per2ft? | SBS-CA2 or SBS- ' ' -45.0*
combination, loose laid CA1, SBS-CA2 or SBS- | or SBS-
structrual concrete CA3
CA3 CA-3
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, an
$-40 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | ° o MO onose’lai dy Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard Note 2 lper2ft? | SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
structrual concrete !
Min. 2-inch ENRGY 3 Foil Face or min.
1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade | (Optional) One or more 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF .
1) SBS-SA BS-SA
5-41 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | layers, any or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, | Note 2 lper2ft’ | SBS-SA (S(;EF'TT"" ) SBS-SA or sz_iA | s
structrual concrete combination, loose laid ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25
PSI AGF or CGF or FescoFoam (perlite
side down)

NEMO ETC, LLC

Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 14 of 48




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2B: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Base Insulation Layer
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 22 ga. B i |
oo 33I:teeli?' ’r;?’npez S'O%ra‘:ie I(S‘;tr':”:n) Oneormore |\ 1 5.inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, Note 2 Loera gz | IM BaseGrip (Optional) SBS-AA, SBS-AA, 450
ST vers, any | ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PS| P SD/SA SBS-TA SBS-TA ‘
structrual concrete combination, loose laid
Min. 2-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade | (Optional) One or more 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF
S-43 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi layers, any or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Note 2 1per4ft> | DynaGrip SD/SA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
structrual concrete combination, loose laid ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25
PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more lavers. an UltraFast (steel only)
S-44 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi - Vers, . Y| Min. 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof Board or All Purpose with 1per2ft?> | SBS-SA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
combination, loose laid .
structrual concrete UltraFast Plastic Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade | (Optional) One or more UltraFast (steel only)
S-45 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi layers, any Min. 1.75-inch Invinsa Foam or All Purpose with 1per2ft? | SBS-SA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
structrual concrete combination, loose laid UltraFast Plastic Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . .
K . One or more layers, any | Min. 0.375-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- 1per2.67 | DynaGrip Base . "
S-46 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi combination, loose laid Fiber Roof Board Note 2 (square plates) 2 SD/SA or SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA 45.0
structrual concrete
. BP-AA, BP-CAL, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
Min. 22 ga., t B
a7 33:2teeli?' ’rmynpez 5’0((;;8(:? One or more layers, any Min. 0.375-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- Note 2 (square plates) 1 per 2.67 BP-CA2, BP-CA-3 CA1, BP-CA2, BP-CA- SBS-CA1, -45.0%
po o PS! | combination, loose laid | Fiber Roof Board quare p ft2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, | 3 SBS-AA, SBS-CA1, | SBS-CA2, '
SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3
in. 0.5-i -Fit B BS-
Min. 22 ga, type B, Grade One or more layers, an ’I\D/lllrr]agos;rlgdr:w?:t(r)ogl—tinc%a;isirc) BP-AA, SBS-AA or (Optional) BP-AA, sz—AAI
S-48 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi L YErs, . Y ! T ) Note 2 1 per 2 ft? ! SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or -52.5
combination, loose laid Board (homogeneous) or min. 1.5- SBS-CA2 CA2,SBS-
structrual concrete . SBS-TA
inch Fesco Foam or DuraFoam TA,
Min 2inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF .
(0] | 1 1.78 Opt 1) SBS-SA
5-49 33steelormin. 2,500 psi | '° 0 MOV S| or CGF, ENRGY 325 PSIAGF or CGF, | UltraFast (steel only) P SBS-SA (SBS_'TTa ) o | sBs-TA 525
structrual concrete ! ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25
PSI AGF or CGF,
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . DynaGrip SD/SA or
. 0.25- E - 1 1.
S-50 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi One o.r m9re lavers, a.ny N.lm 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum Note 2 (square plates) perz 45 JM BaseGrip (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -60.0
combination, loose laid Fiber Roof Board ft
structrual concrete SD/SA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . .
K . One or more layers, any | Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- 1 per1.45 . SBS-AA or
S-51 :33:2;22::}:{:00 psi combination, loose laid Fiber Roof Board Note 2 (square plates) P SBS-AA or SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA 60.0

NEMO ETC, LLC

Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 15 of 48




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2B: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Base Insulation Layer
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . .
552 40 steel or min. 2,500 psi | 01 OF morelavers, any | Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum Note 2 (square plates) | ~Pe" 178 | sgs7a (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -60.0
combination, loose laid Fiber Roof Board ft
structrual concrete
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade | (Optional) One or more ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, .
1 1. BP-CA2 BS- 1) BP-CA2
553 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | layers, any ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 325 PS| | Note 2 pefrtz 3 . Azc orSBS g?&"; JBP-CAZor | cpe a2 67.5
structrual concrete combination, loose laid AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF,
ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
. .| (Optional) One or more . . DynaGrip SD/SA or
Min. 22 ga., type B, 50 ksi Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, 1 per 1.45 A .
S-54 steel Iayers., any ' ENRGY 3 25 PS|, R-Panel 25 PS| Note 2 (square plates) 2 JM BaseGrip (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA 67.5
combination, loose laid SD/SA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
5-55 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | 0N 07 MOrelavers,any |\ g gc inch buraBoard Note 2 1per 1.45 | BP-AA, BP-CA, CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 | SBS-CA2 -75.0
combination, loose laid ft SBS-AA or SBS-CA2
structrual concrete or SBS-TA or SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade .
K . One or more layers, any . . 1per1.33 (Optional) BP-CA2, SBS-CA2,
S-56 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi combination, loose laid Min. 0.75-inch DuraBoard Note 2 P SBS-TA SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-TA 75.0
structrual concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade Min. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board or min. (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
| 1 1. BP-AA, BP-CA2
557 | 33steelormin. 2,500psi | or< Of MOrEIVrs A g 76 inch Fesco Board Note 2 per 1.33 ; * | cA2sBs-An, sBs-cA2 | sBs-cA2 | -75.0
combination, loose laid ft SBS-AA or SBS-CA2
structrual concrete (homogeneous) or SBS-TA or SBS-TA
. UltraFast (steel only)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . . .
K . One or more layers, any | Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- or All Purpose with 1 per 1.45 (Optional) BP-CA3 or
558 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi combination, loose laid | Fiber Roof Board UltraFast Metal ft2 BP-CA3 orSBS-CA3 | sgs.ca3 SBS-CA3 750
structrual concrete
(round) Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
$-59 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi S;n‘:;;;zs 'E)yjsr:'l;r;y 'Fvlll')';r%io':;::f dCUROCK Gypsum Note 2 ! pefrtz”g SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 | CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 | SBS-CA2 -75.0
structrual concrete ! or SBS-TA or SBS-TA or SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . .
.0.5- E - 1 1. BP-CA2
560 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi One qr m9re layers, a.ny Mln 0.5-inch SECUROCK Gypsum Note 2 per2 78 SBS-TA (Optional) BP-CA2 or SBS-CA2 75.0
combination, loose laid Fiber Roof Board ft SBS-CA2
structrual concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more lavers. an UltraFast (steel only) DvnaGrip Base
S-61 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi L Vers, . Y| Min. 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof Board or All Purpose with 1 per1ft? i P (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -82.5
combination, loose laid X SD/SA
structrual concrete UltraFast Plastic Plates
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 16 of 48



TABLE 2B: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Base Insulation Layer
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . .
K . One or more layers, any | Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- 1 per 1.45 | DynaGrip Base .
S-62 33 steel . 2,500 Note 2 lat Opt 1) SBS-TA SBS-TA -82.5*
steelor min. 2, pst combination, loose laid Fiber Roof Board ote 2 (square plates) ft? SD/SA or SBS-TA (Optional)
structrual concrete
(Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA,
. BP-AA, BP-CA1,
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade | (o lavers, any | Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- 1per145 | BP-CA2, BP-cA3, | AL BP-CA2,BP SBS-CAL, .
S-63 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi L . R Note 2 (square plates) 5 CA3, SBS-AA, SBS- SBS-CA2, -82.5
combination, loose laid Fiber Roof Board ft SBS-AA, SBS-CA1,
structrual concrete SBS-CA2 SBS-CA3 CA1, SBS-CA2, SBS- SBS-CA3,
’ CA3 SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade | (Optional) One or more UltraFast (steel only) )
K . . . . . , | DynaGrip Base .
S-64 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi layers, any Min. 1.75-inch Invinsa Foam or All Purpose with 1per1lft SD/SA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -82.5
structrual concrete combination, loose laid UltraFast Plastic Plates
Min 2-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more lavers. an 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF 1per1.45 | DynaGrio Base
565 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | ' Or MO onose'lai dy or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PS| AGF or CGF, | UltraFast (steel only) P iy sg iy P (Optional)SBS-TA SBS-TA -90.0
structrual concrete ! ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25
PSI AGF or CGF,
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . .
66 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi One qr m.ore layers, a.ny Mm 0.5-inch SECUROCK Gypsum UltraFast (square 1 per21.45 DynaGrip Base (Optional)sBS-TA SBS-TA 90,0
combination, loose laid Fiber Roof Board plates only) ft SD/SA
structrual concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . .
K . One or more layers, any | Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- , | DynaGrip Base .
S-67 33 steel . 2,500 Note 2 lat 1 1ft Opt 1) SBS-TA SBS-TA -135.0*
steeformin. &, pst combination, loose laid Fiber Roof Board ote 2 (square plates) per SD/SA or SBS-TA (Optional)
structrual concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . ) (Optional) BP-AA, BP-
. R One or more layers, any Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- 5 BP-AA, BP-CA2, SBS-AA, %
S-68 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi combination, loose laid Fiber Roof Board Note 2 (square plates) 1per1ft SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 CA2, SBS-AA, SBS- SBS-CA2 -135.0
structrual concrete CA2

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 17 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2C: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D: PRELIMINARILY ATTACHED INSULATION, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Insulation Layer(s) Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Base Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more lavers. an prelim 18-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap
S-69 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi L yers, any ’ DeckPro Note 2 and 18-inch o.c. in one center SBS-SA SBS-SA or SBS-TA -45.0*
combination Attached
structrual concrete row
. R (Optional) BP-AA, BP-
$-70 ?'\,/:!’,Irs‘;cjjl i?-.’n:?/npezBs'O%ra(:ie One or more layers, any Prelim. DvnaLastic 180 S E;E?el;\ﬁg and 18-inch o.c. within the 5-inch CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-AA, :E: éﬁ;sgfscé\sz’ 45.0%
T P combination Attached ¥ wide, heat welded lap SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 or ! :
structrual concrete Plates TA
SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . High Load . .y .
] | Prelim. 18-inch o.c. within the 5-inch
S-71 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi ne o.r mF)re ayers, any refim DynaWeld 180 S Fasteners and K inch 0.c. within the >-inc (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
combination Attached wide, heat welded lap
structrual concrete Plates
i High Load . . .
Min. 22 ga. tvpe B. Grade One or more layers, min. 1- Loose DynaFast 180 HW Fasteners and IM 18-inch o.c. within the min. 4-
S-72 - £-ga. ype B, inch combined thickness, . or DynaFast 250 . inch wide, heat-welded side (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -47.5%
33 steel [ laid APB Plates or High
any combination HW laps.
Load Plates
. High Load 6-inch o.c. within every-other
573 ?':/;Ir;'tjjl ii"nf?lnpezzo%ragf One or more layers, any Prelim. DvnaFast 180 S Fasteners and JM min. 4-inch wide, heat-welded (Optional) SBS-CA2, SBS-CA2, SBS-AA 525
" P combination Attached v APB Plates or High | side lap; unattached laps heat- | SBS-AA or SBS-TA or SBS-TA ’
structrual concrete
Load Plates welded.
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more lavers. an prelim 18-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap
S-74 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi N Yers, any ’ DeckPro Note 2 and 18-inch o.c. in two, equally | SBS-SA SBS-SA or SBS-TA -60.0
combination Attached
structrual concrete spaced, staggered center rows
. PermaPly 28 . . .
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . ! 9-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap (Optional) BP-AA, BP-
575 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | 0N OF more layers, any Prelim. | GlasBase Plus, Note 2 and 18-inch o.c. in two, equally | CA2 SBS-AA, sBS-CA2 | SooAA SBSCAZ 1 g
combination Attached | DynaBase or or SBS-TA
structrual concrete R spaced, staggered center rows or SBS-TA
Ventsulation
. . (Optional) BP-AA, BP-
576 2,22&2; iz:"n:?lnpezzoira(:f One or more layers, any Prelim. Dvnalastic 180 S r;i?el;\(;?g and 12-inch o.c. within the 5-inch CA2, BP-CA3, SBS-AA, Zgg_éﬁésgfs;:’ 7.5
T P combination Attached Y wide, heat welded lap SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 or ’ '
structrual concrete Plates TA
SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. 1- Loose- DynaFast 180 HW High Load 12-inch o.c. within the min. 4-
S-77 33 steel at max. 6 ft spans inch combined thickness, laid or DynaFast 250 Fasteners and inch wide, heat-welded side (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -67.5
attached 6-inch o.c. any combination HW High Load Plates laps.
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . 9-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap
| Prelim. BP-AA, BP-CA2, SBS-
S-78 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi One O,r m.ore ayers, any retim PermaPly 28 Note 2 and 12-inch o.c. in two, equally . »SBS SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 -82.5
combination Attached AA or SBS-CA2
structrual concrete spaced, staggered center rows
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more lavers. an Loose- High Load 12-inch o.c. within the min. 5-
S-79 33 steel at max. 6 ft spans L Yers, any . DyaFast 180 S Fasteners and inch wide, heat-welded side (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -82.5
. combination laid R
attached 6-inch o.c. High Load Plates laps.
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12:12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 18 of 48



TABLE 2C: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE D: PRELIMINARILY ATTACHED INSULATION, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Insulation Layer(s) Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Base Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. 1- prelim DynaFast 180 HW ::E:uu;wag-li_:ch \i;ilg:hhc;:;(-wvvlttell“tljr;tﬂ;n.54:nacched
S-80 80 steel at max. 6 ft spans inch combined thickness, ’ or DynaFast 250 R g - . P p (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -90.0
. L Attached wide JM Polymer 71.75-inch o.c.; intermediate
attached 6-inch o.c. any combination HW .
Membrane Batten | 3-inch laps heat-welded
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. 1 High Load 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4 (Optional) SBS-CA2
- < 83, Type B, ) re layers, ’ Loose- Fasteners and JM ) o N P ! SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3,
S-81 33 steel at max. 6 ft spans inch combined thickness, . DynaFast 180 S . inch wide, heat-welded side SBS-CA3, SBS-AA or -97.5
. L laid APB Plates or High SBS-AA or SBS-TA
attached 6-inch o.c. any combination laps. SBS-TA
Load Plates
. : High Load . i .
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. 1- Loose- DynaFast 180 HW Fasteners and JM 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4-
S-82 33 steel at max. 6 ft spans inch combined thickness, . or DynaFast 250 . inch wide, heat-welded side (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -105.0
) S laid APB Plates or High
attached 6-inch o.c. any combination HW laps.
Load Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. 1- Loose- High Load 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4- (Optional) SBS-CA2, SBS-CA2 SBS-CA3
S-83 80 steel at max. 6 ft spans inch combined thickness, . DynaFast 180 S Fasteners and inch wide, heat-welded side SBS-CA3, SBS-AA or ’ ’ | -105.0
. [ laid R SBS-AA or SBS-TA
attached 6-inch o.c. any combination High Load Plates laps. SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. . . High Load . .
Prelim. DynalL 1 -inch o.c. he 4-inch
S-84 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi 1.5-inch combined retim ynalastic 180 S or Fasteners and 6 'mc o.c. over the 4-inc SBS-TA SBS-TA -112.5
K N Attached | DynaWeld 180 S wide laps
structrual concrete thickness, any combination Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. . High Load . .
Prelim. 6-inch o.c. the 4-inch
5-85 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | 1.5-inch combined "eIM- 1 pynaLastic 180'S Fasteners and Inch o.¢. overthe f-nc SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 -112.5
K N Attached wide laps
structrual concrete thickness, any combination Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. . . High Load . .y .
. DynalL 1 - .C. -
S-86 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi 1.5-inch combined Prelim ynalastic 180 S or Fasteners and 6 'mch o-C. within the S-inch (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -112.5
K - Attached | DynaWeld 180 S wide, heat welded laps
structrual concrete thickness, any combination Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. . High Load . s .
Prelim. 6-inch o.c. within the 5-inch
5-87 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | 1.5-inch combined 'eIM- 1 pynaLastic 180'S Fasteners and Inch o.¢. Within the >7inc (Optional) SBS-CA2 | SBS-CA2 -112.5
K L Attached wide, heat welded laps
structrual concrete thickness, any combination Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . High Load . .y .
. DynalL 1 - .C. -
588 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | Min. 1.5-inch NailBoard Prelim ynalastic 1805 or | o Lo ers and 6-inch o.c. within the 5-inch (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -135.0
Attached | DynaWeld 180S wide, heat welded laps
structrual concrete Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. 2- . . High Load . s .
K . . R . Prelim. Dynalastic 180 S or 6-inch o.c. within the 5-inch .
- .2 . BS- BS- -135.
S-89 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi inch coml:?lneﬁ:l thickness, Attached | DynaWeld 180 Fasteners and wide, heat welded laps (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA 35.0
structrual concrete any combination Plates

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13

Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 19 of 48




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2C: STEEL OR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D: PRELIMINARILY ATTACHED INSULATION, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Insulation Layer(s) Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Base Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 22 ga., type EF,
S;:::zistct)assss:ia;—::::oG(:ﬂ One or more layers, min. 1- Prelim High Load 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4-
S-90 with #12-24 x 1.25” DP5, ;nnchcc(;)nTbbilnnaet(iiotnh|ckness, Attached DynaFast 180 HW ET::z:ers and inch wide, heat welded laps (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -142.5
HWH screws with %-inch v
washer
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade . . High Load . .
Prelim. Dynalastic 180 S 6-inch o.c. the 4-inch
591 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi | Min. 1.5-inch NailBoard relim ynaastic " | Fasteners and Inch o.c. overthe 4-inc SBS-TA SBS-TA -150.0
Attached | DynaWeld 180 S wide laps
structrual concrete Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade One or more layers, min. 2- . . High Load . .
S-92 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi inch combined thickness, Prelim. Dynalastic 180 S or Fasteners and 6 .mch o.c. over the 4-inch SBS-TA SBS-TA -150.0
[ Attached | DynaWeld 180 S wide laps
structrual concrete any combination Plates
DynaWeld Cap
. One or more layers, min. High Load . _ . 180 or 180 FR,
S-93 Zrl:&jégi{ezpe EF, 1.5-inch combined Il.:izse DynaFast 250 HW Fasteners and ?r;l;c\:,.(:j: hwézr::v:]jergll:' :- (Optional) SBS-TA DynaWeld Cap -165.0
thickness, any combination High Load Plates ! P 250 or 250 FR,
torch-applied
12-inch o.c. in. 4-i
Min. 22 ga, type B, Grade Prelim Dynalastic 180 S or High Load la I:r:z izc—i:zhtr;ecrﬂ:]t:rg:h
S-94 33 steel or min. 2,500 psi Min. 1.5-inch NailBoard ! Y Fasteners and P o ’ SBS-TA SBS-TA -195.0
Attached | DynaWeld 180 S equally spaced, staggered
structrual concrete Plates
center rows
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 20 of 48



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 3A: STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
NOTE: FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS, REFER TO NOTE 16

System Deck o Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
rimer
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 . .
c-1. :er:‘cc::tf' STIM AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, HA Min. 1.5-inch Invinsa Foam HA JS';' /2259(5”” (Tipt"’”a') SBS-AA, SBS- ;B\S'AA’ SBS- | 1550
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI
AGF or CGF
. Structural | ASTM Min. 0.75-inch FescoBoard or DuraBoard A (FCQEELOB”:JLQA;?'D%Z:;‘:& A gg;A:A ii'scé\sz’ (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- | SBS-AA,SBS- |
’ concrete D41 (homogeneous) AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA CA2, SBS-TA :
(homogeneous) CA2
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 .
. Structural | ASTM PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, A Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK A 5;:3; isr?;\s’- éigtlgg:!LiP—SABASI—EAP—Z Z/Béﬁf’sgzs- a7
' concrete D41 ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board A or S;BS—TA ! TA ’
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board,
ca Structural | ASTM Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3 CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI HA RetroPlus Board or HA gg;A:A ii'scé\sz’ (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- (S:/Béﬁf’sggs' 2775
’ concrete D41 CGF, ValuTherm CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI CGF DuraBoard or min. 0.75-inch cA2 AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA TA :
Fesco Board (homogeneous)
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3 CGF, ) . BP-AA, BP-CA2, , SBS-AA, SBS-
cs. ito::‘cc::tf' o ENRGY 3 25 PSI CGF, ValuTherm CGF, HA wn. -5 r':Ch FescoFoamor | SBS-AA or SBS- ,(AO/-\ptSIgg?CI)ABZPo/:?éz?TSA CA20rSBS- | -277.5
ValuTherm 25 PSI CGF CA2 ’ TA
Structural ASTM Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3 CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI . . .
C-6. concrete Da1 CGF, ValuTherm CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI CGF HA Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard HA SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -277.5
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural ASTM PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF, ENRGY 3 . . .
C-7. concrete D41 25 PSI AGF, ValuTherm AGF, ValuTherm 25 HA Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard HA SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -300.0
PSI AGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
! ! BP- BP-CA2 BS-. BS-
c8 Structural | ASTM PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF, ENRGY 3 HA Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus HA SgSé:& oF: SCI':S—I (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- iAsz ﬁrAISSBS—S -300.0
' concrete D41 25 PSI AGF, ValuTherm AGF, ValuTherm 25 Board or DuraBoard AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA ’
CA2 TA
PSI AGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 ) . .
oo Structural | ASTM PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF, ENRGY3 | 2/:':1'i?\'s(;';g‘i::;r;:;toBB";arf i | oa gg::;\ it-s?:sz-l (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- Z/Béﬁ/:’sgi-s- 3050
’ concrete D41 25 PSI AGF, ValuTherm AGF, ValuTherm 25 e AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA '
(homogeneous) or DuraBoard CA2 TA
PSI AGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
c-10 Structural ASTM ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 HA Min. 1.5-inch Fesco Foam or HA ggSAAAAit Scé-\sz’ (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- (S:/Bé QI:ISSB? 305.0
: concrete D41 AGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF, ValuTherm AGF, DuraFoam CA2 AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA TA :
ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 21 of 48




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 3A: STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
NOTE: FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS, REFER TO NOTE 16

System Deck o Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
rimer
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 MBR-BA, . . MBR-BA, (Optional) BP-CA1, BP-
c-11. :er:‘cc::tf' None AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, 12-inch m’:{ir?;zd';mh FescoBoard 12-inch 22 fgrz’szgsc Ay | CA2 SBSCAL or SBS- EE: Eﬁ; or 525
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI o.c. o.c. CA2
AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
! ! MBR-BA MBR-BA
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, . ’ . . . ! BP-CA2 or SBS- (Optional) BP-CA2 or
C-12. concrete None ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF (1)2(:—|nch Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard (1)2c-|nch CA2 SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 -147.5
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF o o
Structural Min. 0.75-inch FescoBoard (homogeneous) MBR-BA (Optional) Min. 0.75-inch MBR-BA BP-CA2 or SBS- (Optional) BP-CA2 or
C-13. None R . full FescoBoard (homogeneous) full SBS-CA2 -187.5
concrete or min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard . . CA2 SBS-CA2
coverage or min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard coverage
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 MBR-BA ‘ . MBR-BA .
c-14 Structural None PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, full Min. 0.75-inch FescoBoard full BP-CA2 or SBS- (Optional) BP-CA2 or SBS-CA2 1875
' concrete ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF coverage (homogeneous) coverage CA2 SBS-CA2 :
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF & &
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 MBR-BA . . . MBR-BA .
c-15 Structural None PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, full (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch base full BP-CA2 or SBS- (Optional) BP-CA2 or SBS-CA2 3750
’ concrete ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF coverage insulation coverage CA2 SBS-CA2 ’
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF g &
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, UIA-TWO- . . UIA-TWO- BP-CA3 or SBS- (Optional) BP-CA3 or
c-1e. concrete | NOne ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF | PART Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard PART cA3 SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3 600
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
17 Structural None PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, UIA-TWO- Min. 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof UIA-TWO- SBS-SA (Optional) SBS-SA or SBS-SA or 825
! concrete ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF PART Board PART SBS-TA SBS-TA :
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 .
c18. ito::‘;::tf' None AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, DO | Min. 15-inch Invinsa Foam | 22 TWO" | sps s (SEEF'TT;’") 2BS-5Aor s 825
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI
AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 . . (Optional) BP-CA1, BP-
[ IA-TWO- | Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK IA-TWO- BS-CA1
c-19. drructural | None AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Dt VO | Min. 0.25-ch SECHOCE DO | sBsTA CA3,SBS-CATOrSBS- | ooo cai O | 1050
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PS| vp cA3
AGF or CGF
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 22 of 48



TABLE 3A: STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
NOTE: FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS, REFER TO NOTE 16

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck o Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
rimer
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, UIA-TWO- . . UIA-TWO- | BP-CA2 or SBS- (Optional) BP-CA2 or
¢-20. concrete | o€ ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF | PART Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard PART CA2 SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 -147.5
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, UIA-TWO- . . UIA-TWO- .
C-21. concrete None ENRGY 3 25 PS| AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF PART Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard PART SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -150.0
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
c-22 Structural None PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, UIA-TWO- | Min. 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof UIA-TWO- | JM BaseGrip (Optional) SBS-AA, SBS- SBS-AA, SBS- 155.0
' concrete ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF PART Board PART SD/SA TA TA '
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PS|, ENRGY 3 ) )
c-23. ‘z‘torr:’;rt:t':l None AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ;J/LAR'TT WO- | Min. 1.5-inch Invinsa Foam ;JX:TT Wo- Js';l /EZSEG”F’ (Tc/)\pt'onal) SBS-AA, SBS- iis’AA’ SBS- | 1850
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI
AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, UIA-TWO- | Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK UIA-TWO- _
C-24. concrete None ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF PART Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board PART SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA 1775
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
c.25 Structural None Min. 0.75-inch FescoBoard (homogeneous) UIA-TWO- (FZSpctgan:a:)rc'ivl(:t;r?wlzst;l:eczus) UIA-TWO- | BP-CA2 or SBS- (Optional) BP-CA2 or SBS-CA2 1875
’ concrete or min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard PART ) . g PART CA2 SBS-CA2 ’
or min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard
BP-AA, CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-
Structural . ) UIA-TWO- | (Optional) Min. 0.5-inch UIA-TWO- . ! (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- .
C-26. concrete None Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus Board PART RetroPlus Board PART (S:iSZ-AA or SBS- AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA -(;22 or SBS- -187.5
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
c27 Structural None PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, UIA-TWO- Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK UIA-TWO- BP-AA, SBS-AA, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- SBS-AA, SBS- 2475
: concrete ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF PART Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board PART SBS-CA2 CA2, SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 CA2 :
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
BP-AA, BP-CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-
Structural ) . UIA-TWO- | (Optional) Min. 0.75-inch UIA-TWO- . ’ | (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- .
-28. .0.75- BS- BS- 2 BS- - .
c-28 concrete None Min. 0.75-inch FescoBoard (homogeneous) PART FescoBoard (homogeneous) PART zASZ AA or SBS AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA ‘(Ifﬁ or SBS 2850
BP-AA, CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-
Structural ) ) ) UIA-TWO- | (Optional) Min. 0.5-inch UIA-TWO- . ! (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- .
C-29. N Min. 0.5-inch R -Fit B DuraB: SBS-AA or SBS- CA2 or SBS- - .
? concrete | e in. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board or DuraBoard | p gy Retro-Fit Board or DuraBoard | PART o AA,SBS-CA2 0r SBSTA | " 3050

NEMO ETC, LLC

Certificate of Authorization #32455

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 23 of 48




TABLE 3A: STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
NOTE: FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS, REFER TO NOTE 16

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck o Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
rimer
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
€-30 Structural None PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, RSUA or Min. 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof RSUA or SBS-SA (Optional) SBS-SA or SBS-SA or €75
’ concrete ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF OSFA Board OSFA SBS-TA SBS-TA ’
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 .
c31L iz::‘;::tf' None AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, SONOT | Min, 15-inch Invinsa Foam | S | sBs-sA (S(;g’f'TTa') 2BS-5Aor ot 67.5
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI
AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
c-32 Structural None PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, RSUA or Min. 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof RSUA or JM BaseGrip (Optional) SBS-AA, SBS- SBS-AA, SBS- €75
’ concrete ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF OSFA Board OSFA SD/SA TA TA ’
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 . .
c-33. iz::‘;::tf' None AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, 25:;: °" | Min. 1.5-inch Invinsa Foam gsst;: or JS';' /EZSEG”F’ (T(ipt"’"a') SBS-AA, SBS- iiS‘AA' B 675
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI
AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 SBS-AA, SBS-
' ! . . . BP-AA, BP-CA2, (Optional) BP-AA, SBS- !
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, Min. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board, CA1, SBS-
C34. concrete | oM ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF | "> RetroPlus Board ROUA AR OrSES: | AR O3S TAL SBSCAZ | cazorses. | 190
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF TA
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 . . (Optional) BP-CA1, BP-
| RSUA Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK RSUA BS-CAl
c3s. itorr:‘:::t': None AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, OSSLFJ AR '"SSm_SFi'S:r :OofUBcir ) Ossl; W | sBsTA CA3, SBS-CAL o SBS- EB; s | 1050
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI yP CA3
AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF RSUA or Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK RSUA or
-36. ! ! ’ X BS- i BS- BS- -177.
36 concrete | o€ ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF | OSFA Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board OSFA SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA 7.5
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
c-37 Structural None PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, RSUA or Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK RSUA or BP-AA, SBS-AA, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- SBS-AA, SBS- 2475
' concrete ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF OSFA Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board OSFA SBS-CA2 CA2, SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 CA2 '
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 24 of 48




TABLE 3A: STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
NOTE: FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS, REFER TO NOTE 16

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck o Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
rimer
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, Min. 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof JM BaseGrip (Optional) SBS-AA, SBS- SBS-AA, SBS-
c38. concrete | None ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF | N0 Board CR-20 SD/SA TA TA 1125
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 . .
c-39. iz::‘;::tf' None AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, CR-20 Min. 1.5-inch Invinsa Foam CR-20 JS';' /EZSEG”F’ (T(ipt"’"a') SBS-AA, SBS- iiS‘AA' B 1125
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI
AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 ) . (Optional) BP-CA1, BP-
Structural Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK SBS-CA1
C-40. co::‘ccr:tf None AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, CR-20 . '”Sum_Fi'E; rocf Board CR-20 SBS-TA CA3, SBS-CA1 or SBS- BeCA3 °" | -105.0
ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PS| yP cA3
AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, . . .
C-41. concrete None ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF CR-20 Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard CR-20 SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -150.0
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
! ! . . BP-AA, SBS-AA, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- SBS-AA, SBS-
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK
C-42. N ! ! ’ CR-2 CR-2 BS-CA2 BS- | CA2, SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 CA2 BS- -247.
concrete one ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF 0 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 0 ?AS or SBS orsfaz-TsA , SBS T or SBS >
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch base BP-CA2 or SBS- (Optional) BP-CA2 or
43 concrete | None ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF | C 20 insulation CR-20 cA2 SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 360.0
or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 25 of 48




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 3B: STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION orR REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED TEMP ROOF, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck X Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Primer /Temp Roof
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural | ASTM D41 primer followed PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, (Optional) Base BP-CA2 or (Optional) BP-
-44. MBR-BA A R MBR-BA BS-CA2 -147.
¢ concrete by SBS-TA (smooth) ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or insulation SBS-CA2 CA2 or SBS-CA2 SBS-C >
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Structural | ASTM D41 primer followed Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof RSUA or (Optional) SBS-
C45. concrete by SBS-TA (smooth) Board OSFA None N/A SBS-TA TA SBS-TA 2250
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
c-46 Structural ASTM D41 primer followed ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF HA Min. 1.5-inch Invinsa HA JM BaseGrip (Optional) SBS- SBS-AA, 155.0
' concrete by JM BaseGrip SD/SA or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm Foam SD/SA AA, SBS-TA SBS-TA '
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 . .
PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, i(r?c”ht';’;‘targ_';/:i”é:ié
Structural ASTM D41 primer followed ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or RetroPlus Board or ! BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP- SBS-AA,
C-47. concrete by BP-AA, SBS-AA (smooth) CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF, min. 0.5- HA DuraBoard or min HA CA2, SBS-AA AA, SBS-AA, SBS- SBS-CA2 -167.5
or SBS-TA (smooth) inch Retro-Fit Board, RetroPlus Board or X ) or SBS-CA2 CA2 or SBS-TA or SBS-TA
. . 0.75-inch Fesco Board
DuraBoard or min. 0.75-inch Fesco Board
(homogeneous)
(homogeneous)
. (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, )
ASTM D41 primer followed . . BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP- SBS-AA,
tructural ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-P |1 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF Min. 1.5-inch F
cag. | Stuetural |y Bpaa, SBS-AA (smooth) OY3 25 PSl, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AG HA In. 1.5-nch Fesco ), CA2,SBS-AA | AA, SBS-AA, SBS- | SBS-CA2 | -167.5
concrete or SBS-TA (smooth) or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm Foam or DuraFoam or SBS-CA2 CA2 or SBS-TA or SBS-TA
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
ASTM D41 primer followed ) R . R .
Structural Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3 CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI Min. 0.5-inch (Optional) SBS-
-49. D - - -277.
¢-49 concrete :::;ne or two DynaWeld CGF, ValuTherm CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI CGF HA DuraBoard HA SBS-TA TA SBS-TA 277:5
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
ASTM D41 primer followed ! ! ) ) .
Structural PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF, ENRGY 3 25 Min. 0.5-inch (Optional) SBS-
-50. t DynaWel ! ! ! BS- BS- - 5
50 concrete g:;ne or two DynaWeld PSI AGF, ValuTherm AGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI HA DuraBoard HA SBS-TA TA SBS-TA 3000
AGF

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 26 of 48




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 3C: STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE F: NON-INSULATED, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck X Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Primer
No. (Note 1) Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
St t |
c-51. ructura ASTM D41 SBS-SA (Optional) SBS-SA or SBS-TA SBS-SA or SBS-TA 45.0
concrete
Structural . .
c-52. o ASTM D41 JM BaseGrip SD/SA (Optional) SBS-AA, SBS-TA SBS-AA, SBS-TA -155.0
Structural .
C-53. i ASTM D41 BP-AA, BP-CA2, SBS-AA or SBS-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA 275.0
Structural ]
C-54. i ASTM D41 SBS-TA (Optional) BP-CA2, SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA 315.0
St t |
C-55. corr:’ccr;f ASTM D41 BP-CA2 or SBS-CA2 (Optional) BP-CA2 or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 -495.0

TABLE 3D: STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION orR REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE F: NON-INSULATED, BONDED ROOF COVER, PAVER SYSTEM OVERBURDEN

System Deck Waterproofing SR MDP
No. (Note 1) Primer Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Structural !’)I-»ilzfr?caasseaEg:::zdl\l/lneﬁwogine (Optional) DynaWeld Cap FR or Wausau Tile: Terra-Paver in Lok-Down atop Terra-Base. Terra-Base is bonded directly to the
C-56. concrete None Adhesive HS” 1-inch ribbons 6- DynaBase HW, DynaWeld Cap 180 top surface of the waterproofing system in Royal “Hurricane Force Membrane Adhesive HS”. -85.0
inch o.c ! torch applied FR, torch applied The Terra-Paver is secured with the Lok-Down tabs and screws.
(Optional) Wausau Tile: Terra-Paver in Lok-Down atop Terra-Base. Terra-Base is bonded directly to the

C-57. Structural | ASTM DynaBase HW, torch applied DynaBase HW,
concrete D41 .
torch applied

DynaWeld Cap FR,

. top surface of the waterproofing system in Royal “Hurricane Force Membrane Adhesive HS”. -102.5
torch applied

The Terra-Paver is secured with the Lok-Down tabs and screws.

Structural | ASTM (Optional) DynaWeld Cap 180 Wausau Tile: Terra-Paver in Lok-Down atop Terra-Base. Terra-Base is bonded directly to the
C-58. DynaBase HW, torch applied DynaBase HW, v p top surface of the waterproofing system in Royal “Hurricane Force Membrane Adhesive HS”. -110.0
concrete D41 . FR, torch applied . .
torch applied The Terra-Paver is secured with the Lok-Down tabs and screws.
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 27 of 48



TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: LWC TO DECK, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck LWC Base Insulation Layer Coverboard Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
gz | M o
B Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-P I, ENRGY 32 i 1) Additi | D ip B
we-r | B2 YPEB L cellutar Concrete with in. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 Rsua | (Optional) Additiona Rsua | DYaGriPBase | (optionaljses-TA | sBS-TA -75.0
Grade 33 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI layer(s) base insulation SD/SA
steel Celcore HS Rheology
Modifying Admixture
Min. 340 psi, minimum 2-
inch thick Celcore MF . . . - .
LWC-2 Structural Cellular Concrete with Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 RSUA (Optional) Ad'dltlona.l RSUA DynaGrip Base (Optional)SBS-TA | SBS-TA 775
concrete PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI layer(s) base insulation SD/SA
Celcore HS Rheology
Modifying Admixture
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 UlA- UIA-
LWC-3 Structural Min. 200 psi, min 2-inch PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, TWO- (Optional) Additional TWO- SBS-SA (Optional) SBS- SBS-SA or 750
concrete Elastizell ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or PART layers of base insulation PART SA or SBS-TA SBS-TA ’
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 22 :\:é:tiligkpcsglglg r|T\]/|uFm 3 UIA- UIA-
e | B | Gl G | Mo S G e 0Grazs | | (oot | W | sy | G| S50 | g
conl Celcore HS Rheology ' PART v PART
Modifying Admixture
Min. 22 :\:é:tahligkpcsglglg r|:]/|uFm 3 UIA- UIA-
LWC-5 gara Zyep;B, Cellular Concrete with 'F\,"S'ln'Rfa'r':;gE'\;ng 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 TWO- fg‘:::’;;?;gﬂ:’:ﬁ;’;;n TWO- Eg;':f”p Base | (Optional)sBS-TA | SBS-TA 75.0
steel Celcore HS Rheology ! PART Y PART
Modifying Admixture
Structural | M- 200 psi, minimum 2= e 6 i ch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 UIA (Optional) Additional ulA (Optional) SBS- | SBS-CA1,
LWC-6 concrete inch thick pre-existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI TWO- layer(s) base insulation TWo- SBS-CA-2 CA2 SBS-CA2 -80.0
cellular LWIC ' PART v PART
Min. 200 psi, minimum 2- . . UIA- . - UIA- .
Lwe-7 i;rr:‘cc::tf' inch thick pre-existing &lanpir'lclth'\;sz 3, RePanel, ENRGY3 25| ryo. f:f:{’;;i'lfﬂ'::ﬁ;;'on TWoO- SDI‘)’;:E”F’ B2%€ | (Optional)sBS-TA | SBS-TA -80.0
cellular LWIC ' PART v PART
Min. 310 psi, minimum 2-
inch thick Celcore MF UIA- UIA-
in. 1.5-i E - E 2 i iti D ipB
LWC-8 ‘:ZTCC::;:' Cellular Concrete with ’;ASIIn R-Pz:;hzs’\rigf\( 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 TWO- l(gpetr'(osr)‘ab';idi:'lcl’:tailon TWO- Sg;‘:f”p 3¢ | (Optional)SBS-TA | SBS-TA -90.0
Celcore HS Rheology ! PART Y PART
Modifying Admixture

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 28 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: LWC TO DECK, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck LWC Base Insulation Layer Coverboard Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, UIA UIA (Optional) BP-
LWC-9 Structural Min. 200 psi, min 2-inch ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF TWO- Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK TWO- SBS-TA CA1l, BP-CA3, SBS-CAl or -105.0
concrete Elastizell or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm PART Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board PART SBS-CA1 or SBS- SBS-CA3 ’
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF CA3
Min. 310 psi, minimum 2-
inch thick Celcore MF . . UIA- . - UIA- .
oo | S| Coiarcongeowin | ML DG e BNGY228 |y | oot s | o, | scag | SR SO g
Celcore HS Rheology ' PART Y PART
Modifying Admixture
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 UIA- UIA-
Structural Min. 200 psi, min 2-inch PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, . . BP-CA2 or (Optional) BP-
WWELL | concrete | Elastizell ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or ;\/'\VR? Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard ;XVRC; SBS-CA2 CA2orsgs-caz | SBSCAZ 1475
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 UlA- UIA-
Structural Min. 200 psi, min 2-inch PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, . . (Optional) SBS-
LWC12 | nerete | Elastizell ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or P:’Rc;' Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard ;X’Rc;' SBS-TA TA SBS-TA -150.0
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 0.75-inch
Structural Min. 200 psi, min 2-inch Min. 0.75-inch FescoBoard (homogeneous) or UIA- FescoBoard UIA- BP-CA2 or (Optional) BP-
Lwc-13 oo P b ¢ TWO- : TWO- P SBS-CA2 -187.5
concrete Elastizell min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard (homogeneous) or min. SBS-CA2 CA2 or SBS-CA2
PART . PART
0.5-inch DuraBoard
. R . UIA- . . . UIA- BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP- SBS-AA,
tructural | Min. 2 2-inch t 1) Min. 0.5-inch
LWC-14 iorr:‘ccr:t? EI;:tiZSI? psl, min 2-inc Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus Board TWO- ngr;iTjS)BO:’r do >inc TWO- | CA2,SBS-AA | AA, SBS-AA, SBS- | SBS-CA2or | -187.5
PART PART or SBS-CA2 CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-TA
(Optional) Min. 0.75-inch
) o ) ) UIA- FescoBoard UIA- BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP- SBS-AA,
LWC-15 itor:cc::t? EMlgs‘téglcl) psi, min 2-inch m:: 8;fr::;lz::g‘ﬁfgg‘:r(:z:“gﬁ‘::;g::& °" | Two- | (homogeneous) or min. TWO- | CA2,SBS-AA | AA, SBS-AA, SBS- | SBS-CA2or | -225.0
o PART 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board or | PART or SBS-CA2 CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-TA
DuraBoard
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, BP-AA, BP- .
1A- 1A- t 1) BP- BS-AA
Structural Min. 200 psi, min 2-inch ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF v Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK v CA2 SBS-AA, (Optional) SBS-AA,
LWC-16 , TWO- . TWO- AA, SBS-AA, SBS- | SBS-CA20r | -225.0
concrete Elastizell or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm PART Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board PART SBS-CA2 or CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-TA
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF SBS-TA

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13

Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 29 of 48




TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: LWC TO DECK, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck LWC Base Insulation Layer Coverboard Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, UIA UIA
Structural Min. 200 psi, min 2-inch ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF i Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK i (Optional) BP-
LWC-17 TWO- TWO- BS-TA BS-CA2 -225.
¢ concrete Elastizell or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm PARC')I' Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board PAR?’ SBS CA2 or SBS-CA2 SBS-C >0
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural Min. 200 psi, min 2-inch PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, (Optional) Additional (Optional) SBS- SBS-SA or
LWe-18 concrete Elastizell ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CR-20 layers of base insulation CR-20 SBS-5A SA or SBS-TA SBS-TA 750
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 200 psi, min 2-inch (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, . . (Optional) BP-
LWC-19 Structural Elastizell. Celcore or ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF CR-20 Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK CR-20 SBS-TA CA1l, BP-CA3, SBS-CAl or -105.0
concrete Mearlcre’te or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board SBS-CA1 or SBS- SBS-CA3 ’
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF CA3
Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural ’ P e PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, . . (Optional) SBS-
LWC-20 concrete fﬂe{l;c:;’cer,ellastlzell or ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF o CR-20 Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard CR-20 SBS-TA TA SBS-TA -150.0
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, (Optional) Additional BP-CA2 or (Optional) BP-
LWC-21 -2 -2 BS-CA2 -180.
we concrete Elastizell ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CR-20 layers of base insulation CR-20 SBS-CA2 CA2 or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA 800
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel BP-AA, BP-
Structural | Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch (ENF:aclsc;(n; és FI’; R Pl:ncel 25 PS| E’NRG$n3eA'GF Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK CA2 SBS-AA (Optional) BP- SBS-AA,
LWC-22 : e - ’ CR-2 CEe CR-2 o AA, SBS-AA, SBS- | SBS-CA2 -180.
concrete Elastizell or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 0 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 0 SBS-CA2 or CA’ZSorSSBS—’TSA S EBE—TA or 800
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF SBS-TA
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
Structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK (Optional) BP-
LWE-23 1 ncrete Elastizell or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm CR-20 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board CR-20 SBS-TA CA2 or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 -180.0
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, (Optional) Additional BP-CA2 or (Optional) BP-
LWC-24 CR-2 CR-2! BS-CA2 -222.
concrete Celcore ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or 0 layers of base insulation 0 SBS-CA2 CA2 or SBS-CA2 SBS >
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Structural | Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch (E?“;;c&n; Iég/l rirsll 1rf|;|:nc:| E': F;(;Y 2&?2\72?@ Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK g/i-zA:ésB-PA-A (Optional) BP- SBS-AA,
LWC-25 concrete Celcore or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm CR-20 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board CR-20 SBS-CA2 or éﬁ’zsoBrss-gsA_’TsABs- 223:5:2 or 2225
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF SBS-TA

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 30 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: LWC TO DECK, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck LWC Base Insulation Layer Coverboard Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
Structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK (Optional) BP-
LWC-2 R-2 R-2 BS-TA BS-CA2 -222.
26 concrete Celcore or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm CR-20 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board CR-20 SBS CA2 or SBS-CA2 SBS-C >
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, (Optional) Additional BP-CA2 or (Optional) BP-
LWC-27 CR-20 CR-20 SBS-CA2 -240.0
concrete Mearlcrete ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or layers of base insulation SBS-CA2 CA2 or SBS-CA2
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
ional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel BP-AA, BP-
Structural | Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch (E?l%tlec:(n; 25 }lgl RSP:r:eI 25 PGSI sl-;INRG\E;r;eA,GF Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK CA2 SBS-AA (Optional) BP- SBS-AA,
LWC-2 : A s ’ R-2 R-2 Ty AA, SBS-AA, SBS- BS-CA2 -240.
28 concrete Mearlcrete or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm CR-20 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board CR-20 SBS-CA2 or CAIZSorSSBS—,TSA S ng—'(IEA or 0.0
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF SBS-TA
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
Structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK (Optional) BP-
LWC-29 CR-20 CR-20 SBS-TA SBS-CA2 -240.0
concrete Mearlcrete or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board CA2 or SBS-CA2
AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF

NEMO ETC, LLC

Certificate of Authorization #32455

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13

Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 31 of 48




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 4B: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-2: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ANCHOR SHEET, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck LWC Anchor Sheet Insulation Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Fasteners Attach Base Top Attach | Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Pre-existent
m;:i'r:(:gqp;" Min. 1-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY | (Optional) Min. 1.5
inch thick DynaBase 9-inch o.c. at the 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF | inch Fesco Foam or
Min. 22 ga., cellular LWIC G\I/asPI ! IM LWC CR 4-inch lap and or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, DuraFoam, min. BP-AA, (Optional) SBS-AA
type BV steel To qualif Premin Base Sheet 12-inch o.c.in ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 | 0.75-inch Fesco BP-CA2, BP-AA, SBS- SBS-CA'Z
LWC-30 | or structural q y ! two, equally PSI AGF or CGF, min. 1.5-inch Fesco Board HA SBS-AA AA, SBS- -52.5
the LWC, the PermaPly 28 Fastener : . or SBS-
concrete spaced, Foam or DuraFoam, min. 0.75-inch (homogeneous) or or SBS- CA2 or SBS-
fastener or (Note 11) R X X TA
deck. . staggered center | Fesco Board (homogeneous) or min. min. 0.5-inch Retro- CA2 TA
shall Ventsulation R . .
document rows 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board, RetroPlus Fit Board, RetroPlus
min. 62 Ibf Board or DuraBoard Board or DuraBoard
per Note 11.
Min. 1-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY (Optional) Min. 1.5-
Min. 300 psi 7-inch o.c. at the 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF | inch Fesco Foam or
Min. 22 ga., mini'mump " | GlasPly aeinch Ial' 'and 5. |or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, DuraFoam, min. BP-AA, (Optional) SBS-AA
type BV steel 2 95-inch Premier, JM LWCCR inch o.c ?n two ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 | 0.75-inch Fesco BP-CA2, BP-AA, SBS- SBS-CA'Z
LWC-31 | or structural " PermaPly 28 Base Sheet - ! PSI AGF or CGF, min. 1.5-inch Fesco Board HA SBS-AA AA, SBS- -82.5
thick equally spaced, . ) or SBS-
concrete Concrecel or Fastener stageered center Foam or DuraFoam, min. 0.75-inch (homogeneous) or or SBS- CA2 or SBS- TA
deck. LWIC Ventsulation rovssg Fesco Board (homogeneous) or min. min. 0.5-inch Retro- CA2 TA
0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board, RetroPlus Fit Board, RetroPlus
Board or DuraBoard Board or DuraBoard

TABLE 4C: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS —NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck LWC Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Base Insulation Layer
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
lwn' snga,d Min. 180 psi, mini 2-inch thick isti (Optional) O !M UltraLok, min.
ype B, Grade in. psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing ptional) One or more ) r 1 6-inch ) )
LWC-32 | 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the layers, any Min. 0.25-inch 1per1fe | Dynadrie | (Optional) | ooy -45.0
] o ) Invinsa Roof Board | embedment Base SD/SA | SBS-TA
structural fastener shall document min. 90 Ibf per Note 11. combination, loose laid
concrete (Note 11)
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 32 of 48



TABLE 4D: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE E: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck LwWcC Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 200 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing PermaPly 28 or JM LWC CR Base 6-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and
LWC-33 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. To qualify the LWC, the fastener Glaspl FYremier Sheet Fastener 6-inch o.c. at three, equally SBS-SA SBS-TA -30.0
structural concrete | shall document min. 22 Ibf per Note 11. 4 (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows
. . - . . L. PermaPly 28, . .
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 200 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing Ventsulation JM LWC CR Base 6-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and | BP-AA, SBS-AA, SBS-AA SBS-
LWC-34 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the ’ Sheet Fastener 6-inch o.c. at three, equally SBS-CA3 or . -30.0
. DynaBase or GlasPly CA3 or SBS-TA
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 22 Ibf per Note 11. Premier (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows SBS-TA
JM UltraLok, min.
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing 1.4-inch or JM LWC 7-inch o.c. at the 3-inch lap and .
P Ply 28, GlasB DynaGrip B
LWC-35 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the ermarly 26, Glasbase CR Base Sheet 7-inch o.c. in two, equally ynatarip Base SBS-TA -30.0
. Plus R SD/SA
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 35 Ibf per Note 11. Fastener, min. 1.7- spaced, staggered center rows
inch (Note 11)
JM UltraLok, min.
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing PermaPly 28, GlasBase | 1.4-inch or JM LWC 7-inch o.c. at the 3-inch lap and SBS-AA SBS
LWC-36 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the Plus, DynaBase, CR Base Sheet 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-AA, SBS-TA TA ! -30.0
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 35 Ibf per Note 11. Ventsulation Fastener, min. 1.7- spaced, staggered center rows
inch (Note 11)
JM UltraLok, min.
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing 1.4-inch or JM LWC 7-inch o.c. at the 3-inch lap and SBS-CA-1
LWC-37 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the DynaBase CR Base Sheet 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 ’ -30.0
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 35 Ibf per Note 11. Fastener, min. 1.7- spaced, staggered center rows
inch (Note 11)
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 210 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing . 9-inch o.c. at the 3-inch lap and .
LWC-38 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the g;e::anly 28, Glasbase J:ll\i-LiJr:tcfl(ﬁI;’t?:llni) 12-inch o.c. in two, equally ng;safnp Base SBS-TA -30.0
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 55 Ibf per Note 11. ’ spaced, staggered center rows
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 210 psi, minimum 2-inch thch.< pre-existing PermaPly 28, GlasBase JM UltraLok, min. 9-|rTch o.c. a'F the 3-inch lap and SBS-AA, SBS-
LWC-39 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: Note: To qualify the LWC, the Plus, DynaBase, K 12-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-AA, SBS-TA -30.0
. . 1.4-inch (Note 11) TA
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 55 Ibf per Note 11. Ventsulation spaced, staggered center rows
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 210 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing IM UltraLok. min 9-inch o.c. at the 3-inch lap and
LWC-40 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the DynaBase 1.4-inch (No’te 11') 12-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 -30.0
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 55 Ibf per Note 11. ’ spaced, staggered center rows
Min. 22 ga, type B, DynaBase, GlasPly 7-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and | BP-AA, BP-CA2
M LWCCRB BS-AA, SBS-
LWC-41 | Grade 33 steel or Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Elastizell LWIC. | Premier, PermaPly 28 ! ase 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-AA, SBS- SBS-AA, SBS -37.5
. Sheet Fastener CA2 or SBS-TA
structural concrete or Ventsulation spaced, staggered center rows CA2 or SBS-TA

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 33 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



NEmoO | etc.

TABLE 4D: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)
SYSTEM TYPE E: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck LwWcC Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Trufast Twin Loc
Min. 22 g3, type B, Min. 370 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Elastizell LWIC | DynaFast 180 HW or Tubes (1.8-inch) . ?-mch .o.c. within the mln.. 4 (Optional) SBS-
LWC-42 | Grade 33 steel or X X through Trufast Twin | inch wide, heat-welded side SBS-TA -37.5
with Zell-Crete Fibers DynaFast 250 HW R TA
structural concrete Loc Coiled Batten laps.
Bar
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing JM LWC CR Base 9-inch o.c. at the 3-inch laps
LWC-43 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the PermaPly 28 Sheet Fastener, min. | and 12-inch o.c. in two, equally | SBS-TA SBS-TA -37.5
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 62 Ibf per Note 11. 1.7-inch (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows
DynaBase, DynaBase
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing ERHEZSQ?:;ZS(;’ JM LWC CR Base 9-inch o.c. at the 3-inch laps
LWC-44 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the Y ! Sheet Fastener, min. | and 12-inch o.c. in two, equally | SBS-TA SBS-TA -37.5
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 62 Ibf per Note 11 DynaFast 180, 1.7-inch (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows
: p : DynaPly T1, DynaMax | paced, stagg
S or Dynalastic 250 S
GlasBase Plus,
Deck Treatment: Celcore S-1 broom applied to Ventsulation,
steel deck in continuous film prior to placement of | DynaB DynaB
Min. 22 ga, type B, LWC P P P;n; 2:3’352%_ ase JM LWC CR Base 12-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap
LWC-45 | Grade 33 steel or o . . . s DY . ! Sheet Fastener, min. and 12-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0
structural concrete LWC: Min. 380 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Celcore Dynalastic 180 S, 1.7-inch spaced, staggered center rows
MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology DynaFast 180°S, ’
Modifying Admixture DynaPly T1, DynaMax
S or Dynalastic 250 S
Min. 22 ga, type B, . L . . . JM LWC CR Base 7-inch o.c. at the 3-inch laps
Min. 31 2-inch thick Elastizell LWIC
LWC-46 | Grade 33 steel or '|n 310 psi, m|r'1|mum inc Ick Hlastize PermaPly 28 Sheet Fastener, min. and 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0
with Zell-Crete Fibers -
structural concrete 1.7-inch spaced, staggered center rows
DynaBase, DynaBase
. PR, DynaBase XT, . .
.22 B ) L . . ) ) L B - .C. 4-
Min ga, type B, Min. 310 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Elastizell LWIC Dynalastic 180 S, IMLWC CR Base . ’ |nch'o c.at th'e 6.4-inch laps
LWC-47 | Grade 33 steel or X X Sheet Fastener, min. and 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0
structural concrete with Zell-Crete Fibers DynaFast 180, 1.7-inch spaced, staggered center rows
DynaPly T1, DynaMax | paced, stagg
S or Dynalastic 250 S
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing DynaBase, GlasPly JM LWC CR Base 9-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and | BP-AA, BP-CA2 SBS-AA SBS-
LWC-48 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the Premier, PermaPly 28 Sheet Fastener 12-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-AA, SBS- CA2 or ,SBS—TA -52.5
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 93 Ibf per Note 11. or Ventsulation (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows CA2 or SBS-TA

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 34 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 4D: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE E: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck LWC Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Deck Treatment: Celcore S-1 broom applied to R
. ) ¥ ) Trufast Twin Loc
Min. 22 ga, type B steel deck in continuous film prior to placement of Tubes (L.8-inch) 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4
in. , ty| X u 8- -i .c. withi in. 4- .
LWC. D Fast 180 HW 1) SBS-
LWC-49 | Grade 33 steel or X . X . ynaFast 180 or through Trufast Twin | inch wide, heat-welded side (Optional) 585 SBS-TA -52.5
LWC: Min. 430 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Celcore DynaFast 250 HW ; TA
structural concrete . Loc Coiled Batten laps.
MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Bar
Modifying Admixture
Min. 22 g3, type B, |\ 500 bsi, minimum 2-inch thick Mearlcrete DynaBase, GlasPly JM LWC CR Base 7-incho.c. atthe d-inchlapand | BP-AA BP-CA2 | oo ) cpo.
LWC-50 | Grade 33 steel or Premier, PermaPly 28 7-inch o.c. in three, equally SBS-AA, SBS- -60.0
LWIC . Sheet Fastener CA2 or SBS-TA
structural concrete or Ventsulation spaced, staggered center rows CA2 or SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing GlasPly Premier, 9-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and | BP-AA, BP-CA2
: JM UltraLok . ) SBS-AA, SBS-
LWC-51 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the PermaPly 28 or (Note 11) 9-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-AA, SBS- CA2 or SBS-TA -60.0
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 88 Ibf per Note 11. Ventsulation ote spaced, staggered center rows CA2 or SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 250 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing DynaBase, GlasPly JM LWC CR Base 7-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and | BP-AA, BP-CA2 SBS-AA SBS-
LWC-52 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the Premier, PermaPly 28 Sheet Fastener 7-inch o.c. in two, equally or SBS-AA, CA2 ! -60.0
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 69 Ibf per Note 11. or Ventsulation (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows SBS-CA2
Min. 22 ga, type B, . L . . 6-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and
LWC-53 | Grade 33 steel or Min. 500 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Concrecel PermaPly 28 f)r JM LWC CR Base 6-inch o.c. at three, equally SBS-SA SBS-TA -60.0
LWIC GlasPly Premier Sheet Fastener
structural concrete spaced, staggered center rows
; PermaPly 28 . .
Min. 22 ga, type B ’ -inch o.c. at the 4-inch | BP-AA, SBS-AA
n 8a, type B, Min. 500 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Concrecel Ventsulation, JM LWC CR Base 6 !nc 0.c. at the 4-inch lap and  SBS-AA, SBS-AA, SBS-
LWC-54 | Grade 33 steel or 6-inch o.c. at three, equally SBS-CA3 or -60.0
LWIC DynaBase or GlasPly Sheet Fastener CA3 or SBS-TA
structural concrete K spaced, staggered center rows SBS-TA
Premier
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 350 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Celcore MF 6-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and
2 L B
LWC-55 | Grade 33 steel or Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology PermaPly 28 .or M LWC CR Base 6-inch o.c. at three, equally SBS-SA SBS-TA -60.0
o . GlasPly Premier Sheet Fastener
structural concrete Modifying Admixture spaced, staggered center rows
Min. 22 ga, type B Min. 350 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Celcore MF PermaPly 28, 6-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and | BP-AA, SBS-AA
- <283, ype B, ’ psl, ) Ventsulation, JM LWC CR Base . - p ! ’ | SBS-AA, SBS-
LWC-56 | Grade 33 steel or Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology 6-inch o.c. at three, equally SBS-CA3 or -60.0
P . DynaBase or GlasPly Sheet Fastener CA3 or SBS-TA
structural concrete Modifying Admixture Premier spaced, staggered center rows SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 350 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing permaPly 28 or JM LWC CR Base 9-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and
LWC-57 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the ¥ X Sheet Fastener 9-inch o.c. at three, equally SBS-SA SBS-TA -60.0
. GlasPly Premier
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 66 Ibf per Note 11. (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows
. . L . . L. PermaPly 28, . .
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 350 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing Ventsulation JM LWC CR Base 9-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and | BP-AA, SBS-AA, SBS-AA. SBS-
LWC-58 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the ! Sheet Fastener 9-inch o.c. at three, equally SBS-CA3 or . -60.0
. DynaBase or GlasPly CA3 or SBS-TA
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 66 Ibf per Note 11. Premier (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows SBS-TA
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 35 of 48



TABLE 4D: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE E: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck LwWcC Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Trufast Twin Loc
Tubes or JM UltraLok
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 498 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Celcore MF . 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4- .
DynaFast 180 HW Tube (1.8-inch 1) SBS-
LWC-59 | Grade 33 steel or Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology ynarast 180 or ube (1.8-inch) inch wide, heat-welded side (Optional) SBS SBS-TA -60.0
structural concrete Modifying Admixture DynaFast 250 HW through Trufast laps A
ving Batten Bar or JM ps.
Metal Batten TL
Deck Treatment: Celcore S-1 broom applied to DynaBase, DynaBase
steel deck in continuous film prior to placement of | PR, DynaBase XT
Min. 22 ga, type B, LWC P P D ;azgjticaigo Sl JM LWC CR Base 12-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap
LWC-60 | Grade 33 steel or o . . . Y ! Sheet Fastener, min. and 12-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-TA SBS-TA -60.0
LWC: Min. 430 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Celcore DynaFast 180 S, X
structural concrete ) 1.7-inch spaced, staggered center rows
MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology DynaPly T1, DynaMax
Modifying Admixture S or Dynalastic 250 S
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 350 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing PermaPly 28 or JM LWC CR Base 7-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and
LWC-61 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the Glaspl I!remier Sheet Fastener 7-inch o.c. at two, equally SBS-SA SBS-TA -67.5
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 77 Ibf per Note 11. v (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows
. . S . . . PermaPly 28, . .
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 350 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing . JM LWC CR Base 7-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and
X Ventsulation, . BP-AA, SBS-AA SBS-AA or
LWC-62 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the Sheet Fastener 7-inch o.c. at two, equally -67.5
. DynaBase or GlasPly or SBS-TA SBS-TA
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 77 Ibf per Note 11. Premier (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows
Deck Treatment: Celcore S-1 broom applied to
. steel deck in continuous film prior to placement of . .
Min. 22 ga, type B, LWC JM LWC CR Base 7-inch o.c. at the 3-inch laps
LWC-63 | Grade 33 steel or t L i . PermaPly 28 Sheet Fastener, min. and 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-TA SBS-TA -67.5
LWC: Min. 340 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Celcore X
structural concrete A 1.7-inch spaced, staggered center rows
MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology
Modifying Admixture
Deck Treatment: Celcore S-1 broom applied to DynaBase, DynaBase
steel deck in continuous film prior to placement of
Min. 22 ga, type B, LWC P P ER;EIY:;?:;ZS(E JM LWC CR Base 7-inch o.c. at the 6.4-inch laps
LWC-64 | Grade 33 steel or R . . . Y ! Sheet Fastener, min. and 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-TA SBS-TA -67.5
LWC: Min. 340 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Celcore DynaFast 180§, -
structural concrete ) 1.7-inch spaced, staggered center rows
MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology DynaPly T1, DynaMax
Modifying Admixture S or Dynalastic 250 S
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick pre-existing JM UltraLok 9-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and | BP-AA, BP-CA2 SBS-AA SBS-
LWC-65 | Grade 33 steel or cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the DynaBase (Note 11) 9-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-AA, SBS- CA2 or ’SBS-TA -75.0
structural concrete | fastener shall document min. 110 Ibf per Note 11. ote spaced, staggered center rows CA2 or SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga, type B, DynaBase, GlasPly 7-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and | BP-AA, BP-CA2
L B BS- BS-
LWC-66 | Grade 33 steel or Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Celcore LWIC Premier, PermaPly 28 IM LWC CR Base 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-AA, SBS- SBS-AA, SBS -75.0
. Sheet Fastener CA2 or SBS-TA
structural concrete or Ventsulation spaced, staggered center rows CA2 or SBS-TA

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 36 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



TABLE 4D: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE E: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Deck LwWcC Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Trufast Twin Loc
. . L . . Tubes or JM UltraLok | 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4-
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 498 psi, m|n|m.um 2-inch thick Celcore MF DynaFast 180 HW or Tube (1.8-inch) inch wide, heat-welded side (Optional) SBS-
LWC-67 | Grade 33 steel or Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology . X SBS-TA -75.0
e . DynaFast 250 HW through Trufast laps and 6-inch o.c. in one TA
structural concrete Modifying Admixture
Batten Bar or JM center row
Metal Batten TL
Min. 22 ga, type B, . S . . ) PermaPly 28, GlasBase | JM LWC CR Base 7-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and
Min. 430 2-inch thick Elastizell LWIC SBS-AA, SBS-
LWC-68 | Grade 33 steel or .|n psl, mn.wlmum inc Ick Hastize Plus, DynaBase or Sheet Fastener, min. 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-AA, SBS-TA ’ -75.0
with Zell-Crete Fibers . K TA
structural concrete Ventsulation 1.7-inch spaced, staggered center rows
Min. 22 ga, type B, | 1. 430 bsi, minimum 2-inch thick Elastizell LWIC IMLWCCRBase | 7-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and SBS-CA-1,
LWC-69 | Grade 33 steel or R X DynaBase Sheet Fastener, min. | 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-CA2 -75.0
with Zell-Crete Fibers X SBS-CA2
structural concrete 1.7-inch spaced, staggered center rows
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2.25-inch thick Concrecel GlasPly Premier, JM LWC CR Base 7-!nch 0C. ?t the 4-inch lapand | BP-AA, BP-CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-
LWC-70 | Grade 33 steel or PermaPly 28 or 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-AA, SBS- -82.5
LWIC . Sheet Fastener CA2 or SBS-TA
structural concrete Ventsulation spaced, staggered center rows CA2 or SBS-TA
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2.25-inch thick Concrecel JM LWC CR Base 7-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and
LWC-71 | Grade 33 steel or LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the fastener shall | PermaPly 28 Sheet Fastener 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-CA3 SBS-CA3 -90.0
structural concrete document min. 103 Ibf per Note 11. (Note 11) spaced, staggered center row
Trufast Twin Loc
Min. 498 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Celcore MF DynaFast 180 HW or ﬁzszs(f;{mcﬂl)tra o ?nlcrr]wc\t]vic;: ;velzl-r\:vgl]gen;snidi (Optional) SBS-
LWC-72 | Structural concrete | Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology v ’ ' K P SBS-TA -90.0
e . DynaFast 250 HW through Trufast laps and 6-inch o.c. in one TA
Modifying Admixture
Batten Bar or JM center row
Metal Batten TL
. L . . PermaPly 28, . .
Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Concrecel Ventsulation JM LWC CR Base 6-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and BP-AA or SBS-
LWC-73 | Structural concrete LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWC, the fastener shall ! Sheet Fastener 6-inch o.c. at three, equally SBS-AA -120.0
. DynaBase or GlasPly AA
document min. 98 Ibf per Note 11. Premier (Note 11) spaced, staggered center rows
Min. 22 ga, type B, 7-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and BP-AA, BP-CA2
Trufast FM-290 SBS-AA, SBS-
LWC-74 | Grade 33steelor | Min. 300 psi, minimum 2-inch thick Mearlcrete GlasPly Premier rutas 7-inch o.c. in two, equally SBS-AA, SBS- , -127.5
Fasteners CA2 or SBS-TA
structural concrete spaced, staggered center rows CA2 or SBS-TA
. 50% strip mop plus: Fasteners
Min. 22 t B BP-AA, BP-CA2
n 8a, ype B, Min. 300 psi, minimum 2.25-inch thick Concrecel R JM LWC CR Base 4-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and ’ SBS-AA, SBS-
LWC-75 | Grade 33 steel or GlasPly Premier . . SBS-AA, SBS- -146.0
LWIC Sheet Fastener 4-inch o.c. in four equally CA2 or SBS-TA
structural concrete CA2 or SBS-TA
spaced, staggered center rows

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 37 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 4E: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE E: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Lwc Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Fasteners Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)

LWC-76 Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 430 psi, minimum 2-inch DynaFast 180 HW or High Load Fasteners and High 12-inch o.c. within the min. 5-inch (Optional) SBS- SBS-TA 60.0
50 ksi steel thick cellular LWIC. DynaFast 250 HW Load Plates (engage steel deck) wide, heat-welded side laps. TA ’
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 430 psi, minimum 2-inch High Load Fasteners and High 12-inch o.c. within the min. 5-inch (Optional) SBS-

LWC-77 DynaFast 1 BS-AA -60.0

¢ 50 ksi steel thick cellular LWIC. ynaFast 180°S Load Plates (engage steel deck) wide, heat-welded side laps. AA 58S

LWC-78 Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 180 psi, minimum 2-inch DynaFast 180 HW or High Load Fasteners and High 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4-inch (Optional) SBS- SBS-TA 975
60 ksi steel thick cellular LWIC. DynaFast 250 HW Load Plates (engage steel deck) wide, heat-welded side laps. TA ’
Min. 22 ga, type B, Min. 180 psi, minimum 2-inch High Load Fasteners and High 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4-inch (Optional) SBS-

LWC-79 DynaFast 180 S SBS-AA -97.5
60 ksi steel thick cellular LWIC. ynaras Load Plates (engage steel deck) wide, heat-welded side laps. AA

TABLE 4F: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE F: NON-INSULATED, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck LWC Base Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 14) Type Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 22 ga, type B, Grade 33 Min. 300 psi, minimum 2.25-inch thick GlasPly ) (Optional) BP-AA, BP-CA2, SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or
LWC-80 50% st -67.5
steel or structural concrete Concrecel LWIC Premier % strip mop SBS-AA or SBS-CA2 SBS-TA
. . R . Royal Millennium Hurricane Force
Min. 22 B Min. 4 . 2-inch Cel MF Cellul
LWC-81 st(ler:el strguac’t::?:cc;ni:aef: 3r3 Col:cregti ’\)Nsiléhmclzlcorlchs ;hgli Mc?dil; ?r: DynaBase Membrane Adhesive or Hurricane | (Optional) SBS-AA, SBS-TA, SBS-AR, SBS-TA, SBS- 783
' : ) gy Viocltying | By Force Membrane Adhesive HS, 1- | SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2, SBS-CA3 :
Tectum | Admixture; Celcore Curing Compound . . .
inch ribbons spaced 12-inch o.c.
. - . Royal Millennium Hurricane Force
LWC-82 | Structural concrete ('\thl)lrr:c:‘egti r\;lsilt,hm(;ZI.ci—rlzcl-TSc:f:Z:)rlz MFMC:clil;l?r: DynaBase Membrane Adhesive or Hurricane (Optional) SBS-AA, SBS-TA, SBS-AA, SBS-TA, SBS- -193.0
! . &Y ving | by Force Membrane Adhesive HS, 1- | SBS-CA2, SBS-CA3 CA2, SBS-CA3 :
Admixture; Celcore Curing Compound . . .
inch ribbons spaced 12-inch o.c.

TABLE 4G: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS — NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE F: NON-INSULATED, BONDED ROOF COVER, PAVER SYSTEM OVERBURDEN

System Deck LWC (Note 14) Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Overburden
No. (Note 1) Type Treatment Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)

DynaWeld C. W Tile: Terra-Paver in Lok-Down Terra-Base.
DynaBase applied in Royal ynaWeld Cap ausau Tile: Terra-Paver in Lok-Down atop Terra-Base

Structural Min. 498 psi, min. 2-inch Celcore Celcore Curin “Hurricane Force Membrane (Optional) FR or Terra-Base is bonded directly to the top surface of the
LWC-83 concrete MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore Compound g Adhesive HS” 1-inch ribbons DynaBase HW, DynaWeld Cap waterproofing system in Royal “Hurricane Force -85.0
HS Rheology Modifying Admixture P . ! torch applied 180 FR, torch Membrane Adhesive HS”. The Terra-Paver is secured
6-inch o.c. . .
applied with the Lok-Down tabs and screws.
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 38 of 48



TABLE 5A: CEMENTITIOUS WOOD FIBER DECKS — REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1&12) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit
Existing Tectum (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R- UIA- Board, RetroPlus Board or UIA- BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA,
CWEF-1. Plank or Tectum Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, TWO- DuraBoard or min. 0.75- TWO- CA2, SBS-AA BP-CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or -45.0*
LS Plank ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART inch Fesco Board PART or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-TA
(homogeneous)
- ) ) ) BP-AA, BP- )
Existing Tectum (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R- UIA- Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK UIA- CA2 SBS-AA (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA,
CWE-2. Plank or Tectum Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, TWO- G '.sur.n—Fiber Roof Board TWO- SBS-CA2 or ’ BP-CA2, SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or -45.0*
LS Plank ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART P PART SBS-TA SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-TA
Existing Tectum | (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PS|, R- UIA- Min. 0.25.inch securock | YA g%péf;agpszém' SBS-CAL,
CWE-3. Plank or Tectum Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, TWO- G Sum Fiber Roof Board TWO- SBS-TA sBs CA;]. sBs CA,2 SBSCA2 or -45.0*
LS Plank ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART P PART or SBS—C}\?, SBS-CA3
Existing Tectum Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, UIA- . . UIA- .
CWF-4. | Plank or Tectum | ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm TWO- f?’ﬁ:gggﬁ:‘::’ﬁz’tﬁ:‘ TWO- SBS-SA g?‘;g‘s’f‘;l) SBS-5A zgzﬁf\ or -45.0*
LS Plank AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART v PART
Existing Tectum (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R- UIA- Min. 0.25-inch In.vmsa UIA- (Optional) SBS-SA SBS-SA or
CWEF-5. Plank or Tectum | Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, TWO- Roof Board or min. 1.5- TWO- SBS-SA or SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
LS Plank ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART inch Invinsa Foam PART
Existing Tectum (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R- UIA- UIA-
CWE-6. Plank or Tectum Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, TWO- Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard TWO- SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -45.0*
LS Plank ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART PART
<t ; ; BP-AA,, BP- _
Existing Tectum Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK CA2 SBS-AA, (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA,
CWE-7. Plank or Tectum ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm CR-20 Gvpsum-Fiber Roof Board CR-20 SBS-CA2 or BP-CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or -52.5
LS Plank AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF yP SBS-TA SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-TA
Existing Tectum | Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, Min. 0.25.inch SECUROCK g%péf;agpsz;\gm, SBS-CAL,
CWEF-8. Plank or Tectum ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm CR-20 G '.sur.n—Fiber Roof Board CR-20 SBS-TA SBS—CA,l SBS—C/;Z SBSCA2 or -52.5
LS Plank AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF P y SBS-CA3
or SBS-CA3
Existing Tectum | Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, . -, )
CWF-9. | Plank or Tectum | ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm CR-20 fgiﬁ':;ggﬁ:‘:ijﬁfgﬁ\ CR-20 SBS-SA g?ggcs’f‘;’:\) SBS-5A zgzﬁﬁ or 52,5
LS Plank AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF Y
Existing Tectum Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI,
CWEF-10. Plank or Tectum | ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm CR-20 Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard CR-20 SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -52.5
LS Plank AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 39 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



TABLE 5B: CEMENTITOUS WOOD FIBER DECKS — REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE A-2: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ANCHOR SHEET, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

Anchor Sheet Insulation Roof Cover (Note 15)
System Deck Fast MDP
asteners
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Base Top Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Note 11)
Min. 1-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 . . .
DynaBase, 9-inch o.c. at 25 PS|, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or (Fzssgopsgm'v'('):' 1.5-inch
Existing GlasBase Plus, the 4-|th lap CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, DuraFoam, min, 0.75- (Optional) SBS-AA,
Tectum Plank GlasPly and 18-inch o.c. | ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 inch Fesco Board BP-AA, BP- BP-AA, BP- SBS-CA2
CWF-11. Premier, JM UltraLok in two, equally PSI AGF or CGF, min. 1.5-inch Fesco . HA CA2, SBS-AA CA2 SBS-AA, -45.0*
or Tectum LS X . (homogeneous) or min. or SBS-
PermaPly 28 spaced, Foam or DuraFoam, min. 0.75-inch Fesco . . or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 or
Plank . . 0.5-inch Retro-Fit TA
or staggered Board (homogeneous) or min. 0.5-inch SBS-TA
. . Board, RetroPlus Board
Ventsulation center rows Retro-Fit Board, RetroPlus Board or
or DuraBoard
DuraBoard
Min. 1-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 . . .
DynaBase, 9-inch o.c. at 25 PS|, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or (Fzgct;":jgm'w;' 1.5-inch
Existing GlasBase Plus, the 4-|th lap CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, DuraFoam, min. 0.75- (Optional) SBS-AA,
Tectum Plank GlasPly and 12-inch o.c. | ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 inch Fesco Board BP-AA, BP- BP-AA, BP- SBS-CA2
CWF-12. Premier, JM UltraLok in two, equally PSI AGF or CGF, min. 1.5-inch Fesco . HA CA2, SBS-AA CA2 SBS-AA, -82.5
or Tectum LS . . (homogeneous) or min. or SBS-
PermaPly 28 spaced, Foam or DuraFoam, min. 0.75-inch Fesco . . or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 or
Plank . . 0.5-inch Retro-Fit TA
or staggered Board (homogeneous) or min. 0.5-inch SBS-TA
. . Board, RetroPlus Board
Ventsulation center rows Retro-Fit Board, RetroPlus Board or
or DuraBoard
DuraBoard

TABLE 5C: CEMENTITIOUS WOOD FIBER DECKS —REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE B: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15)
System Deck Fast MDP
asteners
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Note 11)
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel
’ ! Min. 1.5-inch Fesco Foam or
Existi E 2 - 2
Pi(;s:llnfrTectum Emigz g AE(,EI':SOI;' Fég:nEel\lleszllzs JA’\:I F;(:Iymer DuraFoam, min. 0.75-inch Fesco BP-AA, BP-CA2, (Optional) BP-AA, BP- | SBS-AA, SBS-
CWEF-13. ! s 1 per 3 ft2 Board (homogeneous) or min. HA SBS-AA or SBS- CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 | CA2 or SBS- -45.0*
Tectum LS PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF Fasteners & . .
0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board, CA2 or SBS-TA TA
Plank or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or Plates
CGF RetroPlus Board or DuraBoard

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 40 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



TABLE 5D: CEMENTITIOUS WOOD FIBER DECKS —REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE C: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Base Insulation Layer
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners (Note 11) Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Existing Tectum .
. ) BP-AA, BP-CA2, (Optional) BP-AA, BP-
CWE-14. Plank or One qr mf)re layers, a.ny Min. 1.5-inch Fesco Foam JM Polymer Auger Fasteners & 1per2.67f | SBS-AA or SBS- CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 o SBS-AA, SBS- 45.0%
Tectum LS combination, loose laid or DuraFoam Plates or JM UltraLok CA2 or SBS-TA
CA2 SBS-TA
Plank
Existing Tectum . . .
Min. 0.75-inch Fesco BP-AA, BP-CA2, (Optional) BP-AA, BP-
CWF-15. Plank or One o.r mf)re layers, a'ny Board (homogeneous) or IM Polymer Auger Fasteners & 1 per 2 ft? SBS-AA or SBS- CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 or SBS-AA, SBS -45.0*
Tectum LS combination, loose laid Plates or JM UltraLok CA2 or SBS-TA
Plank DuraBoard CA2 SBS-TA

TABLE 5E: CEMENTITOUS WOOD FIBER DECKS —REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE E: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners (Note 11) Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Existing Tectum DynaBase, GlasBase Plus, . . . .
CWF-16. | Plank or Tectum GlasPly Premier, PermaPly 28 JM Polymer Auger Fasteners & Plates 12-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and 36-inch o.c. in BP-AA, BP-CA2, SBS-AA, | SBS-AA, SBS -45.0*
. two, equally spaced, staggered center rows SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA CA2, SBS-TA
LS Plank or Ventsulation
Existing Tectum DynaBase, GlasBase Plus, . . R .
9-inch o.c. at the 4-inch | d 18-inch o.c.int BP-AA , BP-CA2, SBS-AA SBS-AA, SBS-
CWF-17. | Plankor Tectum | GlasPly Premier, PermaPly 28 | JM UltraLok inch 0.¢. at the 2-inch 1ap and 18-inch o.¢. In two, ' ' ' ' -45.0*
. equally spaced, staggered center rows SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA CA2, SBS-TA
LS Plank or Ventsulation
Existing Tectum DynaBase, GlasBase Plus, . . . .
CWF-18. | Plank or Tectum GlasPly Premier, PermaPly 28 JM UltraLok Z IE:: O:'aite:jhitt m(e:l’r];:‘::::irlfol\?vzh o.¢. In two, gfsgé'_gAPZCAz' SBS-AA Zisz AR, SBS -82.5
LS Plank or Ventsulation qually sp » Stags
- . Trufast Twin Loc Tubes or JM UltraLok . . ) . )
CWE-19. Existing 3-inch DynaFast 180 HW or DynaFast Tube (1.8-inch) through Trufast Batten 6-inch 0.9 within the I’Tl.ll’l. 4-|nch wide, heat- (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -90.0
Tectum | Plank 250 HW welded side laps and 6-inch o.c. in one center row
Bar or JM Metal Batten TL

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13

Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 41 of 48




TABLE 6A: GYPSUM DECKS — REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

gypsum plank

CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF

Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board

or SBS-CA2

System Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Existing sound Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, UIA- . - UIA- .
G-1. | gypsumor ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or | TWO- g:s:?nnsﬂl)a/::ﬂ't"’”al lavers | 1wo- | sBs-sa L?’;gg?fll) SBS-5A Zgzﬁf\ ° | 50
gypsum plank CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART PART
Existing sound (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel UIA- Min. 0.25-|r.1ch Inv!nsa Roof UIA- (Optional) SBS-SA SBS-SA or
G-2. gypsum or 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm | TWO- Board or min. 1.5-inch TWO- SBS-SA or SBS-TA SBS-TA -82.5
gypsum plank AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART Invinsa Foam PART
Existing sound (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel UIA- Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK UIA- (Optional) BP-CA1, | SBS-CA1
G-3. gypsum or 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm | TWO- G e _Fiber Roof Board TWO- SBS-TA BP-CA3, SBS-CA1 or SBS- -105.0
gypsum plank | AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART ypsum-riber Root Boar PART or SBS-CA3 CA3
Min. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit
Existing sound (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel UIA- Board, RetroPlus Board or UIA- BP-AA, BP-CA2, (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA,
G-4. gypsum or 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm | TWO- DuraBoard or min. 0.75-inch | TWO- SBS-AA or SBS- BP-CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 -112.5
gypsum plank AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART Fesco Board PART CA2 SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA | or SBS-TA
(homogeneous)
Existing sound (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel UIA- Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK UIA- BP-AA, BP-CA2 (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA,
G-5. gypsum or 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm | TWO- G e _Fiber Roof Board TWO- SBS-AA, SBS- BP-CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 -112.5
gypsum plank | AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART ypsum-riber Root Boar PART | CA20rSBS-TA | SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA | or SBS-TA
Existing sound (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel UIA- . . UIA- .
G-6. | gypsumor 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm | TWO- Min. 0'25','E°h SECfU ROCE TWO- | SBS-TA (Optional) BP-CAZ | qps cny | L1125
gypsum plank | AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART Gypsum-Fiber Roof Boar PART or SBS-CA2
Existing sound Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSl, UIA- UIA-
G-7. gypsum or ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or | TWO- Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard TWO- SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -112.5
gypsum plank CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF PART PART
Existing sound Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, . - .
G-8. | gypsumor ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or | CR-20 Lca)‘s’:'?nrﬁl)a/:g‘:]'t'ona' lavers | g0 | sBs-sa L?Zggf‘f;) SBS-SA ::2:?2 ° | 750
gypsum plank CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Existing sound (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK (Optional) BP-CA1, | SBS-CA1l
G-9. gypsum or 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm | CR-20 G o _Fiber Roof Board CR-20 SBS-TA BP-CA3, SBS-CA1 or SBS- -105.0
gypsum plank | AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF ypsum-riber Root Boar or SBS-CA3 CA3
Existing sound Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSl,
G-10. gypsum or ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or | CR-20 Min. 0.5-inch DuraBoard CR-20 SBS-TA (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA -150.0
gypsum plank CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Existing sound Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK BP-AA, BP-CA2, (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA,
G-11. gypsum or ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or | CR-20 G o _Fiber Roof Board CR-20 SBS-AA, SBS- BP-CA2 SBS-AA, SBS-CA2 -257.5
gypsum plank CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF ypsum-riber Root Boar CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA | or SBS-TA
Existing sound Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, . . .
G-12. | gypsumor ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or | CR-20 Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK | o 5| oo ra (Optional) BP-CAZ | qps cny | 2575

NEMO ETC, LLC

Certificate of Authorization #32455

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION

Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 42 of 48




TABLE 6B: GYPSUM DECKS — REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE A-2: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ANCHOR SHEET, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

Anchor Sheet Insulation Roof Cover (Note 15)
System Deck MDP
Fasteners
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Base Top Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Note 11)
Min. 1-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
DynaBase 9-inch o.c. at the ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, (Optional) min. 1.5-inch
Existin G\I/asBase I;Ius A-inch Ia. .and ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 Fesco Foam or
s g 'ch fap an PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGFor | DuraFoam, min. 0.75- (Optional) BP-
sound GlasPly JM UltraLok 18-inch o.c. in X BP-AA, BP- SBS-AA,
. R CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF, inch Fesco Board AA, SBS-AA,
G-13. gypsum or Premier, (Field W/D > two, equally . R . HA CA2, SBS-AA SBS-CA2 -45.0*
<um PermaPly 28 100 Ibf) cpaced min. 1.5-inch Fesco Foam or (homogeneous) or min. or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 or or SBS-TA
gyp ¥ P ! DuraFoam, min. 0.75-inch Fesco 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board, SBS-TA
plank or staggered center .
Ventsulation rows Board (homogeneous) or min. 0.5- RetroPlus Board or
inch Retro-Fit Board, RetroPlus DuraBoard
Board or DuraBoard
DynaBase, 9-inch o.c. at the . .
Existing GlasBase Plus 4-inch lap and One or more layers min. 1-inch
sound GlasPly JM UltraLok 18-inch o.c. in ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 P, Min. 0.25-inch BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP- SBS-AA,
. : R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CA2, SBS-AA, | AA, SBS-AA,
G-14. gypsum or Premier, (Field W/D > two, equally SECUROCK Gypsum- HA SBS-CA2 -45.0*
sum PermaPly 28 100 Ibf) spaced CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Fiber Roof Board SBS-CA2 or SBS-CA2 or or SBS-TA
g}'apnk . y Sfa < dcenter | ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm SBS-TA SBS-TA
P . g8 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Ventsulation rows
GlasBase Plus, 9-inch o.c. at the . .
Existing GlasPly IV, min. 2-inch lap One or more layers min. 1.5-inch
sound GlasPly JM UltraLok and 18-inch o.c. | ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY3 25PSI, |\ o i o UIA- BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP- | oo 1 p
) ) . R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CA2,SBS-AA, | AA, SBS-AA,
G-15. gypsum or Premier, (Field W/D > in two, equally SECUROCK Gypsum- TWO- SBS-CA2 -45.0*
sum PermaPly 28 105 Ibf) spaced CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Fiber Roof Board PART SBS-CA2 or SBS-CA2 or or SBS-TA
g‘l’:nk . v Sfa <red conter | ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm SBS-TA SBS-TA
P . g8 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Ventsulation rows
9-inch o.c. at the
. . . One or more layers min. 1.5-inch
Existing JM LWC CR min. 2-inch lap .
ENRGY 3, R-P I, ENRGY 3 25 PSI BP-AA, BP- 1) BP-
sound PermaPly 28 Base Sheet and 18-inch o.c. GY 3, R-Panel, GY325PS, Min. 0.25-inch UIA- ! (Optional) SBS-AA,
; R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CA2, SBS-AA, | AA, SBS-AA, .
G-16. gypsum or or Fastener (1.2) in two, equally SECUROCK Gypsum- TWO- SBS-CA2 -45.0
sum Ventsulation (Field W/D > spaced CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Fiber Roof Board PART SBS-CA2 or SBS-CA2 or or SBS-TA
gT’:nk 0560 Sfa < d center | ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm SBS-TA SBS-TA
P mvfsg 25 PSI AGF or CGF

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13

Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 43 of 48



TABLE 6B: GYPSUM DECKS — REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE A-2: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ANCHOR SHEET, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

Anchor Sheet Insulation Roof Cover (Note 15)
System Deck MDP
Fasteners
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Base Top Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Note 11)
Min. 1-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel,
DynaBase 9-inch o.c. at the ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, (Optional) min. 1.5-inch
Existin G\I/asBase Ili’lus A-inch Ia. .and ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 Fesco Foam or
s g 'ch fap an PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGFor | DuraFoam, min. 0.75- (Optional) BP-
sound GlasPly JM UltraLok 12-inch o.c. in X BP-AA, BP- SBS-AA,
. R CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF, inch Fesco Board AA, SBS-AA,
G-17. gypsum or Premier, (Field W/D > two, equally . R . HA CA2, SBS-AA SBS-CA2 -75.0
<um PermaPly 28 133 Ibf) cpaced min. 1.5-inch Fesco Foam or (homogeneous) or min. or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 or or SBS-TA
gyp Y P ! DuraFoam, min. 0.75-inch Fesco 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board, SBS-TA
plank or staggered center .
Ventsulation rows Board (homogeneous) or min. 0.5- RetroPlus Board or
inch Retro-Fit Board, RetroPlus DuraBoard
Board or DuraBoard
DynaBase, 9-inch o.c. at the . .
Existing GlasBase Plus 4-inch lap and One or more layers min. 1-inch
sound GlasPly JM UltraLok 12-inch o.c.in ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 325 PSI, |\ 55 inch BP-AA, BP- | (Optional) BP- | oo\,
. : R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CA2, SBS-AA, | AA, SBS-AA,
G-18. gypsum or Premier, (Field W/D > two, equally SECUROCK Gypsum- HA SBS-CA2 -75.0
sum PermaPly 28 133 Ibf) spaced CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF or CGF, Fiber Roof Board SBS-CA2 or SBS-CA2 or or SBS-TA
gTar’nk . y Sfa < dcenter | ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm SBS-TA SBS-TA
P . g8 25 PSI AGF or CGF
Ventsulation rows

TABLE 6C: GYPSUM DECKS — REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE B: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners (Note 11) Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, Min. 1.5-inch Fesco Foam or (Optional) BP-
Existing sound ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, JM Polymer Auger DuraFoam, min. 0.75-inch BP-AA, BP-CA2, AApSBS—AA SBS-AA,
G-19. gypsum or ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 Fasteners & Plates 1 per 4 ft2 Fesco Board (homogeneous) or | HA SBS-AA or SBS- SBé-CAZ or’ SBS-CA2 or -45.0*
gypsum plank PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or (Field W/D > 360 Ibf) min. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board, CA2 SBS-TA SBS-TA
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF RetroPlus Board or DuraBoard
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel
, ) i BP-
Existing sound | ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-Panel 25 PS|, JM Polymer Auger Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK EC;_” BP-AA, BP-CA2, gipt;gg?/?A P- | sBs-an,
G-20. gypsum or ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 Fasteners & Plates 1 per 2 ft? G .sur.n-Fiber Roof Board TWO- SBS-AA, SBS- SBé-CAZ or’ SBS-CA2 or -45.0*
gypsum plank PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or (Field W/D > 180 Ibf) vp PART CA2 or SBS-TA SBS-TA SBS-TA
CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or CGF

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 44 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 6D: GYPSUM DECKS — REROOF (Tear-Off) or RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Base Insulation Layer
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners (Note 11) Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Existi BP-AA, BP-CA2 i 1) BP-AA
61 Xlsst:::ﬁ iorund One or more layers, any Min. 1.5-inch Fesco JM Polymer Auger Fasteners & Plates or 1 per 2.67 SBS-AA or ;:BS—, (S(;gf:):aSLS-CAZI SBS-AA, SBS- 45.0*
' gyp combination, loose laid Foam or DuraFoam JM UltraLok (Field W/D > 240 Ibf) ft? ’ CA2 or SBS-TA ’
gypsum plank CA2 or SBS-TA
Existi d Min. 0.75-inch F BP-AA, BP-CA2 Opti 1) BP-AA
6-22 XISSLan Zc;un One or more layers, any Bolzr:rd (horl':c(): e:esgzs) JM Polymer Auger Fasteners & Plates or 1 per 2 ft2 SBS-A/:\ o SBS-' (SBFS)-:):aSLS-CAZ' SBS-AA, SBS- 45.0*
S combination, loose laid & JM UltraLok (Field W/D > 180 Ibf) P ' CA2 or SBS-TA '
gypsum plank or DuraBoard CA2 or SBS-TA

TABLE 6E: GYPSUM DECKS — REROOF (Tear-Off) or RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE E: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED BASE SHEET, BONDED ROOF COVER

System Deck Base Sheet Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Fasteners (Note 11) Attach Base Ply Cap Ply (psf)
D B lasB PI
G-23 Existing sound gypsum Gr;sa:)l a;er’ei?:r T—"s:rm:sll )8 JM Polymer Auger Fasteners & 12-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and 36-inch o.c. in BP-AA, BP-CA2, SBS-AA, | SBS-AA, SBS- 45.0*
’ or gypsum plank M ! ¥ Plates (Field W/D > 159 Ibf) two, equally spaced, staggered center rows SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA CA2, SBS-TA '
or Ventsulation
. DynaBase, GlasBase Plus, . . . .
G-24. Existing sound gypsum GlasPly Premier, PermaPly 28 JM UltraLok (Field W/D > 100 Ibf) 9-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and 18-inch o.c. in two, BP-AA, BP-CA2, SBS-AA, SBS-AA, SBS- -45.0*
or gypsum plank . equally spaced, staggered center rows SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA CA2, SBS-TA
or Ventsulation
Trufast Twin Loc Tubes or JM
Existing sound gypsum DynaFast 180 HW or DynaFast | UltraLok Tube (1.8-inch) through 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4-inch wide, heat-welded .
-25. 1) SBS-TA BS-TA -60.
G-25 or gypsum plank 250 HW Trufast Batten Bar or J]M Metal side laps. (Optional) SBS SBS 60.0
Batten TL (Field W/D > 177 Ibf)
L DynaBase, GlasBase Plus, . . . .
G-26. Existing sound gypsum GlasPly Premier, PermaPly 28 JM Ultralok (Field W/D > 133 Ibf) 9-inch o.c. at the 4-inch lap and 12-inch o.c. in two, BP-AA, BP-CA2, SBS-AA, SBS-AA, SBS- 750
or gypsum plank . equally spaced, staggered center rows SBS-CA2 CA2
or Ventsulation
Trufast Twin Loc Tubes or JIM
Existing sound gypsum DynaFast 180 HW or DynaFast | UltraLok Tube (1.8-inch) through 6-inch o.c. within the min. 4-inch wide, heat-welded .
-27. BS- BS- -90.
G-27 or gypsum plank 250 HW Trufast Batten Bar or JM Metal side laps and 6-inch o.c. in one center row (Optional) SBS-TA SBS-TA 90.0
Batten TL (Field W/D > 133 Ibf)
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Certificate of Authorization #32455 6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 12: 12/16/2019

©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879 Appendix 1, Page 45 of 48



TABLE 7: RECOVER APPLICATIONS

SYSTEM TYPE A: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Substrate Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 . R .
Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 Min. 0.75-inch Fesco Board BP-AA, SBS- | (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA, SBS-
R-1 . HA (homogeneous) (homogeneous) or | HA AA or SBS- BP-CA2 SBS-AA, -120.0
asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 . . CA2, SBS-TA
min 0.5-inch DuraBoard CA2 SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA
PSI AGF or CGF
L . . (Optional) Min. 0.75-inch BP-AA, SBS- (Optional) BP-AA,
E Min. 0.75-inch F B DuraB: BS-AA, SBS-
R-2 a:'s;g:tgic oof (h;"mg :ng':us) escoBoard or DuraBoard HA FescoBoard or DuraBoard HA AA or SBS- BP-CA2 SBS-AA, i Asz séss-wi -167.5
P g (homogeneous) CA2 SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA '
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
R-3 Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 HA Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- HA BP-AA, SBS- (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA or 2475
asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 Fiber Roof Board AA or SBS-TA | SBS-AA or SBS-TA SBS-TA :
PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- (Optional) BP-CA2
R-4 HA HA BS-TA BS-CA2 -247.
asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 Fiber Roof Board 58S or SBS-CA2 SBS-C >
PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board
! BP-AA, BP- ti 1) BP-AA BS-AA, SBS-
Existing Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3 CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PS| CGF, RetroPlus Board or DuraBoard or ’ (Optional) » | SBSAA, SBS
R-5 asphaltic roof ValuTherm CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI CGF HA min. 0.75-inch Fesco Board HA CA2, SBS-AA BP-CA2 SBS-AA, CA2 or SB5- 2775
P ’ o orSBS-CA2 | SBS-CA20rSBS-TA | TA
(homogeneous)
s . . . BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA, SBS-
vo [T | e arerasrscon e smarsoreme | S0 | wosma | Gz | 27
P ’ OrSBS-CA2 | SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA | TA
Existin Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R- Min. 0.5-inch RetroPlus Board or BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA, SBS-
R-7 as haltgic roof Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF, HA DuréBc')ard HA CA2, SBS-AA BP-CA2 SBS-AA, CA2 or SBS- -300.0
P ValuTherm AGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA TA
Existin Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R- Min. 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board or BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA, SBS-
R-8 as haltgic roof Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF, HA min. 0.75-inch Fesco Board HA CA2, SBS-AA BP-CA2 SBS-AA, CA2 or SBS- -305.0
P ValuTherm AGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF (homogeneous) or DuraBoard or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA TA
Existin (Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 Min. 1.5-inch Fesco Foam or BP-AA, BP- (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA, SBS-
R-9 as haltgic roof PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF, HA DuréFc:\am HA CA2, SBS-AA BP-CA2 SBS-AA, CA2 or SBS- -305.0
P ValuTherm AGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA TA
MBR-BA
Existing . . . (Optional) SBS-SA SBS-SA or
-1 . 0.25- B BS- -112.
R-10 asphaltic roof Min. 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof Board itcj)l\llerage None N/A SBS-SA or SBS-TA SBS-TA 5

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 46 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



TABLE 7: RECOVER APPLICATIONS

SYSTEM TYPE A: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Substrate Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R- UIA UIA
Existing Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF i . . . - (Optional) SBS-SA SBS-SA or
R-11 TWO- Min. 0.25-inch | Roof B TWO- BS-SA -82.
asphaltic roof or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF ° in. 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof Board ° SBS-S or SBS-TA SBS-TA 82.5
PART PART
or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 UIA- UIA-
Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 . . . (Optional) SBS-SA SBS-SA or
R12 | Lsphalticroof | PSIAGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 | 1 WO- Min. 1.5-inch Invinsa Foam TWO- SBS-SA or SBS-TA SBS-TA 825
PART PART
PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 .
f13 Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 ?\I/Co- Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- ;J\',Co_ SBS.TA (E:.F)E;IOSnBaSI!CBAz(Z?L SBS-CA1 or 1050
asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 Fiber Roof Board ! SBS-CA3 '
PART PART SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 . .
1A- Min. 0.75-inch F B 1A- .
f1 Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 ?w o (h;"mg jn'e":us) isf;i:a(;ds_mch gwo- BP-CA2 or (Optional) BP-CA2 | o r 1200
asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 g o SBS-CA2 or SBS-CA2 ’
PART DuraBoard PART
PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 0.75-inch )
UIA- UIA- BP-AA, SBS- Opt 1) BP-AA
Existing Min. 0.75-inch FescoBoard (homogeneous), min. 0.5- FescoBoard (homogeneous), min. . (Optional) ! SBS-AA, SBS-
R-15 asphaltic roof inch Retro-Fit Board, RetroPlus Board or DuraBoard TWO- 0.5-inch Retro-Fit Board, RetroPlus TWO- AA or SBS- BP-CA2 SBS-AA, CA2, SBS-TA -1200
P ! PART ’ ! PART CA2 SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA !
Board or DuraBoard
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 .
- - BP-AA, SBS- BP-
Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 UIA Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- | S'A P-AA, SBS- | (Optional) BP-AA, SBS-AA, SBS-
R-16 asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 TWO- Fiber Roof Board TWO- AR, SBS-CAZ | BP-CA2 SBS-AA, CA2,SBS-TA -120.0
P ! ! PART PART or SBS-TA SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA ’
PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 UIA UIA
Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 i Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- - (Optional) BP-CA2
R-17 asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 TWO- Fiber Roof Board TWO- SBS-TA or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA2 -120.0
PART PART
PSI AGF or CGF
Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 PSI, R-
Existing Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 PSI AGF RSUA or . . . RSUA or (Optional) SBS-SA SBS-SA or
R-1 Min. 0.25-inch | Roof B BS-SA -67.
8 | asphalticroof | or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 PSI AGF | OSFA in 0.25-inch Invinsa Roof Board | gy | SBSS or SBS-TA SBS-TA 67>
or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 RSUA or . . . RSUA or (Optional) SBS-SA SBS-SA or
R-19 asphaltic roof | PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 | OSFA Min. 1.5-inch Invinsa Foam OSFA SBS-5A or SBS-TA SBS-TA 67.5
PSI AGF or CGF

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 47 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



TABLE 7: RECOVER APPLICATIONS

SYSTEM TYPE A: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

System Substrate Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type Attach Type Attach Base Ply Ply Cap Ply (psf)
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 (Optional) BP-CA1
R-20 Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 RSUA or Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- | RSUA or SBS-TA BP??, SBS-CA1 or ’ SBS-CA1 or -105.0
asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 OSFA Fiber Roof Board OSFA ! SBS-CA3 '
SBS-CA3
PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 .
BP-AA, SBS- 1) BP-AA
fop | Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY325 | RSUAor | Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- | RSUAor | SB';CZZ gi’_’éf;gés_AA © | ses-AAsBS- | oo
asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 OSFA Fiber Roof Board OSFA 4 ! CA2,SBS-TA '
or SBS-TA SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA
PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
R-22 Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 RSUA or Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- | RSUA or SBS-TA (Optional) BP-CA2 SBS-CA2 1575
asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 OSFA Fiber Roof Board OSFA or SBS-CA2 '
PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25 .
BP-AA, SBS- 1) BP-AA BS-AA, SBS-
Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- , SBS- | (Optional) g SBS-AA, SBS
R-23 : CR-20 R CR-20 AA, SBS-CA2 BP-CA2 SBS-AA, CA2 or SBS- -262.5
asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 Fiber Roof Board
or SBS-TA SBS-CA2 or SBS-TA TA
PSI AGF or CGF
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ENRGY 3, R-Panel, ENRGY 3 25
Existing PSI, R-Panel 25 PSI, ENRGY 3 AGF or CGF, ENRGY 3 25 Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum- (Optional) BP-CA2
-2 -2 -2 BS- BS-CA2 -262.
R-24 asphaltic roof PSI AGF or CGF, ValuTherm AGF or CGF, ValuTherm 25 CR-20 Fiber Roof Board CR-20 SBS-TA or SBS-CA2 SBS-CA 625
PSI AGF or CGF

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019 NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report J8230.03.08-R12 for FL2948-R13
Revision 12: 12/16/2019
Appendix 1, Page 48 of 48

6™ EDITION (2017) FBC NON-HVHZ EVALUATION
Johns Manville SBS Modified Bitumen Roof Systems; (303) 978-4879



	2019_12_FINAL_ER_JM_SBS_FL2948-R13.pdf
	2019_12_FINAL_A1_ER_JM_SBS_FL2948-R13.pdf

